

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.

Are you requesting an escalation provision?

YES _____ NO X

MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED _____ %

INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF 12/31/21

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed, for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

7 days

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:FIRM NAME: Nicor, Inc.ADDRESS: 100 Commons Rd #7-355CITY, STATE: Dripping Springs TX ZIP: 78620TELEPHONE: (512) 971-8679 FAX: (512) 276-2033EMAIL ADDRESS: amy.e.collins@nicorinc.net

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 50,925.00AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: Amy E. CollinsTITLE: Southwest Regional ManagerAmy E. Collins
Printed Name

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00130164

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			ONE (1) YEAR CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF WATER METER BOXES, LID ASSEMBLIES & VALVE BOX TOPS & CAPS FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS & DEPARTMENT OF WATER, EAST & WEST BANK	No Bid	-
1	10.00	EA	0020 - FORD YOKEBOX UPPER BODY CASTING ONLY, FOR 5/8 INCH BY 3/4 INCH WATER METERS, SHALLOW BOXES, STRAIGHT INLET FORD #YUC-7 (38556)	No Bid	-
2	50.00	EA	0030 - GRADE ADJUSTERS FOR FORD YOKEBOX, ADJUSTS FROM 1-1/4 INCH TO 3 INCH TO GRADE, STAINLESS STEEL SET SCREWS FOR ATTACHMENTS TO YOKEBOX TOP FORD #9501 (38557)	\$11.25	\$1,350.00
3	120.00	EA	0040 - LOCKLESS LIDS - TO FIT 5/8 INCH BY 3/4 INCH FORD YOKEBOX, CATALOG #FLYP1 TO FIT 5-5/8 INCH BY 9-1/8 INCH OPENING FORD #YLL (38352)	\$18.75	\$37,500.00
4	2,000.00	EA	Exception lock & material 0060 - CAST IRON METER BOX AND COVER ASSEMBLIES, FOR 3/4 INCH AND 1 INCH METERS OVAL SHAPE BOX DIMENSIONS: 19-1/4 IN L X 10-3/8 IN W X 11-3/8 IN H COVER DIMENSIONS: 18-5/16 IN L X 9-5/8 IN W X 2 IN H SIGMA #MB281 (38550)	\$18.75	\$1875.00
5	100.00	EA	Exception material. Lid only 0070 - REPLACEMENT COVERS ONLY, 3/4 INCH AND 1 INCH CAST IRON METER BOXES OVAL SHAPE 18-5/16 IN L X 9-5/8 IN W BY 2 IN H SIGMA #MB281 (38351)	No Bid	-
6	480.00	EA	Exception material 0090 - VALVE BOX TOPS AND CAPS, CAST IRON MATERIAL, TYLER 461-S, WITH 10 INCH TOP SECTION BY 9 INCH DIAMETER SIGMA #VB2611 AND VB2600W (64001)	No Bid	-
7	35.00	EA	0100 - VALVE BOX TOPS AND CAPS, CAST IRON MATERIAL, TYLER 461-S, WITH 16 INCH TOP SECTION BY 9 INCH DIAMETER SIGMA #VB2621 AND VB260W (64002)	No Bid	-
8	125.00	EA	0110 - CAST IRON METER BOX AND COVER ASSEMBLIES, FOR 2 INCH METERS	X	X

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00130164

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
9	100.00	EA	SIGMA #MB283 (38330) 0120 - REPLACEMENT COVERS ONLY, 2 INCH CAST IRON METER BOX, SIP INDIA, VULCAN VMB-3 OR SIGMA MB283 (38361)	No Bid	—
10	12.00	EA	0130 - 17 INCH X 30 INCH X 18 INCH RECTANGULAR HIGH PERFORMANCE STRUCTURAL POLYOLEFIN VALVE BOX WITH LOCKING STAINLESS STEEL BOLTS, STRUCTURAL RIBS, DROP-IN METER COVER AND UV INHIBITOR, BLACK/BLACK, BOTTOM MEASURE: 40-1/2 INCH BY 27-1/4 INCH WIDE NDS BRAND #126BCDMB (38335) <i>Exception Box + Locking Lid</i>	\$68.75	\$825.00
11	500.00	EA	0140 - COVER ONLY WITH 2 INCH HOLE TO FIT EXISTING SIGMA BRAND #MB281 (38349)	\$18.75	\$9,375.00
12	500.00	EA	0150 - CAST IRON METER BOX, LESS COVER FOR 3/4 INCH AND 1 INCH WATER METERS, OVAL SHAPE BOX; DIMENSIONS: 19-1/4 INCH LONG X 10-3/8 WIDE X 11-3/8 IN. HEIGHT, SIGMA #MB281 (LESS COVER)	No Bid	—

CORPORATE RESOLUTION

EXCERPT FROM MINUTES OF MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
Nicor
INCORPORATED.

AT THE MEETING OF DIRECTORS OF Nicor
INCORPORATED, DULY NOTICED AND HELD ON 6/7/20,
A QUORUM BEING THERE PRESENT, ON MOTION DULY MADE AND SECONDED. IT
WAS:

RESOLVED THAT Amy Collins, BE AND IS HEREBY
APPOINTED, CONSTITUTED AND DESIGNATED AS AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT OF THE CORPORATION WITH FULL POWER AND AUTHORITY TO ACT ON
BEHALF OF THIS CORPORATION IN ALL NEGOTIATIONS, BIDDING, CONCERNS
AND TRANSACTIONS WITH THE PARISH OF JEFFERSON OR ANY OF ITS AGENCIES,
DEPARTMENTS, EMPLOYEES OR AGENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, THE
EXECUTION OF ALL BIDS, PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, AFFIDAVITS, BONDS, SURETIES,
CONTRACTS AND ACTS AND TO RECEIVE ALL PURCHASE ORDERS AND NOTICES
ISSUED PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF ANY SUCH BID OR CONTRACT, THIS
CORPORATION HEREBY RATIFYING, APPROVING, CONFIRMING, AND ACCEPTING
EACH AND EVERY SUCH ACT PERFORMED BY SAID AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT.

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE FOREGOING TO BE
A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF AN
EXCERPT OF THE MINUTES OF THE ABOVE
DATED MEETING OF THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS OF SAID CORPORATION, AND
THE SAME HAS NOT BEEN REVOKED OR
RESCINDED.



SECRETARY-TREASURER

6/10/20

DATE