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BID NO.: 50-00120177 BID FORM

Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will
only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.
Are you requesting an escalation provision?

YES NO X

MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED %

INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 20 day lead time

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

Global Food Industries, Inc.

FIRM NAME:
ADL : 2961 SW 19th Ter
+ Miami . FL - 33145 il . .
CITY, STATE: ZIP: .
TELEPHONE: ( 786 ) 536-7082 FAX: ( 305 )443-7257
EMAIL ADDRESS: bd(@globalfoodindustnies.com

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge ail addenda on the bid form.Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any ndum on the bid form
will result in bid rejection.

S < o
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: | / ‘Z/j’ Z£ ’ %/\0

NUMBER: 2
NUMBER:

MY COMMISSION # GG 025118
NUMBER: EXPIRES: September 28, 2020

CR AR
O
iaaratt

TCTAL PRIC| ALL BID ITEHS $ .
AUTHORIZE A
SIGNATURE; J«-"ﬂé./«_, ’:)(ﬁ)(g(s?l Sandra Joseph

TiTLE: Executive Administrator

Printed Name

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE

indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
revised per addendum #2



JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

Michael 8. Yenni Brenda C. Patel
Parish President Director
ADDENDUM # 2
Bid No.: 50-00120177 Bid Opening Date: 07/27/2017

For: ONE YEAR CONTRACT TO SUPPLY STAPLE FOOD FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH
DEPARTMENT OF JUVENILE SERVICES

CLARIFICATION:

Please omit the bid form in its entirety. Replace with the attached bid form per Addendum #2.

Please submit revised bid package.

(e SONG

DONNA M EVANS, Buyer il
Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department

Bidders must acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder acknowledges receipt of

this addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to do so will result in bid rejection.

This addendum is a part of the contract documents and modifies the original bidding documents and
specifications. The contents of this addendum shall be included in the contract documents. Changes
made by this addendum shall take precedence over the documents of earlier date.

General Government Bidg. — 200 Derbigny St - Suite 4400 - Gretna, LA 70053
Office 504.364.2678 ~ Fax 504.364.2693
Email: Purchasing@ijeffparish.net Website: www jeffparish.net




Bid Number 50 - 00120177
ONE YEAR CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF STAPLE FOOD FOR THE
- JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF JUVENILE SERVICES

JULY 27, 2017 AT 2:00 PM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
. General Ternis and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing:
Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Donna Evans
DMEvans@lJeffparish.net
504-364-2691

revised per addendum #2




: INVITATION TO BID ;
DATE:  7/11/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER . Page: 1

BID NO.: 50-00120177 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT . i i
P.O. BOX 9 BUYER: DMEVANS@)jeffparish.net

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED IN THE WEST BANK PURCHASING DEPT, SUITE 4400, JEFFERSON PARISH GENERAL GOVERNMENT
BUILDING, 200 DERBIGNY STREET, GRETNA, LA 70053 UNTIL 2:00 PM, 7/27/2017 AND PUBLICLY OPENED THEREAFTER.

For convenience, bidders may also submit bids in the East Bank Purchasing Department, Suite 404, Jefferson Parish
Joseph 8. Yenni Building, 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd., Jefferson LA 70123. However, if submitting bids on the day of bid
opening, bidders must submit at the West Bank location only. All bids will be publicly opened at the West Bank location.

At no charge, bidders may also submit via Jefferson Parish’s electronic procurement page by visiting
www. jeffparishbids.net to register for this free site. Additional instructions are included in the text box highlighting
electronic procurement.

LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED

Unless submitting via online (see Page 3), each bid must be submitted in a sealed envelope bearing on the outside; the name of the
Bidder, his address, and the name of the project for which the bid is submitted and the bid number.

NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN IN INK OR TYPEWRITTEN, AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE
FIRM OR AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC
FIGURES OR SIGNATURES SHALL RESULT IN BID REJECTION.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

THE FOLLOWING INSTRUCTIONS APPLY TO ALL BIDS
All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of
Louisiana Law as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson
Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution No. 113647.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be
downloadad from hitp://purchasing jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor Information. Ctrrent W-8 forms with respective Tax
[dentification numbers and vendor applications may be submitted at any time; however, it your company is not registered and/or
a curient W-9 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a current V/-9 form and respective Tax Identification
numbe- must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract arulor issued purchase order. Failure to do
so may result'in delay of payment. . . ot ¢

All quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or job site, anywhere within the Parish as designated bybthe Purchasing
Department. This provision does not apply to public works projects

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the
project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials
must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or
alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

Bidders should submit all questions in writing and fax them to the Purchasing Department at (504) 364-2693 no later than FIVE 6)
working days prior to bid opening. Bid numbers should be mentioned in all requests. Questions may also be emailed to the buyer for
this bid at the email address listed above. If submitting online, vendors may send questions via the £-Procurement site no later than
Five (5) working days prior to the bid opening.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to
allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions.
The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum. Please note that all official
communication will be expressed in the form of an addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgement on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid
form shall cause the bid to be rejected. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

The purpose and intention of this invitation to bid is to afford all suppliers an equal opportunity to bid on all construction, maintenance,
repair, operating supplies and/or equipment listed in this bid proposal. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM
EACH VENDOR. items bid must meet specifications.

Visit our websits at 0 TR P IHEIASING JEFFPARISH.NET



DATE:  7/111/2017

BID NO.: 50-00120177 Page: 2

JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in
bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item
pricing forms as indicated. Vendors must not alter the bid forms. Doing so will cause the bid to be rejected.

A corporate resolution or written evidence of the individual signing the bid having such authority must be submitted with the bid.
Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected. For corporate entities, such written evidence may be a printout of the Louisiana
Secretary of State's website listing the signatory as an officer. Such printout shall be included with the bid submission. Bids
submitted by Owners or Sole Proprietorships must include certification that he or she owns the entity for which the bid is signed.
This documentation must be submitted with the bid. Failure to do so will result in bid rejection.

NOTE: A sample corporate resolution can be downloaded from our website hitp://purchasing.jeffparish.net or you may provide
your own document. A sample certification of sole proprietorship can also be downloaded from our website
http:/fpurchasing.jeffparish.net or you may provide your own document.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

A. AWARD OF CONTRACT: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual
item basis, or such combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall
be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE
SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE. SPLIT AWARDS MADE TO SEVERAL VENDORS WILL
ONLY BE GRANTED TO THOSE DEEMED RESPONSIVE AND RESPONSIBLE.

All bid prices shall remain valid for 45 days. Jefferson Parish and the lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s) by mutual written
consent may mutually agree to extend the deadline for award by one (1) or more extensions of thirty (30) calendar days.

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submitted a bid in response to this soiicitation may submit a protest in writing to the Director of
the Purchasing within 48 hours of bid opening. The Purchasing Director will review it in connection with the Parish Attorney’s Office
which will then respond in writing as soon as possible.

PREFERENCE: Unless federal funding is directly spent by Jefferson Parish for this purchase, preference is hereby given to materials,
supplies, and provisions produced, manufactured or grown in Louisiana, quality being equal to articles offered by competitors outside
the state. "LSA — R.S. 38:2251-2261"

B. USE OF BRAND NAMES AND 5TOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the
purpose of establishing certain mnimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided
brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award. : .

C. CANCELLATION OF CONTRACT:" JEFFERSON PARISH resérves the right to cancel all or any part if not shipped pro;'zpt!y'. No
charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel any contract at anytime and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

For good cause and as consideration for executing a contract with Jefferson Parish, vendor conveys, sells, assigns and transfers to

Jefferson Parish or its assigns all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the

3n§trust laws o{] the United States and the State of Louisiana, relating to the particular good or services purchased or acquired by
efferson Parish.

D. PRICES: Jefferson Parish is exempt from paying sales tax under LSA-R.S. 47:301 (8)(c). All prices for purchases by Jefferson
Parish of supplies and materials shall be quoted in the unit of measure specified and unless otherwise specified, shall be exclusive of
state and Parish taxes. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals,
the unit price shall prevail.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any
person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the
basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and VIt of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance.with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provisions contained in Section 51.55 (), (d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must
comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s
specifications (ANS! A17.1-1961).

Jefferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federal funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s) that will
provide high quality services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages
the involvement of minority and/or woman-owned business enterprises (DBE’s, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE's) to stimulate
participation in procurement and assistance programs.

revised per addendum #2



DATE:  7/11/2017
BID NO.: 50-00120177 Page: 3
- INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

Advertised bids will be tabulated and a copy of the tabulation will be forwarded to each responding bidder.

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
' , TO ALL VENDORS N i

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing-all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidder’s
submission will be rejected. Please note all requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid

submission.

Please visit our E-Produremenf Page at www.jeffparishbids.net to register and View Jefferson Parish .
solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
' http:lipurchasing.jeffparish.net. -

The general specifications for construction projects and the purchase of materials, services and/or supplies are those adopted by the
JEFFERSON PARISH Council by Resolution No. 113646 or 113647 dated 12/09/09. The general conditions adopted by this
resolution shall be considered as much a part of this document as if they were written wholly herein. A copy may be obtained from the
Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053.

You may also obtain a copy by visiting the Purchasing Department webpage at http://purchasing.jeffparish.net and clicking on Online

Forms.
ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

10,12,13,15, ’

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of attendance.
In accordance with LSAR.S. 38:2212(}), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the MANDATORY pre-bid
conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective bidder who fails to attend the
conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not relieve the bidder of

responsibility for information discussed at the conference, Furthermore, failure to attend the pre-bid conference and inspection
does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing materials or performing any work that may be required to
complete the work in accordance with the specification with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and Code
Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to
the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be
responsible for the payment of these permits and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license number will be
shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected. Additionally if submitting the bid
efectronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to
comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5. ltis the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract. Passageways must be kept
clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at alf times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily
because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions must be exercised at all times fo safeguard the welfare of
JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

revised per addendum #2



DATE:  7/11/12017

Page: 4

BID NO.: 50-00120177

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shall be
recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price
list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All
awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications,
the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract
price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract price
unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicated on the attached “insurance requirements” sheet. All bidders must
comply with the instructions in this sheet. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.
Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in original format (no
copies) If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bond
management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House. No scanned paper copies of any bid
bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on warranties
with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.

Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a separate
item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for construction,
alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS 38:2212.9, LSA-RS
38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders must
submit with bid submissiors COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Mon-Conviction Affidavit,
Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify Affidzvit. For the convenience of
vendors, all affidavits have been combined into oné form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in
its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy
of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with.the bid, however, the sucsessful bidder must submit the

*original affidavit in its origii®al format and without materlal alteration upon contract 8xecution. Failure to comply will result in the bid

submission being rejected as non-respnnsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible
bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions contained
in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders must submit with
bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion Affidavit, Debt Disclosures
Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitied
NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order
to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit
may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without
material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The
Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As such,
the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable certifications
must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with bid submission will
result in bid rejection.

For this project, the Contractor shall not pay any state or local sales or use taxes on materials and equipment which are affixed and
made part of the immovable property of the project or which permanently incorporated in the project (hereinafter referred to as
“applicable materials and equipment”). All purchases of applicable materials or equipment shall be made by the contractor on behalf of
and as the agent of Jefferson Parish (Owner), a political subdivision of the State of Louisiana. No state and local sales and use taxes
are owned on applicable materials and equipment under the provisions of Act 1029 of the 1991 Regular Session ~ Louisiana Revised
Statute 47:301(8)(c). Owner will furnish contractor a certificate form which certifies that Owner is not required to pay such state or local
sales and use taxes, and contractor shall furnish a copy of such certificate to all vendors or suppliers of the applicable materials and
equipment

it shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
leligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a bid,
vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.

revised per addendum #2
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BID NO.: 50-00120177 BID FORM

Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

Al prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will

only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.

Are you requesting an escalation provision?
YES NO X
MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED %
INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 20 day lead time

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

Global Food Industries, Inc.

FIRM NAME:
rpuREss. 2961 SW 19th Ter

ciry, sTaTs: __* ami < M et B
TELEPHONE: (786 ) 5367082 FAX: (305 )443-7257

EMAIL ADDRESS: 0d@globalfoodindustries.com

in the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form.Bidder must

acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowiedge any addendum on the bid form

will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: 1
NUMBER: 2

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

TCTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: §

AUTHORIZED
SIGNATURE:

Sandra Joseph

Printed Name
TiTLE: Executive Administrator

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE

indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
revised per addendum #2
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BID NO.: 50-00120177

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

12.00

20.00

25.00

o
200.00

10.00

200.00

EA

Ccs

cs

cs

CcSs

CSs

ONE YEAR CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF
STAPLE FOOD FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH
DEPARTMENT OF JUVENILE SERVICES

ONE (1)YEAR CONTRACT TO SUPPLY STAPLE

FOOD FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT

OF JUVENILE SERVICES

0001 - ALLSPICE GROUND WHOLE

BRAND:

PACKED:

0002 - APPLE CIDER VINEGAR

(NOT WHITE VINEGAR

BRAND:

PACKED:

0003 - APPLE CIDER VINEGAR PASTEURIZED
1 GALLON

BRAND:

PACKED:

0004 - APPEE JUICE, UNSWEETENED, 150
PERCENT MADE FROM CONCENTRATE
BRAND:

PACKED:

0005 - APPLES PIE FILLING

LITE NO SUGAR ADDED PER CASE: 12/21
OUNCE

BRAND:

PACKED:

0006 - APPLES SLICED PACKED IN ITS OWN
JUICE OR WATER. US NO. 1 HEAVY SYRUP,

LIGHT SYRUP, ARTIFICIAL COLORS, FLAVORS,
SWEETENERS, HFCS.

BRAND:

revised per addendum #2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid *

No Bid

No Bid
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BID NO.: 50-00120177

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 7

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

1

12

13

50.00

200.00

20.00

20.00

30.00

12.00

40.00

Ccs

CSs

(o2

EA

Cs

CS

cs

PACKED:

0007 - APPLESAUCE SINGLE SERVE IN A CUP
PROVIDES 1/2 CUP FRUIT FLAVORS, ORIGINAL
4-4.5 OUNCE INDIVIDUAL CUP. NO ADDED
SUGARS, CORN SYRUP OR ARTIFICIAL
SWEETENERS. HFCS. US NO.1

BRAND:

PACKED:

0008 - APRICOTS, CANNED PACKED IN IT'S
OWN JUICE OR WATER. US NO 1. NO HEAVY

SYRUP, LIGHT SYRUP, ARTIFICIAL COLORS,
FLAVORS, SWEETENERS, HCFS

BRAND:

PACKED:

0009 - ARTIFICIAL SUGAR SUBSTITUTE
SWEETENER, SACCHARIN, SUCRALOSE
INDIVIDUAL 1 GRAM

BRAND:

PACKED:

0010 - BAKING POWDER, DOUBLE ACTING

BRAND:
PACKED:

0011 - BAKING SODA PURE BICARBONATE
OF SODA

BRAND:
PACKED:

0012 - BASE, GUMBO, SMOKEHOUSE
CONTAINERS PER CASE.

BRAND:
PACKED:

0013 - BATTER, KRISPY KRUNCH D

revised per addendum #2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

“‘NoBid ..

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




DATE: 7111/2017 Page 8
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

BRAND:
PACKED:

14 20.00 EA 0014 - BAY LEAF WHOLE VACUUM PACKED No Bid
BRAND:
PACKED:

15 10.00 cs 0015 - BEANS, CHILI No Bid
BRAND:
PACKED:

16 200.00 cs 0016 - BEANS, GREEN CUT US GRADE A FANCY No Bid
MIDWESTERN, 4 SIEVE STRING LEE CUT
ROUND TYPE. 1-1/2 TO 1-3/4 INCH LENGTH.
MIN DRAINED WEIGHT 63 OUNCES. GRADE A
FANCY. NO ADDED SALT.
BRAND:
PACKED:

No Bid

17 30,00 SACK 0017 -BEANS, PINTO US NO 1 . .
BRAND:
PACKED:

18 50.00 cs 0018 - BEANS, PINTO, LOW SODIUM REFRIED No Bid
2 OUNCS GRAIN EQUIVALENT MIME PER
12 CUP SERVING. NO MSG OR SALT
SUBSTITUTES, TRANS FAT, LARD. NO MORE
THAN 5 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 2 PERCENT
SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT SODIUM PER
1/2 CUP SERVING.
BRAND:
PACKED:

19 90.00 EA 0019 - BEANS, PORK-N-BEANS, FLAVOR No Bid
BLEND OR NORTHERN BEANS AND PORK.
BRAND:

revised per addendum #2
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BID NO.: 50-00120177
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

50.00

40.00

10.00

50.00

10.00

40.00

20.00

SACK

CcSs

Cs

CSs

CcS

SACK

CS

PACKED:

0020 - BEANS, RED KIDNEY US NUMBER 1

BRAND:

PACKED:

0021 - BEEF BASE SOUP, FRESHLY ROASTED
BEEF FROM LEAN PROMAL CUTS, NO BONES,
VEINS OR ORGAN MEAT. THICK PASTE CONSIS-
TENCY, DARK BROWN COLOR WITH NATURAL
ROASTED BEEF AROMA. 9 PERCENT FAT. ONE
POUND YIELDS 5 GALLONS OF STOCK. USDA
INSPECTED NO MSG AND LOW SODIUM,
BRAND:

PACKED:

0022 - BEEF BROTH CONCENTRATE

STICK POUCHES 100/9.6 GRAMS

BRAND:

PACKED:

0023 - BEETS, SALAD CANNED SLICED

US GRADE C MEDIUM SIZE, MIN DRAINED
WEIGHT 68 OUNCES.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0024 - BISCUIT MiX, NO PEANUT PRODUCTS
MUST LIST ALL INGREDIENTS

BRAND:

PACKED:

0025 - BLACK-EYED DRY PEAS US NO 1

BRAND:
PACKED:

0026 - BREAD CRUMBS, ITALIAN STYLE 12

revised per addendum #2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Uim

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

27

28

29

30

31

32

40.00

100.00

200.00

. 20.00

200.00

200.00

cs

Ccs

cs

cs

Cs

Ccs

.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0027 - CAKE MIX, CHOCOLATE

PUDDING IN THE MIX, YIELDS 384 SQUARES.
BRAND:

PACKED:

0028 - CAKE MIX, YELLOW PUDDING IN THE
MiX, NO PEANUT PRODUCTS. MUST LIST ALL
INGREDIENTS.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0029 - CARROTS, SLICED US GRADE A, NO. 1
MEDIUM FANCY, NO ADDED SALT.

BRAND:

PACKED:
0030 - CELERY DEHYDRATED CHOPPED

BRAND:

PACKED:
0031 - CEREAL BARS, GOLDEN GRAHAMS

BRAND:

PACKED:

0032 - CEREAL, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH,
1 OUNCE SELF SERVE BOWL.:

MINIMUM 1 OUNCE GRAIN EQUIVALENT TO PER
SERVING. 25 PERCENT LESS SUGAR THAN
CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH. WHOLE WHEAT. NO
TRANS FAT. NO MORE THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL
FAT, 0 PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM, 6 GRAMS OF SUGAR PER OUNCE.

BRAND:

revised per addendum #2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U/M

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

33

34

35

36

37

200.00

200.00

90.00

90.00

200.00

cs

Ccs

cs

cs

Ccs

PACKED:

0033 - CEREAL, CORN SELF SERVE BOWL,

1 OUNCE SELF SERVE BOWL.:

MINIMUM 1 OUNCE GRAIN EQUIVALENT TO PER
SERVING. 25 PERCENT LESS SUGAR THAN
CHEX. WHOLE CORN. NO

TRANS FAT. NO MORE THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL
FAT, 0 PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM, 6 GRAMS OF SUGAR PER OUNCE.
BRAND:

PACKED:

0034 - CEREAL, CORN/OAT FLAKE, HONEY
FLAVORED, 1 OUNCE SELF SERVE BOWL.:
MINIMUM 1 OUNCE GRAIN EQUIVALENT TO PER
SERVING. 25 PERCENT LESS SUGAR THAN
HONEY BUNCHES OF OATS. NO

TRANS FAT. NO MORE THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL
FAT, 0 PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM, 6 GRAMS OF SUGAR PER OUNCE.
BRAND:

PACKED:

0035 - CEREAL, NO SUZ<R ADDED RAISINS

1 OUMCE SELF SERVE BOWL. .UNSWEETENED
BRAND:

PACKED:

0036 - CEREAL, NO SUGAR ADDED SELF SERVE
BOWL UNSWEETENED (CORN FLAKES, RICE
KRISPIES, SPECIAL K, ETC.)

BRAND:

PACKED:

0037 - CEREAL, PUFFED CORN,

SELF SERVE BOWL, 1 OUNCE SERVING. MIN 1
OUNCE GRAIN EQ PER SERVING. CHEX, WHOLE
CORN. NO TRANS FAT. NO MORE THAN 3
PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 0 PERCENT SATURATED
FAT, 10 PERCENT SODIUM, 6 GRAMS OF SUGAR
PER SERVING.

BRAND:

revised per addendum #2

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

PACKED:

38 90.00 cs 0038 - CEREAL, RAISIN BRAN OR EQUAL No Bid
96 COUNT
BRAND:
PACKED:

No Bid

39 100.00 cs 0039 - CEREAL, SUGAR ADDED SELF SERVE oH
BOWL SWEETENED (FROSTED FLAKES, APPLE
JACKS, SUGAR POPS, NUT AND HONEY
CRUNCH, CORN POPS, COCOA KRISPIES, HONEY
SMACKS AND FRUIT LOOPS OR EQUAL.
BRAND:
PACKED:

40 50.00 cs 0040 - CEREALS, CHEERIOS No Bid
LARGE SIZE BOX
BRAND:
PACKED:

.4 7000 | . CS 0041 - CEREALS, CRISPED (RICE KRISPIES) _ NoBid |
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid

42 200.00 cs 0042 - CEREALS, MINI SHREDDED WHEAT
FROSTED SELF SERVE BOWL
1 OUNCE SERVING. NO TRANS FAT. NO MORE
THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 0 PERCENT
SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT SODIUM, 6
GRAMS OF SUGAR PER SERVING.
BRAND:
PACKED:

43 20.00 cs 0043 - CEREALS, PEANUT BUTTER (RICE No Bid

KRISPIES)

BRAND:

PACKED:

revised per addendum #2
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: §0-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY uma DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid
44 80.00 cs 0044 - CEREALS, VITAMIN FORTIFIED FLAKE
CEREAL CORN FLAKES.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid
45 20.00 cs 0045 - CHEESE 'N CRACKERS,
6 PER PACKAGE INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid
46 20.00 o] 0046 - CHEESE, NACHO
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid
47 20.00 cs 0047 - CHEESE, PARMESAN, GRATED
BRAND:
PACKED:
Y : .
No Bid
48 200.00 cs 0048 - CHEESE’N CRACKERS, PEANUT BUTTER,
6 CRACKERS PER PACKAGE
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid
49 40.00 cs 0049 - CHERRIES, MARASCHINO HALVES RED
COLOR. PACKED IN LIGHT SYRUP.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No Bid
50 10.00 cs 0050 - CHERRY PIE FILLING
LITE NO SUGAR ADDED PER CASE: 12/21
OUNCE
BRAND:
PACKED:

revised per addendum #2
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

uim

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

51

52

53

54

55

56

40.00

10.00

10.00

200.00

100.00

10.00

Ccs

Ccs

cs

cs

Ccs

EA

0051 - CHICKEN BASE SOUP COOKED
CHICKEN MEAT IN NATURAL PROPORTION, NO

ORGAN MEAT, VEINS, BONES OR ADDED SKIN,
THICK PASTE CONSISTENCY, RICH GOLDEN
COLOR WITH FRESH CHICKEN AROMA, MAXIMUM
SODIUM AND FAT 16 PERCENT. ONE POUND
YIELDS 5 GALLONS OF STOCK. USDA INSPECT-
ED. LOW SODIUM, NO MSG

BRAND:

PACKED:

0052 - CHICKEN BROTH CONGENTRATE

STICK POUCHES 100/9.6 GRAMS

BRAND:

PACKED:

0053 - CHICKEN NOODLE SOUP

ADD NO WATER. READY TO EAT. LOW SODIUM
PER CASE: 12/10.75 OUNCE

BRAND:

PACKED:

. &

0054 - CHICKEN, PULLED, CANNED NO MEAT .
BY-PRODUCTS, CEREALS, EXTENDERS, NO MORE

THAN 8 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 9 PERCENT
SATURATED FAT, 9 PERCENT SODIUM PER 2
OUNCE SERVINGS. GRADE A,

BRAND:

PACKED:

0055 - CHICKEN, STOCK LOW SODIUM,

0 PERCENT TOTAL FAT AND SATURATED FAT

NO MORE THAN 10 PERCENT OF SODIUM PER
1 CUP SERVING.

BRAND:
PACKED:

0056 - CHILI POWDER

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

57

58

58

60

61

62

60.00

100.00

120.00

50.00

100.00

100.00

Ccs

cs

cs

Ccs

Cs

Cs

BRAND:
PACKED:

0057 - CHILI WITHOUT BEANS

BRAND:
PACKED:

0058 - CHINESE DUCK SAUCE

BRAND:

PACKED:

0058 - CHIPS, LAYS BAKED POTATO

BRAND:

PACKED:

0060 - CHIPS, TORTILLA MISSION YELLOW
ROUND

BRAND:

PACKED:

0061 - CHIPS, TORTILLA, WHOLE CORN

1 OUNCE GRAIN EQ PER SERVING. NO TRANS
FAT. NO MORE THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 0
PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 5 PERCENT SODIUM;
ROUND SHAPE,

BRAND:

PACKED:

0062 - CHIPS, WHOLE GRAIN, 1 OUNCE GRAIN
EQ PER SERVING. SUN CHIPS, ORIGINAL,
GARDEN SALSA. WHOLE GRAINS. NO TRANS FAT
NO MORE THAN 10 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, §
PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 150 MG SODIUM PER
1 OUNCE SERVING: MINIMUM 2 GRAM FIBER
PER 1 OUNCE

BRAND:

PACKED:

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
63 200.00 cs 0063 - CINNAMON TEDDY GRAHAMS SNACK PACK No bid
3 OUNCE SINGLE SERVING. PACKED
INDIVIDUAL SERVINGS TO A CASE. MADE WITH
PURE VEGETABLE SHORTENING. NO PALM OIL
OR LARD, CHOLESTEROL FREE, LOW SODIUM
AND SATURATED FAT.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
64 40.00 CN 0064 - CINNAMON, GROUND DRIED BARK OF
CINNAMON BURMANNI
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
65 24.00 EA 0065 - COCOA NATURAL PROCESS
UNSWEETENED 16 OUNCE SIZE
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
66 40.00 cs 0066 - COFFEE, ALL PURPOSE MAXWELL :
R . HOUSE . . ¥
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
67 200.00 cs 0067 - COLLARD GREENS US GRADE A
NO ADDED SALT. US NO 1 FAIRLY TENDER
CLEAN WELL TRIMMED
BRAND:
PACKED:
68 90.00 cs 0068 - COOKIES OLD FASHION SUGAR BULK No bid
BRAND:
PACKED:
bid
69 40.00 cs 0069 - COOKIES, ANIMAL CRACKERS No bi
(SINGLE SERVE) PER CS: 100/1 OUNCE

revised per addendum #2
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

70

71

72

73

74

75

76

100.00

100.00

200.00

80.00

100.00

120.00

200.00

Ccs

Cs

cs

cs

Ccs

Cs

BRAND:
PACKED:

0070 - COOKIES, OATMEAL RAISIN
OLD FASHION ’

BRAND:

PACKED:

0071 - COOKIES, OLD FASHION CHOCOLATE
CHIP

BRAND:

PACKED:

0072 - COOKIES, OLD FASHION VARIETY PACK
IN TRAY

BRAND:

PACKED:

0073 - COOKIES, PEANUT BUTTER »
OLD FASHION KEEBLER BULK

BRAND:
PACKED:

0074 - COOKIES, VANILLA WAFERS

BRAND:
PACKED:

0075 - CORN CREAM STYLE A, US GRADE A
FANCY

BRAND:
PACKED:

0076 - CORN, WHOLE KERNEL US GRADE A
FANCY GOLDEN MINIMUM DRAINED WEIGHT 70

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

77

78

79

80

81

82

83

60.00

40.00

20.00

40.00

40.00

90.00

70.00

cs

cs

SACK

Cs

Cs

CS

Ccs

OUNCES C ENAMEL LINED CANS US NO 1. NO
ADDED SALT.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0077 - CORNBREAD MiX, NO PEANUT
PRODUCTS MUST LIST ALL INGREDIENTS.
BRAND:

PACKED:

0078 - CORNBREAD STUFFING MIX INSTANT
CHICKEN FLAVOR, STOVE TOP

BRAND:

PACKED:

0079 - CORNMEAL YELLOW NEW PROCESS
MEETS ALL FEDERAL SPECIFICATIONS

BRAND:
PACKED:

. . . - .
0080 - CORNSTARCH
13 PERCENT MOISTURE

BRAND:
PACKED:

0081 - CRACKERS, ANIMAL GRAHAM COOKIES
MADE WITH ENRICHED FLOUR, LOWFAT

BRAND:
PACKED:

0082 - CRACKERS, MULTIGRAIN WHOLE WHEAT

BRAND:

PACKED:

0083 - CRACKERS, SALTED SODA FRESH GOOD
QUALITY, 2 TO A PACK.

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER QUANTITY

uim

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

84 100.00

85 100.00

86 100.00

87 30.00

88 12.00

89 100.00

80 100.00

cs

cs

cs

Cs

(o]

cs

BRAND:

PACKED:

0084 - CRACKERS, WHEAT REDUCED FAT
TRISCUITS, WHOLE WHEAT FLOUR, NO TRANS
FAT. NO MORE THAN 3 PERCENT TOTAL FAT,

2 PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0085 - CRACKERS ,WHEAT THINS, WHOLE WHEAT
FLOUR. NO TRANS FAT, NO MORE THAN 3 PER-

CENT TOTAL FAT, 2 PERCENT SATURATED FAT,
10 PERCENT SODIUM.

BRAND:
PACKED:

0086 - CRANBERRY JUICE, OCEAN SPRAY

BRAND:
PACKED:

0087 - CREAMER, NON-DAIRY POWDER

BRAND:

PACKED:

0088 - CUMIN GROUND POWDER

BRAND:

PACKED:

0089 - CUSTOM CULINARY PANROAST LOW
SODIUM BROWN GRAVY MIX

BRAND:

PACKED:

0090 - CUSTOM CULINARY PANROAST LOW
SODIUM CHICKEN FLAVORED GRAVY

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

91

92

93

94

95

96

200.00

40.00

40.00

-
240.00

200.00

200.00

cs

SACK

BG

CSs

Ccs

Ccs

BRAND:

PACKED:

0091 - DRESSING DIP CUP, RANCH MINIMUM

0.5 OUNCE. SOYBEAN OIL, NO HIGH FRUCTOSE
CORN SYRUP, NO MORE THAN 5 PERCENT TOTAL
FAT, 3 PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM, 6 GRAMS OF SUGAR PER SERVING.
BRAND:

PACKED:
0092 - FLOUR, PLAIN ENRICHED

BRAND:
PACKED:

0083 - FLOUR, YELLOW CORN

BRAND:
PACKED:

L] -
0094 - FRUIT COCKTAIL, CANNED -
US GRADE A PACKED IN NATURAL JUICE
CONTAINS PEACHES, PEARS, PINEAPPLE,
CHERRIES AND GRAPES. CUT IN 1/2 INCH
CUTS.
BRAND:
PACKED:
0095 - FRUIT CUP INDIVIDUAL MIXED
FRUIT. GRADE A PACKED IN IT'S OWN JUICE
OR WATER.
BRAND:
PACKED:
0096 - FRUIT CUP, 4 OUNCE INDIVIDUAL
CUP. MIXED FRUIT. NO HEAVY SYRUPS, LIGHT

SYRUP, ARTIFICIAL COLORS, FLAVORS,
SWEETENERS, HFCS. US NO. 1 GRADE A,

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

NO bid

No bid

No bid
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

97

98

98

100

101

102

90.00

96.00

30.00

10.00

40.00

200.00

Cs

EA

CS

cs

cs

CS

PACKED IN JUICE OR WATER.

BRAND:

PACKED:

0097 - FRUIT JUICE BOX PURE APPLE WITH
STRAWS 100 PERCENT PURE FRUIT JUICE

APPLE ASEPTIC PACK TO BE SHELF STABLE,
TETRA BRIK PACK WITH STRAWS.

BRAND:

PACKED:
0098 - GARLIC GRANULATED

BRAND:

PACKED:

0099 - GARLIC, CHOPPED FRESH, NO
PRESERVATIVES OR SALT. NOT PACKED IN OIL
BRAND:

PACKED:

61 00 - GATORADE G2 LOW C;\LOR!E

POWDER MIX PER CASE: 32/2.5 GALLONS

ASSORTED PACK INCLUDES: FRUIT PUNCH AND
GRAPE

BRAND:

PACKED:

0101 - GELATIN FRUIT FLAVORED: GRAPE,
ORANGE, CHERRY, MIXED FRUIT. DRY MiX.
BRAND:

PACKED:

0102 - GIANT GRAHAM GOLDFISH, MIN 1
OUNCE GRAIN EQ PER SERVING. PEPPERIDGE
FARM. WHOLE WHEAT. NO TRANS FAT. NO
MORE THAN 10 PERCENT TOTAL FAT, 5

PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT SODIUM
6 SUGARS PER 0.9 OUNCE SERVING.

revised per addendum #2

No bid

No bid

No bid

s

No bid

No bid

No bid
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BID NO.: 50-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
BRAND:
PACKED:
103 40.00 cs 0103 - GINGERBREAD MIX No bid
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
104 100.00 cs 0104 - GRAHAM CRACKERS HONEY 3 COUNT
PACKS, ENRICHED WITH FIBER, 100 PERCENT
VEGETABLE SHORTENING, INDIVIDUALLY
WRAPPED,
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
105 200.00 cs 0105 - GRANOLA BAR, CRUNCHY OAT & HONEY
NATURE VALLEY, APPLE. NO TRANS FAT, PEA-
NUT FLOUR, NUTS, HIGH FRUCTOSE CORN
SYRUP, NO MORE THAN 5 PERCENT FAT, 3
PERCENT SATURATED FAT, 10 PERCENT
SODIUM, 20 PERCENT SUGAR; AT LEAST 2
GRAMS FIBER PER SERVING,
. BRAND: . e
PACKED:
106 200.00 cs 0106 - GRAPE JUICE, NO ARTIFICIAL Nobid
FLAVORS, VITAMIN C ENRICHED AND NO
ADDED SUGAR
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
107 30.00 cs 0107 - GRAPEFRUIT JUICE, 100% PURE
MADE FROM CONCENTRATE
BRAND:
PACKED:
108 40.00 cs 0108 - GRAVY MIX INSTANT DRY MIXES No bid
RECONSTITUTES WITH WATER. FLAVORS ARE
BEEF, CHICKEN, PORK AND TURKEY.

revised per addendum #2
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BID NO.: 50-00120177 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
109 20.00 cs 0109 - GREEN BELL PEPPERS DEHYDRATED
CHOPPED.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
110 100.00 (of] 0110 - GRITS QUICK ENRICHED WHITE HOMINY
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
111 12.00 EA 0111 - GUMBO FILE’
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
112 20 00 Cs 0112 - GUMBO MIX DEHYDRATED SEASONINGS
WITH CONTROLLED SPICES. NO MSG, CAJUN
. GUMBO MIX . *
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
113 12,00 cs 0113 - GUMBO MIX, CAJUN LOUISIANA FISH o
FRY PRODUCT
BRAND:
PACKED:
114 No bid
40.00 cs 0114 - HAM BASE SOUP DRY MEAT, SODIUM
CONTENT NOT TO EXCEED 15 PERCENT AND
FAT CONTENT NOT TO EXCEED 8 PERCENT. ONE
POUND YIELDS 5 GALLONS. NO MSG.
BRAND:
PACKED:
No bid
115 1,400.00 LB 0115 - HAM, BONELESS, SKINLESS, CURED
AND SMOKE, PRESSED, FULLY COOKED., (NO

revised per addendum #2
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

116 40.00

117 20.00

118 16.00

119 60.00

120 80.00

121 30.00

cs

Cs

EA

cs

Ccs

CcS

MORE THAN 15 PERCENT WATER ADDED).
BRAND:
PACKED:

0116 - HONEY PURE

BRAND:

PACKED:

0117 - ICE CREAM CONES, SMALL

BRAND:

PACKED:

0118 - ITALIAN SPICE BLEND SEASONING
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