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Central Bidding Time: Fri March 24, 2017 3:29:13 PM GMT-6

Location: Metairie > > USA

Name: Geary Carbine

Email: gcarbine@deltaprocess.com

Address: 3021 21st Street

Zip code: 70002

Contact number: 15048337867

NIGP Codes: 72012 - Booster or Circulating Pumps, In-Line

(Commodity code categories) 79015 - Centrifugal Pumps, Portable
72017 - Centrifugal Pumps, Compact, Submersible
72018 - Centrifugal Pumps, Stationary
72025 - Dry Pit Sludge Pumps
72040 - Mechanical Pumps and Accessories

72056 - Pumps, Miscellaneous (Not Otherwise
Classified)

72064 - Sewage and Sludge Pumps, Submersible

72067 - Sewage and Sludge Pumps, Surface
Mounted

72073 - Sump Pumps, Submersible and Non-
Submersible

72079 - Trash Pumps, Portable, Engine-Driven

72082 - Water Pumps and Accessories (See 060-35
for Automotive Type)

89023 - Elements, Primary (Flow, Pressure,
Temperature, etc.)

https://www.centralauctionhouse.com/members/deItaprocessequipment.html?&feedback=s. .. 3/24/2017
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89028 - Instrumentation Equipment, Parts and
Accessories (Actuators, Analyzers, Regulators,
Controllers, Transducers, etc.)

89066 - Sewer Lift Stations and Parts

89069 - Sumps, Parts, and Accessories (See 720-73
for Sump Pumps)

89070 - Switches (Pressure, Flow, Level,
Proximity, Temperature, etc.)

89074 - Transmitters (Pressure, Flow, Level, etc.)

Where To?
% Main Menu

Home - Central Bidding - Register - ContactUs -
Terms

Renew/Upgrade Membership

Central Auction House, LTD
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Central Bidding Time: Fri March 24, 2017 3:29:34 PM GMT-6
Place a Bid for 5000119244 - QUANTITY OF PUMP PARTS AND EQUIPMENT

Please enter your best bid proposal for this project

-Louisiana Contractor ID#

i 1
| !

{
i H

Enter all information required on the outside of the sealed envelope in the box below

g | |
a | |

Bid Bond # - PR

f
i H
H {

Jefferson Parish Vendor #:

Upload Attachment(s)

While this site accepts various file types. sizes and quantities, the preferred method for delivering all of the appropriate and
required bid documents is one single scanned PDF file. Vendors submitting bids with multiple uploaded imagesiphotos of hid

https://www.centralauctionhouse.com/Do/ShowBidForm/71657756/14218 3/24/2017
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responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible. the bidder’s submission will be rejected.
Please note all requirements in this bid package for electronic bid submission.

Upload a file
Click the Upload button in order to upload bid related documents

Home - Central Bidding - Register - ContactUs -
Terms

Renew/Upgrade Membership

Central Auction House, LTD

https://www.centralauctionhouse.com/Do/ShowBidForm/71657756/14218 3/24/2017
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5000119244 - QUANTITY OF PUMP PARTS AND EQUIPMENT
Jefferson Parish Government

Project documents obtained from www.CentralBidding.com
15-Mar-2017 04:02:32 PM



Louistana

Bid Number 50-00119244

QUANTITY OF PUMP PARTS AND EQUIPMENT

BID DUE: MARCH 24, 2017 AT 11:00 AM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing
Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Misty A. Camardelle
Buyer Email: mcamardelle@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683
FAX: 504-364-2693




JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

Michael 8. Yenni Brenda J. Campos
Parish President Director

CHANGES TO JEFFERSON PARISH BIDDING PROCEDURES

The East bank Office of Purchasing is now open! We are located in the Joseph S. Yenni
Building, 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd,, Suite 404, Jefferson, LA 70123. Bidders may submit
bid responses at this location, pending authorization in each bid package. Bidders should
carefully read and must respond accordingly per the requirements of the bid
packages. NOTE: Bidders submitting bids on the day of bid opening, bidders must
submit at the West Bank location only.

Other Changes Continued:

e Effective June 1, 2017, bidders may no longer send bid responses via facsimile, as
some bid solicitations may provide. Vendors responding to bid solicitations may
only submit via USPS, courier service, hand delivery or via online by registering free
of charge at www.jeffparishbids.net. For more information, please contact the
Purchasing Department or visit jeffparish.net.

e Affidavits (Non-Public Works Affidavit or Public Works Affidavit) - as you are

aware, bidders are required to submit affidavits pursuant to LA public bid law and
Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. Bidders must read each bid package to ensure
compliance. Effective August 1, 2016, affidavits are required with bid submission.
While copies are acceptable to include with bid submission, original affidavits are
required upon contract execution. Original affidavits are encouraged with bid
submission.

o Current W9 Forms and vendor applications may be submitted at any time; however,
if your company is not registered and/or a current W-9 form is not on file, a current
W-9 form must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a
contract and/or issued a purchase order.

¢ Upon contract execution, successful bidder must continue producing final insurance
certificates per standard Jefferson Parish insurance requirements. Proof of
insurance is required for bidding purposes. Bidders must read the insurance
requirements attachment included in each bid package for specific instructions.

Bidders should reference the “Additional Requirements” section of the bid
instructions and/or the “Important Notice to Bidders” included in the bid package
for specific requirements to respond accordingly.

For more information, please call Jefferson Parish Purchasing at 504-364-2678.

General Government Bldg. — 200 Derbigny St - Suite 4400 - Gretna, LA 70053
Office 504.364.2678 ~ Fax 504.364.2693

Email: Purchasing@ieffparish.net  Website: www.jeffparish.net



INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
DATE:  3/M14/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 50-00119244 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: MCAMARD

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 3/24/2017 via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at www jeffparishbids.net.

This site is free for all Jefferson Parish vendors. For additional information on registration or use of this free site,
please see the text box highlighting electronic procurement.

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution

No. 113647. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053, You may also obtain a copy by visiting the
Purchasing Department webpage at purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from http://purchasing.jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor information. Current W-9 forms with respective Tax
identification numbers and vendor applications may be submitted at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or
a current W-9 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a current W-9 form and respective Tax Identification
number must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract and/or issued purchase order. Failure to do
so may result in delay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from paymient of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be
based on F.0.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID
ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. ltems bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise
indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete
and return the associated line item pricing forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in
unit prices and totals, the unit prices shall prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its
judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submitted a bid in response to this solicitation may submit a protest in writing to the Director of the Purchasing
within 48 hours of bid opening. The Purchasing Director will review it in connection with the Parish Attorney's Office as appropriate and a written

response will be provided as soon as possible.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage
unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any

time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless
otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one (1) year
guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated
and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

if this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to allow bidders the
opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will
issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause
the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of establishing certain
minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete
product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any person in the United
States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1975, or with
respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except
that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and Vii of
the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final
handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), {d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects
Zl\!.;qsé fXT1p7ly1wig16?;adion 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s specifications
-1 .

Jefferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federai funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s) that will provide high quality
services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages the involvement of minority and/or
woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE's, WBE’s and SBE's) to stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.



DATE: 31472017
Page: 2
BID NO.: 50-00119244

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT

TO ALL VENDORS -

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidder’s
submission will be rejected. Please note all requitr)emeqts contained in this bid package for electronic bid
- submission.

Please visit our E-Procurement Page at www.jeffparishbids.net to register and view Jefferson Parish
solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
http:/fpurchasing.jeffparish.net. L :

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(l), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective
bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the

project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any
and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor’s License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field
in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5. ltis the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract.
Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material
must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions
must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.




DATE:  3/14/2017
Page: 3
BID NO.: 50-00119244
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

7. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal
contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officic Recorder of
Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court
and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 wil require both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of
the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

8. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

9. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

10. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicated on the attached "insurance requirements” sheet. All bidders
must comply with the instructions in this sheet. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected.

11. A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the tota! bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House. No
scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

12. This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
representations on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications.

13. Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
quoted as a %eparate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

14. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including:
Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Coliusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify
Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID
AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration
upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

15. NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been
combined into one form entitied NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT, This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material aiteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next iowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with
bid submission will result’in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  3/14/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00119244 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

MCAMARD

VENDOR; 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER:

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the

Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according
to standard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation

supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 3-4 weeks ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection. '

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW #***
FIRM NAME:
Delta Process Equipment
SIGNATURE: . TITLE:
(Must be signed nere)  ICAYY Carbine Sales Representative
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
Geary Carbine
ADDRESS:
3017 21st, Suite 209
CITY, STATE: :
STATE Metairie, LA “% 70002
TELEPHONE: FAX:
(504 833-7867 604 833-1755
EMAIL ADDRESS:
gcarbine @deltaprocess.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § 2,756.47




DATE: 3/14/2017

- BID NO.: 50-00119244

Page: 5

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

uma

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

6.00

1.00

2.00

4.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

30.00

6.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

QUANTITY OF PUMP PARTS AND EQUIPMENT

0010 - ASSEMBLY, FLAP VALVE, TO INCLUDE
HOUSING AND FLAPPER, 4 IN.,

HYDROMATIC PUMP PART NO. §1729-000-5,
FOR MODEL NO. 40MP, 40MMP, 40MPH
SK NUMBER 00-0685010

0020 - NUT, IMPELLER, HYDROMATIC

NOQ. 00852-007-1, FOR PUMP MODEL

NO. 6oMP

SK NUMBER 00-0685360

0030 - RING, SNAP, EXTERNAL, HYDROMATIC
NO. 00975-015-1, FOR PUMP MODEL

NO. 60MP

SK NUMBER 00-068734B

0040 - RING, SNAP, INTERNAL,
HYDROMATIC NO. 974-004-1

SK NUMBER 00-0687400

0050 - LUG, SEALING FLANGE, 12 IN.,
HYDROMATIC NO. 11460-000-2, FOR PUMP
MODEL NO. $12LX

SK NUMBER 00-068945F

0060 - VOLUTE, GORMAN RUPP PUMP

NO. 2526, FOR MODEL NO. 14A2-B

SK NUMBER 00-0675130

0070 - SLEEVE, SEAL, HYDROMATIC PUMP
PART NO. 02310-006-3 FOR MODEL

NO. S12LX7500FB

SK NUMBER 00-0687100

0080 - SEAL, MECHANICAL, 1-1/2 IN,,
SINGLE, TYPE 21, CERANMIC VS CARBON,
REMOVABLE ROTARY FACE AND BELLOWS,
EQUAL TO A HYDROMATIC NO. 920-001-1,

SPING IS 2-7/16 INCH
SK NUMBER 00-0686820

0090 - SHAFT, HYDROMATIC NO. 946-003-3,
FOR 4 IN. MODEL EXCEPT CLOSE COUPLED

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

$2,756.47

$2,756.47

no bid

no bid

no bid




DATE: 3/14/2017

Page: 8
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00119244 SEALED BID
NL‘,L,EE;?;R QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES Ugg&?gfs TOTALS
SK NUMBER 00-0688650
Quoting Genuyine Gprman Rupp OEM Parts




o W-0

{Rev. October 2007}

Dapariment of ths Troosury
intornal Ravenis Servico

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

# 756

Give form 1o the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Name {as shown on your Income tax returm)
DXP ENTERPRISES, INC.

Business name, If dilferont from above
DELTA PROCESS EQUIPMENT, INC

List account number{s} hero {optional)

o

3

g

&

«
2 £ | Check appropriate box: [} 71 ¢ s i
g% D Limited fiabifily company, Enter the |ax itication {D=di: entity, G Ps 1) ) D gz;;y;pl
52 [Z] Othor fgen instuctians) »
§ g Address (number, strect, and apt. or suite no} Requoster's name and address (oplional)
8 o | PO BOX 969 8275 FLORIDA BLVD

G [ Gy, state, and 28 codo -

& | DENHAM SPRINGS LA 70727 DENHAM SPRINGS LA 70726

@

&

Taxpayer ldentification Number {TIN)

Enter your TIN In the appropriato box, The TIN provided must match the name given on Line 1 to avoid | Soclal security aumber

backup withholding. For individuals, this Is your social security number (SSN). However, for a resident : :

alien, soloe proprictor, or disregarded entity, ses the Part | instructions on page 3. For other entitles, it Is

your employer identification number (EIN). f you do not have a number, sea How to got & TIN on page 3. or .

Note, If the account is in more than one name, see the chart on page 4 for guidelines on whose Employor identitication number ‘]
76 0509661

number to entor.

Certification

Usner penaities of perjury, | cenlify that

1, The mimber shown on this form Is my comrest taxpayer identification nurber {or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me), and

2. i am not subject to backup withholding because; (a) { am oxempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not beoen notifled by the Internat
Revenus Sorvice (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a {ailure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) tha IRS has

notified me that 1 am no longer subject to backup withholding, and

3. fama U.S. cltizen or other U.S, porson {defined below).

Certification instructions, You must cross out llem 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup
withholding because you have falled to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estato transactions, ltem 2 does not apply.

i

of debt, contributions to an Individual retirernent

For mortgage interest pald, acquisition or ab

of erty,
arrangemant (IBA), and generally, payments other than mtmst and dividends, you are ot required to sign tho Certification, but you must

provide your correct TiN. See the instructions on page 4

Sign

Signature of
Here

U.S. porson b

&QM&L@M,

Nl

General Instructions
Section references ave to the Internal Revenue Code unless
othenviss noted.

Purpose of Form

A person who is required to file an information return with the
IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification nurber {TIN)
to report, for example, income paid to you, real estate
transactions, mortgage interest you pald, acquisition or
abandonment of secured property, cancetlation of debt, or
contributions you made to an [RA.

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person {including a
resident alien), to provide your correct TiN to the person
requesting it (the requester) and, when applicable, to:

1. Certify that the TIN you are giving is correct {or you are
waiting for a number to be issued),

2. Cerlify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or

3. Claim exemption from backup withhaolding If you are a U.S.
exempt payee. If applicable, you are also certifying that as &
U.S. person, your allocable share of any parinership income from
a U.S. trade or business Is not subject to the withholding tax on
foreign partners’ share of effectively connected income.

Note, If a requester gives you a form other than Form W-8 to
request your TIN, you must use the requaster’s form if it Is
substantially similar to this Form W-9.

Dafinltion of a U.S. person. For federal tax purposes, you are

consklered a U.S. person If you are:

e An individual who is a U.S. citizen or U.S. resident alien,

@ A partnership, corporation, company, or association created or

grganizad in the United States or under the laws of the United
tates,

© An estate {other than a foreign estate), or

o A domastic trust (as defined In Regulations section

301.7701-7).

{al rules for pay hips. Partnerships that conduct a
trade or business In the United Slates are gensrally requlred {o
pay a withholding tax on any forelgn partners’ share of income
{from such business. Further, in certain cases where a Forrm W-9
has not been received, a parinership Is required to presume that
a partner is a foreign person, and pay the withholding tax.
Therefors, if you are a U.S. person that is a partnerin a
partnership conducting a trade or business in the United States.
provide Form W-9 to the parinership to establish your U.S.
slatus and avoid withholding on your share of partnership
Income.

The parson who gives Form W-9 to the parinership for
purposes of establishing its U.S. status and avoiding withholding
on its aliocable share of net income from the partnership
conducting a trade or business in the United States is in the
following cases:

© The U.S. owner of a disregarded entity and not the entily,
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