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INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
DATE: 8/30/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 50-00124115 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING I%EXPQRTMENT

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: DMEVANS@jeffparish.net

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, $/07/2018 via online at www.jeffparishbids.net or by hand delivery, USPS mail or other
courier service to Purchasing Department, 200 Derbigny Street (General Government Building), Suite 4400, Gretna, LA
70053. For convenience, bidders ma¥ also submit bids in the East Bank Purchasing Department, Suite 404, Jefferson
Parish Joseph S, Yenni Building, 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd., Jefferson LA 70123, However, if submitting bids on the day

of bid opening, bidders must submit at the West Bank location only,

All bids submitled are subject to these instructions and g;:neral conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all

provisions of Louislana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113546 zndfor Resolution

No. 113847. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may also obtain a copy by visiting the
Purchasing Depariment webpage at purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

Al vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yel registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from hitp-/purchasing jefiparish.net and by clicking on Vendor Informalion. Current W-8 forms with respective Tax
Identification numbers and vendor applications may be submitied at arri'ilime; however, if your company is nol registered and/or

a currant W-9 form Is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a current W-9 form and respective Tax ldentification
number must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract and/or issued purchase order. Failure to do
s0 may result in delay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from pa'gmenl of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be
based on F.0.B, Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated bg the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID
ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Items bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each ilem unless otherwise
Indicated. Twe or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/ar complete
and return the associated line itermn pdcin? forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there Is a difference In
unit prices and totals, the unit prices shali prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individuat item basis, or such combination, as shall in its
gxdgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
IDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submitted a bid in respanse to this salicitation may submit a protest in writing ta the Director of the Purchasing
within 48 hours of bid opening  The Purchasing Direclor will review it in connection with the Parish Attorney’s Office as appropriate and a written
response will be provided as soon as possible.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped proml?tlé. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage
unless -.:Peclﬁed in the quatation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cance! at any
lime and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice 1o the contraclor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products te be new {current) and afl work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless
otherwise specified, no aftermarket pars will be accepled. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have al least one (1) year
guaranly, in writing, from the date of delivery andior acceplance of the project. Any deviations or alteration fram the specifications must be indicaied on
the bid form for each iter and upon requesi, product dala for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Depariment.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to aliow bidders the
opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification reganding instructions. The Purchasing Depariment wili
issue a written response to bidders' questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require writien acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendumn on the bid form shall cause
the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowast responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of eslablishing certain
minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complele
product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from pariicipation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or aclivity, any person in the United
Stales on the grounds of race, color, nalional origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1875, or with
respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped Individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except
that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Titie VI and VI| of
the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply, This assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final
handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), (a), (e), and (k)({5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovalion prrnp'j‘ects
EguNsé fgrln1p_}y1w1ig|6??diun 504 of the 1973 Rehabllitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s specifications

Jefierson Parish and its partners asg the recipients of faderal funds are fully committed to awarding a contraci(s) to firn(s) that will provide high guality
services and that are dedicaled fo diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages the involvemment of minority and/or
woman-owned business enterprises (DBE’s, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE’s) to slimulate paricipation in procurement and assistance programs.



DATE: 8/30/2018

B8ID NO.: 50-00124115 Page: 2

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online,
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitt ng uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not Ie?ible, then bidder's
submission will be rejected. Please note all requill;en]lenits contained in this bid package for electronic bid
submissjon.

Please visit our E-Procurement Page at www.jeffparishbids.net to register and view Jefferson Parish
solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
http:lipurchasing.jeffparish.net.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(l), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and sha!l remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any rrospective
bldl_.'leeé" who fails to altend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
praject.

2. Altendance fo this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure 1o attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, fallure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additionaf cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON-PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Depariment of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these I:en'mls. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contracior must also hold any
and al alaplica_ble Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected,
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field
in the Electronic Procurement system. Failuie to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5. Itis the bidder's responsibility o visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract.
Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material
must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be germiued on the premises. Precautions
must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.



DATE: 8/30/2018

BID NO.: 50-00124115
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Page: 3
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced {o a formal

contract which shall be recorded at the conlractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of

Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be oblained from the Clerk of Caurt

and Ex-Officio Recorder of Morigages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a

Eerformance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
e 100% of the contract Brice. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of

the contract price. Both

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The petformance bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the coniract.

onds shafl be supplied at the signing of the contract.

All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached “Standard Insurance Requirements” sheet attached to this bid
solicitation. Prior to contract executions/purchase order issuance, the stccessful bidder will be required to provide final insurance
certificales which shall name Jefferson Parish as an additional insured In accordance with the instructions in the aforementioned
“Standard Insurance Requirements* sheet.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier’s check, cerlified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as Indicated In the electronic bid sclicitation on Central Auction House. No
scanned paper copies of any bid band will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
reprg‘genttgtions on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications.

Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
gl.éqle? 35 a sbgg?rate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required, This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212,10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For blddin?
urposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, inc uding:
on-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campalgn Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Veri
Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavils have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID
AFFIDAVIT, This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the cumrleled, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration
upon contract exaculion. Failure 1o comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BiDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA - RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid subrnission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavils, including: Non-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Camgaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been
combined inlo one form entilled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit musi be submitted in its original format, and
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly nolarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right fo award blid to the next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced adppendix will be applicable accordinglg and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with
bid submission will result in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, em loyee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of evary contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General In any investigation, audit, inspection,
erformance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a
id, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  8/30/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00124115 JEFFERSON PAR'SH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0. BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: DMEVANS

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Loulsiana taxing
bedy. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY {30} day written
notice to the contractor,

JEFFERSON PARISH Is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 days

INDICATE STARTING TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection,
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER;
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

Emergency Medif—alfl_"l_'gdm:tsﬁ

SIGNATURE: TITLE: .
(Must be signed here) — ///’“ Manager, Bids & Contracts

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
Tim Jafi

ADDRESS:

5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd.
CITY, STATE: Dublin, OH 2IP: 43016
TELEPHONE: FAX:

(800) 558-6270 ( 800) 558-1551

EMAIL ADDRESS:
submitbids@buyemp.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ $467.62




DATE: B8/30/2018

Page: 5
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00124115 SEALED BID
ITEM ICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES “gﬂc;’{;,, TOTALS
ONE TIME PURCHASE OF VARICUS MEDICAL
SUPPLIES
1 200 EA 0001 - IBUPROFEN 200MG TABS 200X2 $1.59 3.18
ITEM NUMBER: 24805,
2 2400 EA 0002 - BENZOYL PEROXIDE 5% GEL No Bid
ITEM NUMBER: 24718.
3 2.00 EA 0003 - GERI-PECTATE LIG MINT No Bid
ITEM NUMBER: 37702
4 1.00 EA 0004 - BP ADVANTAGE PLUS COLOR: NAVY $47.22 $47.22
ITEM NUMBER: 23807.
5 1600 EA 0005 - INST HOT PACK 6X8 MMC 3/PK ORM $0.37 $5.92
ITEM NUMBER: 79452, 3 PACKS.
6 1.00 EA 0006 - TAPE CURASILK 2" #7139 2" X 10YDS $1.34 $1.34
ITEM NUMBER: 17531 BOX OF 6.
7 2.00 EA 0007 - TAPE CURASILK 3" #7140C 3"X10YDS $2.01 $4.02
ITEM NUMBER; 74281 BOX OF 4.
8 1.00 EA 0008 - MOORE FABRIC STRIPS 1X3 AB 1"X3" $2.05 $2.05
BOX OF 100
ITEM NUMBER: 31404,
.0
8 2,00 EA 0009 - ACETAMINOPHEN 325MG TABS 2502 51.09 $2.18
250 PKG/2 ITEM NUMBER: 82467.
10 1.00 EA 0010 - COBAN 1X5YD TAN #1581 BOX OF 30 $0.65 $0.65
ITEM NUMBER: 35357,
. 1.46
11 1.00 EA 0041 - COBAN 3X6YD NEON ASST #1583N BOX $1.46 5
OF 12 ITEM NUMBER; 44424,
12 300 EA 0012 - MEDICATION ENVELOPES PILL BOX OF $8.54 $25.61
500 ITEM NUMBER: 21744,




DATE: 8/30/2018

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00124115 SEALED BID
ITEM
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES Ugﬂggg'ﬁ TOTALS
13 400 EA 0013 - CHLORASEPTIC LOZ CHERRY BOX OF 18 $2.95 $11.80
ITEM NUMBER: 26628.
No Bid
14 2.00 EA 0014 - ORASOL GEL 20% 0.75GM BOX OF 75
ITEM NUMBER: 82474,
15 2.00 EA 0015 - HYDROCORTISONE 1% CRM 1.0G BOX $11.35 $22.70
OF 144 ITEM NUMBER: 82464,
16 4.00 EA 0016 - LIP OINTMENT 0.5GM BOX OF 144 $1.59 $6.36
ITEM NUMBER: 11011.
17 400[ EA 0017 - LORATADINE 10MG TABS 50X1 No Bid
ITEM NUMBER: 82478.
18 2000 EA 0018 - TRIPLE ANTIBIO OINT 1.0GM BOX OF $12.35 $24.70
144 ITEM NUMBER: 82466.
$308.44 $308.44
18 1.00] Ea 0019 - SCALE DIGITAL SOLO DS

ITEM NUMBER: 28241.




JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

Michael S, Yenni Renny Simno
Parish President Director

July 2018

CHANGES TQ JEFFERSON PARISH BIDDING PROCEDURES

The East bank Office of Purchasing is now open! We are located in the Joseph S.
Yenni Building, 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd,, Suite 404, Jefferson, LA 70123, Bidders
may submit bid responses at this location, pending authorization in each bid
package. Bidders should carefully read and must respond accordingly per the
requirements of the bid packages. NOTE: Bidders submitting bids on the day
of bid opening, bidders must submit at the West Bank location only.

Other Changes Continued:
* Forall advertised sealed bids, written evidence of signature
authority must be included with bid submission.
* Current W9 Forms and vendor applications may be submitted at

any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or a
current W-9 form is not on file, a current W-9 form must be
supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a
contract and/or issued a purchase order.

* Proofofinsurance in the form of a current certificate
evidencing coverages is required with bid submission. Bidders
must read the insurance requirements attachment included in each
bid package for specificinstructions. Upon contract execution,
successful bidder must produce finalinsurance certificates in
accordance with Jefferson Parish insurance requirements.

Bidders shouid reference the “Additional Requirements” section of the bid instructions
and/or the “lmportant Notice to Bidders” included in the bid package for specific
requirements to respond accordingly.

For more information, please call Jefferson Parish Purchasing at 504-364-2678.

loseph S Yenni Bulldi 18 = 1221 Elmwood Park Bivd., Ste. 404 leffarson, LA 70123
Office 504.364 2678
General Government Bldg. - 200 Derbigny 5t - Suite 4400 - Grerna, LA 70053
Office 504.354,2678

Email: Burchasing@iefpasish.net Waebsite: www feffparish.net
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Emergency
M ed ical P rOd u cts 5000 Tuttfe Crossing Blvd Dublin, OH 43016 800.558.6270 www. buyemp.com

References

City of Houston Fire Department
600 Jefferson Street, Suite 703, Houston, Texas 77007
Darla Colomb, Buyer
832-394-6759
Darla.Colomb@houstontx.gov

Green Township Fire Department
6303 Harrison Avenue, Cincinnati, Ohto 45247
Joe Spears, EMS Coordinator
513-574-0474
spears@areentwp.or

Princeton Rescue Squad
701 Stafford Drive, Princeton, West Virginia 24740
David Johnston, Supply
304-425-3914
Dave.Johnston@princetonrescue.com

City of Racine Fire Department
810 8 Street, Racine, Wisconsin 53403
John Wanggaard
262-635-7915

John.Wanggaard@cityofracine.org

City of Milwaukee Fire Department
2333 N 49t Street, Milwaukee, Wisconsin 53210
Steven Riegg
414-286-8981
srie milwaukee.qov



ACORD" DATE{MMDDIYYYY)
< CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE o208
[ TTHIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED O
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. 2
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. If T
SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the tarms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this §
cartificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsemaent(s). z
PRODUCER N CONTA ﬁ
Aon Risk Services Mortheast, Inc.
columbus oH Office TAIC. No. Exty: (B66) 283-7122 {AR. Moy [800) 363-0105 E
445 Hutchinson Avenue E-MALL °
Su}; te 900 ADDRESS: T
ST AR RS INSURER(S} AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
|msurep INSURER A: Hartford Fire Insurance Co. 19682
sarnova, Inc&_ . 4 INSURER B: Sentinel Insurance Company, Ltd 11000
53359$3§¥12%1525,-2;°B‘1‘$§f' nc. INSuRERC:  Hartford Casvalty Insurance Co 29424
|oublin, oH 43016 usa INSURER D: Medmarc Casualty Ins Co 22241
INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 570070105230 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION QF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POUICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS. Limits shown are as requested
TR TYPE OF INSURANCE fg% POLICY NUMBER o PN LIMITS
A | X | commBRCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY 33UUNVGI435 mzﬂlﬁ EACH OCCURRENCE $1, 000,000
[ DAMAGE TO RENTED
CLAIMS-MADE EI OCCUR PREMRE S e e rance 3300,000
MED EXP {Any one person) $10,000
| PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $1,000,000] ﬁ
| GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER GENERAL AGGREGATE $2,000,000]
e JECT Loc PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG Excluded| 3
OTHER 3
B 33 UuN vG3435 12/01/2017{12/01/2018 | COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT hid
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY Ea accident $1,000,000 .
% | Anv AuTO BODILY INJURY { Per porson) 2
| OWNEDONI..Y iﬁr:%:;msn BODILY INJURY (Per accident) %
| auTtos PROPERTY DAMAGE
HON-OWNED i o
| gﬁ? AITOS AUTOS ONLY | (Per aczident) %
7]
€ | x | umereLLanae | x | occur 33RHUVG1E92 12/01/2017]12/01/2018| gacH OCCURRENCE $10,000,000] ©
EXCESSLIAB | | CLAIMSMADE AGGREGATE $10,000,000
pED| X [RETENTION 510,000
WORKERS COMPENSATION AND | PER STATUTE | IEEH.
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Yin
ANY PROPRIETOR / PARTNER { EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? NIA
(Mandatory in NH) E.L DISEASE-EA EMPLOYEE
EEEEEE-'ﬁ'gﬁ '5? OFERATIONS below _ E.L DISEASE-POLICY LIMIT _|=
0 | Products Liab 170H3B0020 12/01/2017|12/01/2018| aggregate Limit $10,000,000|=
Claims Made Agg Deductible 5150, ooo| M
Per occ Limit $10,000,000 %
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS { LOCATIONS f VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional R s le, may be sttached If more space is required) %
Evidence of Coverage. D
5
CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION ﬂ

Emergency Medical Praducts, Inc.
5000 Tuttle Crossing 8lvd.
cublin OH 43016 usa

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE
EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DEUVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE
POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

A Ot Fovsisas Naronst o

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

©1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD



AGENCY CUSTOMER ID: 570000037575

e LOC #:
ATeRe ADDITIONAL REMARKS SCHEDULE page _ of _

Aon Risk Services Northeast, Inc.

POLIGY NUMBER
See Certificate Number: 570070105230

CARRIER

See Certificate Number:

570070105230

NAIC CODE

NAMED INSURED
sarnova, Inc.

EFFECTIVE DATE:

ADDITIONAL REMARKS

THIS ADDITIONAL REMARKS FORM IS A SCHEDULE TQ ACORD FORM,
FORM NUMBER: ACORD 25 FORM TITLE: Cedrlificate of Liabilty Insurance

INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE

NAIC #

INSURER

|| INSURER

INSURER

INSURER

ADDITIONAL POLICIES

If a policy below does not include limit information, refer to the corresponding policy on the ACORD

certificate form for policy limits

INSR ADDLISUI!II POLICY NUMBER oI, }’DLIC\‘ LIMITS
LTR TYPE OF INSURANCE Nsp [wvo ETEE.“E mr;i#EDN '
{(MM/DI/YYYY) | (MMDDAYYY)
QOTHER
D Products Liab 1701380020 12/01/2017|12/01/2018 |Per occ $50,000
Claims Made pDeductible

ACORD 101 (2008/01)

The ACORD name and logo aro registered marks of ACORD

£ 2003 ACORD CORPORATION. ANl rights reserved.



Form W'g

{Rev, November 2017)

Dapartment of the Treasury
Intarnal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

» Go to www.irs.gov/FormW9 for instructions and tha latest infarmation.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Emerge Medical Products, Inc.

1 Name {as shown on your income 1ax return). Namae [s required on this line; do nat feave this lins blank,

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, il diferent from above

] Other (saa Inatructions) »

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of tha person whose name Is entered on ina 1. Chack only one of the

[0 umited Rablity company. Entar the tax classtiication (C=C corporation, §+5 corparation, PaPartnersh p) b

Nate; Check the appropriale box In Ihe line abova for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do nat chack | Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC If the LLC Is classitied as a single-mamber LLG that is distegarded irom tha ownar unless ths owner of the LLG Is do
anaiher LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. iederal tax purpases, Otherwise, a single-member LLC that| =° o [ any)
Is disregarded from lhe owner should check the appropriate box for tha 1ax classHication of is owner.

4 Exsmplions {codes apply only to

following seven boxes, cerlain entitles, not hgividmh 88
Inatructions on page 3):
O tndwidualisole proprietor or CComperation [J Scoporation [ Partnesnp [ Trusvestate
single-member LLC Exemp! payes cods { any)

Appiay 13 stoounty mainiained outyle e LS §

3 Address {number, streel, and apt. or suite no) See instruciions.
5000 Tuttle Crossing Blvd

Print or type.
Sea Speacific Instructions on page 3.

Requesters name and atdress (optional)

8 Cliy, stale, and ZIP code
Dublin OH 43016

7 List aceount nusnbaris) hara (optional)

Il Taxpayer identification Number [TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box, The TIN provided must maich the name gven on ne 1 to avoid Soclal security number
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
rasident allen, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it Is your employer idenlification number (EIN}. If you do not have a number, see How fo gel &

or

TiN, later,

Nete: If the account is in more lhan one name, sea the instructions for ine 1. Also sea What Name and

Number To Give the Requestsr for guidelinas on whose number to enter.

Employer Idenilfication numbear

Part Il Certification
Under penalties of perjury, | cerlify that: .

1. The number shawn on this form is my correct taxpayer Identification number (or | am waiting for a number to ba Issued to me}; and
2.1 am not sublect 1o backup withholding bacause: {a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or {b) | have not baen notified by the Inlernal Revenue
Servica (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a fallure to report all interest or dividends, or {c) the IRS has notified me that | am

ne longer subject to backup withholding; and
3, 1 am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) enterad on this form (if any) indicating that | am exemp! from FATCA raporting Is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross oul tem 2 above if you have been nolified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withhokding because
you have failed to report al Interest and dividends on your tax retum. For real estata transactions, item 2 does not apply. For morigags Inlerest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individusl retirement arrangement {IRA), and generally, payments
other than interest and dividends, you ara nol required to sign the cerlification, but you must provide your comecl TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later,

Sign
Hare

e VS U > e

Dats > 4’/2’{( ¢’

General Instructions

Ssactlion referencas ara to the Intemal Aavenus Code unless otherwise
noted,

Future devalopments. For the tatest infarmation about developments
refated to Form W-8 and its instructions, such as lepislation enacted
after they were published, go o www.krs.gov/FormWa.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IAS must obtain your corect taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social securily number
(SSN), individuat 1axpayer identification number (ITIN}, adoplion
taxpayer Identification number {ATIN), or emplaysr identification number
(EIN), to report on an informatien returr the amount pald to you, or other
amount reportabls on an Information retuen, Examples of Information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

s Form 1099-INT finterest earned or paid)

+ Form 1093-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual
Iunds)

* Form 1089-MISC {various types of incoma, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

¢ Form 1028-B (steck or mutual fund sales and certaln other
transactions by brokers)

= Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)

* Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party nalwork transactions)

» Form 1088 (homa mortgage interest), $098-€ {studant loan Interest),
1098-T {tuition)

* Form 1098-C (canceled dabl)

= Form 1098-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)
Usa Form W-8 only i you ars a U.S. parson {including a resident

aken), to provide your correct TIN,

if you do not ratum Form W-8 to tha requestar with a TIN, you might
be subfect to backup withholding. See What Is backup withholding,
fater.

Cat. No, 10231X

Form W=-9 @ev. 11-2017)



