

DATE: 3/08/2024

INVITATION TO BID  
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00144686

**JEFFERSON PARISH**

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
P.O. BOX 9  
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009  
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

PURCHASING SPECIALIST:  
DNELSON

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

**DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH**

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1 WEEK APO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) \_\_\_\_\_

<b>*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***</b>	
FIRM NAME: <u>INDUSTRIAL COMMERCIAL MOTORS + CONTROLS</u>	
SIGNATURE: <u>William Pappas</u> (Must be signed here)	TITLE: <u>PRESIDENT</u>
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: <u>William Pappas</u>	
ADDRESS: <u>P.O. Box 1842</u>	
CITY, STATE: <u>MADEVILLE LA.</u>	ZIP: <u>70470</u>
TELEPHONE: <u>( ) 504 415-7288</u>	FAX: <u>( ) 504 827-1167</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>WPAPPAS@ICMCLLC.COM</u>	

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 1,993.14

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144686

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			<b>PURCHASE OF SUPPLIES FOR JEFFERSON PARISH PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE</b>		
1	2.00	EA	0001 - ELBOW, STREET, 90 DEGREES, 3/8 IN., GALVANIZED SCHEDULE 40  SK NUMBER 00-0292040	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
2	2.00	EA	0002 - PLUG, GALVANIZED, 1 INCH, SCHEDULE 40, SQUARE HEAD  SK NUMBER 00-0292500	\$ <u>↑</u>	\$
3	3.00	EA	0003 - ELBOW, 1/2 INCH, 90 DEGREE GALVANIZED, SCHEDULE 40  SK NUMBER 00-0291800	\$ <u>↑</u>	\$
4	2.00	EA	0004 - VALVE, GATE, 6 IN., FLANGED, CAST IRON BODY, BRONZE MOUNTED,  NON-RISING STEM, DOUBLE DISC, OPEN LEFT, HANDWHEEL, DOMESTIC, EPOXY COATED, CLOW NO. F-5070, RESILENT SEAT IS NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0622420	\$ <u>↑</u>	\$
5	5.00	EA	0005 - GAUGE, PRESSURE, 0-60 PSI, 2-1/2 IN. DIAMETER FACE, 1/4 IN.  MALE PIPE THREAD BOTTOM CONNECTION, BLACK ENAMEL PAINTED STEEL CASE SK NUMBER 00-0695120	\$ <u>↓</u>	\$
6	10.00	EA	0006 - NIPPLE, GALVANIZED, 3/8 IN. X 3 IN.  SK NUMBER 00-0296150	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
7	2.00	EA	0007 - BEARING, BALL, DOUBLE SHIELD, NO. 6207-ZZ  SK NUMBER 00-0452730	\$ <u>10.00</u>	\$ <u>20.00</u>
8	25.00	EA	0008 - NIPPLE, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 1/2 IN. X CLOSE, MALE THREAD X MALE THREAD  (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE) SK NUMBER 00-0694810	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
9	8.00	EA	0009 - PUMP, SUMP, 1-1/2 IN., CAST IRON BODY, PENTAIR/MYERS NO. MS33D10,	\$ <u>228.88</u>	\$ <u>1,831.04</u>

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144686

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			115V, 3000 RPM, 10 FT. POWER CORD, (REPLACES HYDROMATC PART NO. 51843-010-7 MODEL NO. DA-1) SK NUMBER 00-0574100		
10	1.00	EA	0010 - VALVE, CHECK, 6 IN., 16 IN. FACE TO FACE, FLANGED, LEVER AND  WEIGHT, IBBM, BRONZE DISC FACING, EPOXY COATED, STAINLESS STEEL BOLTS/ NUTS, MEETS ANSI/AWWA C508, MUELLER NO. A-2602-6-01 SK NUMBER 00-0628070	\$ NO BID	\$
11	30.00	EA	0011 - CONNECTOR, MECHANICAL, UNI-TAP, AL9CU RATED FOR NO. 10 AWG-250 KCMIL,  BURNDY NO. BIT250 SK NUMBER 00-086992E	\$	\$
12	12.00	EA	0012 - BOLT, EYE, 1/2 IN.-13, 3-1/4 IN. LONG SHANK, FORGED GALVANIZED, WITH  NUT, 2200 LB. WORKING LOAD LIMIT, WITHOUT SHOULDER, CROSBY NO. G-291 NO. 1043374 SK NUMBER 00-0271660	\$	\$
13	5.00	EA	0013 - NIPPLE, GALVANIZED, SCHEDULE 40, DOMESTIC, 1-1/4 IN. X 2 IN.  SK NUMBER 00-0297150	\$ NO BID	\$
14	4.00	EA	0014 - BELT, B-54, GOODYEAR HY-T MATCHMAKER ORS SC  SK NUMBER 00-0040500	\$ 14.06	\$ 56.24
15	6.00	EA	0015 - BELT, NAPA NO. 3VX560 PREMIUM INDUSTRIAL  SK NUMBER 00-0041300	\$ 14.31	\$ 85.86
16	4.00	EA	0016 - BUSHING, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 4 IN. X 3 IN., MALE SPIGOT X FEMALE  SOCKET (ELECTRICAL FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0694220	\$ NO BID	\$
17	10.00	EA	0017 - VALVE, BALL, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 2 IN., TRU-UNION, TO INCLUDE FEMALE	\$ NO BID	\$

DATE: 3/08/2024

Page: 8

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144686

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
18	2.00	EA	SOCKET END AND FPT ENDS SK NUMBER 00-0692050  0018 - UNION, PIPE, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 2 INCH, FEMALE PIPE THREAD X FEMALE  PIPE THREAD, MUST HAVE VITON O-RING SEAT SK NUMBER 00-0690630	\$ <i>NO BID</i>	\$
19	10.00	EA	0019 - VALVE, BALL, BRASS, 1 INCH, FEMALE PIPE THREADS, 150 PSI WSP  RATED SK NUMBER 00-0622520	\$	\$
20	3.00	EA	0020 - VALVE, BALL, BRASS, 1/2 IN. FEMALE PIPE THREAD, GRAINGER NO. 5X715  SK NUMBER 00-0622500	\$	\$
21	2.00	EA	0021 - CLAMP, PIPE REPAIR, 14 INCH X 20 INCH LONG, DOUBLE BAND, ALL STAINLESS  STEEL, O.D. RANGE 15.07 - 15.82, BUNA FULL FACED GASKET, FORD NO. FS2-1582 X 20-N SK NUMBER 00-0167190	\$	\$
22	60.00	EA	0022 - CAP, PVC, 6 IN., PUSH-ON, SDR-35 SK NUMBER 00-0132010  DELIVERY ADDRESS PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE 1500 RIVER PARK ROAD BRIDGE CITY, LA 70094	\$ <i>NO BID</i>	\$





# Southern Water Service, LLC

4983 North Lee Hwy  
Cleveland, TN 37312

## Quote

Date	Quote #
3/11/2024	107141

### Name / Address

Industrial-Commercial Motors & Controls  
4520 M.L. King Blvd  
New Orleans, LA 70125

### Ship To

Industrial-Commercial Motors & Controls  
4520 M.L. King Blvd  
New Orleans, LA 70125

Lead times quoted are estimates based on component availability at the time of the quote.  
Dates are subject to change and do not constitute compensation.

P.O. No.	Freight Terms	EST. Lead Time - SUBJECT TO CHANGE	Quote Expiration	
	Best Way	In Stock	Price subject to change	
Item	Description	Qty	Price Each	Total
Myers item	Model MS33D10 Submersible Sump Pump 1/3HP, 115V, 1Ph, 10' Cord  SHIP TO 70094 13.6 LBS EA.  FROM 53115 + 12.00 EA. FRT  L 10 W 10 N 12  BID 216.88 FRT + 12.00 <hr/> 228.88	8	198.45	1,587.60

Price does not include freight charge.

Southern Water Service is not responsible for damaged products due to shipping. It is the sole responsibility of the receiving party to fully inspect the product at the time of delivery for any potential damage and/or missing items. We recommend removing any protective wrapping to fully inspect the product before the driver leaves.

Subtotal	\$1,587.60
Sales Tax (0.0%)	\$0.00
Total	\$1,587.60

Phone: (423) 479-2753

Fax: (423) 728-2358

E-mail: [asanders@southernwaterservice.com](mailto:asanders@southernwaterservice.com)