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1-3 days
*Excludes special
 order and large
 equipment

WA Butler Company dba: Covetrus North America

VP, Pricng & Analytics

Kelly Bullock

400 Metro Place North

Dublin, OH 43017

614 724-3461 N/A

biddesk@covetrus.com

23,738.09

Kelly R Bullock (Mar 22, 2021 22:10 EDT)
Kelly R Bullock



No bid

No bid

$17.10 $171.00

$27.61 $1,380.50

$57.89 $57.89

$52.65 $157.95

$113.86 $1,138.60

$113.86 $1,138.60

$124.71 $374.13

$19.21 $76.84

$12.57 $251.40

$6.34 $12.68

$9.69 $19.38

$9.14 $182.80

sku: 050398  sold in 30ct

sku: 000805

sku: 043245  sold in 2ct

sku: 071386  sold in 50ct

sku:   033046  sold in 6x30ct

sku: 033047  sold in 6x30ct

sku: 068144

sku: 012186

sku: 007319

sku: 072718

sku: 061807

sku: 023754



No bid

$8.02 $48.12

$153.00 $153.00

$14.85 $594.00

$27.10 $162.60

$429.00 $6,864.00

$460.00 $3,680.00

$87.14 $348.56

$41.16 $41.16

$2.21 $4.42

$309.22 $1,855.32

$5.70 $34.20

$5.86 $11.72

sku: 055481

sku: 056594  sold in 12 x 16oz

(1case = 12 bottles)

sku: 028983

sku: 043694   sold in 132ct

sku: 058799   10 x 3 doses

sku: 045549  10 x 3 doses

sku: 071700   

sku: 006368

sku: 030972

sku: 001557

$25.88 $25.88
sku: 070816

sku: 049164

sku: 061258



No bid

No bid

No bid

sku: 022975 Sold in EA

$76.40 $152.80

$18.67 $37.34

$238.16 $4,763.20

sku: 069239 

sku: 022658  sold in 24ct

(case of 20) 
@ $3.82 ea




