
Jefferson Parish 
Government

5000132899 Purchase of Sports Equipment for 
the Jefferson Parish Recreation Department

November 25 20 @11 00 A



5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT FOR THE JEFFESON
PARISH RECREATION DEPARTMENT
Jefferson Parish Government

Project documents obtained from www.CentralBidding.com

19-Nov-2020 09:03:34 AM











30-45 Days ARO

N/A

60365

School Specialty, LLC. 

Assistant Secretary

Leonard Adkins

100 Paragon Parkway

Mansfield, Ohio 44903

800 305-0174 Ext 1656 800  675-1775

bidnotices@schoolspecialty.com
17,887.16



$43.39 $5,467.14

No Bid

$43.39 $4,772.90

$57.19 $2,573.55

$58.09 $3,485.40

$71.49 $285.96

$36.19 $180.95

smithm78
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item number : 006890

smithm78
Text Box
Item :  1594870
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Alternative:  Item #: 1596357

smithm78
Text Box
Alternative:Item #: 2004659

smithm78
Text Box
Alternative: Item #: 2004660

smithm78
Text Box
Alternative: Item #: 1596357



$36.19 $144.76

$36.19 $72.38

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$32.29 $904.12

No Bid

No Bid

smithm78
Text Box
Item #: 1594871

smithm78
Text Box
Item #: 1594872

smithm78
Text Box
Item #: 022548





Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 2 
School Specialty Item #1596357 

 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Wilson Official League Youth Baseball, Raised Seam, Pack of 12. 
 
Champions Series: Game played and Practice.  Grade C/D leather.  Full 
grain leather.  SST Seam technology.  Red cushion cork. Pack of 12 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 3 
School Specialty Item #1596357 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Wilson Official League Youth Baseball, Raised Seam, Pack of 12. 
 
Champions Series: Game played and Practice.  Grade C/D leather.  Full 
grain leather.  SST Seam technology.  Red cushion cork. Pack of 12 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 4 
School Specialty Item #2004659 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Champion Sports Major League Baseball, Pack of 12 
 
Pitch like the pros with this NFHS-approved Major League Premium 
Cowhide Leather Baseball. Designed to meet major league specifications, it 
has a dense double cushioned cork core and wool yarn winding. Covered 
in tough cowhide leather with raised seams for a textured feel that's easy 
for players to grip and control. Great for recreational and competitive 
teams wanting the feel and performance of an official game ball. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 5 
School Specialty Item #2004660 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Champion Sports Official League Premium Baseball, Pack of 12 
 
Great for both official games and training, this Champion Sports Official 
League Baseball is NGHS approved and made with a tough cowhide leather 
cover that can stand up to season after season of use. Three-ply wool yarn 
winding and a double cushioned cork core give this leather baseball a 
professional feel, while raised stitching adds a classic look and makes the 
ball easier for players to grip. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 6 
School Specialty Item #006890 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Wilson A1010 NFHS High-Quality Baseballs, Set of 12 
 
The A1010 Baseball features a raised seam, premium leather cover, 
cushioned cork center and premium wool blend windings. Set includes 12 
baseballs. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 7 
School Specialty Item #1594870 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Easton Aluminum Softball Fast Pitch Bat, Sapphire, 28 Inches/18 Ounces 
 
The Sapphire is the bat you can swing with power and keep under control. 
A cushioned all-sports grip helps keep your hands in place during hours of 
play. Measures 28 inches long and weighs 18 ounces. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 8 
School Specialty Item #1594871 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Easton Aluminum Softball Fast Pitch Bat, Sapphire, 29 Inches/19 Ounces 
 
The Sapphire is the bat you can swing with power and keep under control. 
A cushioned all-sports grip helps keep your hands in place during hours of 
play. Measures 29 inches long and weighs 19 ounces. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 9 
School Specialty Item #1594872 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Easton Aluminum Softball Fast Pitch Bat, Sapphire, 30 Inches/20 Ounces 
 
The Sapphire is the bat you can swing with power and keep under control. 
A cushioned all-sports grip helps keep your hands in place during hours of 
play. Measures 30 inches long and weighs 20 ounces. 
 

 



Customer Name: JEFFERSON PARISH GOVT 
Bid# 5000132899 PURCHASE OF SPORTS EQUIPMENT 

SEQ# 13 
School Specialty Item #022548 

 
                                                                                                                         

 

Wilson TDJ Junior Composite Football 
 
Wilson TDJ Junior Football features a composite cover that offers a great 
tacky feel for practice or fair weather game play. Sold individually. 
 

 

 



 

September 28, 2020 * School Specialty LLC * W6316 Design Drive, Greenville, WI 54942  
Phone 888-388-3224 

 

SCHOOL SPECIALTY LLC 
OFFICERS AUTHORIZED TO SIGN BIDS AND CONTRACTS 

The Board of Directors of School Specialty, LLC have approved the following resolution:  
 
The officers of School Specialty, LLC have appointed as ‘Officers Authorized to Sign Bids and Contracts’ and hereby 
are authorized to execute, deliver, and thereby bind School Specialty into bid agreements or any agreements 
regarding the purchase of inventory in the ordinary course of the business.”   
 
Accordingly, this listing identifies associates who are authorized to act solely for the aforementioned purpose on behalf 
of School Specialty in the officer capacities set forth by their respective names and titles and at the signing levels 
indicated. Such parties are authorized by office, not individual. Such authorities will be reviewed annually by the Board 
of Directors and may be revoked at any time. 
 

Name 
 

Officer Title Authority Level ($) Contract Duration 

Ryan Bohr CEO and President 
All amounts over 
$5,000,000  

5 years or more including extension 
by mutual agreement 

Kevin Baehler Executive VP, CFO 
All amounts over 
$5,000,000 

Up to 5-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

David Fricke 
VP Pricing Bids & Sales 
Support 

Amounts up to 
$5,000,000 

Up to 5-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Amy Fuss 
Director Bids & 
Contracts 

Amounts up to 
$3,000,000 

Up to 5-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Ashley Clark 
Director Learning 
Environment Support 

Amounts up to 
$3,000,000 

Up to 5-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Nathaniel Fieweger Attorney 
Amounts up to 
$3,000,000 

Up to 5-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Leonard Adkins 
Manager Bids & 
Contracts 

Amounts up to 
$1,000,000 

Up to 3-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Sarah Peterson 
Manager Bids & 
Contracts 

Amounts up to 
$1,000,000 

Up to 3-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Grant Hedrick 
Manager Learning 
Environment Support 

Amounts up to 
$1,000,000 

Up to 3-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

Greg Clemens 
Manager, Credit & 
Collections 

Amounts up to 
$1,000,000 

Up to 1-year duration including 
extensions 

Lisa Umble 
Supervisor Bids & 
Contracts 

Amounts up to 
$250,000 

Up to 3-year duration including 
extensions by mutual agreement 

 






