INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  10/02/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00124370 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC ~ |BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the

Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written

notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all'work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid

form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: ONE

NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:
BASIQ_S\UP )_‘Y L /G)
SIGNATURE: TITLE:
(Must be signed th) M %ﬂ MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NA

]OHN ATKINSON
ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: | AFAYETTE, LA 2P 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:
( ) 337-769-0122 ( B37-247-7699
EMAIL ADDRESS:
charlotte@basicsupply.com
349.40

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $




DATE: 10/02/2018

BID NO.: 50-00124370

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

3.00

3.00

3.00

3.00

12.00

100.00

12.00

6.00

20.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT

0010 - TIP,WELDING,VICTOR #00-1-101
SK# 00-0306610

0020 - TIP,WELDING,VICTOR #4-1-101
SK# 00-0306620

0030 - HANDLE,TORCH,HEAVY DUTY WITH
BUILT-IN REVERSE FLOW CHECK VALVES AND

FLASH BACK ARRESTORS,VICTOR #315FC,
MODEL #0382G0034, GRAINGER #5KJ43
SK# 00-0306720

0040 - ATTACHMENT,WELDING,CUTTING,
VICTOR #0381G0816 FOR VICTOR #CA2460

WELDING OUTFIT.GRAINGER #54RZ99
SK# 00-0306730

0050 - SUPPORT,BACK,LARGE,POWERBRIGHT
ORANGE,DECADE CADET #46583 OR PROFLEX

BY ERGODYNE #11884HV,GRAINGER #35ZA91,
FASTENAL #1038962
SK# 00-0477130 SB200

0060 - CARTRIDGE,RESPIRATOR, THREADED,
ORGANIC/ACID/AMMONIA,GMC TYPE,10 PER BOX

MSA PART #464046 MUST BE THIS BRAND
TO FIT EXISTING MSA RESPIRATORS,
GRAINGER #4LR60

SK#00-0484090

0070 - BRUSH,WHEEL,STANDARD TWIST WIRE,
4 IN DIA.,7/8 IN TRIM,.020 WIRE SIZE
5/8 IN-11 UNC ARBOR,20,000 RPM,WEILER

#13120
SK# 00-059737Q DW4930

0080 - HANDLE,HINGED POWER,CHROME,1/2 IN
SQUARE DRIVE X 17-7/8 IN LONG,PROTO

#5468, ARMSTRONG 12-918,0R EQUILALENT
SK# 00-0601550
4766325

0090 - SHACKLE,ANCHOR,1/4 IN, 1/2 TON
LOAD LIMIT,SCREW PIN, GALVANIZED,CROSBY

6457931

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

10.95

131.40

NO BID

NO BID

7.75

93.00

12.50

75.00

2.50

50.00




DATE: 10/02/2018

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00124370 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES GLATED TOTALS

#G-209
SK# 00-0271020

10 20.00]  EA 0110 - SHACKLE,ANCHOR,5/8 IN, WITH SCREW NO BID NO BID
PIN,HOT DIP GALVANIZED,5 TON,WORKING
LOAD LIMIT,CROSBY #G-209-A
SK# 00-0271100

11 2000 EA 0120 - DISC,GRINDING,FLAP,4-1/2 IN DIA NO BID NO BID

X 7/8 IN ARBOR,POLIFAN FLAT TYPE,
LAYERED,ALUMINUM OXIDE, 60 GRIT, 13,300
MAXIMUM RPM GRIT & EPD #62152,PFERD #80-
PFF 115622 A

SK# 00-058867A




SAFETY PRODUCTS

PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS

Item Number SB200
Hi-Vis Orange Back Support Belt
Tapered Abdominal Support Panels,
Description '_I'WO-Stage Closgre include§ 5” Elasftic
Cinch Strap to adjust for desired tension,
Attached Adjustable 1.25” Wide Elastic
Suspenders, Smooth Glide Adjustable Clips
Fabric Polyester
Fabric Color Black/Orange
Waist e P
Size (in.)
S 28" - 32”
M 32”7 - 37”
L 37" - 43”
XL 43” - 49”
2XL | 49” - 55”
3XL | 55” - 60”
Unit of Sale Each (Individually Bagged)
Case Pack 24 Each
Country of Origin China
Other Similar Style SB, SB100 & BSBO1

Case | Case | Case | Case

Part # Color Case UPC HT WD LG WT
SB200-S BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120137 9 13 18 12
SB200-M BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120120 9 13 18 14
SB200-L BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120113 9 13 18 15
SB200-XL | BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120144 9 13 18 16
SB200-2XL | BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120151 9 13 18 17
SB200-3XL | BLACK/ORANGE | 50796326120168 9 13 18 18

Last Modified: June 22. 2015

Corporate Headquarters:

West Coast Office:

4025 Viscount Ave.
Memphis, TN. 38118
Phone 901-458-5030
Fax 901-458-3343

4451 Eucalyptus Avenue
Chino, CA 91710

Phone 877.264.9832
Fax 877.264.9833

www.cordovaisc.com




Dewalt DW4930 High Performance Full Cable Twist Wire
Wheel Brush, 4 in Dia x 5/8-11, Carbon Steel

Highly specified wire grades, .020, are constructed with
internal holding plate to ensure consistency and safety.
Constructed for even balance which provides smooth
performance. Used for weld cleaning, stringer bead weld
cleaning, removal of weld spatter, heavy encrustations,
scale, flash removal, deburring, roughening for adhesion.

STEEL-CABLE TWIST WIRE
5/8"-11 Arbor - Carded
Dialn: 4

Max. RPM : 20,000

4766325

6457931

"Vulcan Handle, 1/2 in Drive, 16 in L, Chrome Vanadium Steel,
Chrome"

PRODUCT OVERVIEW

Drop forged chrome vanadium steel with knurled handle cap.

PROFESSIONAL QUALITY

Hang Tagged

Drive Ins. : 1/2

LgthIn: 16

Product Details

Features

"Knurled handle cap for better grip"
Hang tagged

Midland Big Orange 081213/MC646G Anchor Shackle, 1/4 in, 1000 1b, Forged Steel

PRODUCT OVERVIEW

Meets requirements of Federal Specification RR-C-271D Amendment 1. Shackle pins are forged from alloy
steel, heat treated and tempered to give greater strength. Galvanized per ASTM A153. Design factor 5:1

SCREW PIN

HOT DIPPED GALVANIZED

Pin Dia.x Body Size : 5/16 x 1/4

WLL Tons: 1/2

Product Details

Size:1/4 in

Pin Type:Screw

Body Material:Forged Steel

Pin Material:Alloy Steel

Finish:Hot Dip Galvanized

Features

Drop forged construction with alloy steel pin

Hot dip galvanized

Used to easily joining attachments to welded chain or wire rope
Use only forged steel shackles for load carrying purposes
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