INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
DATE:  3NM7i2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 50-00119293 JEFFfERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
| P.O.BOX9
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
| 504-364-2678

VENDOR: : | BUYER:  SFOLSE

Bids will be received untif 11:00 AM, 3/24/2017 via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at www.jeffparishbids.net.

This site is free for all Jefferson Parish vendors. For additional information on registration or use of this free site,
please see the text box highlighting electronic procurement.

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, ali of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with alt

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

Fthics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution

No. 113647. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Streef, Greina, LA 70053, You may also obtain a copy by visiting the
Purchasing Department webpage at purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

Al vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Farish vendor if not already yel registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from http:/ipurchasing jeffparisn.net and by clicking on Vendor Information. Current W-9 forms with respective Tax
{dentification numbers and vendor appiications may be submitted at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or
a current W-8 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory, Furfher, 2 current W-9 form and respective Tax ldentification
number must be supplied upan contract execution, should you be awarded a contract andfor issued purchase order. Failure to do
so may result in deiay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmentai bodies are exciuded from pagment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be
based on F.0.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID
ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Hems bid must meet specifications, JEFFERSON PARISH will accept ene price for each item unless atherwise
indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete
and return the associated line item pricing forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. Inthe eventthereis a difference in
unit prices and totals, the unit prices shall prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its
judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER, taking inte consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submitted a bid in response o this solicitation may subrnit a protest in writing to the Director of the Purchasing
within 48 hours of bid opening. The Purchasing Director will review it in connection with the Parish Attomey's Office as appropriate and a written
response will be provided as soon as possible.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to eancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges wilt be allowed for parking or cartage
unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be fifled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the night to cancel at any
time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new {current) and all work raust be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless
otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one (1) year
guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery andior acceptance of the project.  Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated
andfor supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference {see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to allow bidders the
opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will
issue a written response to bidders' questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment en the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shalf cause
the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH resefves the right to award bid to next lowest respensive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of establishing certain
minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitied for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete
product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are nol to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or aclivity, any person in the United
States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1975, or with
respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except
that any exemption from such prehibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1864, or Title V| and Vil of
the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This assurance includes comnpliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final
handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Section 51.55 (g}, {d}, (e}, and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects
must comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute's specifications

{ANSI AL 17.1-1961).

Jetferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federal funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s} that wili provide high quaiity
services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages the involvemnent of rainority andfor
woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE's) to stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.



DATE:  3M7/2017

BID NO.: 50-00119293 Page: 2

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BiIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

iN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT

This electronic procurement system aliows véndors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. ‘Bidders are encouraged:to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one singie PDF file-
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred.. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are notiegible, then bidder’s-
submission will be rejected. Please note all requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid:
Please visit our E-Procurément Page at. www.jeffparishbids.net to register.and view Jefferson Parish .- -
" . .soficitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department pageat .~ =
st w5 ' - httpilipurchasing.jeffparishnet. v oo

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE .
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW. -

1. All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required fo sign in and out as svidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.8. 38:2212(l), all prospective bidders shali be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any praspective
bidder who fails to aftend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure fo attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to altend
the pre-bid eonference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner,

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Depariment of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The confractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Coniractor must also hold any
and ali applicable Federal and State ficenses. Contractor shall be responsibie for the payment of these permits
and shalt obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.5. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
Additionally if submitfing the bid electronically, then the ficense number must be entered in the appropriate field
in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5, ltis the bidder's responsibility fo visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be clean and free of ali litter and debris daily and upon completion of the cantract.
Passageways must be kept clean and iree of material, equipment, and debxis at all times. Flammable material
musi be removed from the job site daily because sforage will not be permitied on the premises. Precautions
must be exercised at al! times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.



DATE:  3M7T2047

Page: 3

BID NO.: 50-001192383

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

18.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works inlexcess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal

contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of

Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court

and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state lin the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shalt be 106% of
the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at ihe} signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be

supplied at the signing of the contract.
|

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price untess otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

Unless otherwise stated in the bid specificafions, the successful bidder will be reguired to procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandaled insurance requirements as indicated on the attached “insurance requirements” sheet. Alt bidders
must comply with the instructions in this sheet. Failure o comply will cause bid to be rejected.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All surefies must be in
original format {no copies). i submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Centrat Auction House. No
scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepied as part of the electronic bid submission.

This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis, JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
repre_?ent_:-mons on warranties with regard to minimum guarantecd guantities unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications.

Freight charges shouid be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
quoied as a separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Compisted, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies fo all solicifations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, inciuding:
Non-Conviction Afiidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Carmpaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify
Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID
AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in jts original format, and without material alleration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original formai and without material alteration
upon contract execution. Failure to comply will resuit in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, alf affidavits have been
combined into one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon sontract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly comptleted, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable cerifications with
bid subrnission will result in bid rejection.

it shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, fo cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155,10{19). By submitfting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  3/M7/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00115293 JEFFERSON PAR!SH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
 P.O.BOX S
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678
VENDOR: - BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., alf governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking of cartage unless specified in guotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according
to standard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation
supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

dweeks
iNDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES stock todwee

INDICATE STARTING TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

in the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowiedge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY:

SIGNATURE: T . e TITLE:
{Must be signed here} \\ﬁt{f Ay f"«"“""‘“\[}Z}' A7 SALES
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:

ROBERT A ROGERS /

ADDRESS:
812 LITTLE FARMS AVE

CiTY, STATE: ZIP:

METAIRIE LA 70003
TELEPHONE: FAX:

{504 ) 229-8461 { )
EMAIL ADDRESS:
bobrogers@consoclidatedpipe.con

3107.06

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: §
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DATE: 3M72017

BID NO.: 50-00119293

INVITATION TC BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

12.00

12.00

12.00

600.00

20.00

12.00

2.00

§0.00

38.00

EA

LF

PK

ROLL

EA

{0291720)
|

0010 - Piug, 1/8 fnch, galvanized,
schedule 40, square head, solid

(0292340) |

0011 - Plug, gaivanized, 2 inch,
schedule 40, square head, solid

{0282700)

0012 - Nipple, 1-1/4 in x 2 i long,
grade no. 318 stainless steel,

Merit brand
{0287154)

0013 - Tubing, poly-flo, 3/8 in od,
imperial-Eastman no. 66-P-3/8,

natural color
{0304340}

0614 - Tubing, polyethylene, 1/4 inch
od, type 1, grade E5, black, 120 PSl|

working pressure, 100 feet per package,
Parker brand part no. EB-43-0100
{0304360)

0015 - Bushing, hex, 2 inch x 344 inch,
brass, 150 pound, Merit no. 114 or equal

{0371240)

0018 - Cable, stainless steel, 3/8 inch
diameter, grade 304, 7 x 19

construction, 12,800 pound breaking
strength, 1000 feet per resi,

Wireco brand or equal

{0487510}

0017 - Elbow, PVC, schedule 80, 50
90 degree, 1/2 in, female socket x

female socket, electrical fittings are
not acceptable, Fastenal no. 0470926
{0690040)

0018 - Elbow, 50 degree, schedule 80
PVC, 3/4 in. female thread x female

025

3.00

NO BID

2.50

30.00

NO BID

NO BID

10.16

121.92

NO BID

0.65

39.00

3.00

108.00




DATE: 3M772017

BID NO.: 50-00119293

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 7

SEALED BID

iTEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

urm

DESCREP‘FION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

86.00

48.00

12.00

60.00

12.00

.00

48.00

36.00

EA

EA

socket, electrical conduit is not
acceptable
{0680070)

0019 - Eibow, PVC, schedule 80,
490 degree, 1 in, female socket x female

socket, (electrical fittings are not
acceptable}
{0690080}

0020 - Elbow, schedule 80 PVC,
90 degree, 3 inch socket x socket,

electrical conduit is not acceptable,
Fastenal no. 047399
{0690160)

0021 - Elbow, PVC, schedule 80,
90 degree, 4 in, femaie socket x female

socket, electrical fitting are not
acceptable
{06901 80)

0022 - Coupling, PVC, schedule 80,
112 in, socket x socket, {electrical

fittings are not acceptable)}
{06806200)

0023 - Tee, PVC, schedule 80, 1/2 in,
female pipe thread x female pipe x

female pipe thread, electrical fitiings
are not acceptable
{D690370)

0024 - Union, pipe, schedule 80 PVC,
1-1/4 inch, female socket x female
socket, must have Viton o-ring seat
{0690580)

0025 - Adapter, PVC, scheduie 80, male,
112 in, fernaie socket x male thread,
electrical conduit is not agceptable

{0590690)

0026 - Adapter, male, PVC, schedule 80,
1 in, female socket x male pipe thread

1.33

127.68

6.15

29520

9.30

111.60

69.00

2.12

25.44

6.80

41.40

1.37

65.76

2.63

97.68




DATE: 31772017

BID NO.: 50-00118293

INVITATION TO BID Ff-‘iOM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: B

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

27

28

29

30

M

32

33

34

24.00

6.00

445.00

6.00

24.00

4.60

18.00

60.00

LF

EA

{electrical conduit fittings are not
acceptable)
(0680920}

0027 - Adapter, maie, schedule 80 PVC,
2 inch, socket x male thread, must be

constructed as one piece, electrical
conduit is not acceptable,

Fastenal no. 0470498

{0690930)

0028 - Adapter, female, scheduie 8Q PVC,
3 inch femnale socket x female thread,

constructed as one piece, electrical
conduit is not acceptable,

Fastenal no. 0470491

{0690340)

0029 - Pipe, PVC, schedule 80,
1-1/2 in x 20 FT, plain ends,

electrical conduit is not acceptabie,
Fastenal no. 0472015
{0691080)

0030 - Cap, PVC, schedule 80, 4 inch,
socket, electrical conduit is not

acceptable, 5 per case,
Fastenal no. 0470597
{0691770)

0031 - Valve, ball, schedule 80 PVC,
true union, 1 inch, to include fematle

socket ends and FPT ends
{6692020)

0032 - Nipple, PVC, schedule 80,
4 inch x close, male thread x maie

thread {electrical conduit fittings
are not acceptabie)
{0692650)

0033 - Coupling, airhose, 1/2 in female
N.P.T. ends, guick-acting, cadmium
plated, Airking no. AM-3

{0301730)

0634 - Elbow, 90 degree, 3/4 in,
schedule 80 PVC, socket x socket,

6.40

146.40

14.90

89.40

0.93FT

372.00

20.76

124.56

28.11

674.64

12.90

57.60

NO BID

0.83

408.80
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\
Non-Public Works Bid

;:%FFI:DAVIT

STATE OF Louisiana |

PARISH/COUNTY OF Jefferson

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared: Robert A

Rogers _, (Affiant) who afier being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that
he/she is the fully authorized Rep. of Consolidated Pipe _ (Entity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number 50-00119293 , o the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaien Contribution Disclogures

{Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choiee A Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to cutent or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,

Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or
indirectly.

Choice B Yes there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this section.

Page 1 of 3 Updated: 02.27.2014




Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):
Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the Parish 1o
the Affiant.
Choice B Yes There are NQ debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section.
Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Aftiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demelition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

{The remainder of this page is intentionally left blank.]
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That no part of the confract price ‘&eceived by Affiant was paid or will be paid to any
persoil, corporation, firm, association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their no‘{mal compensation to persons regularly employed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition
of the public building or project wefe in the regular course of tbeirg'iuties for Affiant.

,'j/ .W . // //’
(Kbt A 'vd@j/"&ﬂ»

Signaiure of Affiant

Robert A Rogers
Printed Name of Affiant ¢ A 3 7 8, Gl%’ 2 .

SWORN ANLLSUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME _
ONTHE 29nd DAY OF Mareh 20 Z J,,,

J/_\‘.\L\\
—X)
Notef}ﬂy leb#lic N

/

£
Pr@Name of Notary

N_ptarny-ar Roli Number

| fo
My commission expires J’JL C/(’c:‘{ %/7
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CORPORATE RESOLUTION

EXCERPT FROM MINUTES OF } MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF
ConSotionTED PUE @ Su??wf e T

INCORPORATED.

!
AT THE MEETING OF DIRECTORS OF CanSotipalo U?b S’qﬁ it Copmbacdy
INCORPORATED, DULY NOTICED AND HELDON _Sg¢ :é?r‘mbé’m b Zolb
A QUORUM BEING THERE PRESENT, ON MOTION DULY MADE AND SECONDED. IT
WAS:

RESOLVED THAT RotedT A. RoGERS _BE AND IS HEREBY
APPOINTED, CONSTITUTED AND DESIGNATED AS AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT OF THE CORPORATION WITH FULL POWER AND AUTHORITY TO ACT ON
BEHALF OF THIS CORPORATION IN ALL NEGOTIATIONS, BIDDING, CONCERNS
AND TRANSACTIONS WITH THE PARISH OF JEFFERSON OR ANY OF ITS AGENCIES,
DEPARTMENTS, EMPLOYEES OR AGENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, THE
EXECUTION OF ALL BIDS, PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, AFFIDAVITS, BONDS, SURETIES,
CONTRACTS AND ACTS AND TO RECEIVE ALL PURCHASE ORDERS AND NOTICES
ISSUED PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF ANY SUCH BID OR CONTRACT, THIS
CORPORATION HEREBY RATIFYING, APPROVING, CONFIRMING, AND ACCEPTING
EACH AND EVERY SUCH ACT PERFORMED BY SAID AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT.

] HEREBY CERTIFY THE FOREGOING TO BE
A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF AN
EXCERPT OF THE MINUTES OF THE ABOVE
DATED MEETING OF THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS OF SAID CORPORATION, AND
THE SAME HAS NOT BEEN REVOKED OR
RESCINDED.




