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1-21 days

MWI Animal Health

Pricing Specialist

Teana Brekunitch

3041 W Pasadena Drive 

Boise, ID 83705
800-216-1163

mwibids@mwianimalhealth.com

21,938.54



15.75-mand 472.50-mand

No Bid No Bid

20.59-mand 41.18-mand

No Bid No Bid

450.14 900.28

45.82-mand 229.10-mand

506.70-mand 7600.50-mand

15.72-mand 62.88-mand

5.59 111.80

182.25-MAND 1822.50-mand

116.75-MAND 1167.50-mand

1000/case
2850.00570/case

359.45-mand 1437.80-mand



506.70-mand 5067.00-mand

17.55 175.50

No Bid No Bid

**Pricing subject to change without notice**

We cannot ship RX items without an updated DVM license and DEA.




