INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  6/22/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00123462 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC BUYER: CGASPER

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

2-3 WEEKS
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

BASIC SUPPLY, LLC —
SIGNATURE: //W - TITLE:
{Must be signed he L I ez _ MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
/~  JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: zIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:
() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:
charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _ 2638.90




DATE: 6/22/2018

BID NO.: 50-00123462

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

3.00

36.00

12.00

12.00

16.00

15.00

864.00

4.00

30.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

ROLL

EA

HANDLE, TORCH, HEAVY DUTY W/BUILT-IN
REVERSE FLOW CHECK VALUES AND VARIOUS
OTHER WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR JEFFERSON
PARISH PUBLIC WORKS ADMINISTRATION.

0010 - HANDLE,TORCH,HEAVY DUTY WITH
BUILT-IN REVERSE FLOW CHECK VALVES AND
FLASH BACK ARRESTORS,VICTOR #315FC,

MODEL #0382G0034,GRAINGER #5KJ43
SK# 00-0306720
3-7252

0020 - REPELLENT,DOG,1-1/2 OUNCE SPRAY
CAN,HALT
SK# 00-0484380
0030 - TWINE,NYLON,#18,1/16 IN DIA.,
550 FT PER ROLL, 165 LB TEST,DURALINE
BRAND #00090
SK# 00-0490080
0040 - GASKET MAKER,RTV SILICONE,HIGH
TEMPERATURE,PERMATEX #26B-RED, 3 OZ. TUBE
SK# 00-0491160 31314
0050 - TOOL,ZIP-FLARE,REED #SFPE-1 IN,
FOR CTS POLYETHYLENE SDR9 WATER TUBING,
ITEM CODE #04202,LINE# 310
SK# 00-0584900
0060 - HOIST,CHAIN,LEVER,HEAVY-DUTY, TEN
FOOT LIFT,1-1/2 TON, TUGIT RED LINE
#R291B,ALL MATERIAL HANDLING #LAO16-100
SK# 00-0586080

POWER PULL 600

0070 - BATTERY,ALKALINE,INDUSTRIAL,SIZE
AA,1.5 VOLTS,24 PER PACK,DURACELL

PROCELL #PC1500,GRAINGER #5LE23
SK# 00-0588220
0080 - CLOTH,ABRASIVE,2 IN X 50 YDS,
220 GRIT,ALUMINUM OXIDE,NORTON #K224,
FASTENAL #99338490,GRAINGER #11L402
SK# 00-0597680

91-0012

0090 - SPRAYER,GARDEN,COMPRESSED AIR,
PLASTIC,ONE GALLON CAPACITY,CHAPIN #2601

1610

85.00

255.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

3.65

43.80

NO BID

NO BID

130.00

1950.00

NO BID

NO BID

19.75

79.00

9.60

288.00




DATE: 6/22/2018

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00123462 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER QUANTITY U/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
SK# 00-0596340
10 3.00 EA 0110 - ADAPTOR,SOCKET,REDUCING,CHROME, 9.25 27.75

3/4INDR TO 1/2 IN DR,FED.SPEC.
GGG-W-641E,PROTO #5453
SK# 00-0602860

DeWalt DWMT752930SP




Item ID:

3-7252

Description: HEAVY DUTY TORCH HANDLE Item Notes:
Torch handles have die forged brass body Y's and valve bodies.
Threaded for easy replacement. Control valves have teflon packing
for smooth, gas tight operation. Tube in tube design has greater
wall thickness for higher handle strength. Victor® style. Heavy Duty

J-B Weld 31314 Hi Temp Silicone Sealant, :
3 Oz, Solid Gel, Slight, 212 Deg F Flash, i

1.007 Specific Gravity, <3% VOC RTV =
(room temperature vulcanized) silicone neﬁ'gffﬁq:?m"
gasketing material, designed for use in CaSealant T

FEATURI

mechanical assemblies where the existence
of higher, continuous temperatures up to
550 degrees F or 650 degrees F eatror:
intermittent might exist. Upon curing, s
which occurs when the product is exposed

- Water Pumps
to the moisture in air,...more

Sealant

Power Pull 600 Heat Treated Chain Puller, 1-1/2 Ton, 5/16
In Cable Dia, Steel

Chain Pullers pull, lift, and drag with ease and speed. 5
Foot Lift. Specifications: Rated Capacity: 1-1/2-ton Tested
Load: 2-1/4-ton Standard Lift: 5 feet Chain diameter: 5/16"
Handle length: 16-3/8" Net weight: 26.5 Ibs

DeWalt DWMT752930SP Reducing
Adapter, 1/2 In Male, 3/4 In Female
DeWalt Reducing Adapter, 1/2 in Male
Drive, 3/4 in Female Drive




Chapin 16100 Home And Garden Sprayer, 1 Gal, White
Multi-purpose sprayer for herbicides, pesticides, fertilizers, turf/
landscape and general cleaning. In-tank removable filter catches
anything that gets by the strainer basket when filling and attaches to
the inlet filter at the piston. Adjustable cone-to-straight spraying
nozzle. Ergonomic pump handle. Comfortable trigger shut off. Lock-
on sprayer in spray mode to reduce fatigue. Polyethylene tanks which
are non-corrosive to most fertilizers, herbicides and pesticides, yet

lightweight and durable

Aluminum Oxide Shop Rolls
This J weight cloth is extremely flexible for use in surface preparation, deburring
and general clean up. A staple for every shop—we offer an imported economy

version and a premium product “Made in the USA".

Std.
Pack

Width x Length

50
60
80
100
120
1" x 50 yds. 1 150
130
220
240
320
400
50

Imported
Economy
91-0285
91-0287
91-0286
91-0288
91-0081
91-0008
91-0289
91-0290
91-0271
91-0014
91-0292
91-0267

Made
In USA
Premium

a1

-0025
-0027
-0030
-0034
-0037
-0044
-0047
-0051
-0054
-0061
g1-

0064

-0217

Width x Length PS;gk
2" x 50 yds. 1
91-0012

Grit

a0
60
80
100
120
150
180
220
240
320
400

Imported
Economy
91-0019
91-0003
91-0022
91-0005
91-0007
91-0009
91-0010
91-0012
91-0013
91-0016
91-0017

Made
In USA
Premium

91-0026
91-0029
91-0032
91-0036
91-0041
91-00
91-004
91-005
91-005
91-006
91-00
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