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DATE: 1/11/2018 

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued 

BID NO.: 50-00121916 

ITEM 
NUMBER QUANTITY U/M 

1.00 EA 

2 20.00 EA 

3 4.00 EA 

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES 

STOCK SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH 
WB PUBLIC WORKS ADMINISTRATION DIVISION 

0010 - CLAMP,DOUBLE BAND,12 IN (FCC), 
20 IN WIDTH, 0.0.RANGE 13.95 IN- 14.75 

IN,T SK# 00-0166800 

0020 - CLAMP,PIPE REPAIR, 8 INCH X 15 
INCH LONG, SINGLE BAND, ALL STAINLESS 

STEEL, O.D. RANGE 08.99- 09.39, BUNA 
FULL FACED GASKET, DOMESTIC, FORD 
#FS1-939 X 15-N SK# 00-0165500 

0030 - NUT,OPERATING (THREADED),1-1/2 IN 
PENTAGON, 5-1/4 IN MUELLER IMPROVED/ 

CENTURION (FOR MODELS BEFORE 19871 
�=��-��-+--�=�t��==t=== icAT ALOG #A-423, PART #175234,ITEM #A-1 

SK# 00-0330000 

4 4.00 EA 

5 3.00 EA 

6 400.00 LF 

7 60.00 LF 

8 10.00 EA 

0040 - NUT,HOLD DOWN, 5-1/4 IN MUELLER 
IMPROVED/CENTURION (FOR MODELS BEFORE 

1987)CATALOG #A-423,PART #281951, 
ITEM #A-4 SK# 00-0330030 

0050 - PLATE,UPPER,5-1/4 IN MUELLER 
IMPROVED (FOR MODELS BEFORE 1972 "OLD 

STYLE")CATALOG #A-24015, ITEM #H-83, 
PART #180001 
SK# 00-0342600 

0060 - PIPE,PVC,C-900,8 INCH X 20 FT 
LONG, CLASS 150 PRESSURE RATING, BELL 

X SPIGOT, GASKETED JOINT , 
SK# 00-0691180 

0070 - PIPE,PVC,C-905, CLASS 150 
PRESSURE RATING,BELL X SPIGOT, GASKETED 

JOINT, 14 IN X 20 FT LONG 
SK# 00-0691210 

0080 - VALVE,GATE, 2 INCH FEMALE IRON 
PIPE THREAD, NO LEAD BRONZE ALLOY WITH 
MARKINGS, NON-RISING STEM, 200 PSI RATED 
, NIBCO #T-113-LF, 
SK# 00-062030A 

UNIT PRICE 
QUOTED 
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SEALED BID 

TOTALS 

I 
I 

20.89 208.90

100-408HC

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



100-408HC
Mueller ProLine Compact Pattern Standard Port 
Gate Valve, 2 In, IPS, Forged Brass

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Standard Port, Non-
Rising Stem, Six-Point Cast-Iron Handle, Brass 
Wedge Disk, Threaded Ends Comply With ANSI 
B1.20.1, Certified To NSF 61.

BRASS - STANDARD
FIP X FIP
FIP In : 2
PSI : 200

INFORMATION AND GUIDES
Catalog
Download PDF readerTo view these documents, 
you need Adobe Acrobat Reader. You can 
download a free copy from the Adobe web site.

PRODUCT DETAILS
Size: 2 In
Body Material: Forged Brass
End Connection: IPS
Fluids: Water, Oil, Gas
Pressure Rating: 200 Psi WOG, 125 Psi WSP
Series: ProLine
Special Features: 350 Deg F, Cast Iron 
Handle
Standards: ANSI B1.20.1, NSF 61
Trim Material: Brass Wedge Disc
Type: Compact Pattern, Standard Port
FEATURES
Non-Rising Stem For Limited Space Operation
Six-Point Cast Iron Handle
Forged Brass Construction For Quality And 
Dependability
Not For Potable Water
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