CENTRALBIDDING

FROM CENTRAL AUCTION HOUSE

5000137090 Purchase of various stock items for the Jefferson Parish
Eastbank Warehouse
Jefferson Parish Government

Project documents obtained from www.CentralBidding.com
12-Jan-2022 01:24:36 P



Jefferson
s Pa_rish_ '

Bid Number 50-137090

Purchase of various stock items for the Jefferson Parish Eastbank

Warehouse

BID DUE: January 20, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions

in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and

General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing

Department’s eProcurement site, www.jeffparishbids.net, by the bid due date

and time. Late bids will not be accepted.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Rae Lynn Hartman
Buyer Email: RScott@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2688




INVITATION TO BID Pago: 1
DATE: 1M2/2022 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BIDNO.: 60-00137090 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70064-0009
504-364-2878
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: RSCOTT@jeffparish.net

Bids will bo recolved untll 11:00 AM, 1/20/2022 via onlino at www.joffparishbids.net.

TE BIDS \MJ.L NOT BE ACCEPTED
NOTE.ONLYBIDSWTEN!NWKORTYPMTTEN. MQFERLY&@@BYAW THE FIRM OR AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC FIGURES OR SIGNATURES ML RESULT IN BID REJECTION.
HOWEVER, ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES AS DEFINED IN L8A - Rss 9.281%2 ARE ACCEPTABLE. SIGNATURE MUST BE A SECURED DIGITAL

All bigs submilted are subject to thesa Instruclions and conditons and any spean! conditions ond speaficetons contoined heren, ol of which

mmmdmwm@m By wmwlowww 18 of Loulsiana Law, as well be In ,

wilh the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Code of Ethics, app Pastsh (.1

Resclution No. 113846 andior Resolution No. 113847 as amonded. A of these resoiutions may be obtoined from ths Office of the Perish Clerk,
Jofforson Paris Govermmu&ﬂmg.m ; wm%x;ma LA 70053, You may aiso obtain 8 copy by vislling the

All vendors submilling bido ahﬂm%&wmllw%mmm be downioaded rom
hitpApuwchasing pmsh.net bycﬂdmgon Cumrent W-9 rmwwmsmmmmmm
applications may any fimo; however, H your company i3 not registored wnwmnwetommmtmﬁfc vendaor reglstrotion is

mandatory. wmmnwhmmdmmwhm!nmmmmummm

Jaﬁmml’aﬁahbwnpt mwmmmsmm Al prices for purchases by JoHetson Parish of 6nd materals
‘“&‘3 mmmammwm m%mm
in fgures. In (he evend thara s ammmhmmwwmmm shall bo based on F.OB.
anPaﬁshasdwgmteﬂ%“m Dgumm.lsﬁ P WILLACOEPYONENDONLYFROM
EACH IR liems bed must meet SONP wwmmwmm unigss othemwise indicated. Two or more
for one item wil resul] in bid Bikiders are required and retumn the bid form andior compiote and return (ho ssseciated
item pricing forms as indicated. mwmmmﬂumm . in the event there i3 a ditference in unil prices end totals, the umit

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves tho mmmmamwﬂammdmmaummammlmwm.ummmmmmmm
bo in the best inlarest o JEFFERSON PARISH. Every coniract or ordor shall be swarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH SPECHICATIONS and tho DELIVERY ANDIOR COMPLETION DATE

PROTEST&OWMMM&WMMmpmwm sollcilation moy protost nrmn 1o precurement, in writhng to 0o Director of
u\opm:vmbge nwhem\?mwhm l%\pmc{ wmmuo:e?mm:ga o%t'wmﬁgvm
consuitation, will then of more Chapler Ohdeion 2,
Soasiaton. b Mmmg& maponﬂ protests in wrifing information, pleasa

JEFFERSONPMBHWM to cancol aft or of an order i not shipped will be atowad for parking of cartage
?aﬁﬁml &muwmmwwmm“ﬁtﬂamgmmmmmmﬁm%:mmmmmuw
tima mbymmummwmcaym

JEFFERSONP&R!&WMMM%WWQW&)MMSM mghmm ctices for (e proiect. Undess
wrﬂm,fmmmednmo mngﬁmaeLMmedlho dav?:m a!mﬂmm mﬂm Al on
mmmmemwamemm u%dbymmwmwmmmmm

lwismmmm:a &Wmﬁwm(m"mwww Mmmmawmmﬁwmuwmmmm
mth{dsﬁm * questions in the form of an Addendum.

Al formal Addenda require wrilten acknowledgmant on the bid form by tha bidder mobmm the Addendum numderintho 8 inte
section. Failure to acknowiodge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause the bid PARISH reserves the ownrd bid
wmmmmwmmmMeml

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS Wnembmndnamas and stock numbers are spacified, R is for the purpose of
estediishing certain minimum standards of ua!ig may be submitted for preducts of equal quallty, provided brand names and
stock numbers are specified. Compists p ala mayhamqtﬁmdpﬁn:lomrd

Quentities listed are for bidding purposes only. Aclual requirements may ba more or tess than quantitios listed.



DATE: 1Mz2022

BID NO.: 50-00137030 Page: 2

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

B:dders are not to excluds from tion in. the benefits of, or subject to discrimingtion under or , any
m’ hmumdsmsonmmmdmg?ymmmm origin, o?sgcm "nalaonﬂwwbassnmg;am under the Age
n Act of 1875, or with respect to an otharwise quallfed handicapped individual as in Section 504 of the
Rehabititation Mdisn.ammwmamﬁgoameMm\xemmnmmw wwamt@atnhahmgnm
basis of religion as provided in the Civil R Act of 1864, or Title V1 and VIi of the Act of Apri! 11, 1888, shal also epply. This
assurance includes with the !nlst‘aﬁvem:gnh'emmofﬁteRmmsmmgﬁnsl discromination
: c). (d), (e), and (k )om\ekeg\daﬁons.ﬂewmcﬁmgmnovaﬁmpmimmm‘
ply with Ssction 504 of the 1873 tion Act, as emended, in accordance with the Ametrican National Standard Insttute’s

specifications (ANSI Al 17.1-1861).

Jeffarson Parigh end ils atMW&ofwmmemwmaw%bfms)mm
provide high quatily and that are dedicated to diversily and to containing costs. Thus, Jaflerson P 8t

encoureges (ha involvement of minosity andfor woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE's) to
slimulate participation in procuremant and assistance programs.

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenlence of roviewing and submitting bids online.
This Is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are to submit
_electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and"m%x'tmﬁ bid documents is preferred. Bldders submitting uploaded lmae:‘e:’gf8
bid responses are sole mnsl o for clarity. if uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidd
submission will be rejected. Please nots all mqumrgs contalned in this bid package for olectronic bid
: , : ~ submission. : -

X
as

Ploase visit our E-Procurement P:fgeﬂat‘ww.}eﬁpaﬁ‘shblds.net to register and view Jefferson Parish
solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Departmont page at
~ , - httptipurchasing jeffparish.net. :

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

' PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
L CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.
13 ' :
1. Abbidders must attend the MANDATORY conference and will be reqwred to sign in and out as evidence of

attandance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(1), all prospective biddars shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shafl remain in atlendance for the duration of the conference. 3
bidder who fafls to atiend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited rom submitting a bid for the

2 Attendance 1o this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relisve the bidder of responsibiiity for information discussed at the conference. Furtharmore, failure to sitend
mapm-bédconlemnoeandlmpedbndoesmtmﬁwammwwdm&omuwnmmonummm
matarials or performing any work thet may be required to complate the work in accordance the spacification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3 Contractor must hold cument applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licanses with the rtment of | and
Codo Enforcement.  Contractor shall obtain eny and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
of inspection and Code Enforcement. Thaommctmshallbemsmnsib!afonheﬁymemol
these is. Mmmmcﬁwmmmmmmmm‘ Contractor must hold any
and afpﬂmb& al and Stato licenses, Conlractor shall be responsibie for the payment of thesa permits
and shall cbtain them priof to the start of the project.

4. A LA Stale Contractor’s License will ba required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq and such license
mgrnberwﬂlbes&wwnonmaowadaufmwemmcenvmpe.Fa‘s)uralown’gtg'wmcammmdtobe
rejacted. When submitting the bid electronically, the license number must be entared in tha appropriale figld in the
elactronic procurement system. Failune to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.



DATE:

BID NO.: 50-00137080

11212022
Pago: 3
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

S. ltis the bidder’s responsibiity to visk the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6.

10.

1.

12

13

14.

15.

Jobsﬂammdeanarﬁlmsdaﬂﬁuarmdebmdawm compistion of the coniract. Passageways

mm“ &angwma‘ég]ﬂme& Hlion t‘ebg‘gggsed lg?lrgr?esto fogumm mlfare f
en Precaution mus! a 88 9 ol

JEFFERSON ARISHandtggm

genearal public.

price fist of recordation costs m beobta!nedfrom the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio M formertshof
Jofferson, All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a parformance and a payment bond otherwise stated in
the bid spacifications, the parformanca bond requirements shall be 100% of the confract price. Uniessoﬂteswbestaiemhe
mﬁammmmmmmmmmm1mwmewmm Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of

confract price uniess otheiwise indicated in tha specifications. The parformance bond shall be suppﬁedal@wslmﬂngo

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 160% of the

mmpnw unless ctherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
oon

Al beddam must comply with the requirements stated in the attached *Standard Insurance Requirements® sheet sttached lo this
soficiation. Failure to comply with this instruction will result in bid rejection.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
wmmmmmmmmwmm)wwmamwm vendors must submit an

bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bondmanagmnemsg&em(s as indicated in the electronic bid
eoﬂdmmanc«mualmwmuwse No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid
] n

This is an as neaded basis conlract  JEFFERSON PARISH makes no ropresentations on warranties with regard to minimum
gusranteed quantitios unless otharwise stated in the bid spedifications.

Freight charges should be included in tota!l cost when uoted FOB DELIVERED, fr tmustbe quoted as a
separate itam. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB Do?’»lﬁelgh:mmamnﬂmwdqufm.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Property Nowmmmm% wﬁtoaﬂwﬁd&a&mw
construction, alteration or damolition of public b o projects, in
38:2212.8, LSA-RS 38:2212. 10, LSA-RS 38:2224, andSecz-9231ofme Ordinances. For bidding

‘all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTAR!ZED
mmmw Affidavil, Non-Collusion Affidawl, Campatgn Coniribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and
E-Verify Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors anamaammcemwnmmmmmmmaucwom
8iD DAVIT. This affidavit muswewhnumdin oﬂgémlfotmat and wilhoznmatedal alteration, in order to be compliant
and for tho bid to ba considered responsive. A scanned copy of the comphated notarized affidavit may be
submitted with the bid, however, the successful biddar must submit the original vitinhs l!cmalandwimmmw
aﬁetahmuponconhactexm&on Fammmmwmmwinmwsmniwm tafectedasnm-tespomiva
Parish reservas the right to eward bid lo the next lowast responsive and responsibie bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Compiated. Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with tha provisions
contgingd in LSA - RSSBMdaMSeci&SiofmoJeﬁmPaﬁshCodaofOtdinaneos For mm.anﬁddofs
must submil with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavils, : Non-Coliusion
Affidavit, Dett Disclosures Affidavit and C n Contribution Affidavit For the convenience of vandars, all affidavits havo
been cambined into one form entitted NON PUB WORKSBIDAFFIDAVIT This affidavit must be submitted in s origina!
fmmat.andwnlhoutmataﬂalaﬂemﬁon in order to ba compliant and for the bid to be considered respansive. A scanned copy of
no!anzednmdavﬂmaybesumniuadwﬁhlhew howevar, the successful bidder must

otigma alﬁuavﬂ original format and withoul material alteration upen contract execution. Faflure to comply will
tesuhmmebwsubnussim ngmisctadasmn—mspom&va The Parish reserves the right to avsard bid to tho next lowast
responsive and responsibie bidder in this event
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INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  1M272022 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 5
BID MO 5000157090 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 3
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
B 504-364-2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: RSCOTT

As por LSA-RS 47:301 et seq,, all governmental bodies are excluded from paymaont of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowad for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancoel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day writtan
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each itam
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Depariment.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 6-8 Weeks (Ford)

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are Issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowiedge any addandum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowiedge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*+ ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

F :
S I Coburns Supply

SIGNATURE: n

5 a—/v_) TLE: Esti
(Must be signad haro) W stimator

| PRINT OR TYPE NAME:

Matthew Thames
AHDRENS: 1849 Commercial Dr.
CITY, STATE: i pP;
Harvey, LA 70058
TELEPHONE: FAX:
{225} 341-0823 {504 ) 348-1085
EMAIL ADDRESS:

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _20417.99




DATE: H2022

BID NO.: 60-00137080

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

NUMBER

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

4.0

10.00

1.00

4.00

2.00

12.00

ROLL

Purchaso of varfous stock itoms for tho
Joftarson Partsh Eastbank Warchouse

0010 REDUCER, CONCENTRIC, 8 IN MECH
JOINT X 6 IN FLANGED, DUCTILE IRON,

FUSION EPOXY COATED, WITHOUT ACCESSORIES

MUST HAVE AWWA, ASTR,OR ANSI APPROVAL
AND WRITTEN PROOF OF 1808001
CERTIFICATION.

STK. £ 0094810

0020 MESH, CONCRETE REINFORCING WIRE,
6 IN X 6 1IN, 10/10 GAUGE, EACH ROLL IS

6 FT. X 180 FT., PELICAN & RSXMEX610R
STK. # 0481040

0030 MACHINE, TAPPING, 878 IN THRU 2 IN
COMPLETE W/BOX AND TOOLS, MUELLER

CATALOG #0-§, PART £ 39308
STK. # 0630350

0040 CLAMP, 4 INCH X 12 INCH LONG, ALL
STAINLESS, 4.76 TO 6.15 RANGE, SINGLE

BAND, FULL GASKET, DOMESTIC, CASCADE
#CR1-0480-12
STK. 2 0165000

0050 SLEEVE, TAPPING, 8/8,8 X 8 CI, 0D
RANGE 8.05 - 8.485.

STK. 2 0854320

0080 HUT, OPERATING, 2G-38, FIT3 4, 6 &8
IN RESILIENT SEAT VALVE, MUELLER
2176828

STK. # 0855800

0070 REDUCER, BELL, 2INCH X 1 INCH, NO
LEAD BRASS

STK. 9 0382070

0030 VALVE, RESILIENY SEAT GATE, 6N,
C618 DUCTILE IRON, MECH. JOINT, NRS, 2
IN OPER. NUT, EPOXY COATED, STAINLESS
BOLYS & NUTS, DOMESTIC, NO ACCESSORIES,

M AND H 87571,
STK. # 062405A

No Bid

No Bid

98.34

983.41

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

595.61

7147.32




DATE: 111272022

BID NO.: 60-00137080

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

IVERY
NURIBER

QUANTITY

OESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

1"

12

13

6.00

200

10.00

10.00]

0080 VALVE, RESILIENT SEAT GATE, 4 IN,
€816 DUCTILE IRON, MECH. JOINT, NRS, 2

N OPER. NUT, EPOXY COATED, STAINLESS
BOLTS & NUTS, DOMESTIC, NO ACCESSORIES,
14 AND H #7571,

8TK. 0 062402A

0100 VALVE, CHECK, 3IN, 11 IN FACE TO
FACE, FLANGED, GRAVITY OPERATED, I1BBI,

RUBBER D18C FACING, EPOXY COATED,
STAINLESS STEEL BOLTSNUTS, DONESTIC,
MUELLER #A-2602-6

STK 20821450

0110 GASKET, FLANGE, 3 IN, FULL FACE,
1186 IN THICK TEXTURED RED RUBBER, 1809,

4-HOLE
8T £ 0430850

0120 VALVE, RESILIENT S8EAT GATE, 8 IN,
€515 DUCTILE IRON, MECH. JOINT, NRS, 2

IN OFER. NUT, EPOXY COATED, STAINLESS
BOLTS & NUTS, DOMESTIC, NO ACCESSORIES,
8 AND H #7571,

8TK. #082408A

0130 BOLY, HEX HEAD, 3/4 IN - 10 X 2-3/4

IN LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE §
IDENTIFICATION MARKING, BARED ON BLUE
TEFLON COATING MEETS ASTH B117 TESTING
FOR CORROSION

STK. # 04368590

DELIVER TO:

JEFFERSON PARISH EASTBANK WAREHOUSE
4901 JEFFERSON HIGHWAY

JEFFERSON, LA 70121

MR. CURTIS (ICFARLAND

466.76

2800.56

No Bid

No Bid

948.67

9486.70

No Bid




