INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  1/10/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00121901 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC BUYER: CGASPER

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknow!edge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: ONE

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

TN BA§}C SU?LY, LLC

SIGNATURE: . TITLE:
(Mustbqu %/f/ld/‘% MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAME: = ~ ~ (7
/ym JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:
( y 337-769-0122 ( y 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _2351.50




DATE: 1/10/2018

Page: 5
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.; 50-00121901 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
ELECTRICAL WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR
JEFFERSON PARISH HERO PUMP STATION.
4.
1 15.00 EA 0010 - BLINE B44122ZN PLTD BEAM CLAMP 80 72.00
UNISTRUT RP2785
2 70.00| EA 0020 - BLINE B22SHGALV 10 FT SLOTTED 19.10 1337.00
PRE-GALV CHANNEL
WESANCO W200SSPG10
3 100.00 FT 0030 - DOT CH1212 (JAC12CB) JACK CHAIN 0.32 32.00
100 FT BOX
072-1727
4 100.00 c 0040 - DOT S1-IC (SK114J) 1" S-HOOK 0.13 13.00
N121-574
5 7.00 EA 0050 - EATON DG321NGB 30A 240V 3P N1 42.00 294.00
NON-FUSED SWITCH
6 5.00 EA 0060 - EATON DG321UGB 30A 240V 3P N1 52.50 262.50
NON-FUSED SWITCH
7 2.00 EA 0070 - EATON BAB3020H 3P-120-240V-20A 80.00 160.00
CIRCUIT BREAKER
8 1.00 EA 0080 - SQD Q0320 MINIATURE CIRCUIT 62.00 62.00
BREAKER
9 3.00 EA 0090 - EATON BR2020 2-20A SP DUPLEX 13.00 39.00
c/B
10 2.00 EA 0100 - EATON BR320 3P-240V-20A CIRCUIT 40.00 80.00
BREAKER
1 4.00 EA 0110 - BLINE B104ZN 4H ANGLE CONN NO BID NO BID
12 20.00 EA 0120 - DOT MBS14114 1/4-20X1-1/4" SS NO BID NO BID
HEX MACH BOLT
13 100.00 EA 0130 - DOT FENW14114 (FW14114J) 1/4" NO BID NO BID
FENDER WASHER




DATE: 1/10/2018

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00121901 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER QUANTITY U/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

ATTN: ALFRED CHAN/BRYAN GAUDIN
PH#: 349-5142

DELIVER TO: HERO P/S
4644 PETERS RD.
HARVEY, LA 70058




P2785 3-3/8" Electro Galvanized Zinc Steel Beam
Clamp

Manufacturer ATKORE (UNISTRUT)

E This is an Expanded Catalog ltem

Product Attributes

Grade 33
Load Limit 1000 b
Clamping Range 3/4"

Mount Type Bottomn Flange
Style U-Bolt

Height 3-3/8"

Width 3"

Finish Galvanized
Bolt Size 3/8"-16
Material Steel
Specification ASTM A1011

Type Strut Channel Beam Clamp
Product Weight 0.83
uom Each



WESANCO #W-200-S5-PG-10
Metal Framing Channel Steel 10-ft Pre-Galvanized

Specifications

Type: Metal Framing Width: 1-5/8 in.
Configuration: Single Gauge: 12
Material: Steel Holes: Slots-Back, 9/16 in.x1-1/8 in_, 2 in.OC
Finish: Pre-Galvanized Length: 10 ft.
Height: 1-5/8 in. Manufacturer W200
Series:
Description

Channels: Type - Metal Framing; Configuration - Single; Material - Steel; Finish - Pre-Galvanized; Height - in - 1-5/8; Width - in - 1-5/8;
Gauge - 12; Holes - Slots-Back, 9/16"x1-1/8", 2"0C; Length - 10-ft: Manufacturer Series - W200



Campbell 072-1727 Single Jack Chain, NO 12, 100 Ft L, 29 Lb, Low
Carbon Steel

Use for fixture and novelty suspension, general utility use not requiring
high strength. WARNING: DO NOT EXCEED the working load limits
for chain or components. DO NOT USE for overhead lifting or hoisting.
DO NOT USE if the chain or components are visibly distorted or worn.

SINGLE - LOW-CARBON STEEL
Blu-Krome (Electro-Galvanized)
Trade Size In: 12

Lgth Ft: 100

WLLLb:29

PRODUCT DETAILS

Chain Size: NO 12

Load Capacity: 29

Inner Length: 3/4

Usage: For Fixture And Novelty Suspension

N121-574
OPEN S HOOK 1IN ZN PLT
National Hardware S-Hook, Open, Series: V2076, 5/16 in
Opening, 20 Ib, Steel, Zinc Plated, 0.105 in Diameter, 1 in
Length, BHMA A138.18, For Interior and Exterior
Applications

FEATURES

Light Hook Design For Hanging Home And Industrial
Products

Can Be Opened And Closed With Pliers
Manufactured From Steel Wire
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