2022 Construction Materials Supplier BID NOTICE

<u>Sealed bids</u> for supplying limestone, sand, and/or other suitable approved material used for site development for a period of <u>one (1) year</u> from January 15, 2022 to January 14, 2023 to be delivered and tailgate spread in areas as directed by the Commission will be received by the Greater Lafourche Port Commission (GLPC) located at 16829 East Main, Cut Off, LA 70345 until <u>2:05 PM on Friday</u>, <u>January 7, 2022</u> at which time bids will be opened and read aloud.

Any bids submitted must be on the forms obtained from the GLPC. Sealed bids can be delivered by USPS to 16829 East Main Street, Cut Off, LA 70345, hand delivered or overnight courier service to 131 East 91st Street, Cut Off, LA 70345, or submitted online through the website address below.

Copies of detailed proposal shall be examined online at https://www.centralauctionhouse.com/rfp.php?cid=68 or obtained from the GLPC in person, by emailing glpc@portfourchon.com, or by calling 985-632-6701.

The Commission reserves the right to waive any informality or to reject any and all bids. In the event of a tie, the bid proposal resulting in the lowest administration expense to the GLPC will be selected.

Chett Chiasson
Executive Director
Greater Lafourche Port Commission

PUBLICATION DATES:

THE DAILY COMET: December 8, December 15, 2021, and December 22, 2021

LAFOURCHE GAZETTE: December 8, December 15, 2021, and December 22, 2021

2022 CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS PROPOSAL

GREATER LAFOURCHE PORT COMMISSION

The undersigned bidder, having familiarized itself with the attached stipulations, including the advertised Bid Notice; Stone-Aggregate Specifications; and this Proposal (all of which are made a part hereof) hereby proposes, in compliance with these stipulations, to furnish the Greater Lafourche Port Commission (GLPC) with the following or any part thereof, complete as herein specified, which includes all applicable taxes (except sales tax). The GLPC is tax exempt.

It is <u>not</u> a requirement that all bidders submit a bid for each line item material. Bidders are free to select which line item materials for which they wish to submit a bid. The Commission, at its discretion, may elect to award all or any portion of the following items.

In the event of a tie, the proposal resulting in the lowest administration expense to the GLPC will be selected.

The selected bidder(s) will be required to execute the Affidavit Regarding Employment Verification, as required by Louisiana's Public Bid Law, within 10 days of bid opening date (January 7, 2022).

MATERIAL(S) TO BE DELIVERED AS DIRECTED BY COMMISSION PERSONNEL (All Prices in Figures)

CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

LOCATIONS			
(Golden Meadow "GM")			

1A (GM South) 1B (Intracoastal to GM) 1. RIVER SAND (PER CUBIC YARD) 2. TOP SOIL (PER CUBIC YARD) 3. FILL DIRT (PER CUBIC YARD) 4. YELLOW LIMESTONE, 610 GRADATION (PER TON) \$ No Bid 5.. YELLOW LIMESTONE, 57 GRADATION (PER TON) S No Bid 6. GREY LIMESTONE, 610 GRADATION \$40.40 (PER TON) 7. GREY LIMESTONE, 57 GRADATION 38.30 (PER TON) 8. GREY LIMESTONE, 3 X 1½ GRADATION 39.35 \$ 42.50 (PER TON)

	CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS	1A (GM South	1B (Intracoastal to GM
9.	GABION STONE 4" X 8" (PER TON)	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
10.	MANSIZE RIP RAP (PER TON)	\$ No Rid	\$ No Bid
11.	FILTER CLOTH (GTF-300)		. 4108
	(per square yard; Freight on Board)	\$ \$ 1.19	\$_ \$ /.08
12	FILTER CLOTH (GTF-200)	\$ \$0.85	\$ \$0.76
	(per square yard; Freight on Board)	5 5 5	2 30
13.	TENRBX11131246 TENSAR BX1100	\$ \$ 1.57	\$ \$1.43
	(per square yard; Freight on Board)	⊅ <u>₽</u> /	Φ_ Ψ1
14.	TENRBX12131164 TENSAR BX1200 (per square yard; Freight on Board)	\$ \$ 2.38	\$ \$ 2.16
15.	LANDLOK S2 (PER ROLL)	\$ \$ 2.20	\$ \$2.00
16.	GEOTEXTILE NON-WOVEN FILTER FABR	RIC-15 \$ \$ /./6	\$ \$ 1.06
OTH	ED MATTERIAL C (OPTIONAL) (DECCRIPE	•	•
OTH	ER MATERIALS (OPTIONAL) (DESCRIBE A	AND SPECIFY MEASURE. 1 A	MEN1); 1 B
340	thetic 3x1 Alternate	\$29.00/CY	\$27.00/CY
LOC	ATION OF SUPPLY AND APPROXIMATE Y	ARDAGE STOCKPILED (OPTIONAL):
Abo	we material stockpiled in Thibod	oux LA (Approx.	10,000 CY Stockpile
LIST	OF EQUIPMENT AVAILABLE FOR USE IN	CONTRACT (OPTIONAL):
	NA		1
	1-17.	1101	
NAM	IE <u>Joshua L. Arabie</u> SIGNA	TURE WWW QUE	//
	E Member / Manager		
FIRM Onshare Materials, LLC			
ADD	PRESS 127 Lincoln Lane		
CITY	Thibodaux	STATE ZIP ZIP	70301
РНО	NE <u>985-449-0391</u>	FAX 985 - 447 - 6	6729

EMAIL	trac@onshoreco.com	
SALES PEI	RSON TO CALL FOR ORDERS:	

NAME Trac Eschette

PHONE 985-449-0391

PER TON BIDS

All loads that are ordered on a per ton basis must be accompanied by a weight ticket from a DOTD Certified Weigh Scale.

STONE - AGGREGATE SPECIFICATIONS

ROAD BASE AGGREGATE NO. 610		COARSE AGGREGATE NO. 57 - % Passing		MANSIZE RIP RAP		AGGREGATE WEIGHT	
1 ½" 1" ³ ¼" 3/8"	100 90-100 70-95 50-80	1 ½" 1" ½" #4	100 90-100 25-60 00-10	125 # 75-125 # 25-74 # 6-24 #	100 40-50 20-40 10-25	610 57 Rip Rap	100 #/Cu. Ft. 90 #/Cu. Ft. 80 #/Cu. Ft.
#4 #10 #40	35-65 25-50 10-26	#8	00-05	0-6#	00-15		
#200	04-12						

LIGHT WEIGHT AGGREGATE (COARSE)

Minimum weight of 37# / Cu. Ft. (as specified in the 1992 edition of the Louisiana Standard Specifications for Roads and Bridges Section 1003.02(b)(3).

DELIVERY AND ORDERING SPECIFICATIONS

You may be required to deliver requested materials in 14-yard tandem trucks and/or in 18-wheeler trucks. While your bid shall not include two separate prices for each option, you should consider any additional cost you may incur using either method. In other words, your bid price will apply to delivery in both 14-yard tandem trucks and in 18-wheeler trucks. On large projects, contractor may be required to deliver a minimum of 1,500 yards per day of dirt or sand, or a minimum of 1,200 tons of stone per day. GLPC hours of operations to receive deliveries are 7:00AM to 3:00PM Monday thru Friday. The selected bidder(s) shall deliver materials within the hours of operation listed above at the earliest time but no later than 3 days after order.

DELIVERY AREAS

For purposes of receiving this bid, the Commission has established different delivery areas and/or methods for which they would like to receive a price. Location 1A shall encompass tailgate delivery to any area from the Leon Theriot Lock south to Port Fourchon. Location 1B shall encompass tailgate delivery to any area from the Intracoastal Canal in Larose south to the Leon Theriot Lock in Golden Meadow.

Name of Project

Date of Bid

STATE OF LOUISIANA

PARISH OF LAFOURCHE

AFFIDAVIT

Before me, the undersigned notary public, duly commissioned and qualified in and for the parish and state aforesaid, personally came and appeared Affiant, who after being duly sworn, attested as follows:

LA. R.S. 38:2212.10 Verification of Employees

- A. At the time of bidding, Appearer is registered and participates in a status verification system to verify that all new hires in the state of Louisiana are legal citizens of the United States or are legal aliens.
- B. If awarded the contract, Appearer shall continue, during the term of the contract, to utilize a status verification system to verify the legal status of all new employees in the state of Louisiana.
- C. If awarded the contract, Appearer shall require all subcontractors to submit to it a sworn affidavit verifying compliance with Paragraphs (A) and (B) of this Subsection.

Onshore Materials, LLC NAME OF BIDDER	NAME OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER
7-5-2021. DATE	TITLE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER
SIGNAT	TURE OF AUTHORIZED
SIGNATO	DRY OF BIDDER/AFFIANT
Sworn to and subscribed before me by A	official on the 5 day of $\sqrt{2022}$.
Sh	Notary Public Christopher H. Rivlere Bar Roll #: 11297 Notary ID#: 14956
	w 8 - ⁷