

C#1110433

DATE: 4/17/2015

INVITATION TO BID  
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 1

BID NO.: 50-00113062

**JEFFERSON PARISH**  
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
P.O. BOX 9  
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009  
504-364-2678

WHEN ORDERING OFF THIS BID,  
PLEASE INDICATE THIS BID  
NUMBER ON ALL ORDERS.

15-48673

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

BUYER: MOVALLE

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 4/27/2015 via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at [www.jeffparish.net](http://www.jeffparish.net)

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of Louisiana Law, as well compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution No. 113647. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may also obtain a copy by visiting the Purchasing Department webpage at [www.purchasing.jeffparish.net](http://www.purchasing.jeffparish.net) and clicking on On-line forms.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. Items bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item pricing forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit prices shall prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders' questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

**USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS:** Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and VII of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), (d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute's specifications (ANSI A117.1-1961).

## INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

### IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT TO ALL VENDORS

This Electronic Procurement System allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online. This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only.

Please visit the Purchasing Department webpage at <http://purchasing.jeffparish.net> to register and review Jefferson Parish solicitations.

## ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

1. All bidders must attend the pre-bid conference in relation to this bid; attendance is mandatory. Failure to attend will prohibit a company from submitting a bid. Vendors are hereby noticed that any vendor arriving after the mandatory pre-bid conference begins will not be allowed to sign in as evidence of attendance.
2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification with no additional cost to the owner.
3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.
4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected. Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
5. It is the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.
6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract. Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

## INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

7. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of \$5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of \$25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
8. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
9. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.
10. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procure standard insurance policies evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicted on the attached sheet. The current certificate of insurance must be submitted by low bidder within 10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.
11. A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid Solicitation on Central Auction House. No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.
12. This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations or warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.
13. Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form.
14. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits (in Original Format) required; Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit and E-Verify Affidavit must be completed, signed, notarized and submitted by low bidder within 10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department on all solicitations for construction, alteration or demolition of public building or project, including but not limited to requirements found in LSA-RS 38:2212.9; LSA-RS 38:2212.10; LSA-RS 38:2224; Code of Ordinances, Jefferson Parish, Louisiana, Sec 2-923.1. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected; the Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format for the bid to be considered responsive.
15. NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits (in Original Format) required; Non-Collusion Affidavit, and Campaign Contribution Affidavit must be completed, signed, notarized and submitted by low bidder with bid submission or within 10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department. See LSA-RS 38:2212.10; LSA-RS 38:2224; Code of Ordinances, Jefferson Parish, Louisiana, Sec 2-923.1 Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected; the Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format for the bid to be considered responsive.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection, performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.

DATE: 4/17/2015

INVITATION TO BID  
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 4

BID NO.: 50-00113062

**JEFFERSON PARISH**

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
P.O. BOX 9  
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009  
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

BUYER: MOVALLE

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 4/27/2015 via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at [www.jeffparish.net](http://www.jeffparish.net)

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation supplied with your quotation.

**DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH**

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

2-10 Days And

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_  
NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_  
NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_  
NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

N-30  
FOR DESTINATION

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) \_\_\_\_\_

<b>*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***</b>	
FIRM NAME:	BSN SPORTS PO BOX 7726
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)	DALLAS, TX 75209-0726
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:	CHRIS BLOOMFIELD BID DIRECTOR
ADDRESS:	BSN SPORTS PO BOX 7726
CITY, STATE:	DALLAS, TX 75209-0726
TELEPHONE:	(800) 527-7510 x 7324
FAX:	(800) 365-7653
EMAIL ADDRESS:	BSNBID@BSNSPORTS.COM

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 121.71

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 5

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			A ONE TIME PURCHASE OF VARIOUS ARTS AND CRAFTS ITEMS FOR JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF RECREATION.		
1	1.00	ONLY	0010 AC746 COLOR SPLASH FOAM SHAPES W/ ADHESIVE NUMBERS, 600 PCS	NO BID	
2	1.00	ONLY	0020 AC750 COLOR SPLASH FOAM SHAPES W/ ADHESIVE HEARTS, 500 PCS		
3	1.00	ONLY	0030 AC756 COLOR SPLASH FOAM SHAPES W/ ADHESIVE ABCS, 1000 PCS		
4	3.00	EA	0040 AC822 EVA FOAM SHEET ASSORTMENT (PACK OF 78)		
5	2.00	EA	0050 AC935 COLOR SPLASH SHAPES W/O ADHESIVE-PEACE SIGNS, 800 PCS		
6	2.00	EA	0060 AS501 SHARPIE PERMANENT MARKERS FINE POINT (SET OF 8)		
7	1.00	ONLY	0070 AC609 100' ROLL MAGNETIC STRIP W/ ADHESIVE		
8	4.00	EA	0080 BE1152 VERTICAL HOLE ALPHA BEADS		
9	5.00	EA	0090 BE630X WHITE ELASTIC CORD 100YD MEDIUM		
10	18.00	EA	0100 BE943 OPAQUE PONY BEADS 1/2 LB BAG		
11	15.00	EA	0110 CE4647 SNEAKER KEY RING CRAFT KIT (MAKES 12)		
12	3.00	EA	0120 CO127 PAPER FANS (MAKES 24)		
13	1.00	ONLY	0130 CO94 PLASTIC FUNNEL (PACK OF 24)	✓	

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 6

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
14	12.00	EA	0140 GL422C 16OZ ALEENE'S TACKY GLUE	NO BID	
15	5.00	EA	0150 GL580 ALEENE'S FOAMTASTIC FOAM GLUE		
16	3.00	EA	0160 GL597 COLOR SPLASH GLUE STICK, PURPLE (PACK OF 30)		
17	1.00	ONLY	0170 GL607 COLOR SPLASH MINI GLITTER GLUE PENS (PACK OF 72)		
18	2.00	EA	0180 GL618 STANDARD GLUE STICKS (PACK OF 30)		
19	15.00	EA	0190 GP1764 FOOTBALL FUN HELMETS CRAFT KIT (MAKES 12)		
20	20.00	EA	0200 GP2174 COLLAPSIBLE WATER BOTTLE CRAFT KIT (MAKES 12)		
21	2.00	EA	0210 GP3010 ASSORTED NEON PARACHUTE CORD BRACELET CRAFT KIT (MAKES 24)		
22	3.00	EA	0220 GP482 DESIGN-A-HAT CRAFT KIT (MAKES 12)		
23	1.00	ONLY	0230 LT15 COLOR SPLASH LIQUID TEMPERA 16OZ ASSORTMENT (PACK OF 12)		
24	2.00	EA	0240 PE1031 SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  DARK BLUE		
25	2.00	EA	0250 PE1032 SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  DARK BROWN		
26	3.00	EA	0260 PE107A WHITE NEWPRINT PAPER 12"X18" 30LB		

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
27	2.00	EA	0270 PE113BG SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  BRIGHT GREEN	NO BID	
28	6.00	EA	0280 PE113BK SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  BLACK		
29	6.00	EA	0290 PE113BL SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  BLUE		
30	2.00	EA	0300 PE113BR SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  BROWN		
31	2.00	EA	0310 PE113DG SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  DARK GREEN		
32	2.00	EA	0320 PE113GR SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER (PACK OF 50)  HOLIDAY GREEN		
33	2.00	EA	0330 PE113 SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  GRAY		
34	4.00	EA	0340 PE113HP SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  HOT PINK		
35	2.00	EA	0350 PE113LB SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  SKY BLUE		
36	2.00	EA	0360 PE113LBR SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  LIGHT BROWN		
37	2.00	EA	0370 PE113LG SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 8

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			LIGHT GREEN		
38	4.00	EA	0380 PE113LI SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)	NO BID	
			LILAC		
39	4.00	EA	0390 PE113MA SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			MAGENTA		
40	4.00	EA	0400 PE113MU SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			ASSORTED		
41	2.00	EA	0410 PE113PK SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			PINK		
42	6.00	EA	0420 PW113RE SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			HOLIDAY RED		
43	4.00	EA	0430 PE113SC SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			SCARLET		
44	2.00	EA	0440 PE113VI SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			VIOLET		
45	4.00	EA	0450 PE113WT SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			BRIGHT WHITE		
46	2.00	EA	0460 PE113YE SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			YELLOW		
47	4.00	EA	0470 PE113OG SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)		
			ORANGE		

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 9

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
48	2.00	EA	0480 PE1197 COFFEE FILTERS (PACK OF 250)	<del>NO BID</del>	
49	6.00	EA	0490 PE122 ART TISSUE ASSORTMENT 20"X30" (PACK OF 20)	<del>NO BID</del>	
50	5.00	EA	0500 PE126C PAPER PLATES 9" (PACK OF 100 )	<del>NO BID</del>	
51	10.00	EA	0510 PE1627 ARTIST SKETCH PAD 9"X12"	<del>NO BID</del>	
52	2.00	EA	0520 PE585 SUNWORKS GROUNDWOOD CONSTRUCTION PAPER 9"X12" (PACK OF 50)  RED	<del>NO BID</del>	
53	1.00	ONLY	0530 PE768 BRIGHT WHITE SULPHITE DRAWING PAPER 12"X18" 50LB	<del>NO BID</del>	
54	1.00	ONLY	0540 PE770 BUDGET MANILA DRAWING PAPER 12"X18" 40LB	<del>NO BID</del>	
55	1.00	ONLY	0550 PT3126 2OZ COLOR SPLASH ACRYLIC PAINT (SET OF 12)	<del>NO BID</del>	
56	2.00	EA	0560 PT3306 COLOR SPLASH WATER COLOR MEGA PACK (PACK OF 36)	<del>NO BID</del>	
57	1.00	ONLY	0570 PT3321 8OZ COLOR SPLASH WASHABLE TEMPERA PAINT (PACK OF 12)	<del>NO BID</del>	
58	2.00	EA	0580 SC1116 CHARCOAL SQUARE PASTELS (PACK OF 12)	<del>NO BID</del>	
59	3.00	EA	0590 SC1127 WASHABLE MARKERS SCHOOL PACK (PACK OF 200)	<del>NO BID</del>	
60	1.00	ONLY	0600 SC1174 NO. 2 PENCILS W/ERASER (PACK OF 144)	<del>NO BID</del>	
BSN SPORTS PO BOX 7726 DALLAS, TX 75209-0726			CHRIS BLOOMFIELD BID DIRECTOR		

DATE: 4/17/2016

Page: 10

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
61	1.00	ONLY	0610 SC1192 SHARPIE FINE TIP METALLIC MARKERS (PACK OF 6)	No Bid	
62	3.00	EA	0620 SC672 SQUARE COMPRESSED CHARCOAL (BOX OF 12)		
63	3.00	EA	0630 PENTEL OIL PASTEL SETS (SET/25) (BOX OF 25)		
64	1.00	ONLY	0640 SC743 PINK PEARL ERASER (PACK OF 36 )		
65	2.00	EA	0650 SC795 CRAYOLA CLASSPACK COLORED PENCILS 12 COLORS (BOX OF 240)		
66	2.00	EA	0660 SC800 CRAYOLA CLASSPACK CRAYONS REGULAR 16 COLORS (BOX OF 800)		
67	2.00	EA	0670 SC809 CRAYOLA CLASSPACK MARKERS 16 COLORS REGULAR TIP (BOX OF 256)		
68	1.00	ONLY	0680 SCC877 COLOR SPLASH GIANT BOX OF SIDEWALK CHALK (BOX OF 126)		
69	1.00	ONLY	0690 SC883 COLOR SPLASH BROADLINE MARKERS PLUS PACK OF 8 COLORS (PACK OF 200)		
70	2.00	EA	0700 SP3974 SAND ART BOTTLES (PACK OF 24 )		
71	3.00	EA	0710 SP3975 COLORED ART SAND 12OZ (PACK OF 10)	✓	
72	2.00	EA	0720 SY641 FOAM BALLS 2" (PACK OF 12)	✓	
73	10.00	EA	0730 SY669 STYROFOAM CUBE	No Bid	

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 11

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
74	1.00	ONLY	0740 SZ627 FISKARS SCISSORS FOR KIDS POINTED TIP (PACK OF 12)	NO BID	
75	2.00	EA	0750 TR106 CHENILLE STEMS 12"LX6MM (PACK OF 1000)		
76	8.00	EA	0760 TR87 CHENILLE STEMS 12"LX6MM SPARKLE (PACK OF 100)		
77	7.00	EA	0770 CLOTHESPINS, SPRING 2-3/4" (PACK OF 100)		
78	1.00	ONLY	0780 W10320 SPECTRUM ECONOMY CANDY STRIPED HOOPS (PACK OF 12) SMALL 2 1/2 INCH MT. SAGE BSN #1106495 24" DIA.	29.84	29.84
79	1.00	ONLY	0790 W4540GR FLOOR MARKING TAPE 2" WIDE GREEN BSN # FTAP26GR	5.92	5.92
80	2.00	EA	0800 W4540YE FLOOR MARKING TAPE 2" WIDE YELLOW BSN # FTAP26GO *4020.	5.92	11.84
81	3.00	EA	0810 W4952 FITNESS DICE (PAIR)	NO BID	
82	2.00	EA	0820 W4998003 SPECTRUM JUMP ROPES (SET OF 6)		
83	1.00	ONLY	0830 W5267 BIG 10 BOWLING MT. SAGE BSN #1246162 *ONE BSN	37.17	37.17
84	5.00	EA	0840 W5896001 SPECTRUM WHISTLE-RED	NO BID	
85	5.00	EA	0850 W5896005 SPECTRUM WHISTLE-PURPLE		
86	1.00	ONLY	0860 W8699 GIANT FOUR IN A ROW		
87	1.00	ONLY	0870 W8731 2-IN-1 SHUFFLEBOARD COURT/BOWLING LANE MT.		

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR

DATE: 4/17/2015

Page: 12

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00113062

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
88	10.00	EA	0880 W9455001 BREAKAWAY ROPE LANYARD RED	NO BID	
89	10.00	EA	0890 W9455003 BREAKAWAY ROPE LANYARD BLUE		
90	5.00	EA	0900 W9455004 BREAKAWAY ROPE LANYARD GREEN		
91	10.00	EA	0910 W9455005 BREAKAWAY ROPE LANYARD ORANGE		
92	5.00	EA	0920 W9455006 BREAKAWAY ROPE LANYARD PURPLE	NO BID	
93	1.00	ONLY	0930 W8749 ROLLER SHUFFLEBOARD DISC (SET OF 8) Aut. Swn BSW #11 set of 8.	36.9457	36.94
94	1.00	ONLY	0940 W9756 JUMBO FOAM DOMINOES (PACK OF 28)	NO BID	
95	2.00	EA	0950 YA22C POM POMS 1" ASSORTED COLORS (PACK OF 100)	NO BID	
96	3.00	EA	0960 16143001 PLASTIC TREASURE CHEST WITH LID GOLD/BLACK		

BSN SPORTS  
PO BOX 7726  
DALLAS, TX 75209-0726

CHRIS BLOOMFIELD  
BID DIRECTOR



**CENTRALBIDDING**  
FROM CENTRAL AUCTION HOUSE

**5000113062 - A one time purchase of various art and craft items for  
Jefferson Parish Department of Recreation.  
Jefferson Parish Government**

Project documents obtained from [www.CentralBidding.com](http://www.CentralBidding.com)  
22-Apr-2015 09:42:01 AM