

DATE: 3/16/2018  
BID NO.: 50-00122588

INVITATION TO BID  
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 4

**JEFFERSON PARISH**

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT  
P.O. BOX 9  
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009  
504-364-2678

VENDOR: **BASIC SUPPLY, LLC**

BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

**DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH**

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

**2-3 WEEKS**

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

NUMBER: \_\_\_\_\_

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) \_\_\_\_\_

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***	
FIRM NAME:	<b>BASIC SUPPLY, LLC</b>
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)	TITLE: <b>MANAGER</b>
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:	<b>JOHN ATKINSON</b>
ADDRESS:	<b>PO BOX 63066</b>
CITY, STATE:	ZIP: <b>70596</b>
TELEPHONE: ( ) <b>337-769-0122</b>	FAX: ( ) <b>337-247-7699</b>
EMAIL ADDRESS:	<b>charlotte@basicsupply.com</b>

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ **670.36**

## INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00122588

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH WB PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT		
1	48.00	PR	0010 - GLOVES SHORT BLACK PVC COATED, KNIT WRIST,COTTON LINED,MEMPHIS #6100	1.14	54.72
			GRAINGER #49DA36,MSC #76552090 SK#00-0580460 <b>A400</b>		
2	6.00	EA	0020 - TROWEL,BRICK,9 IN LONG X 4-3/4 IN WIDE,TEMPERED SPRING STEEL BLADE,  MALLEABLE IRON SHANK RIVETED TO HICKORY HANDLE,DOMESTIC, OSBORNE #180 SK# 00-0591000 <b>5646096</b>	5.96	35.76
3	4.00	EA	0030 - CUTTER,WIRE ROPE,HAMMER-TYPE, 1-1/16"CAPACITY,MORSE-STARRETT MODEL #1A  SK# 00-0581220	NO BID	NO BID
4	2.00	EA	0040 - CUTTER,WIRE ROPE,1-1/2 IN CAPACITY,HAMMER TYPE,MORSE-STARRETT,  MODEL #2 SK#00-0581240	NO BID	NO BID
5	36.00	EA	0050 - LAMP,FLUORESCENT,TWIST,23 WATT COMPACT,120 VOLT,6-1/8 IN LONG,MEDIUM  SCREW BASE, SYLVANIA #CF23EL830MED SK# 00-048221D	NO BID	NO BID
6	7.00	EA	0060 - TIP,WELDER,VICTOR #2-1-101 SK# 00-0307030 <b>31-1282</b>	8.56	59.92
7	6.00	EA	0070 - TIP,WELDER,VICTOR #3-1-101,6700C 2413 JLZ <b>32-1283</b> SK# 00-0307040	8.56	51.36
8	12.00	EA	0080 - SUPPORT,BACK,XX-LARGE WITH LUMBAR PAD, POWERBRIGHT ORANGE,DECADE  CADET #46585 OR ERGODYNE #11886 SK# 00-0477150 <b>SB200</b>	7.25	87.00
9	20.00	EA	0090 - SAW,PVC,18 INCH BLADE,TO CUT PVC ABS,WOOD VANEER,RIGID #50522  SK# 00-0585860 <b>2677391</b>	19.08	381.60
10	12.00	EA	0110 - RULE,TAPE,OUTSIDE DIAMETER,6 FT LONG WITH 16 THS & 100 THS INCH,LUFKIN	NO BID	NO BID

DATE: 3/16/2018

Page: 6

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00122588

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			# W606PD SK# 00-0590510		

**A400:**

PVC Knitwrist A400. A best seller the red PVC fully dipped working glove with knitted wrist and cotton interlock lining has a smooth finish with excellent abrasion resistance. Extremely flexible PVC. Fully REACH compliant PVC coating. Fully coated for maximum liquid protection. Cotton liner with knitwrist. Men's Sizes S-XX. Please specify sizes when ordering.

**5646096**

**ProSource 16610 Brick Trowel, 10 In L High Carbon Steel Blade, Hardwood Handle**

Hardened tempered high-carbon steel blade. High-lift handle for maximum hand clearance with a polished steel ferrule.

**Blade Length:** 10 In  
**Handle Material:** Hardwood  
**Blade Material:** High Carbon Steel  
**Handle Type:** Durable Ergo Soft

**FEATURES**

Has Hardened And Tempered High Carbon Steel  
 High-Lift Handle For Maximum Hand Clearance With A  
 Polished Steel Ferrule  
 Durable Ergo Soft Handle Reduces Fatigue

**2677391**

**Lenox 20980HSF18 Hand Saw, 18 In L, 10 TPI**

Wide, Rigid Carbon Steel Blade With Precision Milled Teeth. Cuts Through Any Diameter Plastic Pipe, Wood And Nail-Embedded Wood. Cuts On Push And Pull Strokes. Blade Resists Flexing, Attaches To Handle With Single Screw. Lightweight Aluminum Handle With Large Opening Hand Grip For Max Finger Clearance And Enough Room For Gloves. 10 Teeth Per Inch.

**PRODUCT DETAILS**

**Blade Length:** 18 In  
**Blade Material:** Carbon Steel  
**Handle Material:** Aluminum  
**Handle Type:** Comfort Grip

**Includes:** Blade

**Overall Length:** 22 In  
**T P I Or Pitch:** 10 TPI

**Usage:**For Cutting Plastic, PVC And ABS

**FEATURES**

Teeth Cut On The Pull Stroke And Not On The Push Stroke For Safety  
 Over Molded Rubberized Grip For A Comfortable And Secure Grip While Working  
 Flush Cutting Option Easily Mount The Blade On The Bottom Of Handle For Flush Cutting Applications

# K-T Victor® Style Tips-

## HEAVY DUTY OXY-ACETYLENE CUTTING TIP

Style 1-101. Fits Victor® Journeyman®

Model No.	Size	Model No.	Size
31-1279	00	31-1282	2
31-1280	0	31-1283	3
31-1281	1		



Oxy-Acetylene

## QUOTING 31-1282 & 31-1283