DATE:  8/09/2017 Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00120493 BID FORM

Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will

only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.

Are you requesting an escalation provision?
YES NO . . . .
3% or BLS National Index whichever is higher
MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED %
INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF 45 days

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 5-15 business days

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) N/A
THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

FIRM NAME: Agni Enterprises, LLC (dba) Head to Heels Safety Supplies

ADDRESs: 2865 SW 69th Ct.,

C|1:Y, sTATE: Miami, FL 2IP: 33155

TELEPHONE: (305 ) 712-6653 FAX: (888) 592-3667

EMAIL ADDRESS: CService@headtoheels.net

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form.Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form
will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: 1

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ 33:627.60
AUTHORIZED 3 .
SHGHATIOE i Subbarayan R Pochi Ph.D.

Printed Name

nirte: Manager & COO

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE
indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
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DATE: 8/09/2017

BID NO.: 50-00120493

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U/M

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

10.00

20.00

700.00

500.00

5.00

70.00

100.00

10.00

700.00

360.00

8.00

BX

BX

BX

BTL

BTL

BTL

BTL

BTL

TRAY

TRAY

BX

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR VETERINARY
MEDICAL SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON
PARISH ANIMAL SHELTER

0001 - ABAXIS COMPREHENSIVE DIAGNESTIC
PROFILES, 48 COUNT/BOX

ABAXIS ITEM 415892

0002 - ABAXIS COMPREHENSIVE DIAGNESTIC
PROFILES, 24 COUNT/BOX

ABAXIS ITEM 415888

0003 - ACTIVYL XLG 6 X 6PK, 36 DOSES
MEREK 115627

0004 - ALCOHOL, 4 QTS TO A BOX,
VEDCO ITEM 104350

0005 - AMOXICILLIN, TABLET, 400 MG
500 COUNT

0006 - ATROPHINE SULFATE INJ 1/120
GRAIN 100ML

VEDCO ITEM 12300

0007 - AZITHROMYCIN, 40 MG/ML 15 ML

0008 - BAYTRIL INJECTABLE, 22.7 MG/ML,
20 ML BOTTLE

0009 - BIVALANT INFLUENZA VACCINES,
25 DOSES/TRAY

MEREK ITEM 138310

0010 - BORDATELLA VACCINE,
25 DOSES/TRAY

0011 - BRAVECTO 4.4 - 9.9 LBS CHEWABLE
FLEA, 10/BOX

MERECK ITEM 131100

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$5.28

$2,640.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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DATE: 8/09/2017 Page 7
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid No Bid
12 8.00 BX 0012 - BRAVECTO 44 - 88 LBS, 10/BOX
MEREK ITEM 131175
No Bid No Bid
13 8.00 BX 0013 - BRAVECTO 9.9 - 22 LBS, 10/BOX
MEREK ITEM 131125
No Bid No Bid
14 50.00 BTL 0014 - BUTORPHANOL, 10 MG/ML
10 ML BOTTLE
No Bid No Bid
15 12.00 BX 0015 - CAPSTAR OVER 25 LBS, 60 COUNT
ELANCO 604154M
No Bid No Bid
16 12.00 BX 0016 - CAPSTAR UNDER 25 LBS, 60 COUNT
ELANCO 604153M
No Bid No Bid
17 150.00 cs 0017 - CARDBOARD PET CARRIERS, 12/CASE
No Bid No Bid
18 50.00 EA 0018 - CATHETERS, TOMCAT, 14 CM
$59.12 $591.20
19 10.00 BX 0019 - CATHETERS, 20 GAUGE X 1", 50/BOX
$59.12 $591.20
20 10.00 BX 0020 - CATHETERS, 20 GAUGE X 2", 50/BOX
$59.12 $591.20
21 10.00 BX 0021 - CATHETERS, 24 GAUGE X 3/4",
50/BOX
No Bid No Bid
22 30.00 BTL 0022 - CEFPODOXIME (SIMPLICEF), 100 MG,
100 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
23 15.00 BTL 0023 - CEFPODOXIME (SIMPLICEF), 200 MG,
100 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
24 10.00 BTL 0024 - CEPHALEXIN TABLETS, 500 MG,
500 TABS
No Bid No Bid
25 10.00 BTL 0025 - CEPHALEXIN, 250 MG CAPSULES,
100 COUNT
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DATE: 8/09/2017

Page 8
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid No Bid
26 20.00 GL 0026 - CHLORHEXADINE SCRUB, 2 PERCENT
No Bid No Bid
27 30.00 GL 0027 - CHLORHEXADINE SCRUB, 4 PERCENT
No Bid No Bid
28 15.00 BTL 0028 - CLINDAMYCIN ORAL SUSPENSION,
20 ML
VEDCO ITEM 160050 . .
No Bid No Bid
29 250.00 TRAY 0029 - DA2PP VACCINE, 25 DOSES/TRAY
No Bid No Bid
30 260.00 TRAY 0030 - DA2PPL VACCINE, 25 DOSES/TRAY
No Bid No Bid
31 20.00 BTL 0031 - DECTOMAX (DORAMECTIN) INJECTIBLE
100 ML
No Bid No Bid
32 50.00 BTL 0032 - DOXYCYCLINE, 100 MG, 500 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
33 20.00 BX 0033 - DTM CULTURES, 10/BOX
' No Bid
34 120.00 BTL 0034 - ENALAPRIL MALEATE 2.5 MG, NO Bld
100 COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 206040 . .
No Bid No Bid
35 120.00 BTL 0035 - ENALAPRIL MALEATE 2.5 MG, 1000
COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 206043 . .
No Bid No Bid
36 120.00 BTL 0036 - ENALAPRIL MALEATE 5 MG, 100 COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 206045
No Bid No Bid
37 120.00 BTL 0037 - ENALAPRIL MALEATE 5MG, 1000 COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 206047
No Bid No Bid
38 20.00 BTL 0038 - EPI OTIC ADVANCED CLEANER 8 0Z
VIRBAC ITEM 209803
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DATE: 8/09/2017

Page 9
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid No Bid
39 150.00 BTL 0039 - FATAL PLUS, 250 ML
No Bid No Bid
40 20.00 BX 0040 - FELV/FIV COMBO TESTS, 30/BOX
No Bid No Bid
4 550.00 TRAY 0041 - FVRCP VACCINE, 25 DOSES/TRAY
$119.88 $8,391.60
42 70.00 cs 0042 - GAUZE SPONGE, 4 X 4 12 PLY,
4000/CASE
No Bid No Bid
43 20.00 BX 0043 - GIARDIA TESTS, 25/BOX
No Bid No Bid
44 10.00 BTL 0044 - HEXZOLE SHAMPOO LOVET 16 0Z
ITEM 248625
No Bid No Bid
45 20.00 BTL 0045 - HYDROMORPHONE, 40MG/ML, 20 ML
No Bid No Bid
46 90.00 BTL 0046 - ISOFLURANE, 250 ML
No Bid No Bid
a7 50.00 BTL 0047 - KETAMINE, 100 MG/ML, 10 ML
No Bid No Bid
48 20.00 BTL 0048 - KETOCONAZOLE, 200 MG TABLETS,
100 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
49 50.00 GL 0049 - LIME PLUS DIP GALLON DECHRA
ITEM 275860
No Bid No Bid
50 50.00 BX 0050 - MARQUIS PASTE, 4 TUBES/BOX
No Bid No Bid
51 20.00 BTL 0051 - METACAM INJECTION, 5 MG/ML, 10 ML
No Bid No Bid
52 5.00 BTL 0052 - METRONIDAZOLE, 250 MG, 500 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
53 12.00 BTL 0053 - METRONIDAZOLE, 500 MG, 500 COUNT
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DATE: 8/09/2017 Page 10
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY u/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid No Bid
54 200.00 BTL 0054 - MINOCYCLINE, 100 MG CAPUSLES,
500 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
55 200.00 BTL 0055 - MINOCYCLINE, 50 MG CAPSULES,
100 COUNT
$6.15 $307.50
56 50.00 BX 0056 - NEEDLES, 18 GAUGE, 100 COUNT
$6.15 $307.50
57 50.00 BX 0057 - NEEDLES, 20 GAUGE, 100 COUNT
$6.15 $1,230.00
58 200.00 BX 0058 - NEEDLES, 22 GAUGE, 100 COUNT
. 30.00
59 200.00 BX 0059 - NEEDLES, 25 GAUGE, 100 COUNT $6.15 $1,2
No Bid No Bid
60 250.00 TUBE 0060 - NEO/POLY/BAC OPTHALMIC OINTIMENT,
3.5 GM
No Bid No Bid
61 10.00 EA 0061 - NEO/POLY/BAC WITH DEXAMETHASONE
OINTMENT CLIPPER OPTHALMIC ITEM 185700
No Bid No Bid
62 10.00 BX 0062 - NOVOX CHEWABLE 100 MG 180CT
VEDCO ITEM 301980
No Bid No Bid
63 5.00 BX 0063 - NOVOX CHEWABLE 25 MG 180 COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 301940
No Bid No Bid
64 5.00 BX 0064 - NOVOX 75 MG 180 COUNT
VEDCO ITEM 301965
No Bid No Bid
65 250.00 BTL 0065 - ORBAX (ORBIFLOXACIN) SUSPENSION
30 MG/ML 6/20ML BTL
MEREK ITEM 305645 ) .
No Bid No Bid
66 8.00 BX 0066 - OPTHALMIC OINTMENT
(2% CYCLOSPORINE), 6/BOX
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DATE: 8/09/2017 Page 1
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY u/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
MEREK ITEM 305600 . .
No Bid No Bid
67 10.00 EA 0067 - OTOMAX OINTMENT, 8 OZ
No Bid No Bid
68 20.00 BTL 0068 - PANACUR LIQUID 1000 ML
No Bid No Bid
69 70.00 BX 0069 - PILL POCKETS FOR DOGS, LARGE
SIZE, BEEF OR POULTRY FLAVOR, 6/BOX
No Bid No Bid
70 10.00 BTL 0070 - PREDNISONE, 20 MG TABLETS, 1000CT
No Bid No Bid
7 10.00 BTL 0071 - PREDNISONE, 5 MG TABLETS, 1000CT
No Bid No Bid
72 45.00 BTL 0072 - PYRANTEL, 32 0Z
No Bid No Bid
73 700.00 BTL 0073 - RABIES VACCINE, 10 DOSE TANK,
CANINE/FELINE
$46.25 $925.00
74 20.00 BX 0074 - SENSI-TOUCH POWDER FREE GLOVES,
SIZE 6.5, 50/BOX
ANSEL ITEM 242830 ) ]
No Bid No Bid
75 25.00 BX 0075 - SURGICAL DRAPE, 38 IN X 100 YD
$11.11 $1,111.00
76 100.00 " BX 0076 - SYRINGES 3CC W/O NEEDLE, 100/BOX
No Bid No Bid
77 100.00 BX 0077 - SYRINGES, 1CC W/20 GAUGE NEEDLE,
100/BOX
$17.65 $529.50
78 30.00 BX 0078 - SYRINGES, 10CC WITHOUT NEEDLE,
100/BOX
$11.15 $9,477.50
79 850.00 BX 0079 - SYRINGES, 3CC W/20 GAUGE NEEDLE,
100/BOX
$30.54 $1,542.00
80 50.00 BX 0080 - SYRINGES, 35CC W/O NEEDLE, 25/BOX
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DATE: 8/09/2017 Page 12
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120493 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
No Bid No Bid
81 200.00 TUBE 0081 - TOBRAMYCIN EYE DROPS, 5 ML
No Bid No Bid
82 50.00 BTL 0082 - TRAMADOL, 50 MG, 100 COUNT
$15.85 $951.00
83 60.00 BX 0083 - VEDCO SURGICAL BLADES STAINLESS
STEEL SINGLE WRAP, 100/BOX
ITEM 364200 . .
No Bid No Bid
84 20.00 BTL 0084 - VETMEDIN 1.25 MG, BOERINGER
50 COUNT
No Bid No Bid
85 20.00 BTL 0085 - VETMEDIN 5MG, BOERINGER 50 COUNT
ITEM 409125
$321.14 $3,211.40
86 10.00 BX 0086 - VICRYL 4-0 SUTURE 27" 70CM METRIC
FS-1 REVERSE CUTTING, 36/BOX
No Bid No Bid
87 30.00 BTL 0087 - XYLAZINE, 100 MG/ML, 50 ML
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Bid No.: 50-00120493 AF Page 1 0of 3

Non-Public Works Bid
AFFIDAVIT

STATE OF Florida

PARISH/COUNTY OF Miami-Dade

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared: Subbarayan R

Pochi , (Affiant) who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that

he/she is the fully authorized Owner of Agni Enterprises, LLGEntity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number 50-00120493 | to the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaign Contribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,
Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or
indirectly.

Choice B J there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this section.

Updated: 02.27.2014
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Bid No.: 50-00120493 AF Page 2 of 3

Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the Parish to
the Affiant.

Choice B ‘/ There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section.

Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition of the public building or

project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

[The remainder of this page is intentionally left blank.]

Updated: 02.27.2014
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Bid No.: 50-00120493 IR Page 1 of 2

STANDARD INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS — PUBLICLY ADVERTISED BIDS

All required insurance under this bid shall conform to Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646
or No. 113647, as applicable. Contractors may not commence any work under any ensuing
contract unless and until all required insurance and associated evidentiary requirements
thereto have been met, along with any additional specifications contained in the advertised bid.
Except as where otherwise precluded by law, the Parish Attorney or his designee, with the
concurrence of the Director of Risk Management or his designee, may agree on a case-by-
case basis, to deviate from Jefferson Parish’s standard insurance requirements, as provided in
this Section. Vendors requesting deviation therefrom shall submit such requests in writing,
along with compelling substantiation, to the Purchasing Department prior to the bid’s due date.
Any changes to the insurance requirements will be reflected in the bid specifications and
addenda. Prior to contract execution and at all times thereafter during the term of such
contract, contractors must provide and continuously maintain all coverages as required by the
foregoing Resolutions, and the contract documents. Failure to do so shall be grounds for
suspension, discontinuation or termination of the contract.

For bidding purposes, bidders must submit with bid submission a current (valid)

insurance certificate evidencing the required coverages. Failure to comply will cause

bid to be rejected. The current insurance certificate will be used for proof of insurance at time
of evaluation. Thereafter, and prior to contract execution, the low bidder will be required to
provide final insurance certificates to the Parish which shall name the Jefferson Parish, its
Districts Departments and Agencies under the direction of the Parish President and the
Parish Council as additional insureds regarding negligence by the contractor for the
Commercial General Liability, Workmen’s Compensation Insurance and the Comprehensive
Automobile Liability policies. Additionally, said certificates should reflect the name of the
Parish Department receiving goods and services and reference the respective Jefferson Parish
bid number.

JEFFERSON PARISH REQUIRED STANDARD INSURANCE
M WORKER’S COMPENSATION INSURANCE

As required by Louisiana State Statute, exception; Employer's Liability, Section B shall
be $1,000,000 per occurrence when Work is to be over water and involves maritime
exposures to cover all employees not covered under the State Worker's Compensation
Act, otherwise this limit shall be no less than $500,000 per occurrence.

Note: If your company is not required by law to carry workmen’s compensation
insurance, i.e. not a Louisiana company, sole employee of the company, then
bidders must request a workmen’s compensation insurance declaration affidavit
prior to the bid opening date. This insurance declaration affidavit must be fully
completed, signed, properly notarized and submitted with the bid. A scanned
copy may be submitted with the bid; however, the successful bidder must submit
the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon
contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being

Revised 10.20.2018



Bid No.: 50-00120493 IR Page 2 of 2

rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the
next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

M COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Shall provide limits not less than the following: $1,000,000.00 Combined Single Limit
per Occurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

M COMPREHENSIVE AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Bodily injury liability $1,000,000.00 each person; $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.
Property Damage Liability $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.

Note: This category may be omitted if bidders do not/will not utilize company
vehicles for the project or do not possess company vehicles. Bidder must
request an automobile insurance declaration affidavit prior to the bid opening
date. This insurance declaration affidavit must be fully completed, signed,
properly notarized and submitted with the bid. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid; however,
the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and
without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result
in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the
right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this
event.

DEDUCTIBLES

No insurance required shall include a deductible not greater than $10,000.00. The cost of the
deductible shall be borne by the contractor.

NOTE: If the vendor requires a change in deductibles, the request must be submitted in writing
to the Purchasing Department prior to the due date of the bid. Such request shall be
reviewed by the Parish Attorney’s Office with the concurrence of the Director of Risk
Management.

UMBRELLA LIABILITY COVERAGE
An umbrella policy or excess may be used to meet minimum requirements.

FOR CONSTRUCTION AND RENOVATION PROJECTS:
The following are required unless otherwise specified in the bid. Such insurance is due upon contract execution.

1) OWNER’S PROTECTIVE LIABILITY

To be for the same limits of liability for bodily injury and property damage liability established for
commercial general liability.

2) BUILDER’S RISK INSURANCE

The contractor shall maintain Builder’s Risk Insurance at his own expense to insure both the
owner (Parish of Jefferson) and contractor as their interest may appear.

Revised



2017 FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY AMENDED ANNUAL REPORT FILED

DOCUMENT# L14000133871 Jul 31, 2017
Entity Name: AGNI ENTERPRISES, LLC Secretary of State
CC6001448302

Current Principal Place of Business:

2865 SW 69TH CT.,
MIAMI, FL 33155

Current Mailing Address:

2865 SW 69TH CT.,
MIAMI, FL 33155 US

FEI Number: 47-1699827 Certificate of Status Desired: Yes
Name and Address of Current Registered Agent:

POCHI, SUBBARAYAN R
2865 SW 69TH CT.,
MIAMI, FL 33155 US

The above named entity submits this statement for the purpose of changing its registered office or registered agent, or both, in the State of Florida.

SIGNATURE:

Electronic Signature of Registered Agent Date

Authorized Person(s) Detail :

Title AMBR
Name POCHI, SUBBARAYAN R
Address 9021 SW 94TH STREET, APT. 510

City-State-Zip: MIAMI FL 33176

| hereby certify that the information indicated on this report or supplemental report is true and accurate and that my electronic signature shall have the same legal effect as if made under
oath; that | am a managing member or manager of the limited liability company or the receiver or trustee empowered to execute this report as required by Chapter 605, Florida Statutes; and

that my name appears above, or on an attachment with all other like empowered.

SIGNATURE: SUBBARAYAN R POCHI PRESIDENT & CEO 07/31/2017

Electronic Signature of Signing Authorized Person(s) Detail Date





