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Jefferson
Parish

State of Louisiana

Bid Number 5000135021

ONE TIME PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES FOR
JEFFERSON PARISH EASTBANK WAREHOUSE

BID DUE: JUNE 29, 2021 AT 11:00 AM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all page:

in the technical s Weciﬁcaﬂaas and }effersaﬁ ?arish !ﬂs?mctizms for Bid;iers anﬁ
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing
partment’s eProcurement site by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name:; BRENDA BELLOW- BUYER |
Buyer Email: bbellow@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683
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INVITATION TO BIO Page: 1

DATE: &33303 THIS B NOT AN ORDER
BID NO.: §0-00136021 JEFFERSON PARISH
PFURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.OC.BOXS
GRETHA, U&. TO0584-0008
504-364-2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BEBELLOWSisfiparish.nat
Bids wiil be recalved uatll 1100 AM, BI29/2021 via onling ai veww Joffparishbids net

LATE Eii}% YLk NOT B mcem
W?E%%LYW?%?WQ%WQ&W?WW AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER UF THE FIRM OR AUTHORIZE
REFRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCE Aﬂi}m WQ&T&?IE FKEHR&S OR SIGNATURES SHALL FESULT IN 81D a&awrm
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DATE: 82212021
BID NO.: 50-00136021 Page: 2
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

Bidders are not to exclude from parficipation in, deny the benafits of, o subjact to discrimination undar any ;zregmm efmrig any
it '*mmmmsmmmma{mm@mmm@m or sax; nor discriminale on the basis : he Ags
iscrimination Actof 1575, of with respect to an olherwise qualified hand individual as
M@ﬁj;ﬁdﬁﬁ?‘i of of tha basis of refigion, sxcer that any axemelion from such
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ity and to contad Tmsaleﬁwmn?w :

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

1. Al bidders must aftend the MANDATORY pre-tid confersncs and will be required (o sign in and out 88 evidence of
attandance, In accordancs wilh LBAR.S. 22121, all prospaciive bidders shall be present at the &egmmafw
MANDATORY pre-big conference and shall remain in aftendance for The durstion of he conference,

bidder who fails ln altend the conferance or ramain fwmmammmmammm%mﬁ
FW‘}

endance o (s pre-bid conference is optional m%@gimmmmm;«mmrmsmw
@mmmﬁmmmwmmmmamm imore, fallure o altend
ﬁzeﬁfmm@remm& 1 does not refieve the successiul bidder from the reces agafﬁsfm&m

malsrials or | any work that may be required 10 complate the work in acoordance with the specification
mlhmmmr‘mmt:;ﬁwm i

3. Conlracior must hold currant appiicabls JEFFERSON PARISH Bcansos with ¢ f rmpection

Code Enforcement. Contractor shall sbiain any and all pammits required by he nge:g ER%M PAR%SH
Department of Inspection and Cede Enforcemant. The contractor shaill be responsible for «m{!

these permils, All parmils must be obtained o the siant of iha project. eomrmmsw‘
i w?mm:wmwmmmm@em

and all appiicatle Faderal andg Siata fic
and shail obtain them prios 1o the start of the project.

4, A%Sﬁmﬁmﬁmﬁfsmmﬂmmmmm%wﬁs 37-2150 et seq, and such license
raimber will ba shown an ihe outside of the bid slechonic ertveiope. Fallure Iy will cause lne bid o be
rejected. When submilfing ihe bid slecitonisally, mmﬁwmwmwm‘ 4 in the approprista field in the
slgclronic procuremant system, Failurs o comply will cause {he bid 1o be reiecited.
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BID NO.: 50-00136021 Page: 3
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INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

1t 5 the bidder's msponsibility to vigit tha iob site and svaluate the job before submiding s 8.

Jub site must be clean and free of all litter and debnis daly and upon comglation of the contract. Passageways must be kept
mwrm of ﬁ}'&tamf sgquipment, and debrls at al imes. F%mmm material must be remcied fram e job sile éaify
itted on tha pramises. Pracaulion must be exercised at 2!l times i saleguard the wellors of
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NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS. A performanca band will be required for fhis bid, The amount of the bond wil be 100% of the
m@mmmmmmmmmmmm The perloemance bond shall ba supplied at the signing of the
zon

NOMN-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: Apammmdmlwmm&;f&ﬁsw The amount of the bond will be 100% of e
contract prics unless stherwisa incicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied al the sigring of the
eordract
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guaranieed quantities unlass ctharwise siated in the bid specifications.
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contained in LBA ~ RS 382224 and Sec 2 31&%&&&mn%@hm&ﬁf¢m For bi i

must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Afficavits, in
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810 NO.; 5000135021 Page: 4

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

17, Forthis project, | hammmmmmm &Wﬁm&w&%&’m@wmim_m’

affixed and made pad of the immovable prope

contracior on behalf of and as the agent of Jefferson Pansh (Owner), a

pﬁ:émsfw%ﬁs&@
1o 45 “spplicable materials and :m’ éﬁgﬁfﬁﬁ%&ﬁ&f
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» Lowdslang Revised Stakide 47: amygz} Mwﬁ%&@&w@mmwﬁm%m%mmmﬁmm&
taxas, and qonlractor shall furnish a copy of such cerificale to all vendors or
ma@@s%mm@aﬁ%ﬁ&%%ma&d%@ﬁmﬂﬁ

}t :3‘;@& be the duty of ﬂgry parish officer, employes, d !'Bnﬂﬁ, 6%& spgcial district, board, and commission: and the
HBIY © subcontractor, and licanses of the parish, and the duty of every ip;;ﬁ:;xzt for mr&ﬁc:;ﬁm of
iﬁgibiﬁty for a parish contract or program, 15 cooperate with the inspectar General in any In sudit, ingspuction,

£4 mm or haaring pursuant to Jeffersan Parish Code of Ordinances Sectien 2-185.1 13}; y submitting a
 acknowladges this and will ablde by 3l provisions of the refarenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: §

BID NO.: 50.00135021 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 8
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0008
 sua-3sa2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BBELLOW

DATE:  8/22/2021

As por LSA-RS 47:301 ot saq,, all governmental bodies are excludad from paymant of aales taxes to any Loulsiana taxing
body. Quotations shail be based on F.0.B. Agency warshouse or jobsita, anywhare within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department

JEFFERSON PARISH resarves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promplly. Mo charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage uniess specified In quotation. The ordar must not be filled at a higher price than quoted,
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cance! at any ime and for any reason by Issuing a THIRTY (30} day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products o be new and all work to ba done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alloration from the speeifications must ba indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submittad by the time apscifised by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-4 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

in the evant that addenda are issued with this bidders MUST acknowladge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid fo bY placing the addendum numbar as indicated. Failure to
acknowladge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:
HNUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) ______

*+ ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRM NAME: R ———
Coburns Supply

pisgrelR / Newh 04,/2/ T iside Sales

T PRINT OR TYFE NAME:

Mark Tate

" 1849 Commercial Drive

CITY, STATE: Haifiey, LA e 70058
~ TELEPHONE: T T FAK:
- (225 }202-7808
EMAIL ADDRESS:
mtate@coburns. com

{ 504 1 348-1095

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _24'222.27




DATE: &2ns02t

8I0 KO.: §0-00135021

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

HUMBER

yia

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UHIT PRICE
QUOTED

JOTALS

.00

3.00

1,800.00

36.00

180

3.00

ONE TIME PURCHASE OF INDUSTRIAL SUPPLIES

FOR JEFFERSON PARISH EASTBANK WAREHOUSE

4010 CORPORATION STOR, 21NCH,
CORPORATION COCK THREAD X PACK JOUHT,

MO LEAD BRASS, DOMESTIC, FORD IFB1000-7
HL, A Y MCODOMALD 747018222 INCH-NL.
STK. 80380950

0420 VALVE, METER BALL, 50 DEGREE 2
IHCH, PACK JOINT X METER, NO LEAD BRASS,

DOMESTIC, FORD #FVAI-TTTW-HL,
AY m{m&m #746028-22.2
STK. #olsiare

0020 BOLY, HEX HEAD, J4 INCHAB X I N,
LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE #5 IDENTIFICATION

MARKING, BAKED ON BLUE TEFLON COATING
MEETS ASTM B117
STH. ¥ 0436600

0040 GASKET, FLANGE, 8 IN, FULL FACE,
1416 1M THICK TEXTURED RED RUBEBER, 1508

STK. g o490470

(050 VALVE, RESILIENT SEAT GATE, 14 I,
£509 CAST IRON, BECH, JOINT, KRS, 21N

OPER. NUT, EPOXY COATED, 88 BOLTS AND
NUTS, DORESTIC, WIQ ACCESSORIES, MUELLER
STK. BOEM1E0

0080 NUT, OPERATING, PART #G-38, FOR A
10N RESILIENT SEAT GATE VALVE, BUELLER
MODEL 9560

BTK, # 0857200

0076 CLAP, 2INCH X 12 INGH LONG, ALL
STAINLESS STEEL, §2.35-02.8) RANGE, FULL
GASKET, DOMESTIC, POWERSEAL #3121A3
STR. # 0184804

0080 VALVE, METER BALL, 2 1M, PACK JOINT
INLET X OVAL METER FLANGE QUTLET, NO

LEAD BRASS, DOMESTIC, FORD SEF4-TTTVENL
AY MCOONALD “?W-ﬂ-&%

218.95

4368.00

220.85

340

6120.00

no bid

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

28485

8545.50




GATE: &2200001

BID HO.: 50-00138021

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BiD

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

"

12

12.00

8.60

STK. 4 0380970

0090 TEE, § 1N X § IN, DUCTILE IRON, MJ
X SWIVEL, FUSION EPOXY COATED, NO

ACCERSORIES, MUST HAVE AWWA, ASTH, OB
ANS| APPROVAL AND WRITTEN PROCF OF
1509001 CERTIFICATION

ST, 5 0107000

G100 NIPPLE, GALYANIZED -12INCH X 8
IHCH, SCHEDULE 40

STK. #0397800

0910 FLANGE ADAPTER, 2 INCH, NO LEAD
£RASS, DOMESTIC, FORD 3('«?33-??»8&

AY MCDONALD #7610F-2
STK. 20381600

0120 PIPE, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 1 IN X 20

FT, PLAIN ENDS, (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT IS

NOT ACCEPTABLE),

STK. # 0651040

DELIVER TO:

JEFFERSON PARISH EASTHANK WAREHOUSE
4901 JEFFERSON HIGHWAY
JEPFERSON, LA 70121

182,75

2193.00

4.30

25.80

85.37

1993.32

1.42

284.00




