INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  5/16/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00119701 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY LLC N BUYER:  SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES RS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRMEANE: BASIC SUPPLY LLC

SIGNATURE: 7 .z : . TITLE:
(Must be signed l1eré)“‘"‘;kéi?{l / %/@G’V@/7L MANAGER
PRINT OR TYPE NAME/ >

¥ JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: E 2 FAX:
() 337-232-1733 () 337-232-2045

EMAIL ADDRESS:
charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _1658.29




NL',T,V['E,;V'ER QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES US'JOPT?SE TOTALS
0010 HOA 76.00
1 10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: 800THA2B 760.00
MFR: AB
0020 AL BOX FOR HOA
2 10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: 800T1TZ 69.00 690.00
MFR: AB
0030 1/2" ALUM COUPLING 2.25
3 25.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: CPLAL-1/2 56.25
wer. et EATON RC50SA
0040 1/2" AL LB COND OUTLET BODY 2.85 .
4 10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: LB19 28.50
mer: cie  TOPAZ 211 - INCLUDES PART
LISTEDIN LINES 5 & 6 INCLUDED INCLUDED
5 0050 1/2" AL COND BODY COVER IN LINE 4 IN LINE 4
10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: 180
wrr.cue  TOPAZ 211 - INCLUDES PART
LISTED IN LINES 5 & 6 INCLUDED INCLUDED
6 0060 1/2" NEO GASKET (9GASK1941) IN LINE 4 IN LINE 4
10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: GASK1941
mFR: cHE TOPAZ 211 - INCLUDES PART
LISTED IN LINES 5 & 6
7 0070 1/2" AL T COND OUTLET BODY 3.78 30.24
8.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: T19
MFR: che T1CG- INCLUDES GASKET
(LINE 8) AND COVER-TOPAZ | INCLUDED | |NCLUDED
8 0080 1/2" NEO GASKET (9GASK1941) IN LINE 8 IN LINE 8
8.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: GASK1941
mFR: cHE T1CG- INCLUDES GASKET
(LINE 8) AND COVER-TOPAZ
o 0090 1/2" AL MALE UNION 9.33 93.30
10.00 EA CATALOG DESCRIPTION: UNY105SA
MFR: CHE GUM-1 KILLARK
10 20.00 EA 0100 1/2" 1H RIGID ZINC COND STRAP NO BID NO BID

CATALOG DESCRIPTION: MED40

MFR: MIN CHE 511




DATE: 5/16/2017

Page: 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00119701 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
11 2000 EA 0110 1/2" *ALUMINUM* COND CLAMP NO BID NO BID
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: B2008PAAL
MFR: BLINE
12 50.00 EA 0120 1/4X2 DRIVE PIN ANCRS NO BID NO BID
MFR: MISC
13 3000 EA 0130 10FT *ALUMINUM* CHANNEL NO BID NO BID
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: BS4AL
MFR: BLINE
14 10.00 EA 0140 1/2" STR LT FLEX CONN NO BID NO BID
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: 5232
MFR: TB
15 10.00| EA 0150 1/2" 90D L/T FLEX CONN NO BID NO BID
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: 5252
MFR: TB
16 4.00 EA NO BID NO BID
0160 2-GANG WPRF BOX 3-1/2"
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: WSM250
MFR: EGS NO BID NO BID
17 4.00 EA

0170 2-GANG WPRF BOX EXT 1" DEPTH
CATALOG DESCRIPTION: WE2
MFR: EGS
TO BE SHIPPED TO:
HERO PUMPING STATION
1600 DESTREHAN AVENUE
HARVEY, LA. 70058

ATTENTION: ALFRED CHAN




Rigid/Intermediate Grade Conduit Fittings

Conduit Couplings
RIGID CONDUIT COUPLINGS - STEEL RIGID CONDUIT COUPLINGS - ALUMINUM
o Applications: Applications:
gl ° Used to join two lengths of threaded rigid or IMC conduit; can be e Used to join two lengths of threaded rigid or IMC conduit; can be
k=8 used in both indoor and outdoor applications used in both indoor and outdoor applications
ir
-c -
=] Standard Material: Features:
e e Galvanized steel e | ightweight

e Fasy to install

UL File No. E-25501 e Corrosion-resistant

Standard Material:

@ c@ e Aluminum

UL File No. E-324286

Unit Wt. Lbs.

Cat. # Size Qty. Per 100

RC50 s 10 12 @ @

RC75 " 10 18

RC100 17 10 29 —

RC125 Vs 5 38

RC150 1. 5 52

RC200 2k 5 69 Unit Wt. Lbs.

RC250 215" 2 181 Cat. # Size Qty. Per 100

RC300 3" 1 220 RC50SA %" 50 6

RC350 3" 1 377 RC75SA " 50 9

RC400 4" 1 298 RC100SA 1" 50 13

RC500 5" 1 477 RC125SA Vs 50 19

RC600 6" 1 684 RC150SA k" 50 23
RC200SA 2" 20 85
RC250SA 2" 12 68
RC300SA 8" 12 91
RC350SA 3" 12 108
RC400SA 4" 12 142
RC500SA 5" 1 242
RC600SA 6" 1 320

A -
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Broraz

SERVICE ENTRANCE

ELLS-SLB N

COPPER FREE ALUMINUM 1 B, X
TOPAZ UNIT SHIP  WT/ N\ .
CAT# A B C CAT # UPC# SIZE (TN CASE  CASE e
23155 L7 137 21 11650 1/2" 0 50 13 ”,Q
dbe il I 12 11660 3/4" 10 5 16 d..

213 4180 1720 19375 :
214 5515 2178 24315 213 116/0 1 . 5 %% 12 @ @@
215 6095 2410 26875 214 11680 11/4 2 10 8

216 6595 2846 3.0625 214XL 11682 11/4" LONG - 2 3 E170258
214XL 791 275 275 215 11690 11/2" ] 5 b
215XL 7.74 3.88 3.375 216 11700 gn 1 5 10
216XL 11702 2" LONG — 1 3
RIGID THREADED TYPE
RIGID T TYPE
T1CG 21731 1/2" 10 100 38
T2CG 21741 3/4" 10 50 30
s A B p T3C6 21751 1" 5 25 20
TIC6 4720 1370 1330 TAC6  7176] i 4 2 01
1266 5570 1625 1540 1566 21771 11/2 2 10 7
136 6460 1900 1740 T6CG 21781 2' - 2 5 )
T4C6 8528 2770 2490 17C6 21791 217" - | 8
156 8528 2770 2490 18CG 21801 3" _ 1 8 @ s p
T6CG  10.831 3335  3.100 n ®
76 13500 4060 5825 19C6 78] 3 ]ﬁz - ] L
T8C6  13.000 4685 5825 1 OCG 2] 82] 4 — ] 11 E170258

T9C6 15937 5450  7.060
T10CG 15937 5450  7.060
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TOPAZ ELECTRIC ¢ 925 Waverly Avenue ¢ Holtsville, New York 11742 « 800-666-2852 ¢ Fax: 800-333-3488 ¢ www.topaz-usa.com





