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Bid Number 50-00118066

QUANTITY OF VARIOUS HARDWARE AND SUPPLIES

BID DUE: OCTOBER 27, 2016 AT 11:00 AWM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing
Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street

General Government Building, Suite 4400

Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Misty A. Camardelle
Buyer Email: mcamardelle@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683

FAX: 504-364-2693




o INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
DATE:  10/13/2016 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 50-00118066 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX S8
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0008
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: MCAMARD

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 10/27/2046via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online at www.jeffiparish.net

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting 2 bid, vendor agrees to comply with all

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

kzthics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution

Ho. 113647. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may also obiain 2 copy by visiting the
Purchasing Depariment webpeage at www. purchasing.jefiparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Registration forms may be
downloaded from www.purchasing jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor Information. While Jefferson Parish may have these on
file, all bidders should furnish their current W-8 Form and respective Tax Identification Numbers with bid submission; records on file
may be invalid or expired. The successful bidder musi submit & W-@ Form and respective Tax Identification Number upon contract
execution. Fallure to do sc may result in delay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana faxing body.
Qluotations shall be based on F.O.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Depariment.
JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. items bid must meet specifications, JEFFERSON
PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in bid rejection.
Bidders are required to compleie, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item pricing forms as

inhdigated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit prices
shall prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such
combination, as shall in its judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the

LOWEST RESPONSIVE and FESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and
the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for
parking or cartags unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH
reserves the right to cancel at eny time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor,

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the
project. Uniess otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, ali workmanship and materials
must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project.  Any deviations or
alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

if this bid requires a pre-bid corference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to
allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions.
The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders' questions in the form of an Addendum,

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid

form shall cause the bid to be rajected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible
bidder in this event.

IJSE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of
astabiishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and
stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities isted are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from: participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or aclivity, any
nerson in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1875, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the
basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and Vil of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the adminisirative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
arovisions contained in Section: 51.55 (¢}, (d), (e}, and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation prolecis must comply
with Section 504 of the 1973 Rahabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American Nationa! Standard institule’s
specifications (ANE! Al 17.1-1¢61).




DATE:  10/13/2016
EID NO.: 50-00118966 Page: 2
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROGUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS ‘

This electronic procurernent system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online,
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service: while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documenis are not legible, then bidder's
submission will be re ected. Please note all mqui{)emeqts contained in this bid package Tor electronic bid
submission.

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

1. All bidders must atiend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(f), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective
bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conferenca. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Goniracior must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Depariment of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must aiso hold any
and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain ther prior to the start of the project,

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejectad.
Additionally if submitting the bid elecironically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field
in the Electronic Prozurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected,

5. ltis the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

6. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the coniract,
Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material
must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions
must be exercised af all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.



DATE:  10/13/2016

EID NO.: 50-00118066 Page: 3

10.

11,

12.

13.

14.

15.

186.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal

contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of

Morigages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court

and ix-Officio Recorder of Morigages for the Parish of Jefferson, All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the coniract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of
the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing of the coniract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS EIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price uniess otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

Unless otherwise stated i the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicated on the attached “insurance requirements” sheel. All bidders
must comply with the instructions in this sheet. Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejectad.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies). if submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an elecironic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House. No
scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the elecironic bid submission.

This is a reguirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
representations on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications.

Freight charges should be included in tolal cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
QL(let@d gs a iepeftrate iterr. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LBA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. Eor bidding
purposes, all bidders mus: submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including:
Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify
Affidavit. For the conveniznce of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID
AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered rasponsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavii may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration
upon contract execution. Failure 1o comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA —~ RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submil with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavils, including: Mon-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been
combined into one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This afidavit must be subrnitied in its original format, angd
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid fo the nexi lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this avent.

The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As
such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with
bid submission will result in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-1 55.10(19). By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referencad Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances,




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  10M3/2016 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00118066 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: MCAMARD

As per LBA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing

body. Quotations shall be bzsed on F.0.B. Agency warchouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartags uniess specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than guoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor,

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products io be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according
to standard practices. Any daviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation
supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 10-14 days

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure fo acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER;
NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

“* ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FiRM NAME:

Coburn's Supply
SIGNATURE; e B e 3 TITLE:
{Must be signed hera) ) /i } ZL(’/‘}{M’}&_J«‘i‘, w’i i / OSR
PRINT OR TYPE NAME 7

Michael Self

ADDRESS:
1849 Commercial Drive

CITY, STATE: ZiP:
Harvey, LA 70058

TELEPHONE: FAX:
(504 }348-2042 (504 348-1095

EMAIL ADDRESS:
msalf@coburns.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMs: § 2:373.00




DATE: 1011312018

BID NO.: 80-00118066

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

(%1}

Page:

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

L

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

30.00

180.00

24.00

30.00

36.00

72.00

36.00

360.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

QUANTITY OF YARIOUS HARDWARE AND
SUPPLIES

0010 CLAMP HOSE, STAINLESS STEEL, /2
INCH BY 1.1/8 INCH RANGE, HEX SCREW,

SK NUMBER 006-0301900 1/2" -1 1/4"
0020 PAINT MARKING, INVERTED,

FLOURESCENT CAUTION BLUE, 17 OUNCE,
KRYLON NUMBER 03620

SK NUMBER 00-0329550
0030 ADAPTER, HYDRANT NOSE NOZZLE

2-1/2 INCH NST BY 2 INCH MIP, ROCKER

LUG, DOMESTIC HEAVY RED BRASS, DIXON
NUMBER RHA2520T-D

8K NUMBER 00-038009F

0040 LAMP, METAL -X-VAPER, 320 WATTS,
PULSE START, CLEAR, DAMAR NUMBER
M320WIL/IBT28/PS14K, ITEM NUMBER 265644
SK NUMBER 00-038009F

0050 COOLER, WATER, 2 GALLON CAPACITY,
ALL PLASTIC, FDA GRADE LINER, PUSH

BUTTON SPIGOT, BAIL HANDLE, ATTACHED
CUP HOLDER BRACKET, IGO0 NUMBER 421

SK NUMBER 00-0482200

0060 LAMP, FLUORSCENT, TWIST, MEDIUM
SCREW BASE, 120 VOLT 15 WATT ,
SYLVANIA NUMBER CF15EL/TWIST

3K NUMBEROD-048221B

0070 COOLER, WATER, 3 GALLON CAPACITY
ALL PLASTIC, FDA GRADE LINER, PUSH

BUTTON SPIGOT, BAIL HANDLE, ATTACHED
CUP HOLDER BRACKET, IGLOO NUWMBER 431

. 0080 OIL, PENTRATING, SIXTEEN OUNCE CAN,

KRYLON NUMBER 103 LET GO. MSC NUMBER

.94

28.20

4.30

774.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

11.65

4,194.00




DATE: 10/13/2048

BID NO.: 50-00118066

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 8

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

LI

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
GUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

18

16

17

36.00

180.00

12.00

108.00

16.00

144.00

216.00

120.00

12.00

EA

EA

Ea

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

KNOCKER LOOOSE 100z Aero Kroil
0090 LUBRICANT, ANTI-SEIZE, SPRAY,
REGULAR GRADE BOSTIK (NEVERSEIZE)
NUMBER NSA-18 12.5 OUNCE CAN

0100 LINE, WEED EATER, ONE POUND DONUT,
106 SQUARE SHAPE, OREGON NUMBER 21-405

SK NUMBER 00-04900080

0110 SEALANT, PIPE THREAD, WITH PTEE
BRUSHABLE PASTE, SLOW SETTING, 4 QUNCE
BRUSH TOP JAR, LOCTITE NUMBER 30534

SK NUMBER 00-0501810 Blue Monster

0120 PADLOCK, MASTER LOCK NUMBER 5,
MIXED KEYS 36 PER CASE

SK NUMBER 00-580100

0130 SUPPORTBACK, XX(-LARGE WITH LUMBAR
PAD, POWER BRIGHT ORANGE, DECADE CADET
NUMBER 46585 OR ERGODYNE NUMBER 118886,
SK NUMBER 00-0477150

0140 PADLOCK, COMMERCIAL, NUMBER 5KA,
KEYED ALIKE TO NUMBER A573, MASTER BRAD
NO SUBSTITUTIONS (DRAINAGE DEPT)

0150 BATTERY, ALKALINE, INDUSTRIAL, SIZE

D, 1.5 VOLTS, DURACELL PROCELL NUMBER
PC1300

SK 00-0588140

0160 PAIL, 5 GALLON WHITE HIGH DENSITY
POLYETHYLENE, .80 MIL THICKNESS, WITH

LiD, WITH WIRE HANDLE, CENTURY BRAND OR
EQUAL

0170 Marker-PAINT, MEDIUM POINT, 4.50M
UNIE PX-20 WHITE

NO BID

NO BID

74.40

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1.40

302.40

NO BID

NO BID




