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NC111

80321



NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

27.70 1662.00

1.00 432.00

NO BID NO BID

3.5 2100.00

18.65 55.95

14.75 44.25

DORCY 41-4296
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12-120

Johnson 420EM



3-7150
KT INDUSTRIES ARGON FLOWMETER

3-7490
KT INDUSTRIES 1/4" X 50' TWINLINE HOSE
K-T hose is manufactured with intense quality control
that far exceeds industry standards. The twin hose
exceeds RMA & CGA specifications for type S grade R.
Size 1/4" x 50'

SMART STRAPS 149 Padded Ratchet, 1000 lb, 
10 ft L, Orange
Load Capacity:1000 lb
Length:10 ft
Features
Secure almost any size load
3000 lb breaking strength

ProSource 2617934 Light Duty Tarp with 
Aluminum Grommets, 12 ft L x 10 ft W, 6 x 7 in 
Mesh, Polyethylene



 
 

PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS 
 

Item Number VB230P 

Description 
Class II Mesh Safety Vest 

5 Point Breakaway, One Inside Chest 
Pocket and One Outside Pocket 

Fabric 100% Polyester 

Fabric Color Orange 

Retro-Reflective Stripe 2” Silver, 2 Horizontal Stripes 

Closure Hook & Loop 

 
ANSI/ISEA 107-2010 Class II Compliant 
 
 

Size Chest (in.) Length (in.) 

M  46 30 

L  48 30 

XL 52 28.5 

2XL 56 29 

3XL 60 30 

4XL 63 31 

5XL 67 31.5 

6XL 71 31.5 

7XL 75 32.5 

                                   

 

 
 

Unit of Sale Each (Individually Bagged) 

Case Pack 24 Each 

Country of Origin China 

Other Similar Style VB231P 

 

Part # Color Each UPC Case UPC 
Case 
HT 

Case 
WD 

Case 
LG 

Case 
WT 

VB230PM ORANGE 796326309421 50796326309426 7.9 10.6 16.2 10 

VB230PL ORANGE 796326309438 50796326309433 7.9 10.6 16.2 10 

VB230PXL ORANGE 796326309445 50796326309440 7.9 10.6 16.2 11 

VB230P2XL ORANGE 796326309452 50796326309457 10.2 10.6 16.2 12 

VB230P3XL ORANGE 796326309469 50796326309464 10.2 10.6 16.2 13 

VB230P4XL ORANGE 796326309476 50796326309471 11.8 10.6 16.2 13 

VB230P5XL ORANGE 796326309483 50796326309488 11.8 10.6 16.2 13 

VB230P6XL ORANGE 796326309490 50796326309495 11.8 10.6 16.2 14 

VB230P7XL ORANGE 796326309506 50796326309501 11.8 10.6 16.2 14 

 
 

 

Corporate Headquarters: 
4025 Viscount Ave. 
Memphis, TN. 38118  
Phone 901-458-5030 
Fax 901-458-3343 

 

West Coast Office: 
4451 Eucalyptus Avenue 

Chino, CA 91710 
Phone 877.264.9832 

Fax 877.264.9833 

Last Modified: Aug 7, 2015 

www.cordovaisc.com 
 

Certificate of Compliance is attached 

VB230P 



 

 
May 20, 2015 

 

ANSI/ISEA 107-2010 Apparel and Headwear 
Compliance Certificate: #CSPB230052015 

 
 Cordova Safety Products certifies that Model VB230P meets all set 
requirements as stated is ANSI/ISEA 107-2010 as compliant High-Visibility safety 
items for Performance Class 2.  All relevant materials have been third-party 
certified with documents referenced under this certificate number.  The 
manufacturer certifies that these items meet all design requirements and have 
been measured for the appropriate amount of visible reflective material and 
background material for the smallest size offered for this product. 
 
 

Amount of visible background material (smallest size offered): 

821 square inches 
(ANSI Class 2 Minimum 775 sq. in.) 

 
Amount of visible retroreflective material (smallest size offered): 

271 square inches 
(ANSI Class 2 Minimum 201 sq. in.) 

 

 
  Company:            Cordova Safety Products   
                      Address:              4025 Viscount Ave. 
                    City, State, Zip     Memphis, TN 38118 
                      Phone                  901-458-5030 
                      Models:                VB230P                   

Class:                   2 

                              
 
The undersigned hereby warrants that he/she is authorized to legally bind the  
organization identified above. 
 
 
Name: Bill Greeneisen 
 
Title: Product Manager 

 



 
VEST SPECIFICATIONS 

 
Item Number VZ240P/VZ241P/V241P 
Product Group Class II Safety Vests 
Description Class II Mesh Safety Vests, Available in Orange 

(VZ240P) and Lime (VZ241P), Zipper Closure, 
Silver Reflective Stripes (2 vertical & 2 horizontal), 

One Inside Pocket.  V241P=Lime with Velcro® 
Closure 

  
ANSI/ISEA 107-2004 
Class II Compliant 

 
Fabric and Retroreflective 

Material is 3rd Party 
Certified: 

 
Orange Mesh Fabric 
Certificate 1211322 

Dated 2/27/09 
TexTest Laboratory 

Valley, Alabama 
 

Lime Mesh Fabric 
Certificate #1211324 

Dated 2/27/09 
TexTest Laboratory 

Valley, Alabama 
 

Retroreflective Material 
Certificate #051114-01A 

Dated 2/10/06 
Calcoast Testing Laboratory 

Emeryville, California 
 

Please see accompanying 
Certificate of Compliance 

#CSP240050809 
 

 
 
 

                   
 
 

Unit of Sale One Each 
Case Pack Twenty Four Each 
Country of Origin China 
Available Sizes S-7XL 

 

 
www.cordovaisc.com 

Corporate Headquarters: 
2085 W.E. Freeman Drive 
Memphis, TN. 38114 
Phone 901-458-5030 
Fax 901-458-3343 
 

West Coast Office: 
15147 Don Julian Drive 

City of Industry, CA 91746 
Phone 877.264.9832 

Fax 877.264.9833 



 
May 8, 2009 

 
ANSI/ISEA 107-2004 Apparel and Headwear 

Compliance Certificate: #CSP240050809 
 
 Cordova Safety Products certifies that Models VZ240P/VZ241P/V241P meet all 
set requirements as stated is ANSI/ISEA 107-2004 as compliant High-Visibility 
safety items for Performance Class 2.  All relevant materials have been third-
party certified with documents referenced under this certificate number.  The 
manufacturer certifies that these items meet all design requirements and have 
been measured for the appropriate amount of visible reflective material and 
background material for the smallest size offered for these products. 
 
 

Amount of visible background material (smallest size offered): 
914.50 square inches 

 
Amount of visible retroreflective material (smallest size offered): 

279.00 square inches 
 
 
  Company:            Cordova Safety Products   
                      Address:              2085 W.E. Freeman Drive 
                    City, State, Zip     Memphis, TN 38114 
                      Phone                  901-458-5030 
                      Models:                VZ240P/VZ241P/V241P 
                      Class:                   2 
                              
 
The undersigned hereby warrants that he/she is authorized to legally bind the  
organization identified above. 
 
 
Name: Scott M. Laxton 
 
Title: Marketing Director 
 



Raid 81590 Concentrated Indoor 
Fogger, 1.5 oz, Aerosol Can, 
Aerosol, Clear Amber, Pleasant, 
625 sq-ft Coverage 
Non-staining and leaves no 
residue. Has a pleasant outdoor 
fresh scent. Kills roaches, fleas, 
ants, and a variety of other insects. 
Clear color. Main Active: 
Cypemethrin. Pack contains three 
1.5 ounce cans.

Arnold WLS-195 Universal Trimmer Line, For 
Use With Most Gas String Trimmers, Polymer
Product Details
Material:Polymer
Special Features:10 Refills
Specifications:0.095 in Diameter X 220 ft Length
Suitable for Use With:Most Gas String 
Trimmers
Type:Universal

3057
Dab-A-Do heavy duty industrial strength 
hand cleaner with pumice in 1 gallon plastic 
pump container.  4 containers per case.  Mfr. 
#3057 cherry.





Johnson 420EM Professional Combination Square, 16 in L, 1/8 in, 1/16 in, 1 mm, Steel Blade



TRU-VISION PLASTICS 
RV40815EPCLF 
VISOR 8X15.5X.040 CLEAR
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