INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  7/17/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00120333 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC BUYER: DMEVANS

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NI TS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

,— BASIC SUPPLY, LLC
SIGNATURE: P ] TITLE:
(Must be signed here)\M/l /%W/,\, MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAME: W
JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:

PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: zIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:
() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ 251.15




DATE: T7/1712017

BID NO.: 50-00120333

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

4.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

5.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

various recreational items

0001-item # 1392983-Fisher Tackle Wheel
36" outside diameter, 22" inside

diameter, 8" thick foam, constructed of

9 ib rebound foam, 22 ounce coated vinyl
in center and outside. 19 ounce vinyl on
faces of wheel. Green

0002-Item # 1271249- Unique forward
slant blocking head with release

mechanism allows an individual player to
engage, control, drive, and extend
upwards all in the same drill. The pad
drives in 8", then releases upward ,
stimulating real time game action for
your players. Wider 55" base keeps sled
stable and extended pad allows players
to react off pad and get up fieid.
Adjustable spring tension on the release
mechanism of the sled. Powder coated
steel for maximum weather resistance and
durability. Gold- Fisher Man Pad

0003-Item # 0795XXXX- Athletic Field
Striper, for use on grass, dirt,concrete

, pavement, or gravel. Sturdy steel
construction with 4 large, easy rolling
wheels and collapsible handle for easy
storage. Lightweight housing includes
windscreen, fingertip on/off lever,

storage for 12 extra cans and simple 2"-
4" line width adjustment. Non-toxic
aerosol spray goes straight downward for

complete coverage.
8267908

0004-item # 0792PACK, Case Pack
including 36 cans of white field marking

paint, water resistant, extremely

durable aerosol field and traffic

marking paint visible on grass for weeks
will not flake or wash away, cans are 17

ounces by weight.
5434725
0005-1tem # 0792CXXX Case Pack

-including 12 cans of green field marking

paint, water resistant, extremely

durable aerosol field and traffic

marking paint visible on grass for weeks
will not flake or wash away cans are 17

ounces by weight.
7674591

0006-item # 1384303 Pro Down Football
Man Shield, Material: Foam, Nylon, Vinyi

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

89.00

89.00

124.20

124.20

37.95

37.95

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 7/7/2017 6
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120333 SEALED BID
EM RICE
NL',TMBER QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES US’JJTED TOTALS

Number of hanles:4, Product Height:5inch
Product Lenght:26 inch, Product Weight:5
pounds, Product Width: 22 inch,

22"W X 26"L X 5"H - 5 Ibs; 4 reinforced
handles.

Needed for Athletics Dept. Contact Seth
Simpson at 736-6999 Ext. 101




Athletic Field Striping Machine | # 8267903
Rust-Oleum 206346 Striping Machine, AF1600 Athletic Field Striping Paint, Steel, Steel, 30-3/4In L

Creates 3-6" straight lines. Covers a larger area in shorter time. Storage compartment halds 12 extra cans. Sturdy steel construction. Collapsible handle for easy
storage. Large diameter wheels to accommaodate high grass conditions.

Product Ordering Vendor Available Codes Order ltem
Information Specifications Information History Restriction

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Creates 3-6" Straight Lines. Covers A Larger Area In Sharter Time. Storage Compartment Holds 12 Extra Cans. Sturdy Steel
Construction. Collapsible Handle For Easy Storage. Large Diameter Wheels To Accommodate High Grass Conditions.

Descripcion Espafiol: MAQUINA PARA PINTAR LINEAS DE CAMPC ATLETICO

= Brand"INDUSTRIAL CHOICE"

PRODUCT DETAILS

FEATURES

« Adjustable For 3-6 In-Wide Lines

« Storage Compartment Holds-Up To 12 Exira Cans
« Sturdy Steel Construction



Marking Spray|# 5434725
Rustoleum M1800 System Precision Line Inverted Water Based Marking Spray Paint,

White
— Use For Marking Concrete, Pavement, Gravel, Grass, And More. Use To Mark The
e Location Of Underground Utilities At Construction And Excavation Sites Where

Identification Is Desired. Features A Precision-Line Spray Tip For Easy-To-Read,
Bright, Vivid Markings. Can Be Applied Down To 25-Degree Fahrenheit. Dries In Less
Than 5 Minutes. Spray-Through Cap. Tip Keeps Paint Off Fingers. Use With Sku#
826.4608. Can Be Used In USDA Facilities Based On FSIS Directive 11,000.4 (Rev. 1),
November 24, 1995. Covers Approximately 600-700 Linear Feet At 1 In. Wide.

Applicable Materials: Concrete, Grass, Gravel And Pavements
Application Method: Marking Wand, Marking Pistol, Marking Wheel
Capacity: 17 Oz

Coverage: 600 - 700 Ft Linear

Flash Point:  -105 Deg C

Form: Aerosolized Mist, Liquid

Odor/ Scent: Mild

Packing Type: Aerosol Can

Pigment: Varies With Color

Resists: Chalking And Fading

Series: Industrial Choice, M1800 System, Precision Line

Specific Gravity: 0.864

Standards: ~ NIOSH/MSHA Approved, OSHA 1910.134, ANSI Z88.2
Temperature Rating: 40 - 90 Deg F

Thinners: Acetone, Xylene, Toluene

Type: Inverted, Water Based

Usage: For Marking Concrete, Pavement, Gravel And Grass

Vehicles: Modified Alkyd

V O C Content: 552 G/L

FEATURES

Marks Up To 250% More Linear Feet Than Other Brands, Precision Tip Virtually No Overspray
No Mess Spray Tip Keeps Paint Off Fingers

Guaranteed Not To Clog

Convenient Spray-Through Cap

Adheres To Hot Surfaces, Can Be Sprayed In The Cold (To 25 Deg F)



be an Oversized, Hazardous, Liquid, or Fragile item. Please see the
Specifications for allowed shipment methods.

: Marking Spray|# 7674591  This item has shipping restrictions. It may
Rustoleum Industrial Choice M1600 System Inverted Solvent Based

RUST-OLEUM
R Marking Spray Paint, 17 Oz, Green
B PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Use For Marking Concrete, Pavement,
Gravel, Grass, And More. Use To Mark The Location Of Underground
Tt Utilities At Construction And Excavation Sites Where Identification Is
2] =] 0] Desired. Features A Precision-Line Spray Tip For Easy-To-Read,
=15 Bright, Vivid Markings. Can Be Applied Down To 25-Degree
- 5 Fahrenhiet. Dries In Less Than 5 Minutes. Spray-Through Cap. Tip
Keeps Paint Off Fingers. Use With Sku#826.4608. Can Be Used In
USDA Facilities Based On FSIS Directive 11,000.4 (Rev. 1), November
24, 1995. Covers Approximately 600-700 Linear Feet At 1 In. Wide.
PRODUCT DETAILS

Applicable Materials: Concrete, Grass, Gravel And Pavements
Application Method: Marking Wand, Marking Pistol, Marking Wheel
Capacity: 17 Oz

Coverage: 600 - 700 Ft Linear

Flash Point: -105 Deg C

Form: Aerosolized Mist, Liquid

Odor/ Scent: Solvent Like

Packing Type: Aerosol Can

Pigment: Varies With Color

Resists: Chipping And Fading

Series: Industrial Choice, M1600 System, SB Precision Line

Specific Gravity: 0.836

Standards: NIOSH/MSHA Approved, OSHA 1910.134, ANSI Z88.2
Temperature Rating: 40 - 90 Deg F

Thinners: Acetone, Xylene, Toluene

Type: Inverted, Solvent Based

Usage: For Interior And Exterior

Vehicles: Modified Alkyd

V O C Content: 548 G/L

FEATURES

Marks Up To 250% More Linear Feet Than Other Brands, Precision Tip Virtually No Overspray
No Mess Spray Tip Keeps Paint Off Fingers

Guaranteed Not To Clog

Convenient Spray-Through Cap

Adheres To Hot Surfaces, Can Be Sprayed In The Cold (To 25 Deg F)
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