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Parish

One Time Purchase of Fire Protection
Equipment and Supplies
for Jefferson Parish Public Works Warehouse

BID DUE: August 18., 2022 AT 11:00 AM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and

General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing
Department’s eProcurement site, www.ieffparishbids.net, by the bid due date

and time. Late bids will not be accepted. |

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Brenda Bellow
Buyer Email: bbellow@ijeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683




e i INVITATION TO BID Page: 1
DATE: 81212022 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

BID NO.: 5000138475 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURGHﬁslgagﬁE;ARTMEN?

8
GRETNA, LA, 70054-0008
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BBELLOW@jelfparish.net

Bids will be recelved until 11:00 AM, 8/18/2022 vis online at www.jeffparishbids.nat.

LATE BIDS YALL NOT 82 ACCEPTED
NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN N INK SRUTYPEWRITIEN, AND FROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE FIRM OR AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL ANDIOR PHOTOSTATIC FIGURES OR SIGNATURES SHALL RE&.&J M B8I0 REJECTION
HOWEVER, ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES A% DEFINED 1IN LSA- ?ﬁc? lé%éﬁ ARE ACCEPTABLE. SIGNATURE MUST BE A SECURED DIGITAL

Al bids submitiad s sublect 1o hess nsbiudisns and genennl conditions pnd any Spetist conditions und mmfmi i
m m part of ths bid proposal reforence. By submilling a bid, vendor agraes o comply with all provisions of Loy
2 withs Whe Jatforsen Panish Code of Ordinances, Louistana Code of Eibies, applioable Jolferson Parish eitveal Hersor
wtutéefs ﬁo 113546 andior Resolution No. 113047 ag amendad. A cop opy ol thegs mmiaaﬁxm gy b oblained from tha Oﬁé@ of ihe Parizh i‘d-s&
Sults 6700, Jallersan Pansh Gertral Govesnment Bullding, 200 Deitigny Stragl, Graing, LA TOUS2. You miay also obialn o copy by vailling the
Pumimang Dophrtiment "wobpage of purghaey b et and ¢ m»gz on Ondding lorma.
Al vandors subee 'timg m ahaili register a5 a Jgésrmm Patish vandor il not abeady vl m;ﬁmtzd Benslratien forms may be dismriondad foe
bilp Hpsirchasing jofl i by clicking on Vendor information. Gureard W forms with respecive 1ax enthealon nuimbers anid vondas
pplications may &a sm}mﬁmd at a0y tiree; hovvewar, If yous compsany 18 red regishersd Bhiror o currend VG foim 18 not on fie, vender regiatiation s
manﬁﬁmﬁ Venders may eipanancs b doisy in pyment § your company @ nola reginlared vendor with Jelfersol Parkin:

Jeltersan Pasisl s exeinpt fom paying sales tax under LEARS. 47:30% (&t};‘; Al mw for purchoses by Jelforson Parish of supplies snd maledal
shall ba quoled In the unit of measune spacitiod and cvm: clharwise z@m sfw te axﬁna&% of state and local Inxas. The price quoled lorwoik
shall bi slatod i bgures, In ihz avenl ihere is a dileranca in unit pricas and tolals, the unit shull provedt, Quatalions shall ks based on F.0.0
Delivored, aspwhare witrin tha Parish a8 desicnalad by the Purchas g %ﬁ JEFFEHSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID DHLY FRON
EACH VENDOR. fiems bid wist mant shecilications. JEFFEREON Mﬂss 4l socent one p@%:g for aach Ham intans olhorwioe dicalisl Two of e
?«rmﬁ for one e will resiit in bid rglecton. Bidders ate required i mp&@mg sigges svoed reaeny the bid forin andlor complts B retuen e asscdialed
iz fl@ﬁ; ;‘s%mng ie%*m; as indicated Tha price quabed for work shall b stated i Rpwes. T e avent Thete i 8 dfferancs in unl prces and 101878, 1hs unit
Wéﬁii nad prava

‘conisined hereln, ol of which

JEFFERSON PARISH mbnrvs the f-gm i award contiadts of place orders on 1 ump surn of individual em Basis, or such canibinalion, ns shall in i ,
gsd;}mm g iy U beesd inleses) of JEFFERSON PARISH % conlrach or oedas shall ba awanded 1o the LOWEST RESPOMSIVE el RESPONSIBLE
IDDER, taking Inlo conalduration tha CONFORMITY WIT%’{ {E ﬁi’%‘-ﬁ(}é? E{}fsﬂi}&s it iéw IEEL!‘,?QR*{ ANDIOR CORPLETION DATE

mm‘ss‘m Oaly m vardors that gubinl bids In rwma iy sa?kﬁiﬂ@rz may protest any slement of e pyncurement, i vaiieg b thé Diedle of
the Pmﬁ%mg Deparimant ?{;xdm g{géail‘ &f b facaived witlin 48 howrs of the relene of the bid mbg i by e %rghm sfimant. Allar
cungultation, the Parish Allomey swill s vampontt bo prolests i witing. (For mive information, pleass see Chapler 3, Articls VI, Division 2, S,
2.914 1 of the Jeliniton Parish z::m of Ordinonves,]

JEFFERSOHN PARK&H fesarvas the right 1o cancal all o noy padt of an order if rol shipped pe _é;v - W charges will b aliwed for parkng or cantags
urlgss | ed in tha quotation. Tho prded must nol be T8od ol ¢ higher Buice than quoled. JEFF ERSON PARISH rassrvas the aghl to cancel of my
tiena el Tor any tosson by issinga THIRTY (30) day Wﬁﬁm nalice fa tha conlracior

Ji:fF,me:m PARISH teiuies all producis to bir now (curtend} ond all work must be padermad ateording 9 stamiasd peactions for the projest. Unlesy
wise spenified, no allermarke] pidl b6 pocopled. Unless siharedes specifis aii warkmanzhip snd sulanals moud ove ol jeasl m (i yemr

% ? arwnling lmm the dale of delivery andior scoaptanca of ha fredeat, Ay do vintions or altetalion fiom e specifications most be ndizalad on
bid form tor pach iem and ynon request, produet datn for stme must Be submilled by the Time specifisd by Ine Purchasing Depardment.

if this bidd tequires 1 ple-bid confarence (see Additonal Requirsments seclion), bidders ate atvised 1hat such conference will b hald Io allow Siiders the
oppedunily o eatly any diserapancian in the bid spenteations and am«% mﬁim: tlaication reganding Instnigions, The Purchasing Dapadment will
fssun a widlen responss to bidders’ questions in the foan of #n Addendum

A Jormal Addermia require viisn anknowsigmant o iim bid farm by e iddee by he blddar ;}Zﬁm%mﬁ Addanchur pumbar s e appropials
saction. Faliure 1o acknowiadge an Addenidim on the bad form shall gmm v big (o Lo rejactad; JEFFERSON PARISH mesarves e tght 1o swand bid
s Pt Sowis! responsive and tesponsible bidder In 1 dvant,

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Whare brand names and slock numbers dre specified, it is for the purpose of
establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and
slock nunibols arg apwiﬁed Complele wed data gy be ranuirad prior i awarnd,

-Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual fequirements may ba nore or lass than quantities listed.




DATE: 2oz

BID NO.: 5000139475 Page: 2

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

Biddars ate nol lo excluds from padicipation in, deny the benelits of, or subjec! to discriminalion under sny program or aclivity, any
person in tha United States on tha grounds of race; color, national onigin, or sex; nor diseriminate on the basis ¢f age under (he Age
Discriminalion Act of 1875, or with raspact (o an olherwise qualified handicapped Individunl as provided In Seclion S04 ol the:
Rehubilitalion Act of 1973, vron the basis of religion, exceopt that afgl exemption from such prohibilion againgl diseriminalion b the
bash of religion as provided in the Civil Righls Act of 1864, or Title VL aid VI of the Act of Agnl 11, 1588, shall slso spply. This
ssgurance intludes complance with the adninistrative requirements of the Ravenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provigions conlained in Section 51.55 (c), (d), (8], and (k}(5) of the Regulations. New consiniglion or rendvation projects must
ﬁ@mgl‘y with Beclion 504 of the 1973 Rehabililalion Acl, 8% amandad, in accordanze with the American Notisnal Standard instilule’s
sppcificalions (ANSI AL 1741881}

Jeforson Parlsh amd its paitners o3 the reciplants of fedaral funds are hully commitied lo swarding a zwtmﬁigg to firn(s) that will
provida hgh quality sernces and thal are dedicated o diversity and to conlaining costs, Thus, Jaflarsen Parish strongly
sncourages he invoelvoment of miotily andfor woman-owned business enterptises (DBE's, Inddiding MBE's, WBE's ansl BEEs) o
stimilatn parlicipation In procurement and assiatance programs.

TN ACCORDANGE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
T e R ROALLVENDORS T T e e

{ This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submiiting bids online.
_ This is a secure site and ayuthorized personnal have limited read access only. Bidders are to submit
__electronically using this froe service; while the wobsite accopis various file types, one single POF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred, Bidders submitling uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity, If uploaded images/documents are :tigtlg%%hieg then bidder's
_submission will be rejected. Please note all mﬁugéz?é:;is contained in this bid package for electronic bid
: ... .. . submisglon, . o o

Ploasa visit our E-Procuromant Page at wwwioffparishbids.r ”i;tﬁf?\%imfaﬁ;ti,vié?{éaﬁéﬁﬂﬁ'Pﬂiéﬁsﬁ‘ -
~ solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
| g " Uhtpiipurchasing jeffparishnet, ‘

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

~ PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
~ CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

1. Al bidders must aflend the MANDATORY pro-bid conference and will be required lo sign in and oul as evidence of
atiendance. In sccordance with LSA RS, 38:2212(0), ol prospeciive bidders shall bu presant st the beginning of the
MANUATORY pre-bid confarence and shall remain I allendance for the duration of the conletence. Any prospastive
hid‘?éfrivm@ fads 10 allend the conference or remain for the duration shall be probibited from submitling & bid for the
project

2. Adlendonce fo this pra-bid conference is oplional. However, tallure to altend the pro-bid conference shall net
rellove the bitider of respongibilily for information discussed at the conforencs, Furthermors, fallure 1o aliend
1w pre-bid confecence and ingpection does not relieve tha successful bidder Tram the necessily of fumishing

‘materials of performing any work thal may be required to complele the work in accordance with 1he specilication
with no aclditional cost to the ownaer,

3. Conlractor must hold curent applicable JEFFERSON PARISH livensas with (ke Dapartment of Inspection and
Cote Enforcement. Contractor shall oblain any and sl permils raquired by 1he JEFFERSON PARISH
Depariment of lnspection snd Code Enforcement. Tho contractor shall be responsible for the paymeni of
theso pormits, All gefmi‘zs must be oblaied paot o the slad of the groject. Contracior must alao hold any
and all applicable Feders! and Stele licensess Uonlractor shall be responsible lor tha paymend of these peroits
and 2hall obtain them prior 1o the sterl of the project.

4. A LA Siale Conlracior's Ucense vall be required in accondance with LSA R.S5. 37-2150 ol seq. and such licanse
number wil be shown on the oulside of the bid elecironic anvelops. Failure lc’-mmggi wilicausa thabidlobe
tejectad, When subaiilling the bid elettronically, Ihe ficensa aumbar must ba entered inthe approprate field s the
alosironic procurement system. Failure o tomply will causathe bid 1o ba refaciad.




DATE:

Bi1212022

BID NO;: 60.00139475 Pago: 3

]
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15.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

fis the bidder's respensibility to visil the job site and svaluate the job before submitling a bid.

. Job #ile must be clean and fres of 8l Bier and delirs dally and upon complstion of the conlract Passagewayy must be Repl

ciean and freo of matenal, equipment, dnd debrs 81 sl imes. Flammabla material must be romoved from the job site dally
tecause storage Wil not be l‘ﬁmmiﬁed on-the promizes, Precsulion mus! be avercised af ol Tmas 1o safoguard the wellare of
JEFFERSOMN PARISH and the general pabiic,.

. PUBLICWORKS 8IDS: All assrdds for public works in excess of $5,000 00 will be reduced 1o a formal contraci which shall be

ecorded al the contracior's expense vdth the Clerk of Cour and Ex-Officic Recordar of Mordgages for the Parish of Jeflorson, A
price lisl of recordation co8ls may be oblained from the Glerk of Courd and Ex-Oltisio Resnrder of Morlgages for the Pardsh of
Jafferson: Al awards In excess of $325.000.00 will requice both a performance and & paymant. bond, Unisss olerwise slaled in
the bid specifications, the performance bond requiremenis shall be 100% of the confract price. Unless otherwise slate in the bid
‘ﬁ;ﬁmﬁfﬂﬁﬁﬁ payment bond requltenients shall be 100% of the contract srice. Bath bonds shall bo supplied at the sighing
of the contrad

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be retuired fof this bid, Tha amount of the bond will be 100% of ths

coniract price unless olhenviza indicated in the specifications. The performunce bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract. _

. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A paymant bond will ba requited for infs bid, The aincunt of the bond will be 100% of the

caniratt ptive-unless oltheryise indizated In the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied

at lra sigaing of the
confract

All bidders must comply with tha requiremants stated In the altached *Standard Insurance Reguirements” shaat allached to this
bid solictalion. Failura to comply with this instruction will result i bid rejection.

A bid bond will be required with bid submisgion in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless olherwise stated in the bid
specificalions. All surelies musi be In original format (no coplss). When submilling o bid enline, vendors must submitan
electronie bid bond Hhrough the ragpaclive onling clsaringhousa bond managemenl syglemis) as indicated In the ol i bid
sgggam?h?g o Ceniral Auglion House, No stanned papar copies of any bld bond will be accepled a3 padd of the slectronic bid
submission.

This is on e noeded basis contract, JEFFERSON PARISH makes no tapresentalions on wirrantios with regard lo iminimum
guarantesd quanbiies unless otharwise stated in (he bid specificalions, ‘ -

Frelghl charges should be included in 16tal cost when queting. 1 not quoted FOR DELIVERED, freight must be guoled as &
separate flem. Bid may be rejecied i nol quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are nolindicaled on bid form.

eonshruchion, alieration or deimoltion of g@bgm buildings or projecls, In conformity with the provisions conlained s LEARS
322929, LBA-RS 38221210, LSA-RS 382224, snd Sec 2-823.1 of he Jellerson Paish Tode of Ordinances. For bidding
g:::;:&g:ggas} alf bldders must submilwith Bid submisaion COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY HOTARIZED Alfidavils,

cluding: Non-Conviction Alfidavil, Non-Collusion Affidavil, Campaign Confribution Affidavit, Dedl Disclosures Alfidavil and.
E-Verly Affidavit. For the convariense of vendors, all affidavila have been combinad info one form entitlad PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must bo submitied in its original format, and without material allemlion, In order o be compliant
und for the bid lo be considered rosponsive. A scanned copy of the compleled, signed and propatly nofarized aflidavit may be
submitied with the bid, however, the successful bidder mus! submit the origingl alffavit inits onginal format and without malerial
alteration upon conlaact execution, Fallure to Comply witl resultin the Bid submission being rejecled as nonresponsiva. The
Partish raxarves the right fo award bid 1o the next lowest responsive and responsible tidder in this svent.

FUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Compleled, Signed and Properly Notarizad Afidavits Required; This ag}pﬁes {o alt soliciations lor

‘NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Comploted, Slgned and Properdy Nolarizéd Affidavits Required in conlormity with the provisions

cortained in LSA ~ RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-023.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
st submil with bid submission COMPLETED, S8IGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavils, including: Non-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Ceniibution Affidavil. For the convenience of vendors, all allidaviis have
besre combinad into one Torm anfitied NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This aflidavil mus! be submiited Inlls original
formal, amd withou! matorial alteration, In order to be compilant and for the bid to be considaerad responsive. A scannad copy of
the sompleted, signed and properly nolarized sffidavit may be submitled with the bid, however, the succassiul bidder must
submil Ine criginal affidavil in s original formal and withsut melern] slteration Upon confract sxacution! Fallurs 1o comply will
result In iha bird submission baing rajocted a5 norsraspondive. The Parish resecvas the rfight lo award bid 1o the next bwest
responsive and responsible bidder In this avent. ’




DATE: 81122022
BID NO.: 60-00130475 o o Page: 4
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

18. The ensuing contiact for this bid soliclation may be eligltle for FEMA reimblrsement andfor Federal fundingleaimbursement,
As such, the referanced appandix will be applicable agcordingly and shall be consideted a part of the bid ducuments. Al
applicable eadificalions pust ba duly compleled, signad and submitled with bid submission. Fallure (o subirdt applicatile
cartifications with bid submission will resull In bid rajsction, :

17. For ihis project; tha Contraclor shall ool pay any stale or lotal sales o use tawes on materials and equipment which ure
affixed and made pad of the immovable properly of the projact or which Is permanently incomerated i the pmg;:i {hereinalier
ralerred lo as “applicable matedals and ﬁi?}gimﬁmr“}, Al purchases of applicable materials o equipment shall Do made by the.
conlractor on behipll of and as the agent of Julferson Pansh (Ovner), » political subdivision of the Siate of Louisians. No stale ond
local sales and use laxes oo owed on applicable matedals and equipment undar the provisions of At 1023 of the 1881 Ragular
Sesslon « Loulsiana Revised Stalule 473018 )e), Dwnerwill fumish 1o conlactor a earfilicale formy which cerdifine thal Dunet s
not ragquired to pay such siate of local sates and use taxey, and conlraclor shall fumnish a copy of such cadificals (o all vendors of
suppliers of the applicable materials and equipment, and report Is Owner the amount of laxes not insurred.

it shatl be the duty of every gzxr’lsh officer, employee, depariment, sgency, special disirict, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licenses of the parish, and the didy of every appiicant {or Cartillcation of
uligibliity fora parish contract or progeam, 1o coopuerate with the Inspactor Ganeral In any {weﬁtﬁ%azian* audit, iInapoction,
gnﬁmmama raviow, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Coda of Ordinances Section 221584 é‘l%} E'y”sui;mi nga:
id, vandor acknowledyes this and will abide by all provisions of the reforenced Jelferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  8/12/2022 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 5
BI RO Stnie JEFFERSON PARISH
PURGHASMG E‘JEP&RTMEN‘!’
BRETNA LA 70054 -0009
504-364-2678
VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BBELLOW

As per LSA-RS 47:301 of seq., all governmantal bodies are excluded from paymant of sales tages to any Loulsiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F,0.B. Agency warchouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department,

JEFFERSON PARISH resorves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be

allowed for parking or cartage unless specified In quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH rescrves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by Issuing a THIRTY (30) day written -
notice to the contractor. ‘

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be dane In workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must ba submitled by the time spacified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 16 Weeks

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

in the event that addenda are Issuaed with this bld biddars MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Blddar miust
acknowledge recaipt of an addendum on the bid form br placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will rosult in bid rejection.

Acknowledpa Recalpt of Addonda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:
HUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S UCENSE NO.: (if appllcable)
~  ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW #ax

FIRM NAME:

Coburns Supply

MSIG‘N)\TURE 7 = e o 5o ™
{Must be signed Mrn) MM i 2\721 - Outsjftg S,aleri

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:

Mark Tate

ADDRESS: -
1849 Commercial Drive

CITY, STATE: —— ZIP: 20058

| TELEPHONE: —
| ( 225) 202-7808 L (504 ) 3481005

EMAIL ADDRESS: mtate@coburns. com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID [TEMS: § 2002163




DAYE: 8Mp0n

BID'NO.: §0-00133475

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH « continued

Page: &

SEALED BID

ITER

NUMBER

QUANTITY

hi

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

3.00

2.00

2000

5oe

B0Y

600,

2.00

1.00

EA

EA

ONE TISE PURCHASE OF FIRE PROTECTION
ECAHPIIENT AND SUPPLIES FOR JEEFERSON
FARISH PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE

0010 - HYDRANT.SA/% IN BY §-U2 FT.
COMPLETE WIFLANGED BROELEFT OPENNST,

KENNEDY GUARDIAN MODEL #K81D
SKH 00-031418A

0020 - HYDRANT,5-1/4 IN X § FT.COMPLETE
WMECHANICAL JOINT SHOE, 3 WAY TYPE OPEN

LEFT,NST,COLD ROLLED STEEL STEMDUCTILE
BREAKAWAY COUPLING, SILVER COLOR,SIS
BOLTS/NUTS KENNEDY GUARDIAN MODEL #K81D
SKA 00-0314148

G030 - cm.usmn REPAIR KITBLACKIN
COLORE-1/§ IH HYDRANT KENNEDY GUARDIAN

BAODEL SK81A OPEN RIGHT,ITEM #5.K5140,
PART #1585C00R1XE1Z

BKE 00-0014400

0840 - HUT 1-172 IN PENTAGON OPERATING,
LEFT OPEN,5-1/4 IN MUELLER SUPER

CENTURION 250 {FOR MODELS AFTER 1887)
PART #146440
SK# 00-0332000

D080 « NUT,HOLD DOWN B4 IN MUELLER
SUPER ﬁENTGRiB& 250 (FOR MODELS AFTER

1987)CATALOG WA-423, PART #148504,
TTER #A-84
KK 000332030

4060 « PLATE LOWER VALVE S IH
ﬁﬁELLE& CENTURION {FOR MODELS BEFORE

1996]CATALOG SA-123,ITEMAA-46,PART
T34
KA 00330440

0070 - WRENCH, 2172 IN HOSE NOZZLE &2
N AND B-1/4 IN KENNEDY GUARDIAN MODEL
#RETDITEN #KB 4G, PART #3310372

SKA 000314350

Q000 « NOZZLE, 2.5 IN HOSE LEAD TYPE,
E-1/4 I MUELLER IMPROVED (FOR MODELS

Nt

3290.77

8 887231

3220.12

. 322012

300.98

4 6019.60

o

NO BID

NO BID

L2

NO BID

14520

1§, 28040

NO BID




DATE: @HZit02:

BID HO.: 50-00138475

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: -7

SEALED BID.

ITEM
HUMBER

QUANTITY

Ui

UNIT PRICE
QuoTED

TOTALS

1t

200

2.00

EA

BEFORE 18727010 STYLEY) CATALOG #A-24015
ITEM 8H-T0
SKE 000341300

0090 - STEMUPPER, THREADED.B-1M IN

ﬁ!UﬁLLﬁﬂiWﬁi}V&D {FOR MODELS BEFORE 1872
;ﬁi}i ETYLE“JCATALOG BAADEZ24 ITER

SK# 00-0341700

0110 < RING SEAT,5-1/4 1N KENNEDY )
GUARDIAN MODEL #K81D,ITEM #KB128, PART
BI196772

GHE 00-03147480

DELIVER TO:

PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE
1600 RIVER PARK BLVD
BRIDGE CITY, LA 70094

NO-BID

&

A

308.60

1561920




