Mark Buttery
Attention Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
Bid NO. 50-132991
13 Month Contract for the Supply of Disposable
Bid Title Gloves on an as needed basis for All Jefferson Parish Departments
Legal Name 2752285 ONTARIO INC
6610 Turner Valley Road Suite #200, Mississauga, ON.,
Address Canada L5N 2P1
Telephone No. 1-905-997-9000
Fax No. 1-905-858-8111
Primary Contact Aisha Ditta
Email ppeproposall @pharmacygo.com
Telephone No. 1-905-997-9000
DUNS No. 204223320
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INVITATION TO BID

DATE: 11/30/2020 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 5
BID NO.: 50-00132991 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 2752285 Ontario Inc. (DBA; PharmacyGo Medical Supplies) BUYER: MBUTTERY

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES Within 2-3 weeks

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: ADDENDUM No. 1

NUMBER: ~

NUMBER: ~

NUMBER: ~

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) N/A - Canadian company

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:
2752285 Ontario Inc. (DBA; PharmacyGo Medical Supplies)

SIGNATURE: . TITLE:

(Must be signed here) Proposal Consultant
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: ﬂ

Aisha Ditta

ADDRESS:

6610 Turner Valley Road Unit #200,

CITY, STATE: ZIP:
Mississauga ONTARIO (Canada) L5N 2P1
TELEPHONE: FAX:

1(905) 997-9000 1(905) 858-8111
EMAIL ADDRESS:

ppeproposall @pharmacygo.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ 9,880 Page 3 of 8



DATE: 11/30/2020

BID NO.: 50-00132991

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Price Quote

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

1.00

250.00

100.00

100.00

100.00

200.00

Cs

Cs

Cs

Cs

Cs

BX

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR THE SUPPLY OF
DISPOSABLE GLOVES ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS
FOR ALL JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENTS

0010 - BOUFFANT DISPOSABLE CAPS, 1000/CS

BRAND: JOHNSON

PRODUCT NO. JW-6524GR, SIZE: 24"
COLOR: GREEN

PACK: 1000/CS

0020 - NON-STERILE DISPOSABLE GLOVES,
LATEX-FREE, POWDER FREE, VINYL

SMALL, MEDIUM, LARGE, AND X-LARGE
100/BOX 10 BX/CS

INTERPLAST PACK 10/100
IG-VF001SM

IG-VF002MED
IG-VF003LARGE
IG-VF004XLARGE

0030 - 0231 GLOVES, SMALL, FOOD SERVICE
DISPOSABLE, CLEAR POLYETHYLENE, POWDER

FREE, 100/BX, 10 BOX/CS

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO.
IG-GL-SMALL

0040 - 0232 GLOVES, MEDIUM, FOOD SERVICE
DISPOSABLE, CLEAR POLYETHYLENE, POWDER

FREE, 100/BOX 10 BOX/CS

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-GL-MEDIUM
SIZE: MEDIUM

10/100

0050 - 0233 GLOVES, LARGE, FOOD SERVICE
DISPOSABLE, CLEAR POLYETHYLENE, POWDER

FREE, 100/BX 10 BX/CS

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-GL-LARGE
SIZE: LARGE

10/100

0060 - 1850 GLOVES, BLUE NITRILE,X-SMALL
DISPOSABLE AMBIDEXTROUS, TEXTURED, 6 MIL
ALTERNATIVE BRAND:
9 INCH LENGTH, POWDER FREE,
100 GLOVES PER DISPENSER BOX
BOX, AMBITEXTROUS, TEXTURED, 6 MIL,
FDA and HEALTH CANADA APPROVED

BRAND: Blue Sail
PRODUCT NO. BS 020-N01
PACK: 100

SIZES: XS/S/M/L/XL
COLOR:White, blue, black, cobalt blue, blue purple

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$12.35
per box

$2,470
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DATE: 11/30/2020

BID NO.: 50-00132991

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Price Quote

Page: 7

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

200.00

200.00

200.00

BX

BX

BX

9 1/2 INCH LENGTH, POWDER FREE,
100 GLOVES PER DISPENSER BOX
BOX, AMBITEX

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-NFX5001
PACK: 100

0070 - 1860 GLOVES, BLUE NITRILE, SMALL
DISPOSABLE, AMBIDEXTROUS, TEXTURED,

6 MIL., 9 1/2 INCH LENGTH, POWDER
FREE, 100 GLOVES PER DISPENSER BOX
ABMITEX

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-NF201
PACK: 100

See above (item number #6) for brand alternative details.

0080 - 1870 GLOVES, BLUE NITRLE, X-LARGE
DISPOSABLE, AMBIDEXTROUS, TEXTURED,6 MIL

9 1/2 INCH LENGTH, POWDER FREE,
100 GLOVES PER DISPENSER BOX
AMBITEX

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-NF204
PACK: 100

See above (item number #6) for brand alternative details.

0090 - 1872 GLOVES, BLUE NITRILE, LARGE
DISPOSABLE, AMBIDEXTROUS, TEXTURED,6 MIL
9 1/2 INCH LENGTH, POWDER FREE,

100 GLOVES PER DISPENSER BOX

BRAND: INTERPLAST
PRODUCT NO. IG-NF203
PACK: 100

See above (item number #6) for brand alternative details.

$12.35
per box

$2,470

$12.35
per box

$2,470

$12.35
per box

$2,470
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PAST PERFORMANCE
BID #50-132991

PharmacyGo is a respected healthcare provider with over 20 years in the Medical Industry.

Since 2008, PharmacyGo & their associated healthcare companies have provided medical supplies and products to patients requiring
rehabilitation treatment, postoperative care, workplace & ergonomic support. From the start of COVID, PharmacyGo has been proud
to help various levels of Governments, Municipalities, Hospitals, Long Term Care Homes & Front Line Health Care Workers with
personal protective equipment (PPE) to help keep citizens safe, healthy & protected.

A list of PharmacyGo's current
customers receiving personal
protective equipment (PPE) and
supplies of similar scope to the
County requirements presented
in this RFP.

GOVERNMENT OF CANADA
GOVERNMENT OF ONTARIO
Campbell Drugstores

Canagen Pharmaceuticals
Multi-national Corporations
Hospitals

Home Depot

Long Term Care Homes

A description of the similarities
in scope to that of the County’s

requirements.

PharmacyGo has provided a complete range of PPE including Surgical & Isolation Gowns, Masks
(N95, KN95<Level 1, 2, 3 Surgical Masks<Cloth Masks), Nitrile & Vinyl Gloves, Face Shields,
Thermometers, Hand Sanitizers & Disinfectant Wipes

Past Performance Record #1

Agency/Company Name ADBO Distribution
Address 5376 Boul Cleroux,

Laval, QC

H7T 2E9
Contract Description N95 Masks + Nitrile Gloves
Contract Value $142,199

Length of Service/Contract

Started a one year contract on July, 23, 2020

Point of Contact

Name John Peter

Title Owner

Phone Number 1(514) 999-9828
Email Address Primotoba@gmail.com

Past Performance Record #2

Agency/Company Name Cotton Candy Inc.
Address 2600 Argentia Rd,
Mississauga, ON
L5N 5v4
Contract Description NO95 masks and Nitrile Gloves
Contract Value $1,000,000+

Length of Service/Contract

No contract. From the initial order date of July 23,2020, PharmacyGo is proud to be a regular
supplier for Cotton Candy Inc.

Point of Contact

Name Valentina Cabrales

Title Account Executive

Phone Number 1(905) 858-2600 x274
Email Address valentinac@cottoncandy.com
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Past Performance Record #3

Agency/Company Name Wireless Now Trading Inc.
Address 2 County Court Blvd,
Brampton ON
L6W 3W8
Contract Description Masks and Nitrile Gloves
Contract Value $18,290+

Length of Service/Contract

No contract. From the initial order date of July 16, 2020, PharmacyGo is proud to be a regular
supplier for Wireless Now Trading Inc.

Point of Contact

Name Junaid Siddiqui

Title Director

Phone Number 1(416) 258-9488

Email Address junaid@wireless-now.com
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BAIRD MACGREGOR

INSURANCE BROKERS LP

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

TO: WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

This is to certify that the insurance policies detailed below are in force for the term shown.

INSURED: PHARMACY GO MEDICAL SUPPLIES O/B 2752285 ONTARIO INC.

2330 DALTON ROAD
MISSISSAUGA, ON
L5A 3M3

COMPREHENSIVE—LIABILITY

COMBINED BODILY INJURY & PROPERTY DAMAGE INCLUSIVE LIMIT

POLICY NO. TERM INSURER
BINDER June 9, 2020 Strategic
to Underwriting

June 9, 2021 Managers Inc.

$2,000,000 — Public Liability, Per Occurrence, $2,500.00 Deductible
$2,000,000 - Products/Completed Operations, Per Occurrence and
in the Aggregate, $2,500.00 Deductible per claim
$1,000,000 — Advertising Liability, Per Occurrence and in the
Aggregate, $1,000.00 Deductible per claim
$1,000,000 — Non-Owned Auto, $1,000.00 Deductible per claim

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS

Sales of Personal Protection Equipment

ADDITIONAL INSURED

N/A

LOSS PAYABLE

N/A

COVERAGE UNDER EACH POLICY MENTIONED ABOVE IS SUBJECT TO THE TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND EXCLUSIONS OF EACH SUCH POLICY.
THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER SHALL NOT BE NOTIFIED OF ANY ALTERATION, REDUCTION, CANCELLATION OR NON-RENEWAL OF COVERAGE NOTED HEREIN.

Date: June 12, 2020

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

825 QUEEN ST. E., TORONTO, ONT. M4M 1H8 TEL. 416.778.8000 FAX 416.778.4492
BAIRDMACGREGOR.COM
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