INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  2/05/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00122010 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VEND%: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC % BUYER: CGASPER

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department. '

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form foreachitem
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRM NAME:
B% SU/I”PLY, LLC

SIGNATURE: i W A TITLE:
(Must be signed(lere)%_ /ﬁ‘/&é-74(7'.44_/ MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE N :

JOHN ATKINSON
ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: zZIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:
() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ 1192.10




DATE: 2/05/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122010

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

5.00

4.00

5.00

100.00

30.00

30.00

24.00

4.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

VARIOUS WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR JEFFERSON
PARISH SEWERAGE DEPARTMENT.

0001 - Coupling, flexible, shielded,
for 12 inch SDR-26 PVC pipe x 12 inch

SDR-26 PVC pipe, 5000 series strong
back RC type, stainless steel clamp
and shear ring, Fernco no. 5056-1212RC
(013573A)

0002 - Wye 8 inch SDR-35 PVC all bell
(0133510)

0003 - Coupling Flex,
12in DC x 12 in PVC,

Fernco no. 1002-1212
(0135590)

0004 - Nipple galvanized,
6 inch x close, schedule 40

(0297960)

0005 - Bolt, hex head,
3/4in-10x 2-1/4in long,

domestic, grade 5 identification
marking, baked on blue teflon
coating meets ASTM B117
(0436570)

0006 - Gasket, ring, drop-in,

3 in, blle-gard 3000, 150 psi
(0490150)

0007 - Gasket, 10 in, drop-in,
ring-style, 10-3/4 in I.D. x 13-3/8 in
0.D. in, blue-gard 3000 material,

150 psi, 1/16 in thick
(0490450)

0008 - Valve, air cock, 1/8 in FPT x
1/8 in FPT, brass, lever handle,
Conbraco no. 41-430-05
(0621150)

0009 - Coupling flange assembily,
PX70 series, bushing size 1610,

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

58.00

290.00

NO BID

NO BID

1.65

49.50

6.34

190.20

11.80

283.20

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 2/05/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122010

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

12.00

12.00

60.00

16.00

15.00

24.00

150.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

Dodge (Baldor) no. 010603
(0631370)

0010 - Union, PVC, schedule 80, 2 in,
female socket x female socket, must

have Viton o-ring seat, (electrical
conduit fittings are not acceptable)
(0690620)

0011 - Tee, PVC, schedule 80,
1-1/4in x1-1/4 in x 1-1/4 in,

socket x socket x socket
electrical conduit fittings are not
acceptable

(0690420)

0012 - Valve, shut-off,
1/4 in FPT x 1/4 in FPT,

30 PSI maximum working
pressure, brass body and plug,
Parker no. V403P-4-4

(0621210)

0013 - Valve, ball, PVC, schedule 80,
true union, 1/2 inch, ends are

female socket x female socket
(0692000)

0014 - Bend, 90 degree, 6 inch,
bell x spigot, SDR-35 PVC

(0130810)

0015 - Coupling, flexible, shielded,
for 8 inch concrete pipe x 6 inch

SDR-26 PVC pipe, 5000 series strong
back RC type, stainless steel clamp
and shear ring, Fernco no. 5006-86RC
(013537A)

0016 - Bend, PVC, 6 inch x 22-1/2
degrees, SDR-35, bell x spigot
(0130610)

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

6.32

379.20

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




* For use on low pressure air systems.

¢ Designed for working pressure of 80 PSI at moderate temperatures.
* Spring-key type cocks of all brass construction with stainless steel springs.
* Machine finish is standard. Polished or plated finish available at extra cost.

FIP X FIP * lever handle
* no hex
Part #
46-345

* Designed for working pressure of 30 PSI.
» Forged brass bodies and brass handles.

FEMALE X FEMALE PIPE

Part #

T

Hex

46-152

FIP X FIP | Ind. A B Approx.
# Wt. Lbs.
1/8” 43 | 1.94 1.68 0.14

BRASS FITTINGS

« Instantaneous off-on operation with 360° rotation.
* Not good for gasoline.

Female Pipe A B Hex
X Female Pipe

Approx.
Wt. Lbs.

1/4” 228 1.82 0.69 0.20
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