DATE: 5/13/2015 Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00112678 BID FORM

Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will
only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.
Are you requesting an escalation provision?

YES NO X

MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED %

INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF One year from date of award

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES STOCK - 30 DAYS

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)
THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

FIRMNAME: __A.Y. McDonald Mfg. Co.

appress: 4800 Chavenelle Rd.

ciry, sTaTe: _ Dubuque, Iowa zip: 52002

TELEPHONE: ( 800) 292-2737 FAX: (800 ) 832-9296

EMAIL ADDRESS: _ sales@aymcdonald.com

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form.Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form
will result in bid rejection.

Addendum: ived
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: a #l Receiy

NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

$885,451.52

TOTAL PRICE ITEMS: $
AUTHORIZED /MJ ,
SIGNATURE: 3 L Robert D. McDonald II

. . 3 " Printed Name
TitrLe:  President & Chief Executive Officer

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE
indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

35.00

1.00

4.00

350.00

100.00

260.00

100.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONE (1) YEAR CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF
BRONZE FITTINGS FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS, ALL WATER
DISTRICTS, AND ALL JEFFERSON PARISH
AGENCIES AND MUNICIPALITIES

0010-ADAPTER TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT CONPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW, AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE
3/4 INCH PJ/FIP,FORD C14-33 GROUP 1
(0020-0060)(38016)MANUFACTURER PART
NUMBER 74754-22

0020-ADAPTER TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW,AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON
PIPE,1 INCH PJ/FIP,FORD C14-44(38026)
7454-22 1 INCH

0030-ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW,AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON
PIPE,2 INCH PJ/FIP,FORD C14-77(38028)
7454-22 2 INCH

0040-ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW,AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE,
3/4 INCH PJ/MIP,FORD C84-33(38015)
7453-22 3/4 INCH

0050-ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW,AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE,
1 INCH PJ/MIP,FORD C94-44 (38025)
74753-22 1 INCH

0060-ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK
JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET

SCREW,AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE,
2 INCH PJ/MIP,FORD C84-77 (38027)
7453-22 2 INCH

0070-BUSHING,REDUCING,INLET OF CC/AWWA
MALE TAPER THREADS AND OUTLET OF FEMALE
CC/AWWA TAPER THREADS.1 INCH MALE CC BY

3.4 INCH FEMALE CC.FORD NUMBER BBAA-43
(37980)

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$9.69

$339.15

$13.14

$13.14

$45.53

$182.12

$9.22

$3,227.00

$10.91

$1,091.00

$43.03

$11,187.80

$8.89

$889.00
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

1

12

13

14

15

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

925.00

1,250.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

0080-BUSHING,REDUCING,INLET OF CC/AWWA
MALE TAPER THREADS AND OUTLET OF FEMALE

CC/AWWA TAPER THREADS,2 INCH MALE CC BY
3/4 INCH FEMALE CC.FORD NO. BBAA-73,
(37981)

0090-BUSHING,REDUCING,INLET OF CC/AWWA
MALE TAPER THREADS AND OUTLET OF FEMALE

CC/AWWA TAPER THREADS,2 INCH MALE CC BY
1 INCH FEMALE CC,FORD NO BBAA-74
(37982)

0100-BUSHING(ADAPTOR),REDUCING,INLET OF
CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND BUSHING

(ADAPTOR) REDUCING OUTLET OF FEMALE
NATIONAL PIPE THREADS,3/4 INCH MALE CC
BY 1/2 INCH FEMALE NOT FORD BBA1-31
(377968)

0120-BUSHING(ADAPTOR),REDUCING BRASS,
INLET OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS,

1 INCH MALE CC BY 3/4 INCH FEMALE NPT,
FORD BBA1-43 (37969)

0130-BUSHING(ADAPTOR),REDUCING,BRASS,
INLET OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND

OUTLET OF FEMALE NATIONAL PIPE THREADS,
2 INCH MALE CC BY 1 INCH FEMALE NPT,
FORD NUMBER BBA1-74 (37970)

0140-BUSHING(ADAPTOR),REDUCING,BRASS,
INLET OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND
OUTLET OF FEMALE NATIONAL PIPE THREADS,

2 INCH MALE CC BY 1-1/4 INCH FEMALE NPT,
FORD NUMBER BBA1-75(37971)

0150-CONNECTOR,YOKE BOX EXPANSION,
STANDARD/HANDWHEEL,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE METER THREADS WITH AN OUT OF MALE

YOKE CONNECTION,5/8 INCH BY 3/4 INCH,
FORD EC-23(38175) 14-ZEHG

0160-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE INLET OF
OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND AN
OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$40.01

$40.01

$40.92

$40.92

$7.24

$7.24

$9.43

$9.43

NO BID

$39.62

$39.62

$12.33

$11,405.25

$28.86

$36,075.00
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

600.00

290.00

1.00

1.00

2.00

36.00

180.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

WITH CLAMPLING SET SCREW,TO HAVE LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,3/4 INCHCC/PJ,
FORD FB1000-3(38035)

74701B-22 3/4 INCH

0170-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND AN

OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING
WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,TO HAVE LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,1 INCH, CC/PJ,
FORD FB1000-4 (38062)

74701B-22 1 INCH

0180-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND AN OUTLET

OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING WITH
CLAMPING SET SCREW,TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,2 INCH CC/PJ,FORD NO.
FB1000-7 (38095)

74701B-22 2 INCH

0190-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND AN

OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREADS,TO
HAVE LARGE RAISED RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,
3/4 INCH CC/FIP FORD NO FB1600-3 (38034)
73148B 3/4 INCH

0200-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND OUTLET

OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREADS,TO HAVE
LARGE RAISED RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,1 INCH

CC/FIPD NO.FB1600-4 (38064)
73148B | INCH

0210-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS AND AN

OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREADS,TO
HAVE LARGE RAISED RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,
2 INCH CC/FIP FORD NO FB1600-7 (38094)
73148B 2 INCH

0220-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF MALE PIPE THREADS AND AN OUTLET OF

PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING WITH
CLAMPING SET SCREW.TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGLAR KEY WAY,3/4 INCH MIP/PJ,FORD
NO. FB1100-3(38033)

74704B-22 3/4 INCH

0230-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF MALE IRON PIPE THREADS AND AN OUTLET

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$37.96

$22,776.00

$140.72

$40,808.80

$24.42

$24 .42

$32.94

$32.94

$137.16

$274.32

$29.73

$1,070.28

$39.10

$7,038.00
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

23

24

25

26

27

28

29

10.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

510.00

50.00

1.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTINGS WITH
CLAMPING SET SCREW,TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEYWAY,1 INCH MIP/PJ,FORD
NO FB1100-4 (38063) 74704B-22 1 INCH

0240-CORPORATION STOP,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF MALE IRON PIPE THREADS AND AN QUTLET

OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING WITH
CLAMPING SET SCREW,TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY,2 INCH,MIP/PJ.FORD
NO 1100-7(38093) 74704B-22 2 INCH

0250-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
OF FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER

WITH AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE
THREADING,5/8 INCH BY 3/4 INCH MTR/FIP
FORD NO. C31-23 (38135)

74637 3/4 INCH

0260-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF FEMALE THREADED METER NUT TO HAVE A

COUPLER WITH AN OQUTLET OF FEMALE IRON
PIPE THREADING,1 INCH MTR/FIP,FOR NO
C31-44 (38136) 74637 1 INCH

0270-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLETER WITH

AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREADING,
2 INCH MTR/FIP,FORD C31-77

0280-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER

WITH AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE
THREADING,5/8 INCH BY 3/4 INCH MTR/MIP,
FORD NO C38-23-2.5(38110)

74620 3/4 INCH

0290-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH
AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE THREADING,

1 INCH MTR/MIP FORD NO C38-44-2.625
(38120) 4620 1 INCH

0300-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
OF FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER

WITH AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE
THREADING,2 INCH MTR/MIP,FORD NO C38-77

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$144.97

$1,449.70

$8.77

$8.77

$12.64

$12.64

NO BID

$5.98

$3,049.80

$9.22

$461.00

$35.56

$35.56
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

30

31

32

33

34

35

36

37

340.00

3,800.00

1,200.00

5,800.00

1,090.00

180.00

750.00

ONLY

ONLY

(38130) 74620 2 INCH

0310-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
OVAL METER FLANGE AND AN QUTLET OF

FEMALE IRON PIPE,2 INCH F:G/FIP,FORD
CF31-77 FLANGE 7610F 2 INCH

0320-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
OVAL METER FLANGE AND AN OUTLET OF MALE

IRON PIPE,2 INCH FLG.MIP,FORD NO 610M
2X 2 1/8 INCH PART NUMBER 7610F

0330-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METERNUT COUPLER

COUPLING METER TO HAVE AN INLET WITH AN
OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE
FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,5/8 INCH
BY 3/4 INCH MTR/PF,FORD C24-23 (38155)
74638-22 3/4 INCH

0340-COUPLING,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH

AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION
TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
1 INCH MTRIPJ,FORD NO C34-44(38165)
74638=22 1 INCH

0370-COUPLING,UNION,TO HAVE AN INLET
AND OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION

WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,3/4 INCH PJ,
FORD NO C44-33 (38102)
74758-22 3/4 INCH

0380-COUPLING,UNION,TO HAVE AN INLET
AND OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION
WITH CLAMPING SET SCEW,1 INCH PJ,FORD

NO C44-44 (38104)
74758-22 1 INCH

0390-COUPLING,UNION,TO HAVE AN INLET AND
OQOUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH
CLAMPING SET SCREW,2 INCH,PJ,FORD
NO.C44-77(38106) 7458-22 2 INCH

0400-COUPLING,UNION(REDUCER), TO HAVE
AN INLET AND OUTLET OF PACK JOINT

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$34.78

$34.78

$38.38

$13,049.20

$11.34

$43,092.00

$15.28

$18,336.00

$10.81

$62,698.00

$12.68

$13,821.20

$57.29

$10,312.20

$13.04

$9,780.00
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

38

39

40

41

42

43

225.00

138.00

24.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

ONLY

EA

COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,3/4
INCH PJ ON ONE END AND 1 INCH PJ ON THE
OTHER.FORD NO C44-34 (38103)

74758-22 3/4 INCH BY 1 INCH

0410-COUPLING,UNION/ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING

WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW FOR PEC TUBING,
AND AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION
FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCEW AND
GASKET FOR IP PIPE,3/4 INCH

PE-PJ/IP-PJ,FORD NO C45-33 (38021)

7458-22-55 3/4 INCH

0420-COUPLING,UNION/ADAPTOR,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING

WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND GASKET FOR
PE TUBING,AND AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT
COMPRESSION FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET
SCREW AND GASKET FOR IP PIPE 1 INCH
PE-PJ/IP-PJ,FORD NO C45-44 (38022)
74758-22-55 1 INCH

0430-COUPLING,UNION/ADAPTER,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION FITTING

WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND GASKET FOR
PE TUBING,AND AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT
COMPRESSION FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET
SCREW AND GASKET FOR 1P PIPE,2 INCH
PE-PJ/IP-PJ FORD NO C44-77(38023)

4758-22-55 2 INCH

0440-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET AND OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE

THREADS AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
3/4 INCH FIP,FORD NO B-11-333W(38081)

76101W 3/4 INCH

0450-CURB-STOP,BALLVALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE

THREADS AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
1 INCH FIP,FORD NO B11-44W(38085)

7610W 1 INCH

0460-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE, TO HAVE AN
INLET AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE

THREADS AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$12.42

$2,794.50

$16.67

$2,300.46

$60.37

$1,448.88

$32.93

$32.93

$50.46

$50.46

$146.85

$146.85
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

45

46

47

48

49

3,700.00

820.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

ONLY

EA

EA

ONLY

2 INCH FIP,FORD NO B11-777W 2 INCH FIP,
FORD NO B11-777W 76101W 2 INCH

0470-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET AND AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT

COMPRESSION TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING
SET SCREW AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
3/4 INCH PJ,FORD NO B44-333W (38086)
76100W-22 3/4 INCH

0480-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET AND AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT

COMPRESSION TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING
SET SCREW AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
1 INCH PJ,FORD NO B44-444W (38091)
76100W-22 1 INCH

0490-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE, TO HAVE AN
INLET AND AN QOUTLET OF PACK JOINT

COMPRESSION TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING
SET SCREW AND TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
2 INCH PJM,FORD NO.B44-777TW

76100W-22 2 INCH

0500-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION

CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE TYPE
FITTINGS WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE,TO HAVE LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK
WINGS,3/4 INCH PJ/FIP FORD NO B41-333W
76102W-22 3/4 INCH

0510-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
AN INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE,TO HAVE LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK
WINGS,1 INCH PJ/FIP FORD NO B41-444W
76102W-22 1 INCH

0520-CURB STOP,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE,TO HAVE LARGE
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
2 INCH PJ/FIP,FORD NO B41-777TW

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$40.48

$149,776.00

$60.95

$49,979.00

$207.28

$207.28

$37.02

$37.02

$56.18

$56.18

$167.66

$167.66
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

50

51

52

53

55

56

57

58

1,440.00

314.00

145.00

1.00

2,00

1.00

2.00

2.00

1.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

76102W-22 2 INCH

0530-ELL,TO HAVE AN INLET AND OUTLET OF
PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW,3/4 INCH,PJ,FORD NO. L44-33
(38180) 74761-22 3/4 INCH

0540-ELL,TO HAVE AN INLET AND OUTLET OF
PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW,1 INCH,PJ,FORD NO L44-44(38181
74761-22 1 INCH

0550-ELL,TO HAVE AN INLET AND OUTLET
OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW,2 INCH PJ,FORD NO L44-77
(38099) 74761-22 2 INCH

0560-ELL(ADAPTOR) TO HAVE AN INLET OF
PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON
PIPE,3/4 INCH PJ/FIP FORD NO L14-33
(38176) 74779-22 3/4 INCH

0570-ELL(ADAPTOR) TO HAVE AN INLET
OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON
PIPE,1 INCH PJ/FIP,FORD NO L14-44 (38177
74779-22-1 INCH

0580-ELL (ADAPTOR),TO HAVE AN INLET
OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING

SET SCREW AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON
PIPE,3/4 INCH PJ/MIP,FORD NO L84-33
74779M-22 3/4 INCH

0590-ELL(ADAPTOR),TO HAVE AN INLET OF
PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH CLAMPING
SET SCREW AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON

PIPE,1 INCH PJ/MIP FORD NO L84-44
74779M-22 1 INCH

0600-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE,3/4 INCH
MTR/FIP FORD NO L31-23 74632 3/4 INCH

0610-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$14.32

$20,620.80

$18.65

$5,856.10

$121.04

$17,550.80

$13.08

$13.08

$21.32

$42.64

$10.09

$10.09

$16.79

$33.58

$10.38

$20.76

$15.27

$15.27
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U/M

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

1.00

1.00

1,000.00

182.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

80.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

EA

AN OUTLET OF FEMALE IRON PIPE,1 INCH
MTR/FIP,FORD NO L3144 74632 1 INCH

0620-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH

AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE,3/4 INCH
MTR/MIP,FORD NO 138-23 (38171)
74621 3/4 INCH

0630-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH

AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON PIPE,1 INCH

M, TR/MIP,FORD NO L38-44 (38172)
74621 1 INCH

0640-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH
AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH

CLAMPING SET SCREW,3/4 INCH MTR/PJ,
FORD NO L34-23 74783S-22 3/4 INCH

0650-ELL,METER,TO HAVE AN INLET OF
FEMALE THREADED METER NUT COUPLER WITH
AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION WITH

CLAMPING SET SCREW,1 INCH MTR/PJ
FORD NO L34-44 74783S-22 1 INCH

0660-NUT,PACK JOINT WITH CLAMPING SET
SCREW AND GASKET,3/4 INCH,FORD NO NG-D4
(38037) 4700-22 3/4 INCH

0670-NUT,PACK JOINT WITH CLAMPING SET
SCREW AND GASKET,1 INCH FORD NO NG-F4
(38038) 4700-22 1 INCH

0680-NUT,PACK JOINT WITH CLAMPING SET
SCREW AND GASKET,2 INCH,FORD NO NG-K4
(38039) 4700-22RW 2 INCH
0690-PLUG,BRASS, TO HAVE AN INLET OF
CC/AWWA MALE TAPER THREADS,TO HAVE
RAISED SQUARE WRENCH HEAD NUT,3/4 INCH

MALE CC,MUELLER NO.H-10033-33 (37998)
73206 3/4 INCH

0700-PLUG,BRASS,TO HAVE INLET OF CC/AWWA
AMLE TAPER THREADS,TO HAVE RAISED SQUARE

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$8.79

$8.79

$12.56

$12.56

$12.88

$12,880.00

$20.65

$3,758.30

$3.16

$3.16

$4.87

$4.87

$14.43

$14.43

$5.30

$5.30

$7.72

$617.60
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

68

69

70

71

72

73

74

75

1.00

30.00

1.00

105.00

78.00

1.00

1.00

415.00

EA

EA

EA

ONLY

EA

WRENCH HEAD NUT,1 INCH MALE,CC,MUELLER
NO.H-10033-44 (38000) 73206 1 INCH

0710-PLUG,BRASS,TO HAVE INLET OF CC/AWWA
MALE TAPER THREADS,TO HAVE RAISED SQUARE

WRENCH HEAD NUT,2 INCH MALE,CC.MUELLER
NO.H-10033-77 (38003)3206 2 INCH

0720-TEE,INLET RUN AND OUTLET BRANCH
ARE TO BE OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION

TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
3/4 INCH PJ BY 3/4 INCH PJ BY 3/4 INCH

PJ. FORD NO.T444-333 (38211)

74760-22 3/4 INCH

0730-TEE,INLET RUN AND OUTLET BRANCH
ARE TO BE OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION

TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
3/4 INCH PJ BY 3/4 INCH PJ BY 1 INCH PJ.
FORD NO.T444-344 (38212)

74760-22 3/4 INCH BY 1 INCH

0740-TEE,INLET RUN AND OUTLET BRANCH
ARE TO BE OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING AND CLAMPING SET SCREW,1 INCH PJ
BY 1 INCH PJ BY 3/4 INCH PJ. FORD 7444-
443 (38213) 74760-22 1 INCH BY 3/4 INCH

0750-TEE,INLETE RUN AND OUTLET BRANCH
ARE TO BE OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION

TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
1 INCH PJ BY 1 INCH PJ BY FORD NO
T444-444(38214) 74760-22 1INCH

0760-TEE,INLET RUN AND OUTLET BRANCH ARE
TO BE OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,2 INCH
PJ.FORD Bl T444-777 (38215)
74760-22 2 INCH

0770-TEE,MULTI-SERVICE,TO HAVE AN INLET
OF FEMALE IRON PIPE AND OUTLET OF SIX (6
FEMALE IRON PIPE,1-2 INCH FIP(BOTTOM)

BY 6-1 INCH FIP(PERIMETER)
FORD NO T11-674

0790-VALVE,METER,BALL VALVE,TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$22.44

$22.44

$27.17

$815.10

$28.94

$28.94

$29.84

$3,133.20

$29.05

$2,265.90

$158.15

$168.15

NO BID

$60.35

$25,045.25




DATE: 6/01/2015

BID NO.: 50-00112678

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 16

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

76

77

78

79

80

81

210.00

365.00

35.00

12.00

100.00

1.00

EA

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE METER NUT COUPLER,TO
HAVE LARGE RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY
WITH PADLOCK WINGS,1 INCH PJ/MTR,FORD
NO B43-444W(38092)

76100MW-22 1 INCH

0800-VALVE,METER,BALL VALVE, TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF OVAL METER FLANGE WITH A LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK
WINGS,2 INCH MTR/PJ,FORD NO BF43-777TW
(38097)76100MW-22 2 INCH

0810-VALVE,METER,BALL VALVE,90 DEGREES,
TO HAVE AN INLET OF PACK JOINT

COMPRESSION TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING
SET SCREW AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE METER
NUT COUPLER, TO HAVE LARGE RAISED
RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK WINGS,
3/4 INCH BY 5/8 INCH 3/4 INCH PJ/MTR

FORD NO B43-332W 74602B-22 3/4 INCH

0820-Valve,meter,ball valve,90 degrees,
to have an inlet of pack joint

compression type fitting with clamping
set screw and an outlet of female meter
nut coupler,to have large raised
rectangular key way with padlock wings,
1 inch PJ/MTR FORD NO BA43-444W
74602B-22 1 INCH

0830-Valve,METER,90 DEGREES, TO HAVE AN
INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF OVAL METER FLANGE WITH A LARGE
RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY WITH PADLOCK
WINGS,2 INCH PJ/FLG FORD NO FV43-777TW
(38096) 4602B-22 2 INCH

0840-WYE(X),TO HAVE AN INLET OF FEMALE
IRON PIPE AND OUTLETS OF FEMALE 1-2
INCH FIP BY 4-1 INCH FIP,FORD NO

Y11-474 74765 2 BY 1 INCH

0850-WYE(Y),TO HAVE TWO INLETS OF MALE
IRON PIPE AND AN OUTLET OF MALE IRON
PIPE 2-3/4 INCH MIP BY 1-1 INCH MIP

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

$182.83

$38,394.30

$44.94

$16.403.10

$70.00

$2,450.00

$148.92

$1,787.04

$45.28

$4,528.00

NO BID
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

82

83

84

85

86

87

88

89

2,00

1.00

1.00

5,000.00

1,700.00

21,000.00

1,500.00

1,200.00

EA

EA

EA

MUELLER NO H-10070

0860-WYE(Y) TO HAVE AN INLET AND TWO
OUTLETS OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
1-1 INCH PJ BY 2-3/4 INCH PJ.FORD
NO Y44-243 08YS22 1 BY 3/4 INCH

0870-GASKET,BLIND,FOR 3/4 INCH WATER
METER,TO BE MADE OF VULCANIZED FIBER

MATERIAL FOR USE IN POTABLE WATER,1-5/32
INCH O.D. BY 1/16 INCH THICK
(22075)

0880-GASKET,BLIND,FOR 1 INCH WATER METER
TO BE MADE OF VULCANIZED FIBER MATERIAL

FOR USE ON POTABLE WATER,1-1/2 INCH O.D.
BY 1/16 INCH THICK (22095)

0890-GASKET,RING(FIBER),FOR 3/4 INCH
WATER METER,TO BE MADE OF VULCANIZED

FIBERT MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE WATER
1-5/32 INCH O.D. BY 23/32 INCH 1.D. BY
1/6 INCH THICK (22070)

0900-GASKET,RING (FIBER),FOR 1 INCH
WATER METER,TO BE MADE OF VULCANIZED

FIBER MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE WATER
1-1/2 INCH O.D. BY 1 INCH L.D. BY 1/16
INCH THICK (22090)

0910-GASKET,RING(METER COUPLING),FOR 3/4
INCH WATER METER, TO BE MADE OF
NEOPRENE MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE

WATER,1-5/32 INCH O.D. BU 25/32 INCH
BY 1/8 INCH THICK (22080)

0920-GASKET,RING (METER COUPLING),FOR 1
INCH WATER METER,TO BE MADE OF NEOPRENE
MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE WATER,

1-1/2 INCH O.D. BY 1 INCH 1.D. BY 1/8
INCH THICK (22100)

0930-GASKET,RING(YOKE BOX),FOR 3/4 INCH
YOKE BOX EXPANSION CONNECTOR,TO BE MADE
OF NEOPRENE MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

.23

$46.46

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

90

91

92

93

94

95

96

97

98

99

100

400.00

56.00

2.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

EA

EA

EA

WATER,1-11/32 INCH O.D. BY 26/32 INCH
1.D.BY 1/8 INCH THICK FORD (GT-118)

0940-GASKET,DROP-IN FOR 2 INCH FLANGE
(OVAL) WATER METER,TO BE MADE OF TWO-PLY

NEOPRENE MATERIAL FOR USE ON POTABLE
WATER 3-15/16 INCH 0.D. BY 2-1/4 INCH BY
1/8 INCH THICK WITH EARS TO SET ON TOP
OF FLANGE BOLTS, TWO-PLY (38390)

0950-BUSHING,TO HAVE AN INLET OF MALE
IRON PIPE THREAD AND AN OUTLET OF FEMALE
IRON PIPE THREAD,1 INCH BY 3/4 INCH

(37114)

0960-BUSHING,TO HAVE AN INLET OF MALE
IRON PIPE THREAD AND AN OUTLET OF
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD,2 INCH BY 1 INCH
(37125)

0970-CAP, OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD,
3/4 INCH (37154)

0980-CAP.OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD,
1 INCH (37155)

0990-CAP.OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD,
2 INCH (37158)

1000-COUPLING,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD
3/4 INCH (37206)

1010-COUPLING,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD
1 INCH (37209)

1020-COUPLING,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD
2 INCH (37218)

1030-CROSS,0OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD
3/4 INCH (37254)

1040-CROSS,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD
1 INCH (37256)

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00112678 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

101 1.00 EA 1050-CROSS,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD NO BID
2 INCH (37267)

102 1.00 EA 1060-ELBOW,45 DEGREE,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE NO BID
THREAD,3/4 INCH (37304)

103 1.00 EA 1070-ELBOW,45 DEGREE,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE NO BID
THREAD, | INCH (37305)

104 1.00 EA 1080-ELBOW,45 DEGREE,OF FEMALE IRON PIPE NO BID
THREAD,2 INCH (37308)

105 1.00 EA 1090-ELBOW,90 DEGREE,OF FEMALE IRON NO BID
THREAD,3/4 INCH (37359)

106 1.00 ONLY 1100-ELBOW,90 DEGREE, OF FEMALE IRON NO BID
PIPE THREAD, 1 INCH (37363)

107 18.00 EA 1110-ELBOW,90 DEGREE,OF FEMALE IRON NO BID
THREAD,?2 INCH (37376)

108 1.00 EA 1120-ELBOW,STREET,45 DEGREE,TO HAVE NO BID
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END,AND
MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE OTHER,
3/4 INCH (37404)

109 1.00 EA 1130-ELBOW,STREET,45 DEGREE,TO HAVE NO BID
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END, AND
MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE OTHER,
1 INCH (37405)

110 1.00 EA 1140-ELBOW,STREET,45 DEGREE,TO HAVE NO BID
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END,AND
MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE OTHER,
2 INCH (37408)

111 1.00 EA 1150-ELBOW,STREET,30 DEGREE,TO HAVE NO BID

FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END,AND

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1
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BID NO.: 50-00112678 SEALED BID
UNIT PRICE
NL',;,’,E;ER QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE ELBOW,
STREET,90 DEGREE,TO OTHER,3/4 INCH
(37454)

112 1.00 EA 1160-ELBOW,STREET,90 DEEGREE, TO HAVE NO BID
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END, AND
MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE OTHER,
1 INCH (37456)

113 1.00 EA 1170-ELBOW,STREET,90 DEEGREE,TO HAVE NO BID
FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON ONE END, AND
MALE IRON PIPE THREAD ON THE OTHER,
2 INCH (37465)

114 1.00 EA 1180-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
3/4 INCH BY CLOSE (37580)

115 1.00 EA 1190-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
3/4 INCH BY 2 INCH (37852)

116 1.00 EA 1200-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
3/4 INCH BY 3 INCH (37584)

117 1.00 EA 1210-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
1 INCH BY CLOSE (37600)

118 1.00 EA 1220-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD NO BID
1 INCH BY 2 INCH (37601)

119 1.00 EA 1230-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
1 INCH BY 4 INCH (37605)

120 1.00 EA 1240-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
2 INCH BY CLOSE (37660)

121 1.00 EA 1250-NIPPLE,ALL MALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
1 INCH BY 4 INCH (37664)

122 1.00 EA 1260-REDUCER,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD NO BID
1 INCH BY 3/4 INCH

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00112678 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS
123 1.00 EA 1270-REDUCER,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD NO BID
2 INCH BY 1 INCH
124 1.00 EA 1280-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
3/4 INCH BY 3/4 INCH BY 3/4 INCH (37814)
125 1.00 EA 1290-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
1 INCH BY 1 INCH BY 1 INCH (37823)
126 1.00 EA 1300-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
1 INCH BY 1 INCH BY 3/4 INCH (37832)
127 1.00 EA 1310-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
2 INCH BY 2 INCH BY 2 INCH (37860)
128 1.00 EA 1320-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
2 INCH BY 2 INCH BY 3/4 INCH (37870)
129 1.00 EA 1330-TEE,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
2 INCH BY 2 INCH BY 1.(37871)
130 1.00 EA 1340-UNION,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
3/4 INCH(37904)
131 1.00 EA 1350-UNION,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD NO BID
1 INCH (37905)
132 1.00 EA 1360-UNION,ALL FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD, NO BID
2 INCH (37908)
133 1.00 EA 1370 - COUPLING, METER, TO HAVE AN INLET NO BID
OF FEMALE THREADED MATER NUT COUPLER
WITH AN OUTLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION
TYPE FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW,
2 INCH MTR/PJ, FORD NO. C34-77
134 5,200.00 EA 1380 - VALVE, METER, BALL VALVE, TO HAVE $40.23 $209,196.00
AN INLET OF PACK JOINT COMPRESSION TYPE

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1
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BID NO.: 50-00112678 SEALED BID
NUMBER | QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES R oh TOTALS

FITTING WITH CLAMPING SET SCREW AND AN
OUTLET OF FEMALE METER NUT COUPLER, TO
HAVE LARGE RAISED RECTANGULAR KEY WAY
WITH PADLOCK WINGS, 3/4 INCH BY 5/8 INCH
BY 3/4 INCH PJ/MTR, FORD NO. B43-332W
(38082) 76100MW-22 3/4 INCH.

REVISED PER ADDENDUM NO. 1




CERTIFICATE OF CORPORATE RESOLUTION

I, John K. Schmidt, the duly appointed Senior Vice President, Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer
& Corporate Secretary of A.Y. MCDONALD INDUSTRIES, INC., an Iowa Corporation (the
‘Corporation’), DO HEREBY CERTIFY that the following is a true and correct copy of a
Resolution adopted at a meeting of the Board of Directors of the Corporation held on April 16,
2015, and that said Resolution has not been rescinded, revoked, amended or modified in any
respect and remains in full force and effect as of the date hereof:

RESOLVED: That the following Officers of A. Y. McDonald Industries, Inc. (the
“Corporation”) whose name appears below, were duly authorized at the Annual Board of
Directors” Meeting on April 16, 2015, to enter into any contract or execute and deliver
any instrument in the name of and on behalf of the Corporation, and such authority may
be general or confined to specific instances.

FURTHER RESOLVED: That the following Officers of A. Y. McDonald Industries,
Inc. (the “Corporation”) whose name appears below are authorized signatories on all
checks, drafts, other orders of payment of money, notes or other evidences of
indebtedness issued in the name of the Corporation:

Senior Vice President, Chief Financial Officer,

Treasurer and Corporate Secretary - J. K. Schmidt
Senior Vice President - S. A. Knapp
Senior Vice President - R. D. McDonald II

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the undersigned has hereunto subscribed his name this 29" day of
May, 2015.

i,

./ /
John K. Schmidt
Senior Vice President,

Chief Financial Officer, Treasurer
and Corporate Secretary

\
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Non-Public Works Bid

AFFIDAVIT

PARISH/COUNTY OF _DUBUQUE

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared:

Robert D. McDonald I, (Affiant) who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that

he/she is the fully authorized President & CEO of A.Y. McDonald Mfg. Co. (Entity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number 50-00112678 , to the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaign Contribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A

Choice B X

Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,
Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or
indirectly.

there are NO campaign contributions made which would require
disclosure under Choice A of this section.

Updated: 02.27.2014
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Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the Parish to
the Affiant.

Choice B __ X There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice
A of this section.

Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

[The remainder of this page is intentionally left blank.]

Updated: 02.27.2014
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That no part of the contract price received by Affiant was paid or will be paid to any
person, corporation, firm, association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their normal compensation to persons regularly employed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition
of the public building or project were in the regular course of their duties for Affiant.

GO T D

Signature of Affiant

Robert D. McDonald II
Printed Name of Affiant

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME

ON THEX?Y A DAY OF /zlmf , 2045
Ny

]// /2"("1’ ‘*7%\/ g/)r ZAIC W,

Notary Public FH

)/ ? % MR CHEFH H F
( derie  sofFman il ¥ CommissioEn N?.:be:.:z’:;s
Printed Name of Notary Tawr~ § My Comm. ap.%&z
ARX LT H P
Notary/Bar Roll Number

.
My commission expires 7 QZ’/‘/ L

Updated: 02.27.2014



