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INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  2/21/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00122301 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX 9

GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR:  BASIC SUPPLY, LLC . BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq,, all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or aiteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

BASIC SUPPLY, LLC

st %) TN
SIGNATURE: / . TITLE:
(Must be signed he@ %ﬂ %c/& MANAGER
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: =
JOHN ATKINSON
ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066

CITY, STATE: zZIP:

LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:

() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699
EMAIL ADDRESS:

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMs: § _>948.62



DATE: 2/21/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122301

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

24.00

200.00

4.00

144.00

50.00

24.00

200.00

6.00

10.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

STOCK SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH

EB PUBLIC WORKS CENTRAL WAREHOUSE

0010 BIT, DRILL, KLEIN-UNIBIT #3, 1/4
IN TO 3/4 IN HOLE DIA. RANGE, HIGH SPEED

STEEL, KLEIN-UNIBIT CAT. # 59003

0020 CLAMP, HOSE, 1/4 IN TO 5/8 IN RANGE
HEX SCREW, ALL STAINLESS STEEL,
GRAINGER #1A527  HCMSS04
STK. # 0301880

0030 GOGGLE, WELDING, JACKSON #WS-80
STK. # 0306810
4-2300

0040 TAPE, DUCT, SILVER, 2 IN WIDE X
60 YARDS LONG, POLYEHTYLENE COATED

CLOTH BACKING WITH RUBBER ADHESIVE,
INDUSTRIAL GRADE, 10 MIL THICK,
SHURTAPE #PC618

STK. # 0484230 9600

0050 FUNNEL, UTILITY, 16 OZ, PLASTIC,
GRAINGER # 4ZH70

STK. # 0484930 5760707

0060 STRAINER FOR 2 INCH SUCTION HOSE,
ROUND HOLE, ZINC PLATED, DIXON #RHS25
OR EQUAL 0228858
STK. # 0486700

0070 SCREWDRIVER, 3/8 IN STANDARD TIP,
12 IN LONG ALLOY STEEL ROUND SHANK,

FULL SIZE HANDLE, DOMESTIC, STANLEY
#66-162, ARMSTRONG #66-223, PROTO
PROTO JK3812R

STK. # 0584600 2025096

0080 HAMMER, SCALING, 16 OZ, HICKORY
HANDLE, VAUGHAN #SC16, GRAINGER #4A100,
MSC # 55327944

STK. # 0586020

0090 BELT, SANDING, 4 IN X 24 IN, 120 X
GRIT, 10 PER BOX, NORTON #R215 METALITE

3185

43.00

1032.00

0.39

78.00

7.48

29.92

7.25

1044.00

1.20

60.00

11.60

278.40

4.50

900.00

NO BID

NO BID

2.13

21.30




DATE: 2/21/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122301

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

5.00

100.00

5.00

EA

EA

EA

(R) PLYWELD
STK. # 059765C

0100 SOCKET, DEEP, 1-1/4 IN, 1/2 IN
DRIVE, 3-1/4 IN LONG, CHROME, 12 POINT,

MEETS FED. SPEC. GGG-W-641E,
PROTO #5340
STK. # 0601350

0110 BRUSH, TRUCK WASH, POLYSTYRENE FILL
WEILER MODEL #73146

GRAINGER #5A171
MSC # 65297749
STK. # 0965710

378A845

0120 HANDLE, WATER FLOW THROUGH FOR
TRUCK WASH BRUSH, 5 FT, STEEL, 7/8 IN
DIA., WEILER #44319

GRAINGER # 3A339

STK. # 0966980

21.00

105.00

23.00

2300.00

NO BID

NO BID




Unibit 15103ZR Self-Starting Step Drill, 1/4 - 3/4 In Dia
X 2-1/2 In OAL, High Speed Steel

Self starting bit features single flute cutting edge for
greater control through steps; three flatted shank
prevents slipping in drill chuck. SpeedPoint tip
penetrates faster and prevents walking in applications
such as drilling holes into stainless steel, copper, brass,
aluminum, plastic, laminates and other thin materials
up to 1/8" thick.

FEATURES

Ideal For Drilling Holes Into Thin Materials Such As
Stainless Steel, Copper, Brass, Aluminum, Plastic And
Laminates

Single-Flute Cutting Edge For Greater Control Through
Steps

3 Flatted Shank Prevents Slipping In Drill Chuck

New SpeedPoint Tip Penetrates Faster Than Previous
Unibits And Prevents Walking

1/16 In Increments

8571846 ProSource SO

ProSource HCMSS04 Interlocked Hose Stainless Steel Hose Clamp '
. Collier de serrage de tuyau en acier inoxydable

Clamp’ 7132-5/8 Ill, Stainless Steel Abrazadera de manguera de acero inoxidable

1-piece stainless steel housing and band in : & i

precision engineered, interlocked :

construction.

imensions,/ Tamano:

" - 5" No. 2

‘G\ISIJ ’ | | aty

0 34193779116
1 D Qe
MADE IN TAIWAN /FABRIGUE EN TAIWAN/HECHO EN TAWAN Cant.

4-1/2” SOFT SIDE GOGGLES
‘ect for general oxy-acetylene welding and cutting. These goggles carry
ade 5 filter plate. The well-proportioned frame is made of the highest
soft vinyl. Soft green opaque frame seals out light leaks. Light weight
nger comfort. Hooded vents are featured for air circulation and seals out
ht. Fits over RX glasses. Meets ANSI Z87 1.

Model No. Size Type

4-2300 2x4-14 Fixed Front
4-2305 2 x 4-1/4" Flip Front




Intertape 9600 Heavy Duty Duct Tape, 1.87 In W X
60 Yd L X 10 Mil T, Poly Coated Cloth Backing
Poly-coated cloth backing with a very aggressive
adhesive that conforms and bonds to almost any
surface. Water and tear resistant. Made with
DuPont Dacron Polyester for added strength and
durability. Meets UL723, HUD & BOCA Codes.

Arrow Plastic 12302 Large Spout Funnel, 16 Oz, Plastic
Kitchen funnels assorted colors. Dishwasher safe. Made in
the USA.

0228858

Abbott Rubber SRHS-200 Round Hole Hose Strainer,
For Use With Pump Suction Hose, 2 In FNPT, Plated
Steel

Strainer for pump suction hose, plated steel. Protects
pump from unwanted debris. Female NPT Inlet.

2025096

ProSource MC-SD10 Screwdriver, 3/8 In, Magnetic Tip, Slotted
Chrome vanadium steel blade ensures greater hardness, strength,
and durability. Satin chrome plated blade with magnetic tip. Soft
cushion grip provides greater comfort and control. Thumb stop+
allows for greater torque.

Shank Length: 81In

Finish:Satin Chrome Plated

Handle Type: Soft Cushion Grip

Material: Chrome Vanadium Steel

Point Size:  3/8In

Point Type: Magnetic Tip, Slotted

FEATURES

Chrome Vanadium Steel Blade Ensures Greater Hardness, Strength
And Durability

Soft Cushion Grip Provides Greater Comfort And Control
Thumb Stop Allows For Greater Torque




Gator 3185 Heavy Duty Resin Bond Power
Sanding Belt, 24 In X 4 In, 120 Grit
For use on power belt sanders. The bi-
directional flush joint allows the sanding belt
to run smoothly in both directions. The resin
LA . bonding system resists heat and humidity,
X 24" Sinding Beks =" extending the life of the sanding belt. These

Paows oo s sanding belts are designed for heavy duty

) sanding and grinding of wood, metal,

fiberglass and painted surfaces.

FINE / FINO

Item # 378A845

Vehicle Washing Brush: Brush Head, Polystyrene,
Extra Soft, 5 1/2 in Block Wd, 10 in Block Lg, 2 1/2 in
Bristle Lg, Foam
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