

ALTERNATE BRANDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED
 St. Charles Parish Public Schools - Child Nutrition Program
 Processed Food Products Bid Number 2016-17
 Request for Bid Bid Period: 7/1/16 through 6/30/17

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 219
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
General-1000					
1002	Onion, Powder. Price per ounce	McCormick Rex	GEL	16 oz	.28/oz
1004	Sauce, Hot	Cajun Chef PPI Crystal Bruce	Cajun Chef	12/12 oz	1.39/ea
1009	Oil, Canola	Ventura Canola			No Bid
1013	Basil, Ground, Sweet	Rex 00720	GEL	9.75 oz	.40/oz
1015	Gravy Mix, Beef	Trio 112500795 Legout 75001 Precision Foods	Trio	8/16 oz	3.80/ea
1016	Gravy, Coloring	First Foods (Pocahontas) 12210 Kitchen Bouquet Lasco Majors	Kitchen Bouquet	12/32 oz	6.54/ea
1036	Chili, Powder	Rex Gel	GEL	16 oz	.28/oz
1038	Cinnamon, Ground	McCormick Rex Gel	GEL	12.5 oz	.32/oz
1041	Seasoning, Vegetable Magic	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic VEG201	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	4/24 oz	38.58/cs
1043	Seasoning, Sweet & Spicy	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic SWSP209	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	6/19.2 oz	52.18/cs
1044	Seasoning, Pizza Pasta Magic	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic Blend	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	6/15 oz	47.36/cs
1045	Seasoning, Honey BBQ	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic ROTHB201	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	4/24 oz	38.58/cs
1046	Seasoning, Magic Creole	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	4/7#	71.77/cs

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1047	Paprika, Ground	Rex Gel McCormick	GEL	16 oz	3.52/cont
1048	Seasoning, Magic Creole, Salt Free	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	6/20 oz	52.75/cs
1049	Base, Beef	Majors 32900 Bernard's 101093 Custom Culinary 0344	Custom Culinary	6/16 oz	.45/oz
1050	Seasoning, Sweetie Magic	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	4/32 oz	18.46/cs
1051	Base, Chicken	Majors 33900 Bernard's 101083 Custom Culinary 0144	Custom Culinary	6/16 oz	.45/oz
1052	Pepper, Cayenne	Rex	GEL	11.5 oz	.32/oz
1053	Food Coloring, Green	Big Chief	Big Chief	Pint	3.45
1054	Food Coloring, Red	Big Chief	Big Chief	Pint	3.30
1055	Garlic Powder	Gel Spice	GEL	16 oz	.25/oz
1056	Sauce, Soy	LaChoy First Foods Kikoman	LaChoy	1 gal	12.96
1057	Noodles, Chow mein	LaChoy	LaChoy	6/24 oz	.195/oz or 28.08/cs
1058	Seasoning, Gravy & Gumbo Mix	Chef Paul Prudhommes Magic	Chef Paul/ Magic Seasoning	4/24 oz	19.20 cs
1064	Chili, canned	Hormel Libby's	Libby's	6/10	11.47/ea
1065	Juice, lemon	Real Lemon Bordens	Real Lemon	8/48 oz	3.67/ea
1067	Parsley, Flakes	Rex Gel McCormick	GEL	16 oz	.69/oz
1068	Pepper, Black	Rex Gel McCormick	GEL	16 oz	.58/oz
1069	Cherries	Pocahontas Star	Copia Premium	6/.5 gal	8.17/.5 gal
1071	Jell-O, Green	Flavor Fresh	Flavor Fresh	6/4.5#	1.42/#

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1072	Jell-O, Orange	Flavor Fresh	Flavor Fresh	6/4.5#	1.42/#
1073	Jell-O, Blue Raspberry	Flavor Fresh	Flavor Fresh	6/4.5#	1.42/#
1074	Jell-O, Red	Flavor Fresh	Flavor Fresh	6/4.5#	1.42/#
1075	Salt, Iodized	Morton Cargill	Cargill	24/26 oz	.67/ea
1076	Soup, Cream of Chicken	Campbell's Heinz	Campbell's/Heinz	12/50 oz	3.87/ea or 46.44/cs
1085	Extract, Vanilla	McCormick Cajun Chef	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	4.40/gal
1086	Extract, Almond, Imitation	Big Chief	Big Chief	pint	1.54
1090	Cocoa	Dixie Crystal Ambrosia			No Bid
1092	Cornstarch	Precision	Argo	24/1#	.89/#
1096	Mustard Yellow Ind.	Cajun Chef PPI	PPI	500 pk	0.016/ea
1097	Pickles	Cajun Chef Vlasic	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	5.17/gal
1098	Pickles, Sweet Relish	Cajun Chef Rainbow	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	7.87/gal
1099	Pickle Spears, Dill	Cajun Chef Vlasic	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	6.09/gal
1101	Butter, Substitute	Butter Buds Molly McButter			No Bid
1107	Garlic, Granulated	Rex Gel	GEL	16 oz	.24/oz
1108	Vinegar, White	Piknik Supreme Rex 17247	So. Classic	4/1 gal	3.03/gal
1109	Sauce, Worcestershire	Cajun Chef 12670	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	4.45/gal
1110	Baking Powder	Hospitality			No Bid
1111	Baking Soda,	Hospitality			No Bid
1112	Yeast, Instant	Saf Fleishmann Red Star	Fleishmann	20/1#	2.66/#
1114	Honey, Light	Groebe Farms	Commodity Honey	6/5#	12.00/5#

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1115	Sugar, Light Brown	Imperial Domino	Domino	24/1#	1.18/#
1116	Sugar, Confectioner	Imperial Domino	Domino	24/1#	1.18/#
1117	Sugar, Granulated	Imperial Domino	Domino	50#	0.56/#
1123	Jelly, Grape	Carriage	Carriage House	6/10	8.81/ea
1124	Jelly, Apple	Pocahontas 23130	Carriage House	6/10	8.81/ea
1126	Jelly, Assorted, 0.5 oz. Individual Packs	Flavor Fresh	Flavor Fresh	200/.5 oz	12.00/cs
1130	Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat	Southern Classic Ventura Cains 5911	So. Classic/CF Sauer	4/1 gal	7.77/gal
1131	Mayonnaise, Reduced Fat, Ind	Flavor Fresh PPI Poco Pak Pocahontas Nugent Heinz S & P Boca			
1132	Chocolate Chips, pure	Ambrosia	PPI/Heinz Ambrosia	200/12 g	0.07/ea
1133	Oil, Olive	Carmello		1/10#	2.57/#
1139	Pickle Relish, Dill	Cajun Chef	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	6.90/gal
1141	Jalapeno Pepper	Cajun Chef	Cajun Chef	4/1 gal	6.70/gal
1146	Pan Coating	Liquid Pam 63110 Buttermist Imperial Butter Bake eez	Pam	6/15.5 oz	0.28/oz
1152	Liquid Smoke	Pocahontas Wrights	Wright's	4/1 gal	2.97/quart or 47.52/cs
1155	Base, Ham. Low sodium, powder	Bernard's 105065 Major 34200			No Bid
1156	Food Coloring, Yellow	Big Chief	Big Chief	Pint	2.72
1157	Food Coloring, Blue	Big Chief	Big Chief	Pint	3.25
1161	Seasoning, Taco Dry Mix	Lawry	Lawry's	6/9 oz	3.95/ea

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1163	Bay Leaves Dry	Gel Spice	GEL	16 oz	5.60/ea
1164	Cumin, pure ground	Gel Spice	GEL	12.5 oz	3.55/ea
1166	Pepper, White, pure, ground	Gel Spice	GEL	pint	12.28
1170	Mustard, Yellow 9oz Squeeze	Heinz	Heinz	16/9 oz	1.14/ea
1178	Marshmallows, Mini	Hospitality 15418	Clown	12/1#	1.86/#
1184	Dressing, Ranch LF	Precision			
		Hidden Valley			
		Atlantic Seas			
		Foothill Farms	Foothill Farms	18/3.2 oz	0.49/oz
1185	Dressing, Cole Slaw	Marzetti's	Marzetti's	4/1 gal	8.68/gal
1186	Dressing, Thousand Island	Chef's	Marzetti's	4/1 gal	7.50/gal
1187	Dressing, Oil & Vinegar	Foothill Farms	Foothill Farms	18/6.5 oz	46.32/cs
1189	Dressing, Italian	Precision	Hidden Valley	18/6.5 oz	0.40/oz
1192	Dressing, Asian	Hidden Valley	Marzetti's	4/1 gal	11.17/gal
1193	Dressing, Ranch, Ind.	Marzetti's	Marzetti's	60/1.5 oz	0.27/ea
1194	Dressing, Honey Mustard Ind.	Grand Gourmet 28005	Flavor Fresh	100/1 oz	.17/ea
1195	Dressing, Italian FF, Ind.	Marzetti's	Marzetti's	60/1.5 oz	.37/ea
1200	Dressing, Caesar Ind.	Marzetti's			No Bid
1201	Sauce, Tartar Ind. Cups	PPI	PPI	100/.75 oz	.19/ea
1203	Bacon Bits	Grand Gourmet 30201			
		Armour Swift	Armour Eckrich	2/5#	67.00/cs
		Hormel	Savor	6/10	44.46/cs
1208	Olive, Black, Sliced	Savor	Seville	4/1 gal	49.64/cs
1209	Olives, Green	Savor			
1210	Sauce, BBQ Gallon	Marzetti			
		Sweet Baby Ray's			
		Hunt's			
		KC Masterpiece	KC Masterpiece	4/1 gal	9.69/ea
1232	Tuna, Water pack	Chicken of the Sea	Starkist	6/43 oz	0.22/oz or 56.76/cs
1287	Sunbutter 6/#10 can	Sunbutter Creamy			No Bid

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1288	Seasoning, Jambalaya	Cook Me Somethin' Mister!			No Bid
1289	Jack Link's Low Sodium Chicken Strip Caddies, (6) 12ct. 0.8 oz.	Jack Links 10000006002			No Bid
1290	Jack Link's Beef Jerky, 0.85 oz.	Jack Link's 100000007721			No Bid
1291	Original Beef Jerky Jack Link's Beef Jerky, 0.85 oz. Teriyaki Beef Jerky	Jack Link's 100000007717			No Bid
1292	Jack Link's Beef Jerky, 0.85 oz. Peppered Beef Jerky	Jack Link's 100000007719			No Bid

Fruits and Vegetables-1300

1300	Corn, Whole Kernel Canned	Libby Allen Pocahontas Sysco Imperial	Allen	6/10	4.15/ea
1302	Beans, Green	Libby Allen Pocahontas	Allen	6/10	4.61/ea 7.91/ea
1303	Tropical Fruit	Dole 09060 Camelia	Dole/Savor	6/10	1.00/#
1305	Beans, White (Navy Peas)	C & F Foods Camelia	Lafayette by Camelia	25#	1.10/#
1306	Beans, Kidney, U.S. No.1.	Camelia C & F Foods	Lafayette by Camelia	25#	43.11/cs
1308	Potatoes, Low Sodium with Vitamin C.	Idahoan 10029700253134	Idahoan	12/25.2 oz	4.40/ea
1310	Beans, Pinto	Allen Bush's	Bush's	6/10	4.68/ea
1311	Beans, Garbonzo	Allen Bush's	Bush's	6/10	4.50/ea
1312	Beans, Black	Allen Pocahontas Bush's	Bush's	6/10	5.45/ea
1314	Potatoes, Sweet Canned	Allen Bruce Foods Pocahontas	Allen	6/10	

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1315	Potatoes, Baby Reds	Idahoan Reds 10029700003385			No Bid
1321	Sauce Marinara, Packed 6/#10	Red Gold RPKNA9E	Angelia Mia	6/10	5.80/ea
1323	Peas, Green Canned	Allen Libby's Pocahontas Veg All	Allen	6/10	5.55/ea
1324	Tomato, Paste	Delmonte Hunts Heinz Pocahontas Contadina Red Gold	Hunts/Heinz Heinz	6/10 9/76 oz	6.11/ea 56.16/cs
1325	Tomato, Ketchup	Lalunta Red Gold REDSC99	Red Gold	6/10	5.83/ea
1326	Salsa, Canned	Red Gold	Red Gold/Hunts	6/10	4.60/ea
1327	Tomatoes, Diced U.S.	Hunts	Red Gold/Hunts	6/10	4.30/ea
1328	Tomato, Sauce	Red Gold	Red Gold/Hunts	6/10	4.81/ea
1331	Tomato, Ketchup	Heinz Hunts	Red Gold/Hunts	6/10	14.65/ea
1332	Tomato Ketchup, U.S. Grade A	Red Gold	Heinz	2/1.5 gal	4.41/ea
1342	Beans, Vegetarian with heavy tomato sauce	Allen 44143	Allen	6/10	4.25/ea
1343	Carrots, Sliced, low sodium,	Libby's Allen Pocahontas Bruce Food	Allen	6/10	No Bid
1344	Okra, Cut, canned	Allen	Allen	6/10	4.47/ea
1347	Potatoes, Diced, Packed 6/#10	Allen	Allen	6/10	44.40/cs
1364	Mandarin, Sections	Dole Savor Premium	Dole/Savor	6/10	

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1365	Applesauce, Canned	Knouse Three Apples 31003 Pocahontas	Three Apples	6/10	5.24/ea
1369	Cranberry Sauce Canned	Ocean Spray	Ocean Spray	6/10	7.47/ea
1377	Peaches, Canned	Delmonte Libby	DelMonte	6/10	8.79/ea
1379	Apples, Sliced Canned	Knouse Three Apples 30571 Pocahontas 180069	Three Apples	6/10	7.42/ea
1383	Pineapple, Tidbits, canned	Delmonte Dole Savor Pocahontas	Dole/Savor	6/10	6.50/ea
Breads & Grains- 1400					
1400	Brownie Mix	Pioneer 99407	Pioneer	6/5.75#	53.92/cs
1401	Cornbread, Mix	Heart of Texas	Heart of TX/Pioneer	6/5#	1.13/#
1403	Pasta, Fettuccini	Zerega Barilla	Barilla	20/1#	1.40/#
1405	Chips, Nacho, R/F, 7/8 oz.	Doritos			No Bid
1406	Chips, Ranch, R/F, 7/8 oz.	MJM 308150			No Bid
1407	Crackers, Cinnamon Graham	Campbell's 15094	Campbell's	300/.9 oz	0.15/ea
1409	Cereal, Krave Smores, 1 oz. Pouch	Kellogg's 38000-12586	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1411	Cereal, Cinnamon Flakes, 2 oz. Pouch	Kellogg's 38000-11460	Kellogg's	48/2 oz	25.38/cs
1412	Cereal, Granola Ind.	Fieldstone	Fieldstone/Malt O Meal	144/1 oz	41.76/cs
1413	Pasta, Bow Tie, Whole Wheat	Zerega			No Bid
1414	Pasta, Penne, Whole Grain	Zerega Barilla	Barilla	2/10#	1.04/#
1415	Cereal, Marshmallow Mateys, 2 oz. Bowl	Malt O'Meal	Malt O Meal	48/2 oz	22.65/cs
1417	Shells, Taco, Jumbo	Tyson 7530	Tyson		No Bid
1418	Cereal, Apple Jacks, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-78787	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1419	Cereal, Froot Loops, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-78788	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1420	Cereal, Cheerios, Whole Wheat, 1 oz., bowl	Malt O' Meal	Malt O Meal	96/1 oz	21.85/cs
1422	Cereal, Original Granola-Bulk,	Fieldstone 09799 Malt O Meal 07485	Fieldstone/Malt O Meal	4/50 oz	41.00/cs
1423	Cereal, Rice Krispies, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-78789	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1424	Cereal, Frosted Flakes, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-54998	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1425	Cereal, Cinnamon Flakes, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-78786	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1426	Cereal, Choco Zucaritas Frosted Flakes, 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-10992	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1429	Crackers, Animal	Mrs. Goodcookie Smartfood	Mrs. Goodcookie	200/1 oz	0.17/bag
1432	Popcorn, White Cheddar	000-28400-25566-0			No Bid
1433	Chips, Popped Crisp, Sour Cream	Eagle Kellogg's	Kellogg's	60/.78 oz	0.36/bag
1434	Crackers, Whole Wheat	Harvest Mill 11455	Kellogg's	300/2 ct	0.07/ea
1435	Crackers, Cheez it, 1.5	Kellogg 24100-12261	Kellogg's	60/1.5 oz	22.16/cs
1436	Chips, Cheetos, Fantastix Flamin Hot	Frito Lay 43578			No Bid
1437	Cereal, Apple Jacks, 1 oz. Pouch	Kellogg's 38000-11469	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1439	Cereal, Froot Loops, 1 oz Pouch	Kellogg's 38000-11467	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1443	Chips, Tortilla, Bulk	Mission Barrel O' Fun 40404	Mission	6/2#	1.75/# or 21.00/cs
1445	Chips, Popped Crisp, BBQ	Eagle Kellogg's	Kellogg's	60/.71 oz	0.35/bag
1449	Cereal, Frosted Flakes, 2 oz. Pouch	Kellogg's 38000-12585	Kellogg's	48/2 oz	25.38/cs
1450	Cereal, Frosted Flakes 1 oz. Bowl	Kellogg's 38000-11465	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1453	Cereal, Rice Krispies, 1oz	Kellogg	Kellogg's	96/1 oz	25.38/cs
1454	Chips, Doritos, Reduce Fat, Spicy Sweet Chili	Frito Lay 49093			No Bid

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1456	Grits, Corn	Quaker Martha White Jim Dandy	Quaker	8/36 oz	2.02/#
1457	Pasta, Spaghetti, Whole Grain	Distributor's Choice	Dakota Growers/Barilla	2/10#	1.04/#
1458	Pasta, Fettuccini, Whole Grain	Distributor's Choice			No Bid
1462	Cornmeal, Yellow	Indian Girl Pioneer	Indian Girl	25#	0.45/#
1464	Pasta, Lasagna, whole wheat	Zerega 8291	Barilla	12/13.25 oz	2.41/#
1465	Pasta, Elbow, whole wheat	Zerega 801 Barilla	Barilla	2/10#	1.04/#
1469	Flour, All Purpose	Pioneer Big Chief	Gold Medal/Pioneer	50#	0.37/#
1470	Flour, Whole Wheat	Koerner Pioneer Pillsbury	General Mills/Pioneer	50#	0.42/#
1472	Oats, Rolled	Malt O Meal Pocahontas	Malt O Meal	12/42 oz	0.058/oz or 29.23/cs
1474	Chips, Oven Baked Ruffles, Cheddar & Sour Cream	Frito Lay 56882			No Bid
1475	Chips, Oven Baked Lays Potato Crisps Sour Cream & Onion	Frito Lay 33627			No Bid
1476	Chips, Sunchips, Garden Salsa	Frito Lay 30821			No Bid
1485	Crackers, Crunchmania, Cinnamon	Kelloggs Crunchmania 38000-24518	Kellogg's	100/1.76 oz	34.00/cs
1486	Crackers, Crunchmania, French Toast	Kelloggs Crunchmania 38000-24520	Kellogg's	100/1.76 oz	34.00/cs
1487	Rice Krispies Treats Whole Grain Bars for Schools	Kellogg's 38000-11052	Kellogg's	80/1.41 oz	31.06/cs
1488	Rice Krispies Treats Mini Bars made with whole grain	Kellogg's 38000-14540	Kellogg's	600/.42 oz	87.22/cs
1489	Rice, Brown, Parboiled	Distributor's Choice			No Bid
Beverages-1500					
1506	Juice Drink, Kiwi, 8 8.5 oz.	Switch Envy	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1507	Juice, Drink, Purple/Black Cherry 8 oz.	Switch Route 66 Epic	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1508	Juice Drink, Fruit Punch, 8 8.5 oz.	Switch Envy	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1509	Juice Drink, Watermelon, 8 8.5 oz	Switch Envy	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1510	Juice, Drink, Orange 8oz	Switch Envy	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1511	Juice, Drink, Green/Lemon Lime 8 oz.	Switch Route 66 Epic	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1512	Juice, strawberry Melon 8oz	Switch Route 66	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1513	Juice, Apple White Grape 6.75oz	Motts Ardmore Farms	Switch	24/8.3 oz	16.60/cs
1516	Juice, Fruit Punch 6.75oz	Motts 31964 Ardmore Apple & Eve 84528TPFA	Motts	32/6.75 oz	0.32/ea
1520	Milk, Soy Vanilla	Silk Soy milk	Motts	32/6.75 oz	0.2/ea
1522	Water, Propel Lemon	Propel	Kikkoman	12/32 oz	23.20/cs
1523	Water, Propel Berry	Propel	Propel	24/16.9 oz	17.85/cs
1526	Water, Bottled 8oz	Crystal Geyser Nestle Pure Life	Propel	24/16.9 oz	17.85/cs
1527	Water, Bottled 4oz	Crystal Geyser Mountain Brook Abita Kentwood Nestle's Pure Life Dansani			No Bid
1528	Juice, Grape	Welch's	Mountain Brook	24/16.9 oz	0.23/ea
1531	Gatorade G2 Glacier Freeze, 12 oz.		Welch's	24/10 oz	19.68/cs
1532	Gatorade G2 Fruit Punch, 12 oz.	Gatorade G2 12007	Gatorade	24/12 oz	15.10/cs
1533	Gatorade G2 Grape, 12 oz.	Gatorade G2 12002 Gatorade G2 12203	Gatorade Gatorade	24/12 oz 24/12 oz	15.10/cs 15.10/cs

S & W Wholesale Foods, LLC
P.O. Box 279
Hammond, LA 70404

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	APPROVED BRAND(S)	BRAND	Unit Size	UNIT PRICE PER BID SPECS
1534	Juice, 100% Slush Pouch, Strawberry Kiwi	Ice Dog 124003			No Bid
1535	Juice, 100% Slush Pouch, Cherry Limeade	Ice Dog 124104			No Bid
1536	Juice, 100% Slush Pouch, Blue Raspberry	Ice Dog 124107			No Bid
1537	Juice, 100% Slush Pouch, Watermelon	Ice Dog 124106			No Bid
1538	Juice, 100% Slush Pouch, Raspberry Lemonade	Ice Dog 124105			No Bid