

DATE: 3/04/2022

Page: 6

BID NO.: 50-00137550

BID FORM
Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for all Urban Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.

Are you requesting an escalation provision?

YES _____ NO X

MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED _____%

INITIAL BID PRICES WILL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF _____

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed, for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

10 calendar days ARO

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

FIRM NAME: Pacific Bridge Sourcing Management dba Benchmark Health

ADDRESS: 10531 48 Camarillo Dr. Suite 1106-517

CITY, STATE: San Diego, CA ZIP: 92127

TELEPHONE: 858) 883-4937 FAX: ()

EMAIL ADDRESS: info@benchmarkhealth.us

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: 1

NUMBER: 2

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 930.00

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: Raguel Gonzalez

Raguel Gonzalez
Printed Name

TITLE: In House Sales/Operation

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
1	100.00	EA	<p>TWO YEAR CONTRACT FOR SAFETY SUPPLIES TO BE ORDERED ON AS NEEDED BASIS FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION</p> <p>0010 Hardhat Helmet, Safety, Slotted, Fas-Trac Suspension Type 1 MSA V-Gard Number 475362 Colors: White, Green SESS NUMBER 14110</p> <p>TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR SAFETY SUPPLIES TO BE ORDERED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS.</p> <p>THE QUANTITIES LISTED IN THIS REQUEST ARE ESTIMATES BASED ON HISTORICAL INFORMATION. THESE ITEMS WILL BE ORDERED ON AN AS NEEDED BASIS DURING THE TWO-YEAR TERM.</p>	NOT BID	
2	50.00	EA	<p>0020 Winter Hat Liners Jackson 3000442 Winter-Liners And</p> <p>Color: Green Medium/Heavy Weight, Quilted, Flame Retardant SESS NUMBER 679/WLQEN</p>		
3	20.00	EA	<p>0030 High Visibility Hat Olgan Number 1271</p> <p>Booney Hat with Adjustable Neck Strap</p>		
4	30.00	PR	<p>0040 Flexible Frame Goggles Soft Frame Perforated On Top And Side</p> <p>For Maximum Ventilation, Fog Free, PYRAMEX C204</p>		
5	100.00	EA	<p>0050 Earmuffs Industrial Earmuffs Feature Wider Ear</p> <p>Cushions That Spread Over A Larger Area NRR 29 DB Over The Head, 28 DB Behind The Neck RADIANS EL30 HL1 1010970</p>		
6	300.00	EA	<p>0060 Knee Pads - Allegro 7100 Heavy Duty Black Molded Rubber</p>	✓	↘

DATE: 3/04/2022

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 9

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
15	50.00	EA	Standard Size: 11-1/4 Inch Wide by 8 Inch Deep by .060 Inch Thick, To Fit JM-103 Faceshields 0150 High Performance Ratcheted Headgear	NO BID	
16	500.00	ROLL	Certified ANSI-Z87.1, MCR/CREWS JM-103 0160 Caution Tape - Barricade TYCO 701455	NO BID	
17	100.00	BX	Caution Barrier Tape National 3 Inch Wide by 1,000 Feet Long Tough Abrasion Resistant, Low Density With Continuous Black Imprint Caution - Caution - Caution Meets OSHA Specifications 1910.144 RAD 64055720 0170 Dust/Mist Respirator Gerson Brand Disposable Elastic Headband, Adjustable Nosepiece, 20 Per Box Gateway Safety Number 80301-R8210	8.00 per box 20 pcs	800.00
18	50.00	EA	0180 Protective Eyewear Pyramex SB 18205	NO BID	
19	50.00	EA	Gray Lens, Black Frames, Anti-Fog Lens Scratch Resistant Lens, Ratchet Action Temples, Non-Slip Rubber Head Grips Meets ANSI Z87.1-1989 0190 Protective Eyewear Clear Lens, Black Frames, Anti-Fog Lens Scratch Resistant Lens, Ratchet Action Temples, Non-Slip Rubber Head Grips Meets ANSI Z87.1-1989	NO BID	
20	2.00	EA	0200 Coverall SESS NUMBER 412 Lakeland 1412-M, 25 Per Case Protects Against Asbestos, Serged Seams, And Static Free, Full Cut Seat, Wide Leg, Extended Torso Length Size: Medium	NO BID	
21	2.00	EA	0210 Coverall DPPTY120SWHLG00	NO BID	

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
7	2.00	BX	0070 Disposable Gloves Medium, Blue, Powder Free Length: 11 Inch Package of 500 MEMPHIS 6015M	6.50 per box 100 pcs	65.00 for 1000 gloves (10 boxes)
8	2.00	BX	0080 Disposable Gloves Large, Blue, Powder Free Length: 11 Inch Package of 500 MEMPHIS 6015L	6.50 per box of 100 pcs	65.00 for 1000 gloves (10 boxes)
9	300.00	PR	0090 Gloves, Russet Split Leather Memphis OG91310L Wing Thumb, Gunn Cut, All Seams Welted, One Piece Back, Fully Lined, Thumb Strap Sewn With Kevlar Thread Size: Large	NO BID	
10	400.00	PR	0100 Gloves, Russet Split Leather Memphis OG91310XL Wing Thumb, Gunn Cut, All Seams Welted, One Piece Back, Fully Lined, Thumb Strap Sewn With Kevlar Thread Size: X-Large		
11	1,750.00	PR	0110 Cowhide Leather Driver's Gloves Unlined, X-Large SESS NUMBER OG87XL		
12	30.00	PR	0120 Gloves, Gauntlet Tanned Memphis Red Ram Number OG94300 Welding Gloves by Elliott Chrome Tanned Leather, Full Wool Back Lining, Reinforcing Leather Back Patch Extending From The Side Seam To The Index Finger		
13	2.00	EA	0130 Auto Darkening Welding Helmet Black, Classic Series, 8 to 12 Lens Shade Miller Electric 251 292		
14	2.00	EA	0140 Performance Faceshield Replacement Window, Injection Molded Propionate,		

DATE: 3/04/2022

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page 10

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			Lakeland 1412-S, 25 Per Case Protects Against Asbestos, Serged Seams, And Static Free, Full Cut Seat, Wide Leg, Extended Torso Length Size: Large	NO BID	
22	30.00	EA	0220 Coverall DPPTY120SWHCLOO		
			Lakeland 1412-XL, 25 Per Case Protects Against Asbestos, Serged Seams, And Static Free, Full Cut Seat, Wide Leg, Extended Torso Length Size: X-Large		
23	100.00	EA	0230 Coverall Collared SMS, White, Elastic Size: 2X-Large		
24	1,500.00	EA	0240 Coverall Collared SMS, White, Elastic Size: 3X-Large CVL-SMS-E-3XL		
25	10.00	EA	0250 Coverall Collared SMS, White, Elastic Size: 4X-Large CVL-SMS-E-4XL		
26	100.00	EA	0260 Coverall Collared SMS, White, Elastic Size: 5X-Large CVL-SMS-E-5XL		
27	2.00	EA	0270 Safety Can - Type II Safe Squeeze Trigger Mechanism Natural Grasp, Lift Latch For Single Handed Filling, Internal Flame Arrestor Automatic Venting Between 3 And 5 Psig Guards Size: 1 Gallon		
28	30.00	EA	0280 Safety Can - Type II Safe Squeeze Trigger Mechanism Natural Grasp, Lift Latch For Single Handed Filling, Internal Flame Arrestor Automatic Venting Between 3 And 5 Psig Guards		

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
29	150.00	EA	Size: 2 Gallon SAFEWAY 2020 0290 Safety Can - Type II Safe Squeeze Trigger Mechanism Natural Grasp, Lift Latch For Single Handed Filling, Internal Flame Arrestor Automatic Venting Between 3 And 5 Psig Guards Size: 5 Gallon SAFEWAY 2050	NOTED	
30	2.00	EA	0300 Safety Can - Type II Eagle US2-51-SY		
31	.00		Yellow, 15-7/8 Inch High Galvanized Steel, Flexible Metal Pour Spout Size: 5 Gallon 2050-Y		
32	600.00	EA	0310 Eyewear, Safety, Clear Lens, SESS NUMBER 0110AFNC Ironwear Frame/Temple Color: Black Frame/Temple Material: Nylon Size: Universal Lens Material: Polycarbonate Lens Coating: Anti-Fog Lens Style: Dual Temple Style: Wraparound 99.9 Percent UV Protection Includes Neck Cord		
33	100.00	EA	0320 Eyewear, Safety, Smoke Lens, SESS NUMBER 0112AFNC Ironwear Frame/Temple Color: Black Frame/Temple Material: Nylon Size: Universal Lens Material: Polycarbonate Lens Coating: Anti-Fog Lens Style: Dual Temple Style: Wraparound 99.9 Percent UV Protection Includes Neck Cord		
34	10.00	EA	0330 Eyewear, Safety, Amber Lens, SESS NUMBER 0113AFNC Ironwear Frame/Temple Color: Black Frame/Temple Material: Nylon Size: Universal Lens Material: Polycarbonate Lens Coating: Anti-Fog Lens Style: Dual Temple Style: Wraparound		

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
35	10.00	EA	99.9 Percent UV Protection Includes Neck Cord 0340 Eyewear, Safety, Clear Lens, SESS NUMBER 0110AF C/W Neck Cord PYRAMEX VENTURE 2 SB45 10DP Frame/Temple Color: Silver/Black Frame/Temple Material: Nylon Soft Nose Bridge Lens Material: Polycarbonate Lens Coating: Anti-Fog Adjustable Temples Lens Style: Single 99.9 Percent UV Protection Contoured Design Frame Three Lens Angles	NO BID	
36	1,500.00	EA	0350 Eyewear, Safety, Gray SESS NUMBER 0112AF C/W Neck Cord PYRAMEX VENTURE 2 SB 4520 DP Frame/Temple Color: Silver/Black Frame/Temple Material: Nylon Soft Nose Bridge Lens Material: Polycarbonate Lens Coating: Anti-Fog Adjustable Temples Lens Style: Single 99.9 Percent UV Protection Contoured Design Frame Three Lens Angles		
37	25.00	PR	0360 Glove, String Knit, Blue/Gray MEMPHIS 9688L Seamless String Knit, Large, 100 Percent Cotton Shell, Full Latex Palm Dip		
38	20.00	PR	0370 Glove, String Knit, Blue/Gray MEMPHIS 9688XL Seamless String Knit, X-Large, 100 Percent Cotton Shell, Full Latex Palm Dip		
39	100.00	PR	0380 Glove, Nylon Grip CONTOUR NMF-506-9 Oil Resistant Palm Coating Size: Large/X-Large		
40	30.00	EA	0390 Ratchet Tie Down 2 Inch Long Handle, 2 Inch Strap Width, Working Load Limit 3,333 Pound,		
				↓	↓

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
41	200.00	PK	Braking Strength 10,000 Pound, Polyester Strapping Fabric, Alloy Steel Plate Ratchet Material, 5-Line 557-227 0400 Ratchet Tie Down, S Hook 1 Inch Strap Width, Working Load Limit 400 Pound, Braking Strength 2,000 Pound, Polyester Strapping Fabric, Alloy Steel Plate Ratchet Material, 5-Line 2 Per Package 1 Tie Down Lifts All 60-106 Hook PLT 5-Line 557-130	NO BID	
42	2.00	PK	0410 Tarp Strap Assortment Black, EPDM Rubber Hardened Steel Hooks, Includes (4) 10 Inch, (2) 15 Inch, (2) 21 Inch, (2) 31 Inch 10 Per Package D1655E 10, 15, 21, 31		
43	2.00	EA	0420 Web Strap Ratchet, Strap Length 40 Feet Strap Width 2 Inch Load Capacity 3,333 Pound Working Load Limit 3,333 Pound Braking Strength 10,000 Pound Polyester Strapping Fabric Yellow Webbing, DBL J Hook Fitting Style, Steel Ratchet Material Length 30 Feet S-Line 557-240		
44	1,000.00	EA	0430 Wasp And Hornet Killer, Aerosol 14 Ounce, CRC 14010 SESS NUMBER 95715		
45	100.00	EA	0440 Yellow Beverage Cooler, 5 Gallon Plastic, Lid Color: Red Exterior Length 14-1/2 Inch Exterior Width 13 Inch Exterior Height 20-1/3 Inch Exterior Diameter 13 Inch IGLOO 48153 SESS NUMBER SQ3		
46	40.00	EA	0450 Yellow Beverage Cooler, 3 Gallon Plastic, Lid Color: Red	✓	↓

DATE: 3/04/2022

Page 14

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00137550

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			Exterlor Height 14 Inch Exterior Diameter 13-1/2 Inch IGLOO 431 SESS NUMBER SQ3	NO BID	