CITY OF NEW IBERIA
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS
Sealed bids will be received by the City of New Iberia, Louisiana, until 02:00 p.m. Thursday,

October 3, 2019 in the City Council Room, Third Floor of City Hall at which time the bids
will be publicly opened for the purchase of:

6-MONTH BIDS
HIGH CALCIUM QUICKLIME (PEBBLE)
ROAD MATERIALS
SANITARY SEWER MATERIALS

12-MONTH BIDS
CLEANING & MAINTENANCE SUPPLIES
LIQUID CHLORINE & SULPHUR DIOXIDE
FERROUS CHLORIDE SOLUTION/BIOXIDE AE35
SEWERAGE PUMPS
CONCRETE RECYCLING
30-YD DUMPSTER DISPOSAL

Specifications may be obtained from the office of the Purchasing Agent, Room 304, Third
Floor, City Hall, 457 East Main Street, New Iberia, Louisiana 70560-3700. You may turn in
your bids at the above address or online at www.centralauctionhouse.com. All envelopes must
be clearly marked on the outside with: Bid (Name of Item/Items Bidding on) Thursday,
October 3, 2019.

CITY OF NEW IBERIA

Freddie DeCourt, Mayor

PUBLISHING DATES: September 12,2019 and September 19, 2019
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INVITATION TO BID
CITY OF NEW IBERIA, LOUISIANA
Sealed hids will be opened by the City of New lberia, Louisiana for the purchase of:
SANITARY SEWER MATERIALS
FOR THE PERIOD: November 1, 2019 thru April 30, 2020
In the City Hall Council Room located on the 3™ floor of City Hall at:
02:00 p.m. on Thursday, October 3, 2019

All bids must be submitted to the Purchasing Agent, City Hall — 457 E. Main Street, Suite 300
New Iberia, LA 70560-3700 no later than:

02:00 p.m. on Thursday, October 3, 2019
All bids shall be submitted on this form to be accepted. For additional information, all potential bidders may contact the
purchasing department at (337) 369-2344. »
EXECUTION OF BID

EXECUTION OF BID MUST BE SIGNED IN INK DATE: 9/24/2019

IN COMPLIANCE WITH THIS INVITATION FOR BIDS AND SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND SPECIFICATIONS
LISTED HEREIN, THE UNDERSIGNED OFFERS AND AGREES TO FURNISH ANY AND ALL ITEMS UPON WHICH PRICES ARE
QUOTED, AT THE PRICE SET OPPOSITE EACH ITEM. IN THE EVENT OF ANY CONFLICT BETWEEN THE TERMS, CONDITIONS,
AND SPECIFICATIONS SET OUT IN THIS INVITATION FOR BIDS AND ANY MATERIAL SUBMITTED WITH THE BIDDER’S
RESPONSE TO THE INVITATION FOR BIDS, THE TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND SPECIFICATIONS OF THE INVITATION FOR BIDS
SHALL CONTROL ANY CONFLICTING MATERIAL.

Michael Self W M i

NAME OF FIRM (PRINT) SIGNATURE (PERSON AUTHORﬂEﬁTO SIGN BIDS)
BIDS MUST BE SIGNED IN INK

301 Jefferson Terrace Michael Self

ADDRESS TYPE OR PRINT NAME
New lberia, LA 70560 Municipal OSR

CITY, STATE, ZIP TITLE

337-367-9212 mself@coburns.com

PHONE E-MAIL (for sending results quicker)



THE CITY OF NEW IBERIA
SANITARY SEWER MATERIALS
BID FORM AND SPECIFICATIONS

Page 2 of 4

ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROXIMATE USAGE UNIT UNIT COST
4” PVC PIPE - SDR 35 ASTM 3034 Belled End 500 FT .85
4” PVC SDR 35 H x FIPT CLEAN-OUT ADAPTER 200 EA 3.08
4” PVC MIPT Clean Out Cap 300 EA 2.25
4” PVC SDR 35 WYE FxFxF 50 EA 4.75
4” PVC Straight Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 3.20
4” PVC Sanitary Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 6.42
4” 2-Way PVC Cleanout Tee SDR 35 HxHxH 25 EA 7.57
4” 2-Way PVC SDR 35 Cleanout HxHxH 25 EA 8.17
4” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp (CI/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 3.60
4” Flexible Coupling Shielded SS Clamp (CI/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 14.50
4” Flexible Coupling $S Clamp (Clay TO Ci/PVC) 100 EA 3.65
4” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp Shielded (Clay TO CI/PVC() 100 EA 21.30
4” PVC SDR 35 Coupling HxH 50 EA 1.60
4” PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 7.30
4” PVC (22-1/2 Degree Bend) HxH 25 EA 2.65
4” PVC (45 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 2.40
4” PVC (90 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 3.30
4” PVC Cap Hub 20 EA 1.50
4” PVC Backwater Valve HxH Solvent Weld 10 EA 20.80
4” ABS Pop-Off/Relief Plug 5 EA 2.80
4" PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 7.33
6” PVC PIPE - SDR 35 ASTM 3034 Belled End 500 FT 1.85
6” PVC SDR 35 H x FIPT CLEAN-OUT ADAPTER 200 EA 13.50
6” PVC MIPT Clean Out Cap 300 EA 8.65
6” PVC SDR 35 WYE FxFxF 50 EA 16.75
6” PVC Straight Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 11.85
6” PVC Sanitary Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 36.00
6” 2-Way PVC SDR 35 Cleanout Tee HxHxH 25 EA 50.20
6" 2-Way PVC SDR 35 Cleanout HxHxH 25 EA 50.40
6” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp (CI/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 7.95
6” Flexible Coupling Shielded SS Clamp (CI/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 27.67
6” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp (Clay TO CI/PVC() 100 EA 7.95
6” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp Shielded (Clay TO CI/PVC) 100 EA 36.00
6” PVC SDR 35 Coupling HxH 50 EA 575
6” PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 14.60
6” PVC (22-1/2 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 25 EA 10.60
6” PVC (45 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 8.50
6” PVC (90 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 7.90
6” PVC Cap Hub 20 EA 4,70
6” PVC Backwater Valve HxH Solvent Weld 10 EA 97.50
6” ABS Pop-0Off/Relief Plug 5 EA NO BID
6” PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 16.25
6x6x4 PVC SDR 35 Reducing Wye HxHxh 20 EA 14.60




Page 3 0of4

8” PVC PIPE - SDR 35 ASTM 3034 Belled End 500 FT 3.40
8” PVC Straight Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 48.35
8” PVC Sanitary Tee SDR35 HxHxH 50 EA 81.27
8” Flexible Coupling $S Clamp (Cl/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 12.10
8” Flexible Coupling Shielded SS Clamp (Cl/PVC To CI/PVC) 100 EA 41.05
8” Flexible Coupling SS Clamp (Clay TO CI/PVC) 100 EA 12.10
8" Flexible Coupling SS Clamp Shielded (Clay TO CI/PVC) 100 EA 41.05
8” PVC SDR 35 Coupling HxH 50 EA 16.25
8” PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 24.80
8” PVC (22-1/2 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 25 EA 26.87
8” PVC (45 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 23.20
8” PVC (90 Degree Bend) SDR 35 HxH 100 EA 32.80
8" PVC SDR 35 Repair Coupling 50 EA 24.80
8x8x4 PVC SDR 35 Reducing Wye HxHxh 20 EA 31.40
8x8x6 PVC SDR 35 Reducing Wye HxHxh 20 EA 37.40
10” PVC PIPE - SDR 35 ASTM 3034 Belled End 500 FT FT 5.30
12” PVC PIPE - SDR 35 ASTM 3034 Belled End 500 FT FT 7.75
STATE MINIMUM DELIVERY (IF ANY) FOR THE FOLLOWING ITEMS:
ITEM DESCRIPTION APPROXIMATE USAGE UNIT UNIT COST
MANHOLE BRICKS (SINGLES) M NO BID
MANHOLE BRICKS {(DOUBLES) M NO BID
SOLIDS 4 x 8 x 16 (CEMENT) 120 NO BID
BRICKS 4 x 4 x 8 (CEMENT) 520 NO BID
VM-3 (MANHOLE CASTING & COVER) 20 UNITS UNIT 237.00
VM-3 WT (MANHOLE CASTING & COVER ) 20 UNITS UNIT 289.75
VFG-18 x 18 30 EA 89.47
VFG-24x24 30 EA 139.24
RCB-7 20 EA 662.94
RCB-31 10 EA 554.94
16 x 16 x 4 concrete sewer cleanout pad w/ Cl cleanout 10
12 in ring and 9 in cover 31.80
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SANITARY SEWER MATERIALS
SPECIFICATIONS & SPECIAL PROVISIONS

MANHOLE CASTING & COVERS
SHALL BE OF A STANDARD TYPE USED FOR SANITARY SEWERS

MANHOLE BRICKS
SHALL BE NO. 1 AND NO. 2 COMMON

POLYVINYL CHLORIDE PIPE (PVC)
SHALL HAVE ANY SDR OF 35 AND BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH LATEST REVISIONS OF ASTM D3034

INSTRUCTONS TO BIDDERS:

DELIVERY SHALL BE F.O.B. CITY OF NEW IBERIA, LOUISIANA TO THE SPECIFIED DEPARTMENT
LOCATIONS. DELIVERY SHALL BE SPECIFIED WHEN ORDER IS PLACED.

ANY AND ALL FREIGHT AND/OR FUEL SERVICE CHARGES SHALL BE INCLUDED IN YOUR TOTAL BID.
BIDS WILL BE AWARDED ON AN ITEM BY ITEM BASIS.

THE CITY OF NEW IBERIA, LOUISIANA IS EXEMPT FROM STATE AND LOCAL SALES AND USE TAX.
MAIL OR HAND DELIVER BID FORM TO: CITY OF NEW IBERIA, PURCHASING AGENT, 457 EAST MAIN

STREET, SUITE 300, NEW IBERIA, LOUISIANA 70560-3700. BIDS MAY ALSO BE SUBMITTED ONLINE AT
WWW.CENTRALBIDDING.COM. BIDS MUST BE SUBMITTED BEFORE BID OPENING DATE AND TIME.

ALL ENVELOPES MUST BE CLEARLY MARKED ON THE OUTSIDE WITH:
BID ENCLOSED — SANITARY SEWER MATERIALS (October 3, 2019)




