INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4

BID NO.: 50-00122560 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BASIC SUPPLY, LLC -vwvn BUYER: SFOLSE

DATE: 3/14/2018

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form foreach item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

2-3 WEEK
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 3W 5

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRM NAME: BASIC S/;PLY LLC

SIGNATURE: TITLE:
(Must be signed here) ZZ /[’¢ /1//71/ MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
/ JOHN ATKINSON

ADDRESS:

PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: ZIP:

LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:

() 337-769-0122 () 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:
charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: % 1367.90




DATE: 3/14/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122560

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

12.00

2.00

2.00

60.00

30.00

144.00

4.00

50.00

6.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

STOCK SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH
EB PUBLIC WORKS CENTRAL WAREHOUSE

0010 BIT, "WHIRLYBIT", 1-1/8 IN X 24 IN
OVERALL LENGTH, 4-1/4 IN SHANK, BRUNNER
& LAY #X31628, TO FIT A MINNICH BRAND

HORIZONTAL DRILL MD. A-1-48,
STK. # 020008H

0020 BIT, DRILL, 37/64 IN X 1/2 IN

REDUCED SHANK, HIGH SPEED STEEL,
DOMESTIC,

STK. # 0195500

0030 BIT, DRILL, 15/16 IN X 1/2 IN

REDUCED ROUND SHANK, HIGH SPEED STEEL,

CHICAGO LATROBE #55460

STK. # 0195800 7745748

0040 SEALANT, URETHANE FOAM FOAM
INSULATION, BIG GAP FILLER, 12 OZ CAN,

GREAT STUFF, DOW #157906

STK. #0329250

0050 SAFETY FLAG FLUORESCENT ORANGE
24" X 24" 36" STAFF

STK. # 0479000

0060 PAIL, 2-1/2 GALLON, WHITE HIGH
DENSITY POLYETHYLENE, .065 MIL THICKNESS
NO LID, WITH WIRE HANDLE, CENTURY BRAND

OR EQUAL,
STK. # 0480960

0070 CUTTER, PIPE, RATCHET OPERATED,
15 IN TILE/CLAY PIPE CAPACITY, INCLUDES
RATCHET, DOMESTIC, WHEELER-REX MODEL

#490-15
STK. # 0581860

0080 SPOTLIGHT, LED 12 VOLT, 550/40
LUMENS, DORCY #41-1050, STREAMLIGHT
#44900,

STK. # 0588090

0090 EDGER, SIDEWALK, 6 IN LONG X 4 IN
WIDE X 5/8 IN LIP, STAINLESS STEEL,

6461263

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

21.00

42.00

3.89

233.40

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

20.50

1025.00

7.90

74.40




DATE: 3/14/2018

BID NO.: 50-00122560

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

U/m

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

10.00

4.00

2.00

EA

EA

EA

KRAFT #CF-165,
STK. # 0590960

0100 WRENCH, NO HUB TORQUE, 5/16 INCH
DRIVE, T-HANDLE, DOUGLAS #6300,RIGID

#31410 OR EQUAL
STK. # 0591240

0110 BLADE, JIG SAW, 24 TEETH PER INCH,
3 IN LONG, FOR THIN METAL, 2 PER PACK,

DEWALT #DW3726-H2

STK. # 0592600 6300859

0120 SOCKET, DEEP, CHROME, 12 POINT, 1/2
DRIVE, 3/8 IN, DOMESTIC, MEETS FED. SPEC
GGG-W-641E, PROTO #5312

STK. # 0600980
7515398

NO BID

NO BID

2.70

10.80

4.85

9.70




7745748

Irwin 911 Regular Length Silver And Deming Drill Bit,
15/16 In Dia X 6 In OAL, High Speed Steel

M-7 high speed steel for strength, heat resistance, and wear
resistance when drilling in wood, metal or plastic; can be
used with keyless chuck. Three-flatted shank design
provides better chuck grip and reduces slippage. All Silver
and Deming bits are 6" long and feature a 1/2" reduced
shank that fits all 1/2" drills.

Series: 911

Type: Regular Length

Diameter:  15/16 In

Flute Type: Spiral

Point Angle: 118 Deg

Cutting Direction: Clockwise

Material: High Speed Steel

Finish:Black Oxide

Applicable Materials: Wood, Metal, Plastic
FEATURES

Bit Is Constructed Of M-7 High Speed Steel For High
Resistance To Abrasion During Tough Drilling
Applications

Three-Flatted Shank Design Provides Better Chuck Grip
And Reduces Slippage

Ideal For Use In Keyless Chucks

All Silver & Deming Bits Are 6 In Long And Feature A 1/2
In Reduced Shank That Fits All 1/2 In Drills

Standard 118 Deg Point For Use In Wood, Metal, And
Plastic

6461263

Marshalltown CE509S Hand Edger,6In L X 4In W,
Stainless Steel

Comfortable wood handle and rust-resistant stainless
steel for producing a radius at edge of concrete slab.

Blade Length: 6 In
Blade Material: Stainless Steel
Blade Radius: 1/2 In

Lip: 5/81In

Blade Width: 4 In

Handle Material: Wood

Handle Type:Comfort Grip

Blade Shape: Straight

Usage:Used To Produce A Radius At The Edge Of A
Concrete Slab To Help Prevent The End From Chipping
Off




6300859

Lenox 20323BT324] Bi-Metal Jig Saw Blade, 3-5/8 In L X 3/8 In W X
0.037In T, 24 TPI

Bi-metal. Milled and set teeth. Designed for optimal performance,
ground to precision sharpness for straighter cuts and a smoother
finish. Super sharp to cut fast without deflection, flexes and resists
breaking extending blade life. Thin metal cutting up to 1/8" thick.
PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Bi-Metal. Milled And Set Teeth. Designed
For Optimal Performance, Ground To Precision Sharpness For
Straighter Cuts And A Smoother Finish. Super Sharp To Cut Fast
Without Deflection, Flexes And Resists Breaking Extending Blade
Life. Thin Metal Cutting Up To 1/8" Thick.

rvee

UNIVERSAL SHANK - BI-METAL
METAL CUTTING

Teeth Per In : 24

Lgth In: 3-5/8

PRODUCT DETAILS

FEATURES

Super Sharp To Cut Fast Without Deflection

Ground To Precision Sharpness For Straight Cuts And A Smooth
Finish

Designed For Optimal Performance In Wood Cutting, Including
Hardwoods

Bi Metal Technology Flexes And Resists Breaking And Extends
Blade Life

TV13AN NIHL %XONE'I wig

7515398

DeWalt DWMT741430SP Deep Socket, 3/8 In, 3/8 In, 12 Point
Knurled beauty rings to reduce hand slippage; premium chrome
vanadium steel for strength and durability.

PRODUCT DETAILS

Drive Size: 0.0375 In

Number Of Points: 12

Socket Size: 0.0375 In

Material: Chrome Vanadium Steel

FEATURES

Knurled Beauty Rings To Reduce Hand Slippage

Premium Chrome Vanadium Steel For Strength And Durability
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