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Bid Number 50 — 00114227

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR VARIOUS CHEMICALS FOR THE
JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS — WATER

BID DUE: THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 10, 2015 AT 2:00 PM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing
Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Misty A. Camardelle
Buyer Email: mcamardelle@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2683
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Two (2) Year Contract for Various Chemicals for the Jefferson Parish

Liquid Ammonia, Zinc Sodium Hexametaphosphate, Bulk Polydadmac Polyelectrolyte Clarifloc

Department of Public Works - Water

BID SPECIFICATIONS FOR CHEMICALS

-4

Ammonium Hydroxide Solution, Powdered Activated Carbon, & Liquid Chlorine, Fluorosilicic

Acid, And Liquid Aluminum Sulfate

Specifications for Line # 0010 (Bulk Liquid Ammonia)

A. The Liquid Ammonia must be certified for use in drinking water under National

B.

Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

The vendor must provide for the transfer of the Bulk Liquid Ammonia via his own hoses
and truck mounted transfer pump. Vendor’s hose connections must be compatible with
the 1-1/4 inch acme adaptor on our tanks. Vendors must verify compatibility of their hose
connections with our tanks before bidding (Contact Plant Superintendents at 504-838-
4398 for Eastbank and 504-349-5085 for Westbank). The Ammonia will be placed into
the storage tanks at each waterworks location by the delivery driver and will be
supervised by the appropriate waterworks personnel.

The Ammonia vendor shall provide an Annual Ammonia Safety Training Program at
each waterworks facility as part of the contract obligation at no additional charge.

Specifications for Line #0020 (Zinc Sedium Hexametaphosphate)

A. The Zinc Sodium Hexametaphosphate bid must be equivalent to Virginia Chemical Vir

Chem 937, Shannon Chemical Shan-No-Cor, or Calgon C-8 Or C-9, containing no less
than 65% as Phosphate and 6.5% as Zinc; must be a free-flowing granular material sized
such that at least 75% will pass a 10 mesh sieve and will be retained on a 80 mesh sieve;
and must be soluble up to 3 Ib/gal of cold tap water and remain free of precipitates for at
least 5 days after preparation. Products requiring hot water for solution preparation are
not acceptable.

B. The Zinc Sodium Hexametaphosphate must be certified for use in drinking water under

National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

C. A technical information sheet indicating the percent composition of active ingredients

must accompany each bid. The bid award will be based upon the lowest price per ton of
the primary active ingredient, Metaphosphate (P205).
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- D. The Zinc Sodium Hexametaphosphate must be supplied in 50 Ib pails which are properly
palletized on wooden pallets such that unloading can be promptly accomplished by
waterworks personnel using their forklift.

Specifications for Line #0030 (Bulk Polydadmac Polyelectrolyte Clarifloc C-308p)

A. The Polydadmac (Polydiallyldimethylammonium Chloride) bid must be one of the
following;:

a. Polydyne C-308P, Cytec Industries 587-C, Chemlink per Chem 550, Nalco 8792,
G.S. Robin 120, CPS Chemical Agefloc Wt-20hv, Callaway Chemical Jay Floc
842, Citichem Chemfloc 615, or Calgon Cat-Floc T, T2, L or LS.

B. The Polydadmac shall have a specific gravity of 1.03 - 1.05 g/ml, a viscosity less than
300 cps at 25 degrees, a shelf life of 12-24 months, and freezing point of minus 5 degrees
C.

C. The Polydadmac must meet the requirements of the latest version of American Water
Works Association Standard B451 and must be certified for use in drinking water under
National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60 to a dosage of 10 mg/L.

D. Each vendor must bid only one Polydadmac product, clearly indicating the product name
on the bid. A technical information sheet on the product bid award will be based upon
the lowest price per ton of active ingredient.

E. Shippers must provide the necessary properly sized equipment to quickly unload their
product into the designated storage tanks at the delivery site.

Specifications for Line #0040 (Ammonium Hydroxide Solution)

A. The 29.4% Ammonium Hydroxide Solution must be certified for use in drinking water
Under National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

B. The bid price of the Ammonium Hydroxide shall include any and all fees associated with
drum return, such as environmental or cleaning fee.

C. Shippers must provide necessary properly sized equipment to quickly unload their
product at the delivery site.
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Specifications for Line #0050 (Bulk Powdered Activated Carbon for Broad Spectrum)

A. The Powdered Activated Carbon must meet the requirements of the latest version of
American Water Works Association Standard B600, must have a Phenol value of 1.8 -
3.2 g/L, and must be certified for use in drinking water under National Sanitation
Foundation Standard 60.

B. Each vendor must bid only one PAC product, clearly indicating the product name on the
bid. A technical information sheet on the product bid must accompany the bid.

C. Shippers must provide the necessary properly sized equipment to quickly unload their
product into the designated storage tanks at the delivery site.

Specifications for Lines #0060 & #0070 (Liquid Chlorine)

A. The Liquid Chlorine must meet the requirements of the latest version of American Water
Works Association Standard B301 and must be certified for use in drinking water under
National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

B. A comprehensive Quality Tracking Program (QTP) must be submitted by the supplier
with the bid proposal and annually thereafter. The QTP must address the required
Chlorine purity specifications and include documentation and reporting protocols to
insure Chlorine Cylinder Integrity.

C. Chlorine Cylinder Valves must be properly aligned and the valve threads must be in good
condition upon receipt. Otherwise the cylinder will be rejected and returned to the
vendor.

D. The Chlorine vendor shall provide an Annual Chlorine Safety Training Program at each
waterworks facility as part of the contract obligation at no additional charge.

E. Shippers must provide the necessary equipment to quickly unload one ton cylinders at the
delivery site and pick up empty cylinders. Any cost associated with the pickup and return
of empty cylinders shall be included in the bid price.

Specifications for Item #0080 (Fluorosilicic Acid)

A. The Fluorosilicic Acid must meet the requirements of the latest version of American
Water Works Association Standard B703 and must be certified for use in drinking water
under National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

B. The bid price of the Fluorosilicic Acid shall be made on a 100% dry basis such that a
shipment of 25% Fluorosilicic Acid shall be paid at a rate of 25% of the bid price. A
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- certified analysis indicating the percentage Fluorosilicic Acid must accompany each
shipment.

C. Shippers must provide the necessary properly sized equipment to quickly unload their
product into the designated storage tanks at the delivery site.

D. In the event that any commodity sought in this bid is the subject of a nationwide product
shortage which can be verified by Jefferson Parish, then Jefferson Parish will agree to
suspend the obligation of the vendor to supply that commodity during any period of its
unavailability. Price is based on 100 % acidity adjusted basis and 20 ton minimum
releases.

Specifications for Item #0090 (Liquid Aluminum Sulfate)

A. The Liquid Aluminum Sulfate must be approximately 48.5% by weight dry Aluminum
Sulfate ( AL2(S04)3-14H20, MW=594) and meet the requirements of the latest version
Of American Water Works Association Standard B403, and must be certified for use in
drinking water under National Sanitation Foundation Standard 60.

B. The bid price of the Liquid Aluminum Sulfate shall be made on a 100% dry basis such
that a shipment of 48.5% Liquid Aluminum Sulfate shall be paid at a rate of 48.5% of the
bid price. A certified analysis indicating the percentage must accompany each shipment.

C. Shippers must provide the necessary properly sized equipment to quickly unload their
product into the designated storage tanks at the delivery site.
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 Water Department Chemical Bid quantities

0001 Bulk Liquid Ammonia delivered freight prepaid in 2 or 3 ton shipments to both the
Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
220 tons

0002 Zinc Sodium Hexametaphosphate delivered freight prepaid in 20 ton shipments to both
the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
120 tons

0003 Bulk PolyDADMAC Polyelectrolyte delivered freight prepaid in 20 ton shipments to to
both the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
1300 tons

0004 Ammonium Hydroxide Solution, 29.4%, in 55 gal drums delivered freight prepaid in 10
drum shipments to 171A Birch Lane, Grand Isle, LA 70358 as required .
90 drums

0005 Bulk Powdered Activated Carbon for broad spectrum organics removal delivered freight
prepaid in 20 ton shipments to to both the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as

required .
400 tons

0006 Liquid Chlorine in one ton cylinders delivered freight prepaid in 20 ton shipments to both
the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
1300 tons

0007 Liquid Chlorine in 150 pound cylinders delivered in 1500 1b shipments freight prepaid to
West Jefferson Waterworks 171 A Birch Lane, Grand Isle, LA 70358 as required
30,000 pounds

0008 Bulk Fluorosilicic Acid bid on a 100% dry basis delivered freight prepaid in 20 ton
shipments to to both the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
140 tons

0009 Bulk Liquid Aluminum Sulfate bid on a 100% dry basis delivered freight prepaid in 20
ton shipments to to both the Eastbank and the Westbank Water treatment plants as required .
3100 tons



INVITATION TO BID
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BID NO.: 50-00114227 JEFFERSON PARISH
e - PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678
BUYER: MCamardelle@jeffparish.net

BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED IN THE PURCHASING DEPARTMENT, SUITE 4400, JEFFERSON PARISH GENERAL GOVERNMENT
BUILDING, 200 DERBIGNY STREET, GRETNA, LA 70053 UNTIL 2:00 PM, 9/10/2015 AND PUBLICLY OPENED THEREAFTER.

LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED

Unless submitting via online (see Page 3), each bid must be submitted in a sealed envelope bearing on the outside; the name of the
Bidder, his address, and the name of the project for which the bid is submitted and the bid number.

NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN IN INK OR TYPEWRITTEN, AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE
FIRM OR AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC
FIGURES OR SIGNATURES SHALL RESULT IN BID REJECTION.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS
THE FOLLOWING INSTRUCTIONS APPLY TO ALL BIDS

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, all of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of
Louisiana Law as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson
Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 and/or Resolution No. 113847,

All vendors submitting bids must register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered. Bidders may be required to
furnish current W-8 Forms and respective Tax Identification Numbers within 10 days after bid opening if such information is not on
file or not up to date. Registration forms may be downloaded from www.purchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on Vendor
Information.

All guotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or job site, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing
Department. This provision does not apply to public works projects

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the
project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepted. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials
must have at least one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or
alterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supporting documentation supplied with bid submission.

Bidders should submit alt questions in writing and fax them to the Purchasing Department at (504) 364-2693 no fater than FIVE (5)
working days prior to bid opening. Bid numbers should be mentioned in all requests. Questions may also be emailed to the buyer for
this bid at the email address fisted above. If submitting online, vendors may send questions via the E-Procurement site no later than
Five (5) working days prior to the bid opening.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to
allow bidders the opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions.
The Purchasing Department will issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum. Please note that all official
communication will be expressed in the form of an addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgement on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid
form shali cause the bid to be rejected. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event.

The purpose and intention of this invitation to bid is to afford all suppliers an equal opportunity to bid on all construction, maintenance,

repair, operating supplies and/or equipment listed in this bid proposal. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM
EACH VENDOR. ltems bid must meet specifications.

Visit our website at HTTP://PURCHASING.JEFFPARISH.NET
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JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more prices for one item will result in
bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and return the associated line item
pricing forms as indicated. Vendors must not alter the bid forms. Doing so will cause the bid 1o be rejected.

if the bid exceeds $30,000.00 and the company is duly authorized to do business in the state of Louisiana, a corporate resolution
must be submitted with the bid or the person signing the bid documents must be listed on the Louisiana Secretary of State's
website as an officer of the corporation, unless bidder has otherwise complied with LSA-R.S. 38:2212(B)(5). if the bid is in excess
of $30,000 and bidder is registered out of the state of Louisiana, a corparate resolution must be submitted with the bid, unless
bidder has otherwise complied with LSA-R.S. 38:2212(B)(5). Failure to comply will cause bid to be rejected; the Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event. Bids submitted by Owner or Sole
Proprietorships must include certification that he or she owns the entity for which the bid is signed. Sole praprietors submitting bids
for public works projects shall within 10 days after bid opening submit sole proprietorship certification.

NOTE: A sampie corporate resolution can be downloaded from our website http://purchasing jeffparish.net or you may provide
your own document, A sample certification of sole proprietorship can aiso be downloaded from our website
hitp://purchasing.jeffparish.net or you may provide your own document.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE. IN THE EVENT OF SPLIT AWARD, THE PURCHASING
DEPARTMENT MAY CONTACT VENDORS TO REQUEST REQUIRED AFFIDAVITS. THOSE VENDORS WILL HAVE 10 DAYS
FROM THE DATE OF NOTICE TO SUBMIT COMPLETE, SIGNED AND NOTARIZED AFFIDAVITS IN ORIGINAL FORMATS.

All bid prices shall remain valid for 45 days. Jefferson Parish and the lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s) by mutual written
consent may mutually agree to extend the deadline for award by one (1) or more extensions of thirty (30) calendar days.

Preference is hereby given to materials, supplies, and provisions produced, manufactured or grown in Louisiana, quality being equal to
articles offered by competitors outside the state. "LSA-R.8.38:2251-2261"

B. USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the
purpose of establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided
brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

C. CANCELLATION OF CONTRACT: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any f{)art if not shipped promptly. No
charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERShON PARISH reserves the right to cancel any contract at anytime and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

For good cause and as consideration for executing a contract with Jefferson Parish, vendor conveys, sells, assigns and transfers to
Jefferson Parish or its assigns all rights, title and interest in and to all causes of action it may now or hereafter acquire under the
angtrust laws of the United States and the State of Louisiana, relating to the particular good or services purchased or acquired by
Jefferson Parish.

D. PRICES: Jefferson Parish is exempt from paying sales tax under LSA-R.S. 47:301 (8)(c). All prices for purchases by Jefferson
Parish of supplies and materials shall be quoted in the unit of measure specified and unless otherwise specified, shall be exclusive of
state and Parish taxes. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals,
the unit price shall prevail.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any
person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the
basis of refigion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title VI and VIl of the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provisions contained in Section 51.55 (c), (d), (&), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must
camply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard institute's
specifications (ANSI A17.1-1961).
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Advertised bids will be tabulated and a copy of the tabulation will be forwarded to each responding bidder,

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT
TO ALL VENDORS | RS s

This Electronic Procurement System allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and su’binittingbids
online, This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Please note
requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid submission. =
Please visit the Purchasing Department webpage at http;llpurcﬁaé.sivng.j‘effparish,net to register and review
‘ Jefferson PariSh‘sclicitatipns,' T B K G

The ,_general specifications for construction projects and the purchase of materials, services and/or supplies are those adopted by the
JEFFERSON PARISH Council by Resolution No. 113646 or 113647 dated 12/09/08. The general conditions adopted by this
resolution shall be considered as much a part of this document as if they were written wholly herein. A copy may be obtained from the
Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053,

You may also obtain a copy by visiting the Purchasing Department webpage at http:/fpurchasing jeffparish.net and clicking on Online

Forms.
ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

5,10,12,13,15 ' '

1. All bidders must attend the pre-bid conference in relation to this bid; attendance is mandatory. Failure to attend wil
prohibit a company from submitting a bid. Vendors arriving after the mandatory pre-bid conference begins will not be
allowed to sign in as evidence of attendance.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Department of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must aiso hold any
and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4. A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number wiil be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field in the
Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

5. ltis the bidder’s responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.
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8. Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the contract. Passageways must be kept
clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily

because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precautions must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of
JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

7. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: Ali awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shalf be
recorded at the contractor’s expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A
price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of
Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in
the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid

specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

8. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the

contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

9. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment band will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the contract
price uniess otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the contract.

10. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required {o procure standard insurance policies
evidencing Parish-mandated insurance requirements as indicted on the attached sheet. The current certificate of insurance
must be submitted by low bidder within 10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department. Failure to comply will cause bid

tg be rejected. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in
this event.

11. A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety hid bond. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies) If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House. No
scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

12. This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on
warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications.

13. Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a
separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form.

14. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits {in Original Format) required; Non-Conviction
Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit and E-Verify Affidavit must be completed, signed,
notarized and submitted by low bidder within 10 days after bid opening to the urchasing Department on all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public building or project, including but not limited to requirements found in LSA-RS
38:2212.9; LSA-RS 38:2212.10; LSA-RS 38:2224; Code of Ordinances, Jefferson Parish, Louisiana, Sec 2-923.1. Failure to
comply will cause bid to be rejected; the Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible
bidder in this event. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitted PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format for the bid to be considered responsive.

15. NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits {in Original Format) required; Non-
Collusion Affidavit, and Campaign Contribution Affidavit must be completed, signed, notarized and submitted by low bidder
with bid submission within 10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department. See LSA-RS 38:2212.10;

LSA-RS 38:2224; Code of Ordinances, Jefferson Parish, Louisiana , Sec 2-923.1 Failure to comply will cause bid

to be rejected; the Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in

this event. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled NON-PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format for the bid to be considered responsive,

16. Since a bid surety is required, bid response may not be faxed. Bid submission will only be accepted online or as delivered 1o the

Purchasing Department, 200 Derbigny Street, Suite 4400, Gretna, LA 70053 by 11am on the bid due date. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies).

t shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
uty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
ligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
erformance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a bid,
endor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances,
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.Non Public Works

All Public Work Projects are required to use the Louisiana Uniform Public Work Bid Form

All prices must be held firm unless an escalation provision is requested in this bid. Jefferson Parish will allow one escalation
during the term of the contract, which may not exceed the U.S. Bureau of Labor Statistics National Index for ail Urban
Consumers, unadjusted 12 month figure. The most recently published figure issued at the time an adjustment is requested
will be used. A request must be made in writing by the vendor, and the escalation will
only be applied to purchases made after the request is made.
Are you requesting an escalation provision?
YES NO
MAXIMUM ESCALATION PERCENTAGE REQUESTED %

INITIAL BID PRICES WiLL REMAIN FIRM THROUGH THE DATE OF

For the purposes of comparison of bids when an escalation provision is requested, Jefferson Parish will apply the maximum
escalation percentage quoted by the bidder to the period to which it is applied in the bid. The initial price and the escalation
will be used to calculate the total bid price. It will be assumed,for comparison of prices only, that an equal amount of material
or labor is purchased each month throughout the entire contract.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 7-10 days from receipt of the order
N/A

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

THIS SECTION MUST BE COMPLETED BY BIDDER:

rirm NAME: MOSaic Global Sales, LLC

aopress: 13830 Circa Crossing Drive

ciry, stare: Lithia, FL zp. 33547

TELEPHONE: (800 ) 578.7891 FAX: (813 1571.6915

EMAIL ADDRESs: I SA.Group @mosaicco.com

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form.Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form
will result in bid rejection.
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: None as of 9/8/15

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $254.240.00
AUTHORIZED .
SIGNATURE:_ Mo 4 10 L 4/”'\ Jennifer Lehman

. Printed Name
TirLe: BusineSs Manager

SIGNING INDICATES YOU HAVE READ AND COMPLY WITH THE INSTRUCTIONS AND CONDITIONS.

NOTE: All bids should be returned with the BID NUMBER and BID OPENING DATE
indicated on the outside of the envelope submitted to the Purchasing Department.
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"~ "INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
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-SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

1 220.00

2 120.00

3 1,300.00

4 90.00

5 400.00

™

TN

TN

DRUN{

TN

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT FOR VARIOUS CHEMIC
ALS FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT
OF PUBLIC WORKS - WATER

0010 BULK LIQUID AMMONIA

(DELIVERED FREIGHT PREPAID IN
APPROXIMATELY 2 OR 3 TON SHIPMENTS TO
BOTH THE EASTBANK AND WESTBANK WATER
TREATMENT PLANTS AS REQUIRED).
DELIVERY LOCATIONS:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

0020 ZINC SODIUM HEXAMETAPHOSPHATE
(DELIVERED FREIGHT PREPAID IN 20 TON

SHIPMENTS TO BOTH EASTBANK AND WESTBANK
WATER TREATMENT PLANTS AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY LOCATION:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

0030 BULK POLYDADMAC POLYELECTROLYTE
CLARIFLOC C-308P (DELIVERED FREIGHT
PREPAID IN 20 TON SHIPMENTS TO BOTH
EASTBANK AND WESTBANK WATER TREATMENT
PLANTS AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY LOCATION:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

0040 AMMONIUM HYDROXIDE SOLUTION, 29.4%
IN 55 GALLON DRUMS

{DELIVERED FREIGHT PREPAID IN
10 DRUM SHIPMENTS AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY TO: GRAND ISLE, LA 70358

0050 BULK POWDERED ACTIVATED CARBON

FOR BROAD SPECTRUM ORGANICS REMOVAL
(DELIVERED FREIGHT PREPAID IN 20 TON
SHIPMENTS TO BOTH EASTBANK AND WESTBANK
WATER TREATMENT PLANTS AS REQUIRED).
DELIVERY LOCATION:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 8/26/2015

BID NO.: 50-00114227..

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page ....7.

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

1,300.00

30,000.00

140.00

3,100.00

TN

L8

™

TN

*%kKk

WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

0060 LIQUID CHLORINE IN 1 TON CYLINDERS

NO BID

NO BID

(CYLINDERS DELIVERED FREIGHT PREPAID
IN 20 TON SHIPMENTS TO BOTH EASTBANK
AND WESTBANK WATER TREATMENT PLANTS
AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY LOCATION:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON,LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

0070 LIQUID CHLORINE IN 150 POUND

NO BID

NO BID

CYLINDERS

(CYLINDERS DELIVERED IN 1500 LB
SHIPMENTS FREIGHT PREPAID AS REQUIRED)

DELIVERY TO: GRAND ISLE, LA 70358

0080 BULK FLUOROSILICIC ACID BID ON A

$1,816.00 ***

$254,240.00

100% DRY BASIS (DELIVERED FREIGHT

PREPAID IN 20 TON SHIPMENTS TO BOTH
EASTBANK AND WESTBANK WATER TREATMENT
PLANTS AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY LOCATION:

EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70075

0080 BULK LIQUID ALUMINUM SULFATE

NO BID

NO BID

BID ON A 100% DRY BASIS (DELIVERED
FREIGHT PREPAID IN 20 TON SHIPMENTS

TO BOTH EASTBANK AND WESTBANK WATER
TREATMENT PLANTS AS REQUIRED).

DELIVERY LOCATION:
EASTBANK PLANT - JEFFERSON, LA 70121
WESTBANK PLANT - MARRERO, LA 70072

Above price is based on a 100% assay adjusted basis a
$1,816.00/dry ton basis = $454/wet ton,25% assay basig

d 20 ton minimugn releases
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- CORPORATE RESOLUTION

EXCERPT FROM MINUTES OF MEETING OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF

INCORPORATED.

AT THE MEETING OF DIRECTORS OF
INCORPORATED, DULY NOTICED AND HELD ON s
A QUORUM BEING THERE PRESENT, ON MOTION DULY MADE AND SECONDED. IT
WAS:

RESOLVED THAT » BE AND IS HEREBY
APPOINTED, CONSTITUTED AND DESIGNATED AS AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT OF THE CORPORATION WITH FULL POWER AND AUTHORITY TO ACT ON
BEHALF OF THIS CORPORATION IN ALL NEGOTIATIONS, BIDDING, CONCERNS
AND TRANSACTIONS WITH THE PARISH OF JEFFERSON OR ANY OF ITS AGENCIES,
DEPARTMENTS, EMPLOYEES OR AGENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO, THE
EXECUTION OF ALL BIDS, PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, AFFIDAVITS, BONDS, SURETIES,
CONTRACTS AND ACTS AND TO RECEIVE ALL PURCHASE ORDERS AND NOTICES
ISSUED PURSUANT TO THE PROVISIONS OF ANY SUCH BID OR CONTRACT, THIS
CORPORATION HEREBY RATIFYING, APPROVING, CONFIRMING, AND ACCEPTING
EACH AND EVERY SUCH ACT PERFORMED BY SAID AGENT AND ATTORNEY-IN-
FACT.

I HEREBY CERTIFY THE FOREGOING TO BE
A TRUE AND CORRECT COPY OF AN
EXCERPT OF THE MINUTES OF THE ABOVE
DATED MEETING OF THE BOARD OF
DIRECTORS OF SAID CORPORATION, AND
THE SAME HAS NOT BEEN REVOKED OR
RESCINDED.

SECRETARY-TREASURER

DATE
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~ Non-Public Works Bid
Affidavit Instructions

* Affidavit is supplied as a courtesy to Affiants, but it is
the responsibility of the affiant to insure the affidavit
they submit to Jefferson Parish complies, in both form
and content, with federal, state and parish laws.

o Affidavit must be signed by an authorized
representative of the entity or the affidavit will not be
accepted.

* Affidavit must be notarized or the affidavit will not be
accepted.

* Notary must sign name, print name, and include
bar/notary number, or the affidavit will not be
accepted.

o Affiant MUST select either A or B when required or the
affidavit will not be accepted.

¢ Affiants who select choice A must include an
attachment or the affidavit will not be accepted.

¢ If both choice A and B are selected, the affidavit will not
be accepted.

« Affidavit marked N/A will not be accepted.

o Itis the responsibility of the Affiant to submit a new
affidavit if any additional campaign contributions are
made after the affidavit is executed but prior to the time
the council acts on the matter.

Instruction sheet may be omitted when submitting the affidavit
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- Non-Public Works Bid
AFFIDAVIT
STATE OF FLORIDA

PARISH/COUNTY OF HILLSBOROUGH

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, personally came and appeared: Jennifer Lehman

, (Affiant) who after being by me duly sworn, deposed and said that

he/she is the fully authorized Business Manager of Mosaic Global Sales, LLC (Entity),

the party who submitted a bid in response to Bid Number 50-00114227 , to the Parish of

Jefferson.

Affiant further said:

Campaign Contribution Disclosures

(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all campaign contributions, including
the date and amount of each contribution, made to current or
former elected officials of the Parish of Jefferson by Entity,
Affiant, and/or officers, directors and owners, including
employees, owning 25% or more of the Entity during the two-year
period immediately preceding the date of this affidavit or the
current term of the elected official, whichever is greater. Further,
Entity, Affiant, and/or Entity Owners have not made any
contributions to or in support of current or former members of the
Jefferson Parish Council or the Jefferson Parish President through
or in the name of another person or legal entity, either directly or
indirectly.

Cheice B there are NO campaign contributions made which would require

disclosure under Choice A of this section.

Updated: 02.27.2014
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- Debt Disclosures
(Choose A or B, if option A is indicated please include the required

attachment):

Choice A Attached hereto is a list of all debts owed by the affiant to any
elected or appointed official of the Parish of Jefferson, and any and
all debts owed by any elected or appointed official of the Parish to
the Affiant.

- Choice B There are NO debts which would require disclosure under Choice

A of this section.
Affiant further said:

That Affiant has employed no person, corporation, firm, association, or other
organization, either directly or indirectly, to secure the public contract under which he
received payment, other than persons regularly employed by the Affiant whose services
in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition of the public building or
project or in securing the public contract were in the regular course of their duties for
Affiant; and

[The remainder of this page is intentionally left blank.]

Updated: 02.27.2014
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~ That no part of the contract price received by Affiant was paid or will be paid to any
person, corporation, firm, association, or other organization for soliciting the contract,
other than the payment of their normal compensation to persons regularly employed by
the Affiant whose services in connection with the construction, alteration or demolition
of the public building or project were in the regular course of their duties for Affiant.

Chsg —

Sigrature of Affiant

Jennifer Lehman, Business Manager
Printed Name of Affiant

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED TO BEFORE ME
ONTHE 8th DAY OF September 2015 .

Mg it %

Notary Public /

Heidi Schmitz
Printed Name of Notary

FF 038672
Notary/Bar Roll Number

My commission expires 07/23/17

SN 'y,% HEIDI SCHMITZ

R e Commission # FF 038672

E 55 Expires July 23, 2017
“ARERR  Bonded Thu Troy Fain Insurance 800-335-7019

Updated: 02.27.2014
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. INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS - BIDS

All insurance requirements shall conform to Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646 or No.
113647. The contractor shall not commence work under this contract until he has obtained all
insurance and complied with the requirements of the specifications and said Parish
Resolutions. Except as otherwise provided by law, the Parish Attorney’s Office with the
concurrence of the Director of Risk Management is authorized to omit in whole or part the
insurance requirements of this section in connection with contracts. Vendors inquiring about
this shall submit his written request to the Purchasing Department prior to the due date of the
bid. Contractor must deliver and maintain such insurances as provided; failure to do so shall
be grounds for suspension, discontinuation or termination of the contract.

Successful bidder wilf be required to procure standard insurance policies evidencing Parish
mandated insurance requirements indicated below. The current certificate of insurance must be
submitted by low bidder within10 days after bid opening to the Purchasing Department. Failure
to comply will cause bid to be rejected.

1. WORKER’S COMPENSATION INSURANCE

As required by Louisiana State Statute, exception; Employer's Liability, Section B shall
be $1,000,000 per occurrence when Work is to be over water and involves maritime
exposures to cover all employees not covered under the State Worker's Compensation
Act, otherwise this limit shall be no less than $500,000 per occurrence.

2 COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Shall provide limits not less than the following: $1,000,000.00 Combined Single Limit
per Occurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

3. COMPREHENSIVE AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Bodily injury liability $1,000,000.00 each person; $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.
Property Damage Liability $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.

DEDUCTIBLES

No insurance required shall include a deductible not greater than $10,000.00. The cost of the
deductible shall be borne by the contractor.

NOTE: If the vendor requires a change in deductibles, the request must be submitted in writing
to the Purchasing Department prior to the due date of the bid. Such request shall be
reviewed by the Parish Attorney’s Office.

UMBRELLA LIABILITY COVERAGE
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..An umbrella policy or excess may be used to meet minimum requirements.

CONSTRUCTION AND RENOVATION PROJECTS:

Unless otherwise specified in the bid, these additional insurance is required. Such insurance
is due upon contract execution.

OWNER'’S PROTECTIVE LIABILITY

To be for the same limits of liability for bodily injury and property damage liability established
for commercial general liability.

BUILDER'’S RISK INSURANCE

The contractor shall maintain Builder's Risk Insurance at his own expense to insure both the
owner (Parish of Jefferson) and contractor as their interest may appear.

NOTE for CERTIFICATE HOLDER:

All insurance certificates shall list the certificate holder as follows:
“The Parish of Jefferson, its Districts, Departments and Agencies under the direction of the

Parish President and the Parish Council.” Additionally, the address on the Certificates should
reflect the department which is letting the bid and reference the respective bid number.

Revised 2.10.2014



CERTIFICATE OF SECRETARY
OF
MOSAIC GLOBAL SALES, LLC
AS TO CORPORATE AUTHORIZATION

The undersigned, Mark J. Isaacson, herby certifies that he is the Corporate Secretary of Mosaic

Global Sales, LLC, a Delaware limited liability company (the “Company”), and further certifies as

follows:

1.

Mosaic Crop Nutrition, LLC, a Delaware limited liability company (“MCN™) is the managing
member of the Company.

He is a member of the Board of Managers of MCN,

Attached hereto as Exhibit A is a true and correct copy of the Company’s Amended and Restated
Limited Liability Company Agreement dated September 18, 2014 (the “LLC Agreement”). The
LLC Agreement has not been modified or rescinded since its adoption, is in full force and effect on
the date hereof, and is the only effective Limited Liability Company Agreement adopted by the
members of the Company on September 18, 2014.

The following is a true and correct copy of resolutions passed by the Managing Member of the
Company on December 29, 2014, pursuant to authority set forth in Sections 18-402 and 18-407 of
the Delaware Limited Liability Company Act and Article 6 of the LLC Agreement, which
reselutions remain in full force and effect:

“FSA GOVERNMENTAL CONTRACT AUTHORIZATION

WHEREAS, the Company enters into agreements relating to the distribution of Fluorosilicic
Acid (“FSA”) to governmental authorities, including municipalities, throughout the United States
(the “Governmental Contracts™);

WHEREAS, the Company desires to grant authority to Betty Kendall-Jones and Jennifer
Lehman (the “Authorized Persons”) and each of them acting alone, to negotiate and enter into
Governmental Contracts relating to the sale and distribution of FSA and documents relating
thereto on behalf of the Company, which Governmental Contracts shall be (i) for a term of not
more than two years; (ii) made in the Company’s ordinary course of business; (iii) on terms and
conditions in which the Company has customarily entered into such contracts; and (iv) on forms
approved by the Company for sale and distribution of FSA (“FSA Governmental Contract
Authorization™); and

WHEREAS, the Managing Member has determined that granting the FSA Governmental
Contract Authorization is in the best interests of the Company.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that:
1. The FSA Governmental Contract Authorization is hereby authorized and approved.
2. Betty Kendall-Jones and Jennifer Lehman, and each of them acting alone, be and

they hereby are authorized, for and on behalf of the Company, to execute any and all
documents as may be necessary to complete and enter into the Governmental



Contracts including, but not limited to municipal bids or quotes, sales contracts,
purchase orders, performance bonds, extension agreements and all ancillary
documents related thereto.

3. Any action taken prior to the date hereof necessary or appropriate to effect the
transactions contemplated by this resolution is hereby ratified, confirmed and
approved in all respects.”

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereto set my hand and the seal of said Company this afi day of

December, 2014.
W -

By: Mark J. Isaacson
Its: Corporate Secretary

STATE OF MINNESOTA )
)ss
COUNTY OF HENNEPIN )

The foregoing instrument was executed the ‘g%ay of December, 2014, by Mark J. Isaacson, the
Corporate Secretary of Mosaic Crop Nutrition, LLC, a Delaware limited liability company, on behalf of

the Company.
W& Lt X /,Z(aﬂféwc'/?_,

Notary Public
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7 CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE s
THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.
IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed, If SUBROGATION 18 WAIVED, subject to ;.;
the terms and conditions of the policy, certaln policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the &=
certificate holder in lleu of such endorsement(s). t
PRODUCER 1 [ i §
Aon Risk Services Central, Inc. FPHORE - FRK - -
Chicago IL Office A No. Extj;  (866) 283-7122 ] A% \oy; (800) 363-0105 g
200 east Randolph EMAL K3
Chicago IL 60601 USA ADDRESS: x
{5) AFFORDING CO NAIC #
INSURED INSURER A: 01d Republic Insurance Company 24147
Mosaic Global sales. LLC: The Mosaic INSURER B:
Company, its Subsidiaries & Affiliates
attn: Mike Bishop, Director Risk mgmr, INSURER C:
Atria Corporate Center, Ste €490 INSURER D:
3033 campus Drive -
Plymouth MN 55441 usA INSURER E:
INSURER F:
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 570055615327 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS iS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED 10 THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO AlL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS, Limits shown are as
e TYPE OF INSURANCE N POLICY NUMBER Y e | OLCYEE LTS
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY MWZY 131 eacH occurrence $3,000,000
[DANAGE YO REN
| clamsmaoe Eoccure rEs Ea D excluded
MED EXP (Any one person} Excluded
PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $3,000,000 §
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: TE $6,000,000] o
X | poucy D fgg Loc PRODUCTS - COMPIOP AGG $3,000,000 §
OTHER: 8
A MWTB 302501 30/22/2014{10/22/2015] COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT b
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY /22/ /22/ COMBINED S $3,000,000 .
x| anv auto BODILY INJURY { Per person) 2
] ALL OWNED i%*}eot;uLED BODILY INJURY (Per accident) o
|| AutoS 2
|__[wmeoavros NON-QWHED Fgwt?:gaﬁnmg ot S
T
o
UMBRELLA LIAR OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE ©
| excessuas || cramsaane AGGREGATE
080 |  IRETENTION
A | WORKERS COMPENSATION AND MWC30250000 10/22/2014|1072272015 PER OTH.
EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY Yin X [Bne | [OF
ANY PROPRIETOR / PARTNER / EXECUTIVE E.L. EACH ACCIDENT £3,000,000
OFFICERIMEMBER EXCLUDED? RIA
{Mandatory in NH) EL. DISEASE-EA EMPLOVEE 53,000,000
gg%?:‘gemou %’?gpemnows below E.L. DISEASE-POLICY LT $3,000,000]
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS  VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Rematks Schoduis, may bo aitsched if more Space Is Fequired)

Liability policy.

RE: Bid No. 50-00107789. The Parish of t :
president and the Parish Council is included as Additional Insured in accordance with the palticy provisions of the General

Jefferson, its Districts, Departments and Agencies under the direction of the Parish

CERTIFICATE HOLDER

CANCELLATION

Jefferson Parish
Purcasing Department
Gretna LA 70053 usa

Jefferson Parish General Government Bldg

200 Derbigny Street, Suite 4400

SHOULD ANY OF YHE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE
EXPIRATION DAYE THEREOF, NOTICE WALL SE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANGE WITH THE
POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

e Pl Sreiins Corntsad S

RS A ERRTINE VT 2 Y (]

ACORD 25 (2014/01)

©1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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Form w-9

(Rav. August 2013)
Deparimant of the Tressury
higzl Revenie Servica

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Qive Form to the
requaster. Do not
gsend to the IRS,

Nume {rs shown on your Income tax return)

‘Mosaic Global Sales, LLC

#5759

Businoss name/disregarded antily name, i different from sbave

o
g Check appropriate box for federal tax classification: Examptions (sse instructions):
S | Clindniduavsocie propristor [ ¢ Corporation [ 8 Corporat Or p [ Trusvest
é Exempt payee code ( any}
5 E} Limitad ¥ability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C 1 lon, P=p: ip} > P Examption from FATCA i
- code (if any}
é = 1 ] other {ses Instructions) »
Address {rumber, slrest, and apl. or suito 110.) [} g naine s od
43830 Cjrca Crossing Drive. - - .
[ City, stats. and 219 code
@ | Lithia, FL. ..33547
List {5) hera {optionai)
YN Taxpayer identification Number (TIN)
Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on the “Name® line | Social security number

to avoid backup withholding. For individuals, this is your soclal security number {SSN). However, fora
1 or disragarded entity, sse the Part | instructions on pags 3. For other
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). if you do not havs a number, see How to gota

ident alien, sole propri
TIN on page 3.

Note. if the account is in more than ona name, see the chart on page 4 for guidelines on whose

number o snter.

Emplayer {dentification number

35-2510179

Il Certification

Under penalties of pedury, | cortify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number {or 1 am waiting for a number to be issued to mu), and

2. 1am not subject to backup withholding b fam

kup withholding, or () | hiavs not been notified by the Intemal Revenue

pt from b

(a)
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interset or dividands, or (¢} the IRS has nofitied me that i am

no longer subject to backup withholding, and
3. tama U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below), and

4. The FATCA codels) entared on this form (if any) indicating that | am exampt from FATCA repording is correct,

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 abova if you have been notifiad by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding
because you have falled to report all interest and dividends on your tax retumn, For roal estate transactions, tem 2 doas not apply. For mortgage

interest paid, acquisition or aband of propeity, Hation of debt, contributions 1o an ind g t (IRA), and
generaily, payments other than intorest and dividends, you ars not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the
inatructions on page 3.
Sign | signature of
Here | us pemon> C1 M - Dete > /92/0 /{7/

v 7
General lnstrucﬁons 3 withholding tax on foreign pariners' share of sflectivaly connected income, and

Saction rafarances are to ihe intemal Revanues Cade unleas otharwise noted.

Future errts. The IRS has created a page on IRS.gov for information
about Form W-9, at www.lrs.gov/wg. Information about any future deveiopmants
affacting Form W-8 (such ¢s legislation enacted after we release It} will be posted
on that page.

Purpose of Form

A parson wha is required ta file an infarmation retum with the IBS must obtain your
carrect taxpayer identitication number (TIN) to report, for example, Income pakd to
you, payments made to you in settisment of payment card and third party network
1 i o4} estate & i gage Interest you pald, acqulsition or

o rty flation of debt, or contributions you made

property

toan IAA.

Use Form W-9 anly if you are 8 U.5. person {including & resident alien), to
provida your correct TIN to the pereon requesting It {the requsster) and, when
appiicabls, to:

1. Cartify that the TIN you ara giving Is cormect {or you are waiting for ¢ number
to be lasusd),

2. Certify that you ars not subject fo backup withhoiding, or

3. Claim plion from backup withholding if you are a U.S, sxempt payss. if .
applicable, you are aiso cerlifying that as a U.S. parson, your atiocable shere of
any partnership income from a U.S, trade or business Is not subjsct to the

4. Cartify that FATCA code{s) antered on this form (it any) indicating that you are
exempt from the FATCA reporting, s comect.
Note. If you are a U.S. parson and a requestar gives you a form other than Form
W-8 1o request your TIN, you must usa the s form if it is ially
simiiar to this Form W-8.
Dafinition of 2 U.8. pereon, For federal fax purposes, you are considered 2 U.S.
person if you are:
 An Individual who Ia a U.S. citlzen or U.S. residant allen,

* A parinership, Y, Of created or org in the
United States or undar the laws of the United States,

+ An estate {othar than a forelgn estate), or

* A domestic trust (as defined In Regulations saction 301.7701-7).

Specixl ruies for partnerships. Parinersh trade or busl in

ps that a
the United States are generally requirad to pay a withholding tax under section
1448 on any forelgn § share of effactively d taxable income from
such business, Further, In certaln cases where a Form W-8 has not been recalved,
the rulss undar secticn 1446 require a partnership to prasuma that a partner ls &
{orslgn person, and pay the section 1448 withholding tax. Therefors, it you area
U.S, person that iz a partner In & partnership conducting a trede or business in the
United States, provids Form W-g to the parinership to establish yaur U.S, status
end avold section 1448 withholding an your share of parinership income,

Farm W-9 {Rev. 8-2013)



Interactive TIN Session:Interactive Results Page 1 of 1

. Online Tutorials

(oo Slgn QW oo ContactUs

Interactive TIN Session:Interactive Results

This screen provides you with the results of your TIN Match request. The "Match Indicator’ displays a code next to the TIN and
name combination. Use the codes below to interpret your results:

0 = TIN and Name combination matches IRS records.

1= TIN was missing or TIN not 9-digit numeric.

2 =TiN entered is not currently issued.

3=TIN and Name combination does not match IRS records.

4 = Invalid TIN Matching request.

§ = Duplicate TIN Matching request.

& = TIN and Name combination matches IRS SSN records.

7 = TIN and Name combination matches IRS EIN records.

8 = TIN and Name combination matches IRS SSN and EIN records.

Important: Before leaving this screen, you may want to do a Print Screen of the results. Once you exit this screen, the
interactive resuits will no fonger be available for viewing.

Using the TIN Matching system allows you to verify the accuracy of taxpayer TIN and name information prior to submitting
information to IRS. Internal Revenue Code 6724 provides any penalties under Section 6721 may be waived if the filer shows
the failure to file a correct TIN on an information retum was due to reasonable cause and not willful neglect. Filers may prove
due diligence and receive a waiver from proposed penalties ifthey prove the TIN and name combination they submitted
matched IRS records. Providing a copy of the Print Screen of your Interactive Resuits will be considered proof of due diligence.
D TNType TN . Name " ResultCode
1 . Unknown ¢ 352510179 © MOSAIC GLOBAL SALES LLC 7

You may do either of the following:

» Select Another Tin Maltching Request to check more TIN and Name combinations.
» Select Done to retum to the TIN Matching home page.

" ANOTHER TiN MATCHING REQUES

IRS Privacy Policy | Privacy Notice
tin-match-rup-webapp (version R-15.0.4)

https://la2. wwwd.irs.gov/esrv/tinm/tinRequestInsert.faces 1/9/2015



