
January 2009  

LOUISIANA UNIFORM PUBLIC WORK BID FORM  

UNIT PRICE FORM  
 

TO: Ascension Parish Government Purchasing Departme nt  
P.O. Box 2392 
Gonzales, Louisiana 70707 
 

 

BID FOR: Ascension Parish Government 
Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe 
 
     

The Unit Price Form shall be used if the contract includes unit prices.  Otherwise it is not required and need not be included with the form.  The number of unit prices that 
may be included is not limited and additional sheets may be included if needed.  
 
UNIT PRICES:  This form shall be used for any and all work required by the Bidding Documents, and described as unit prices.  Amounts shall be stated in figures and 
only in figures. 
 

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe – 16 Gage - Plain  

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”    
 DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”    

 DESCRIPTION:    Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”     

 DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 36”      
  

$8.82

$10.59

$13.26

$15.01

$16.78

$21.81

$28.65



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 24”     

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”     

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 42”     

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

  Unknown 48”      
     

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”     

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”     
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”     
 

$34.57

$40.32

$21.21

$26.52

$42.70

$50.94

$69.00

$88.12

$97.68

$121.65



January 2009  

 
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Plain 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
     
     

$181.40

$193.56

$11.28

$14.26

$18.14

$20.51

$22.87

$29.14

$34.17

$44.36



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
     
     
     

$52.55

$27.32

$34.47

$52.49

$63.17

$81.23

$105.16

$115.69

$148.54

$213.16



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
 
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
     
     

$226.56

NO BID

$12.19

$15.24

$17.26

$19.28

$24.39

$29.46

$45.59

NO BID



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage - Arched 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
     
     
     

$24.38

$30.49

$54.97

$65.88

$90.34

$101.33

$112.33

$139.96

$208.62

$222.61



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
     
     
     

NO BID

$15.73

$20.12

$22.78

$25.42

$32.34

$38.04

$61.16

NO BID

$30.51



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Coated 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
     
     
     

$38.44

$70.51

$81.97

$106.38

$118.37

$130.37

$166.81

$240.36

$255.64

$23.17



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
     
     
     

$28.41

$15.26

$38.01

$42.26

$54.00

$64.30

$85.10

$96.02

$54.47

$66.23



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Plain Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
     
     
     

$106.27

$118.07

$161.24

$206.64

$227.03

$282.45

$419.21

$447.92

$29.45

$38.22



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
     
     
     

$52.16

$52.34

$58.56

$73.18

$86.41

$109.10

$125.13

$69.87

$86.43

$130.02



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
     
     
     

$149.52

$189.22

$244.19

$268.44

$344.09

$489.78

$521.01

NO BID

$32.47

$39.61



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
     
     
     

$44.67

$49.15

$52.65

$75.27

$112.45

NO BID

$62.68

$76.47

$135.02

$154.92



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 12”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 15”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 18”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 21”      
     
     
     

$210.44

$236.02

$261.77

$324.12

$481.23

$511.45

NO BID

$42.74

$53.41

$59.11



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 36”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  16 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 24”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 30”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 42”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  14 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 48”      
     
     
     

$64.66

$80.87

$105.33

$137.02

NO BID

$78.14

$96.82

$159.04

$183.67

$240.12



January 2009  

DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: UNIT OF 
MEASURE: 

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 54”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 60”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  12 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 72”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 84”      
DESCRIPTION:   Galvanized & Asphalt Coated Corrugated Metal Pipe –  10 Gage – Arched Coated Bands 

REF. NO. QUANTITY: 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE: 
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENSION (Quantity X Unit Price) 

 Unknown 90”     
 
 

 

NAME OF BIDDER:                 

ADDRESS OF BIDDER:                

NAME OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY OF BIDDER             

TITLE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY BIDDER:              

 

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED SIGNATORY BIDDER:           

DATE:          

 
All quantities are estimated. The contractor will be paid based upon actual quantities as verified by the Owner.  

$271.18

$299.94

$371.54

$540.21

$587.67

HD SUPPLY WATERWORKS

11323 Cloverland AVE. Baton Rouge, LA 70809

Michael Self

Account Manager

7/7/2016

           Michael Self


