INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX 9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

DATE: 9/05/2017

Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00120872

VENDOR: BUYER: DMEVANS

BASIC SUPPLY, LLC

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 WEEKS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form willt result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRMNAME:  BASIC SUPPLY, LLC
SIGNATURE: TITLE:
(Must be signed herﬂ&%% ZV/V/L, MANAGER
PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
JOHN ATKINSON
ADDRESS:
PO BOX 63066
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
LAFAYETTE, LA 70596
TELEPHONE: FAX:

() 337-769-0122

() 337-247-7699

EMAIL ADDRESS:
charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: §

2410.34




DATE: 9/05/2017

BID NO.: 50-00120872

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

24.00

60.00

6.00

2.00

12.00

6.00

6.00

96.00

400.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

LF

ONE TIME PURCHASE OF VARIOUS BEARINGS,
COUPLINGS AND BELTS

0001 - Belt, 3VX600, Dayco power

wedge cog
(0041250) CWDG5901

0002 - Nipple, galvanized,
1/4 inch x 1-1/2 inch long,

scheduie 40
{0295900)

0003 - Bearing, ball, single row, deep
groove, double shield, NTN no. 6313-ZZ

(0454310)

0004 - Bearing, MRC no. 5309MFG1
(0457930)

0005 - Valve, ball, 1-1/4 inch, no lead
brass, female pipe thread on each end,

600 PSi CWP 150 PSI WSP, Apollo brand
no. 77-140-NL or equal
(0622530)

0006 - Coupling (hub), L-Jaw, no. L-100,
with 1-3/8 in (1.375 in) bore,

5/16 in x 5/32 in keyway,
Lovejoy no. 685144-11522
(063246Y)

0007 - Coupling {(hub), L-Jaw, no. L-110,
with 1-1/8 in (1.125 in) bore,

1/4 in x 1/8 in keyway,
Lovejoy no. 685144-11741
(063247N)

0008 - Eibow, 90 degree, 3/4 in,
schedule 80 PVC, socket x socket,
electrical conduit is not acceptable

(0690060)

0009 - Pipe, PVC, schedule 80,
3/4 inch x 20 foot, plain ends,

6.59

158.16

30.60

209.00

1254.00

178.00

356.00

13.11

157.32

30.54

183.24

45.17

271.02

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00120872 SEALED BID
ITEM UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY U/m DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

no bells, electrical conduit is not
acceptable, Fastenal no. 0472012
(0691020)

10 2400 EA 0010 - Bushing, reducer, 1 in x 3/4 in, NO BID NO BID
schedule 80 PVC, thread x thread,
electrical conduit is not acceptable
(0691950)

1 12.00 EA 0011 - Valve, ball, PVC, schedule 80, NO BID NO BID
true union, 1/2 inch, to include female
socket ends and FPT Ends
(0692000)

12 12.000 EA 0012 - Bushing, reducer, NO BID NO BID

3/4 inch socket x 1/2 inch socket,
schedule 80 PVC, electrical conduit
not acceptable, Fastenal no. 0470510
(0693650)




Home

» 3L400 Classic V-Belt

3L400 Classic V-Belt

DESCRIPTION

Top Width 3/8" x 40" OC
Top Width 9.50mm x 1016mm OC

3VX600 DAYCO Replacement Cogged Wedge V-Belt

Original Equipment Manufacturer _

OEM Part Number 3VX600
Belt Type Cogged Wedge
VBG Replacement Id CWDG5901
et
Qutside Circumference 60.00 1524.00
Top Width 0.38 9.53
Belt Depth 0.33 8.33

Belt Section IVX

3L400 Conventional Wrapped V-Belt Specifications:
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