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Synergy Telcom Inc.  

National Account Manager

Lisa K. Gemmer
8222 Indy Lane

Indianapolis         IN         46214

(800) 201-7590 or (317) 713-1652 ext. 201 (317) 713-1658

lisa.gemmer@synergy-tel.com

Synergy Telcom Inc.

$3314.35



No Bid       No Bid

No Bid        No Bid

No Bid        No Bid

No Bid       No Bid

No Bid       No Bid

No Bid       No Bid

No Bid       No Bid



Discontinued Replaced with Plantronics 201500-01 ENCOREPRO HW530 SPECS Attached.

Line 14        Plantronics 201500-01
                     $64.15       $320.75

Line 12          No Bid       No Bid

Line 11         No Bid        No Bid

Line 13         No Bid        No Bid

Line 8        No Bid           No Bid

Line 9      No Bid            No Bid

Line 10        No Bid         No Bid

Line 15       $66.40         $332.00

Line 16      $102.32         $511.60



Line 25         No Bid      No Bid

Line 23        No Bid       No Bid

Line 24        No Bid       No Bid

Line 22        $37.00      $1850.00

Line 20      $1.00             $50.00

Line 19      $1.00            $100.00

Line 21      $1.50            $75.00

Line 18       $1.50            $75.00

Line 17       No Bid         No Bid

***************************************



Line 34        No Bid           No Bid 

Line 33       No Bid           No Bid

Line 32      No Bid           No Bid

Line 31        No Bid           No Bid

Line 30       No Bid           No Bid

Line 29        No Bid           No Bid

Line 28        No Bid           No Bid

Line 27       No Bid           No Bid

Line 26        No Bid           No Bid

*************************************



Line 37       No Bid           No Bid

Line 36        No Bid           No Bid

Line 35       No Bid           No Bid 




