

BID FORM

To: Mayor and Board of Aldermen
City of Gluckstadt
343 Distribution Drive
Madison, Mississippi 39110

From: Design Precast & Pipe
(Name)
P.O. Box 2401
(Address)
Gulfport, MS 39505
gregory@designprecast.com
(Email Address)
(228) 831-5833
(Phone #)

In accordance with the published Bid Notice, the undersigned does hereby agree to furnish the commodities, supplies, equipment, materials and services to the City of Gluckstadt, Mississippi, for the prices as shown on the attached listing. Unless otherwise indicated, prices will be F.O.B. Gluckstadt.

All prices submitted shall be good and valid from OCTOBER 1, 2023 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2024, except prices for asphalt materials as noted shall be good and valid from October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024

Acceptance by the Mayor and Board of Aldermen shall be sufficient to constitute a valid contract.

THIS, the 24 day of July, 2023

Design Precast & Pipe
(Bidder)

By: CHRIS A. FORE
Vice President
(Title)
[Signature]
(Signature)

previous spot check. As many as 10 percent of the loads may be spot checked.

FORM #3

DRAINAGE PIPE - CONCRETE
MATERIALS ONLY

Bid Type: Total Base Bid

All reinforced concrete pipe (ASTM C-76, Federal S-P-375) and reinforced concrete arch pipe (ASTM C-506, AASHTO M206) shall be in accordance with the latest edition of Mississippi Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction, Mississippi Department of Transportation. Prices include delivery to the City of Gluckstadt at various street locations. Bid prices to be effective from OCTOBER 1, 2023 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2024. Prices include joint seals.

Bidder: Design Precast & Pipe
Address: P.O. Box 2401
Gulfport, MS 39505
Phone #: (228) 831-5833
Email: rgaregov@designprecast.com

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSAL QUANTITY	ITEM UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1.(a)	15" Diameter	480	LF	\$ <u>22.75</u>	\$ <u>10,920.00</u>
(b)	15"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>740.39</u>	\$ <u>740.39</u>
2.(a)	18" Diameter	480	LF	\$ <u>31.20</u>	\$ <u>14,976.00</u>
(b)	18"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>890.39</u>	\$ <u>890.39</u>
3.(a)	24" Diameter	480	LF	\$ <u>47.78</u>	\$ <u>22,934.40</u>
(b)	24"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>1,190.39</u>	\$ <u>1,190.39</u>
4.(a)	30" Diameter	8	LF	\$ <u>68.90</u>	\$ <u>551.20</u>
(b)	30"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>1,565.39</u>	\$ <u>1,565.39</u>
5.(a)	36" Diameter	8	LF	\$ <u>89.38</u>	\$ <u>715.04</u>
(b)	36"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>2,090.39</u>	\$ <u>2,090.39</u>
6.(a)	42" Diameter	8	LF	\$ <u>111.48</u>	\$ <u>891.84</u>
(b)	42"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>no bid</u>	\$ <u>no bid</u>
7.(a)	48" Diameter	8	LF	\$ <u>141.05</u>	\$ <u>1,128.40</u>
(b)	48"Diameter FES	1	Each	\$ <u>3,065.39</u>	\$ <u>3,065.39</u>
8.(a)	18" x 11"	8	LF	\$ <u>32.90</u>	\$ <u>263.20</u>
(b)	18"x 11"FES	1	Each	\$ <u>no bid</u>	\$ <u>no bid</u>
9.(a)	22" x 13"	8	LF	\$ <u>40.95</u>	\$ <u>327.60</u>
(b)	22" x 13"FES	1	Each	\$ <u>890.39</u>	\$ <u>890.39</u>
10.(a)	29" x 18"	8	LF	\$ <u>57.05</u>	\$ <u>456.40</u>
(b)	29" x 18"FES	1	Each	\$ <u>1,190.39</u>	\$ <u>1,190.39</u>
11.(a)	36" x 23"	8	LF	\$ <u>68.60</u>	\$ <u>548.80</u>
(b)	36" x 23"FES	1	Each	\$ <u>1,565.39</u>	\$ <u>1,565.39</u>
12.(a)	44" x 27"	8	LF	\$ <u>94.15</u>	\$ <u>753.20</u>
(b)	44" x 27"FES	1	Each	\$ <u>2,090.39</u>	\$ <u>2,090.39</u>
13.(a)	51" x 31"	8	LF	\$ <u>121.80</u>	\$ <u>974.40</u>

(b)	51" x 31" FES	1	Each	\$ <u>2259.39</u>	\$ <u>2259.39</u>
14.a)	58" x 36"	8	LF	\$ <u>155.05</u>	\$ <u>1240.40</u>
(b)	58" x 36" FES	1	Each	\$ <u>3065.39</u>	\$ <u>3065.39</u>

TOTAL BID \$ 77,284.56

FORM # 4
DRAINAGE PIPE & STRUCTURES
INSTALLATION ONLY

Bid Type: Total Base Bid

Prices include labor for installation of drainage pipe and structures for the City of Gluckstadt at various street locations, in varying conditions, all installed in accordance with the latest edition of Mississippi Standard Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction, Mississippi Department of Transportation. The prices bid for installation of drainage pipe shall provide full compensation for installing pipe of various materials (concrete, plastic, steel, etc.) at the sizes and depths listed in the bid form. The prices shown below do not include drainage pipe or drainage structure materials. The City of Gluckstadt will provide these materials to the Contractor. Incidental materials and work necessary to complete the work under this section and not listed below will not be measured separately for payment. The City at its option will execute the Contractor's bid bond for failure to start the work within 30 days of the purchase order date. The City will also at its option execute the Contractors' bid bond for failure to complete the work within 60 days of the purchase order date unless otherwise specified on the purchase order. Time extensions will be awarded at the discretion of the Public Works Director in extraordinary circumstances. Bid prices to be effective from OCTOBER 1, 2023 THRU SEPTEMBER 30, 2024.

Bidder : _____

Address: _____

Phone #: _____

Email: _____

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSAL QUANTITY	ITEM UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
1.(a)	15" Diameter 0'-5'Depth of Cut	480	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
(b)	15" Diameter 5'-10'Depth of Cut	100	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
(c)	15" Diameter 10'-15' Depth of Cut	20	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
2.(a)	18" Diameter 0'-5' Depth of Cut	480	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
(b)	18" Diameter 5'-10' Depth of Cut	100	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
(c)	18" Diameter 10'-15' Depth of Cut	20	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
3.(a)	24" Diameter 0'-5' Depth of Cut	480	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____
(b)	24" Diameter	100	L.F.	\$ _____	\$ _____