

DATE: 7/14/2021
BID NO.: 50-00135278

INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 5

JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

BUYER: RSCOTT

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

2 weeks ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: 0

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***	
FIRM NAME: <u>The Spectrum Group, Inc.</u>	
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)	TITLE: <u>President</u>
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: <u>Sherryl Benbow</u>	
ADDRESS: <u>PO Box 683</u>	
CITY, STATE: <u>metairie, LA</u>	ZIP: <u>70005</u>
TELEPHONE: <u>(504) 561-6000</u>	FAX: <u>504) 283-3897</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>Sherryl@thespectrumgroup.com</u>	

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 18,750.00

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00135278

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			Purchase of electrical supplies for the Jefferson Parish Eastbank Warehouse		
1	20.00	EA	0001 - Connector, cable, nonmetallic sheathed (romex), die cast zinc, two screw, 3/4 in KO, 10-3 to 8-2 cable, Appleton no. C-750 (087796B)	No Bid	
2	2.00	EA	0002 - Hub, bolt-on, 2 in, raintite, ITE no. HS-200 (0879680)	No Bid	
3	10.00	EA	0003 - Nipple, conduit, aluminum, 3/4 in x close (0881600)	No Bid	
4	30.00	EA	0004 - Controller, pump, Mercoild/Dwyer brand part n o. MPC, USA BlueBook Stock no. MD-62440 (0861770)	\$623.00 ea.	\$18,690.00
5	6.00	EA	0005 - Switch, safety, 100 amp, 600 volt, 3 pole, non-fusible, Nema 3R, with 2 in hub, Cutler-Hammer no. DH363UR, Siemens no. HNF363R, GE no. THN3363R (0874140)	No Bid	
6	30.00	EA	0006 - Seal, conduit knock out, 3/4 in, Weatherproof, Hoffman no. AS075 (0874260)	No Bid	
7	1.00	EA	0007 - Meter, ringless socket, 200 AMS, 3 phase, 7 terminal, 1 position, lever bypass, overhead/underground, Milbank no. U4701-RL-QG (087455A)	No Bid	
8	12.00	EA	0008 - Switch, toggle, 15 amp, 1 pole, ivory, 120 VAC, Pass and Seymour no. 660-I (0873510)	No Bid	
9	10.00	EA	0009 - Nipple, offset, 2 inch, T and B no. 1185	No Bid	

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00135278

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
10	2.00	EA	(0878610) 0010 - Blower, 1/20 HP, 115V, 60HZ, 273 CFM, 1390/1640 RPM, Dayton no. 1TDR3 (0891700)	NO Bid —	
11	10.00	EA	0011 - Breaker, Circuit, 100 amperes, 600 volt, 3 pole, with lugs, new in factory box, no substitute, Westinghouse no. HMCP100R3 (0841820) Please have items shipped to: Eastbank Warehouse Attention: Curtis McFarland 4901 Jefferson Hwy Suite C Jefferson, LA 70121	NO Bid —	
			Freight cost	\$60.00	\$60.00
			Total Cost		\$18,750.00
			Delivery: 2 weeks ARO		
			FOB: Factory, Michigan city, IN		
			Terms: Net 30 Days		
			Validity: 30 Days		
			Freight: Prepay and Allow		