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) INVITATION T4 BID
DATE:  WZI1Z019 THIS{S NOT AN ORDER

BIDNO.; 5000117515 JEFFERSON PARISH
f PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
: P.O.BOX S

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0008
504-364-2678

i

Ho. 388 .2
{FE0E04364 20 r.002/015

BUYER: DREAMEY

VENDOR: Liquid Environmental Solutions -

Bids will bie recaivaed until 11:00 AM, B8/02/2016 via fax: 504-364-2693 or via online ut vwyw,jefiparish.net
¥

All bids submiitted are subject to Ihese instructions and general conditions and any pecial condilions znd specifications contained
nerein, alliof which are made pant of this bid proposa! reference. By submitdng & bid, vendor agrees 1o camply with all

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Lavisizna Code of

Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish aethical siandards and Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 1135646 and/or Resolution

No. 113647, A copy of these resalutions may be obtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053. You may aige obiain 2 cepy by isling the
Purchasin?g Depariment webpage at www. purchasing jefipargsh.net and ¢llicking en On-fine formis.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor If not alreatly yet registerad, Registration fo-ms mey be

dawn{oaded from www.purchasing jefiparish.nat and by clicking on Vendor Infarmasion. While Jeffarzon Barish mey ave these on
file, all bidders should furnish their current W-9 Form and respeciive Tax Identificatizn Numaers with bid submissivs records on fila
may be invalid or expired. The successful bidder must submit a W8 Form and respactive Tex lkentification Numbszr upon contract

execytion. Failure o §o 66 may rasult in delay of payment.

i o ‘
As per LEA-RS 47;301 st seq., all govemmental bodies are sxcluded from payment of sales taxes ta 2ny Louisiana taxing body.

Quotations shall be based on F.O.

Delivered, aryvehere within the Parish as designated by the Purghasing Depariment,

JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. items bid must maat specifications. JEFFEREON
PARISH will acoept one price for each item unless otherwlse indicated, Two or more prices for one fern Will result in bid regecuon.
Bldders ate requiced Io complete, sign and retum fhe bid form and/or compiete and retusm the assotisiad Iine itepo pricing forms as
indicated.d The price quoted for work shaill be stated In figures. In the event there is a difierence in uni: prices and totals, the unit prices

zhall pravail.

JEF FERs;ON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum ar Indivicual liem basis, o7 such
combination, as shall in its judgment be in the hast interest of JEFFERSON PARISH, Every contract o- ordar shall be awsrded 1o the
LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, taking into consideration the CONFORMITY ViITH THE SPECFICATIONS and

the DELIVERY AND/OR COMPLETION DATE

JEFFERSON PARISH raservss the right to cancei alt or any pant of an order if not shipped profptly. No chargas will bz ailowed for
parking of cartage unfess specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at & nigher price ther quoled. JEFFEXSON PARISH
raserves ths right to cancel at any tima and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day writlar: notice (o the coaractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (cunent) and all werk must be perfbrmed accurding 1o standard pracices for the

project. Unless otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts vill be accepted. Unless otheswis2 specit

=l workmanshis 2nd maledals

must have ot leasl one (1) year guaranty, in writing, from the date of deljvary and/or scceptance of the project.  Any devistions or
aiterations from the specifications must be indicated and/or supponing documentation supplied with 4id submission.

if this bid requires & pre-bid conference (see Addilional Requirements section), bidders are advised tiwl such conferencs will be held to
allow bidders the opponunitg 10 identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek furthar clzniization regardiio instructions.

The Purctlwasing Deparimen

will issue a writien response o bidders' questions inthe form of an Addardum.

All formal' Addenda require written acknowledgment an the bid form by the bidder, Failure lo agknowladne an Addend :m on the bid
farm shal] cause the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH raserves the right to award bid to nexi lowast responsive and rasponsible

pidder in this event.

{
USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock riumbers are specifizd, it s for the surpose of
establishing certzin minimum standards of qualily. Bids may be submitted for products of aqual quality. provided brand names and

stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to sward.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Adtual requirements may be more or less than guanilties listed,

Biddars are not to exclude from padicipation in, deny iha benefits of, or subjedt to discrimingtion under any program of aciivity, any
person injthe United Btates on the grounds of race, color, national origin, of sex; nor diserminate on ke hasis of age u-cer tFe Age

Discriminslion Act of 1975, ar with respect tc an othanvise clualiﬁed handicapped indivicuzl as provided in Section 3 :
pt that any exemption from such prohibiticn against dissrimir ation on the

Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the hasis of religion, exce

04 of the

basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1984, or Title Vi and VI of the Act of April 11, 1848, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final hardicapped discrirination
provisions contained in Section 51.55 (¢), (d), (), and (k}(5) of ihe Regulzalions. New consirtciion or rancvation projects must cornply
with Section 504 of the 1873 Rehabilitation Act, 25 amendad, in accordance with the American Mztionst Standard Irstitute's

specifiosfions (ANSI Al 17.1-1961).
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INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITICNS
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All bidders must atiend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required 1o sign ingnd out as evillenca of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(1), all prospective bidders shall be pres=ni &t the baginiing ot the
MANDATORY pre-bid confersnca and shall remaln in atiendance far the duratien of the confursnce, Any frospactive
bidger who fails to altend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited frary submitting 2 bid for the
project.

Attendance 1o this pre-bid confererice is optional. However, failure to attend lhe pre-2id confarence shall.nol
talisve the bidder of responsibility for irfarmation discussed at the copference, Fusthemnors, failure 1o attens
the pre-bid conference ant inspection does nof relieve the suecesshul bidder frem the nesessity of furnishing ;
materials or perorming any wark that may be required to complete the work In acecrdance with the specification
with no addltional cost to the owner.

2

Cantractor must hald current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH ficenses with the Deparmant of Ingpection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor ehiall obtain any and zll permils required by the JEFFERSON PARISH -
Department of Inspection and Code Enforcemént. The contractor shall be responsibie for the pgyment aof
these fermlts. Al permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor rust 850 hold any

and il applicable Federal and State licenses. Contrgclor shall be responsiole for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior {o the start of the project.

A LA State Contraclor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-27150 &1, seq. and suc: livense
number will be shown on the oulside of the bid envelope. Failurs o comply will cause lhz bid to be rejecled
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropfiste fefd
in the Elactronic Procurement systam. Failure to comply will cause the bid to bz rejected.

It is the bidder's responsibility {6 visil the job site and evaluate the job before sthmitting a bid.

Job site must be clean and free of sl litter and debris daily and vpon completion of the contract.
Passageways mus! be kept clean and frea of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable ma:arial
must be removed from the job sile daily because storage will not be permitted on the pramisas. Pracaulicns
must be exercised =t all imas o safegusrd the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public,
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; INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

4

7. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 vill be reduced ta 2 formal
contract which shall be recorded a1 the contractar's expense with the Clerk of Courl and Ex-Cificio Recorder ¢f
Mortgages for ihe Parish of Jefierson. A pricz list of recordation eosts may be obtained from- tha Clerk of Court
ang Ex-Oficlo Recorder of Morlgages for the Parish of Jetfetsan. All awards in excess of $25.006.00 wilt requir: both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise staled in the bid speclifications, the perionnance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the paymert bord requirements «hall be 100% of
theicontract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the slgning of the contragt, :

L my R

8. NOiN-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bld. The amouni of iha bond will be
100% of the contract price unless othemise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be
suppliad at the signing of the contract.

.

i
4. NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A paymen! bond will be required for this big. The amount of ihe nend will be
100% of the contract price unlass othenwvise indicaied in the spacifications, The payment bang shall be

Sufplied at the signing of the contract.

10. Unless otherwige staled in the bid specifications, the successful bidder will be required to procurs standard insurince policies

evidencing Parish-mandated insurange requiraments as indicaied on the aliache: ‘insurance requirements” shee, All bidders

must comply with the instetictions in this sheet. Failure to comply will cause bid tc be rejecied,

11 A Bid bond will be required with bid submisslon in the amount of 5% of the tofal bld, unless oiherwise stated In tre bid o
specifications. Acceptable forms shell be iimited lo cashier's check, cerified check. or sugety bicf bond. All suretes must ba in
original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an elacironio vid 39nd through the raspactive online
cléaringhouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the slectronic bid soficitation on Cerntral Auction =icuse. No
scanned paper coples of any hid bond will be accepted as par of the electronic bid submission,

¥

12. Th:is i5 3 requirements confract to be provided an an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes ne
fegrqfs_enit_ations an warranties with regard te minimum guaranteed quantifies unless ofherwise stated in the bid
spedifications.

13. Freight chargas should be included in iotal cost when quoting._If not quoted FOB DELIVERED, fre'ght must te
quated as a separate item. Bid may be rejected If not quoted FOB DELIVERED cr if freight charges are not
Ind{eated on bid form. . .

>

14. PUBLIC WORKS BIDS . Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavils Required; This applias 1o all sclid stions for
conistruction, alteration or demolition of public buildings ef projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in _SA-RS
38:2212.9, LEA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, end Sec 2-823.1 of the Jefferson Parish Cods of Ordingncas, For bidding
purposas, all biddars must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED ard PROPERLY NOTARIZELD Afldavits, including:
Nop-Convigtion Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavil, Debt Disclosuras Affidavit ani E-Venify
Affidavit. For the convenience of vendaors, all affidavils have been combined inte one form ertitisd PUBLIC WOFKS BID
AFFIDAVIT. This affigavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to se ;ompliant and for
!heibid 1o be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the compleled, signed and properly notarized affidavit misy be submitted
with the bid, hewaver, the successiul bidder must submit the original affidavit in its ariginal format and withou! ms terial alteration
upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejetted as nea-regponsive. The Parish reserves
thegright.to awsrd bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event,

15, NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Campletad, Signed and Proparly Notarized Afidavits Requlrad In conformity with the provisions +
contained in LSA ~ RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Qrdinances. For Jidding purposes, all bidders
must submil with bid submiasion COMPLETED, BIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED afficavits, induding: No-Callusion_
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Afidavil ang Camgalgn‘t:‘cntribuﬁcn Affidavit. For the gonvenience of vandors, all aff davits have been
combined jnfo one form entitled NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submittad in s ¢tiginal formal, .and
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considerad responsive, A scannad copy of the completed,
signed and propery notarized effidavit may be submitied with the bid, however, the successfu’ tidder muyst svbrit the original
affidavit in its original format and without malerial alteration upon contract execution. Faiture to comply will resull in the bid
submission being rejacted as pon-responsive, The Pansh reserves the right 1o award bid lo tha next lowest respinsive and
responsible bidder In this avent.

18. The ensuing contract for (his bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement andfor Fedzral funding/rsintursement, As
such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shail be considered a part of he bid dacument:. Al gpplicable
cert‘iﬁwli.ons‘ must be duly completled, signed and submitteg' with bid submission. Faiiure ta submit applicable carifications with
bid-submission will result in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every Earish officer, employee, department, agency, speclal distrizt bozrd, snd cemrrission: and the
uty of avery contractor, subcontractor, and ficensee of the parish, and the duty of every znpiicant for certification of
elxgstalllty for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, Inapectian,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 7-1 £85,10(18}. By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by ali provisions of the referanced Jeffarser Parish Code of Ordinances.
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BID NO.;;50-00117516 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0,BOX 9

GRETNA, LA, 70054-0008
504.364-2678

VENDOR: Liquid Environmental Solutions BUYER: DREAMEY
; R

- t
[ TR G
As per L3A-RS 47:301 et seq,, all governmental bodies are excludad from payment of sales taxes to any Lodis 2na taxing

body. Q:uamicns shall be based on F.0.B, Agency warehause or jubsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFER§50N PARISH reserves the right to canicel all or any part of an order if not shipped prompily. No charg:s will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled s2a higher prics than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing 3 THIRTY (30) day written
noties (o‘; the contractor.

1
JEFFER;SDN PARISH Is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-liks mannar, accordiag
to stand;ard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the spacifications must e indicater and backup donumentation
supplieci] with your quotation.

4

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
I
; INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES oA
| INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK o NA
{ INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK NA

In the event that addanda-are Isgued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowladge all addenda on the bld farm, Bdder muset
acknowlpdge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failures to acknowledues ary 2ddendunt on e bid
form wu; result in bid rejection, . .
‘ ; : NA
Acknowladge Raceipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
: NUMBER:  NA
NUMBER: NA

NUMBER:

i “_‘
LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

; *** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOQW %+

FIRM NAME:

Liquid Environmental Solutions

SIGNATURE:

: ) TITLE: -
& N " .
[Must be signed here) ) Director of Inside Sales and Servicas
e > / ot

FRINT OR TYPE NAME.
Paul Grffith

7651 Esters Blvd, Suite 200

CITY. 5TATE: . P:

: Irving, Texas 75063- 4013

“TELEPHONE: FAK:

(866 684-7327 (214 £24-6185

- EMAIL ADDRESS: e . .
‘ paul. griffith@liquidenviro.com

ADDRESS:

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID (TEMS: § __9.275.00
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; INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continuad
BID NO.: ISGv00117516 SEALEDRID
NJLEQQR QUANTITY | UM DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES ”g'g;{‘;g‘s TOTALS

]
i

LABOR, MATERIALS & EQUIOMENT NECESSARY 7D
PROVIDE A ONE (1})YEAR CONTRACT TQ PUMP

QUT GREASE TRAPS AT VARIDUS JEFFERSON : -
PARISH LOQCATIONS FOR THE COMMUNITY ; .
JUSTICE AGENCY,

187.50 187.50

o At o s mmcnnas

1.00f  ONLY U001 JEFFESON PARISH CORRECTIONAL CENTER

i 100 DOLHONDE STREET
: GRETNA, LA 70053

rrgmg o

i 750 GALLON EXTERIOR GREASE TRAP

. IFA S!TE vts:T IS NEEDED FOR ANY OF THE

4 JEFFERSON PLAYGROUNDS PLEASE CQHTACT
BRYAN HEBERT AT (504) 736-6999. X 107

{ BETWEEN THE HOURS OF 6:30 A M. AND 3:30

: P.M, MONDAY THRU FRIDAY TO SCHENULE AN

i APPOINTMENT.

1

IF A BITE VISIT IS NEEDEO FOR ANY QTHER
LOCATION PLEASE GALL MIKE LEMOINE DR
JERRY ADAMS AT (504) 354-2675 BETWEEN
THE HOURS OF 5:00 AM. AND 2:00 P.M.
MQONDAY THRU FRIDAY TO $CHEDULE A
APPOINMENT,

JUaway i b

NOTE: ALL EXPENDITURES SHOULD BE
CHARGED TO THE USER'S DEPARTMENT,

NEW CONTRACT SHOULD BE FOR . i
ONE YEAR STARTING 12/17/2018 AND WILL
-END ON 12/16/2017 - ONE YEAR

QUANTITIES: ;
THE CONTRACT WILL GUARANTEE THE i
CONTRACTOR A MINIMUM OF TWO (2)
INTERIOR TRAPS AND ONE (1) EXTERIOR
TRAP PER WEEKLY SERVICES, THE UNIT i
PRICES QUOTED FOR EXTERIOR TRAPS WILL :
COVER ADDITIONAL SERVICES NECESARY-
WEEKLY OR PERIODICALLY FOR THE
REMAINING TRAPS, SERVICE GREASE TRAFS :
TWICE ANNUALLY FOR PARKS AND RECEATION,
- BACKWASHING: o
| BACKWASRING OF MATERIALS FROM ANY
SERVICES VEHICLE TO ANY PARISH FAGILITY
IS STRICTLY FORBIDDEN, UNDER NO )
CIRCUMSTANCES SHALL BACKWASHING BE
ALLOWED.
CLEANING AREAS AND SAFTY:
JOB SiTES MUST BE CLEAN AND FREE OF
ALL LITTER AND DEBRIS DALY AN UPON
COMPLETION OF THE CONTRACT, PASSAGEWAYS
MUST BE KEPT CLEAN AND FREE OF MATERIAL
EQUIPMENT AND DEBRIS AT THE TIMES.
INFLAMMABRE MATERIAL MUST BE XEMOVED
FROM THE JOB SITE DAILY. BECAUSE STORAGE

o s e . St e e e o B

4 e A e b e
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continved

389 L7

v OTIONS

Paga: &

SEALED B

ITEM

NUMBER | QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES e orace

. —— — s 1 m e

L e e - e

b —_——

. -

1,00

1.00

1.00

2.00

1.00

1.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY

TOTALS

WILL NOT BE PREMITTED ON THE FREMISES.
PRECAUTIONS MUST BE EXERCIED AT ALL

TIMES TO SAFEGARD THE WELFACE AND SAFETY
OF THE GENERAL PUBLIC AND EMPLOYEES OF
JEFFERSON PARISH AND OTHER PARISH
OFFICALS.

CANCELLATION CLAUSE;

THE PARISH OF JEFFERSON RESERVES THE
RIGHT TO CANCEL THE CONTRACT AT ANYTIME
AND FOR ANY REASON BY [SSUING A THRITY
{30) DAAY WRITTEN NOTICE TO THE
CONTRACTOR.

0002 JEFFERSON PARISH CORRECTIQONAL = 150.00

150.00

CENTER 3

100 DOLHONDE STREET
GRETNA, LA 70053

250 GALLON EXTERIOR GREASE TRAP

150.00
0003 JEFFERSON PARISH GENERAL,

150.00

GOVERNMENT BUILDING

200 CERBIGNY STREET
GRETNA, LA 70053

220 GALLON GREASE TRAP

i:‘f '
0004 RIVARDE DETENTION CENTER ~ 740.00

750.00

1550 GRETNA 8LVD.
HARVEY, LA

6 FT U X4 FT W GREASE TRAP

150.00
0005 PARD PLAYGROUND

300.00

5185 EIGHTY ARPENT ROAD -
MARRERO, LA

250 GALLON GREASE TRAPS

0006 KINGS GRANT PLAYGROUND 150.00

150.00

3B0S 15TH STR'EET
HARVEY, LA
250 GALLON GREASE TRAP

r
0007 BELLE TERRE PLAYGROUND ‘_‘_1 <0 OO

150.00

$600 BELLE TERRE ROAD
MARRERO, LA
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continuaed
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SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UAIT PRICE
_JOTED

TOTALS |

10

11

12

13

14

e o ot St & b £+ e S0 e

—— . —— s

-

1.60

1,00

1.00

1.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY,

ONLY

ORLY

ONLY|

QNLY

250 GALLON GREASE TRAPS
~ 4008 JEFFERSON PARISH PARKS AND
RECREATION MAINTENANCE OFFICE

7437 LAPLACQ BLVD,
MARRERQ, LA

750 CALLON GREASE TRAP
0003 HARVEY PLAYGROUND
2240 ALAMO STREET
GRETNA, LA

250 GALLON GREASE TRAP
0010 RANDICAP FISHING PIER
(LOWER LAFITTE)

569 MARRERO AND 3RD STREET
LAFITTE, LA

250 GALLON GREASE TRAP
0011 MILEY PLAYGROUND
6715 WEST METAIRIE AVE.

METAIRIE, LA
METTING ROOM NO. 3

IN KITCHEN UNDER CABINETS UNDER SINK,

40 GALLON GREASE TRAP
1IGINWX24INLXIBIND

0012 METAIRIE PLAYGRCUND
1521 PALM STREET

METAIRIE, LA )

GYM KITCHEN AREA BETWEEN MEETING ROOMS

{1 AND 2

1ZINLX12INDX12INW
GREASE TRAPS

0043 NETAIRIE FLAYGROUND
1621 PALM STREEY

METAIRIE, LA

GOLOEN AGE BUILDING OUTSIDE OF
BUILDING

32N X 36 IN D ROUND

GREASE TRAP

0014 GIRARD PLAYGRQUND
S300 iRVING STRERY

187.50

150.00

150.00

150.00

150.00

| 160.00

_150.00

150.00

. 750.00

150,00

150.00

150.00
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; INVITATION YO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - contined
BID NO.; 50-00117516 SEALEDBID

¥

{

ITEM B :
NUMBER | QUANTITY | Ui OESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES | e cE TOTALS

METAIRIE, LA
] CUTSIDE CONCESSION STAND BY -
WEST ESPLANADE AVENUE o=

36 1N YW X 42 IN D ROUND
GREASE TRAPS

A SV

15 1.00] ONLY 0015 SOFTRALL COMPLEX 150.00 150.00
6328 SAINTS DRIVE -

METAIRIE, LA

CONCESSION STAND IN CABINET
J0LBS 16 INWX24WLX13IND
15 GPM GREASE TRAP

18 1.00]  oNLY 0016 DELTA PLAYGROUND 150.00 150.00
i B301 WEST METAIRIE AVE, -

METAIRIE, LA
40 LBS GREASE TRAP

17 1.00]  ONLY 0017 DRAKE PARK
800 DRAKE AVENUE

150.00 15C.00

WESTWEGO, LA
250 GALLON GREASE TRAP

18] 100 onLY 0018 LAFRENIERE PARK ) 160.00 150.00
3000 DOWNS BLVD. - :

| , METAIRIE, LA

! "CONCESSION STAND i
40 LBIGALLONS GREASE TRAPS

e

531

18 100/ ONLY 0019 HARVEY PLAYGROUND 1
2240 ALAMOD STREET - -

j HARVEY, LA 70058

.00 156.00

256 GALLON SPETIC TANK
20| - 100  ONLY Q020 HANDICAP FISHING PIER "53.00 i 150.00
" {LOWER LAFITTE}

449 MARRERO AND 3RD STREET
LAFITTE, LA

259 GALLON SPETIC TANK

2 1.00]  oNLY 0021 OWENS PLAYGROUND _7 50.00

" (OUTSIDE CONCESSION STAND)
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - cantinuesd

B0 NO.! 50-00117516 GIZALED BID

Page: )

i
ITER Y
NUMBER | QUANTITY | ums DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES UM PRICE TOTALS

11101 NEWTON STREET
RIVER RIDGE, LA 70123
e

40 L.BS. GREASE TRAP

22 1.00] ONLY (022 LEMON PLAYGROUND 150.00 - 150,00
{(FIELD CONCESSION STAND) - :

1111 SHREWSBERRY ROAD
JEFFERSON, LA 70121

40 L8S, GREASE TRAPS

23 100  owLY 0023 NICHOLSON FLAYGROUND 1£0.00 - 150.00
[CONCESSION STAND) " 3

7101 $1TH STREET
MARRERO, LA 70072

12INLX42IND 12iN2
GREASE TRAPS

24 100| ONLY 0024 OAKDALE PLAYGROUND _150.00 _150.00
(KITCHEN ROOM 103) - ;

850 WALL BLvD.
GRETNA, LA 70058

JOLBSIEINWZ2AWL XISIND
15 GMP GREASE TRAP

25 1.00] ONLY 0025 WOODMERE PLAYGROUND S
4100 GLEMERE DRIVE

HARVEY, LA 70058

BEHIND GYM BY GARAGE DOORS
SINLXS2INWXSFTD
1000 GALLON GREASE TRAP

50.
6 1.00{  ONLY 0026 JEFFERSON PLAYGROUND 150.00 150.00

4100 SOUTH DRIVE o
JEFFERSON, LA 70121 :

CONCESSION'STAND ON TRACK FIELD
L INWXI2IND
GREASE YRAP

150.00 150.00
“ 100/ ONLY 0027 JEFFERSON PLAYGROUND ,
411 SOUTH DRIVE e

JEFFERSON, LA 70121
J2INWX38IND
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BID NO.: 50-001175156

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continund

Pigs: 10

SHALED BID

ITEN
NUMBER

QUANTITY

Ui

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UrlIT PRICE
GUOTED

TOTALS

28

28

a0

31

3z

33

34

1.00

1.00

1.00

500

1.00

ONLY

ONLY

ONLY]

ONLY

GREASE TRAPS

0028 LASALLE PARK
§600 AIRLINE DRIVE
METAIRIE, LA 70003

CONCESSION STAND
TBINWX24WLXIBIND

0029 BRIGHT PLAYGROUND
(GYN CONCESSION S§TAND)

3401 CLEARY AVE,
METAIRIE, LA 70002

500 GALLON GREASE YRAP
0030 MULTIPURPOSE BUILDING
(INSIDE CONCESSION STAND}

8300 SAINTS DR,
METAIRIE, LA 70003

500 GALLON GREASE TRAPS

0031 WATER JETTING SERVICES
10 BE PERFORMED AT THE SAME TIME

GREASE TRAPS ARE SERVICED.

NOTE
VENDOR SHALL WATER JET TQ CLEAN THE
EXTERIOR RIVARDE KITCHEN SEWER LINES

DRAINING INTO THE EXTERIOR GREASE TRAP,

THIS 1S NEEDED TO ENSURE THAT THE
EXTERIOR SEWER LINES ARE NOT CLOGGED
WITH GREASE,

THE WATER JETTING SHALL BE PERFORMED
AT THE SAME TIME OF GREASE TRAP
PUMPED QUT CLEANED,

0032 WATER JETTING SERVICES
TO BE PERFORMWED AS A SEPARATE

CALLOUT

4 HOUR MIMINUM

0033 WATER JETTING SERVICES
PERFORMED AS A SPEARATE CALLOUT
AFTER A FOUR HOUR MINIMUM,

0034 EMERGENCY SERVICES
AFTER HOURS ON WEEKDAYS AND ALL

1£0.00

1£0:00

150.00

150.00

1£0.00

150.00

. o Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

. No Bid

i Ne Bid

485.00

!
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISK - continued
BID NO.j 50-00147514s SEALED BID
T TTUNITPRIC 7]
r;d,fgm QUANTITY | um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES ’22}0@;5 TOTALS

DAY ON SATURDAY AND SUNDAY.
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STANDARD INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS - BIDS UNDER $30k

All required insurance under this bid shall conform 1o Jeffarscn Parish Rasolution No, 113645
oriNo. 113647, as applicable. Contractors may not commence any work under any ensuing
contract unless and until all required insurance and associated gvidentizry requirements
thereto have been met, along with any additional specifications contained in the bid, Except as
where otherwise precluded by law, the Parish Attorney or his designee, with the concJrrence
oflthe Director of Risk Management or his designee, may agree on a casa-by-case bazig, to
deviate from Jefferson Parish's standard insurance requirements, as provided.in this Section.
Vendors requesting deviation therefrom shalt submit such requests in writing, along with
compelling substantiation, to the Purchasing Department prior to the bid’s due date. Any
changes to the insurance requirements will be reflected in the bid specifications and zddenda.
Prior to contract execution and at all times thereafter during the tarm of such contract,

' co:‘-ntractors must provide and continuously maintain all Coverages as recuired by the foregoing
Resolutions, and the contract documents. Failure to do so shall be grouneds for suspension,

dis!continuaﬁon ortermination of the contract.

‘

Folg bidding purpases, bidders must submit with bid submission  current (valid)

insurance certificate evidencing the required coverages, However, if a bidder has an file with
the} Purchasing Department a current (valid) insurance certificate that fulills the requirernents
in this document, then this will be accepted as evidence of same. Othervise, failure 10 submit
a current (valid) insurance certificate with bid submissicn or if no current {valid) insurance
certificate is on file, then the bid will be rejected. Final certificates shall rame the Jefierson
Patish, its Districts Depariments and Agencies under the direction of the Tarish FPresident and
the|Parish Council as additional insureds regarding negligenca by the contractor for e
Cor,nrnercia! General Liability and the Comprehensive Autornchile Lizbiity nolicies.
Additionally, said certificates should reflect the name of the Parish Dagariment receiving goods
andi services and reference the respective Jefferson Parish bid number.

{ JEFFERSON PARISH REQUIRED STANDARD INSUR ANCE
M  WORKER’S COMPENSATION INSURANCE

As required by Louisiana State Statute, exception; Empleyer's Lizbility, Section B shall
be $1,000.000 per occurrence when Work is to be over water znd involves marifime
exposures to cover all employees not covered under the State Worker's Compensetion
Act, otherwise this limit shall be no less than $500,000 per occurrense.

Note: If your company is not required by law to carry workmen's comg 2nsalion
insurance, i.e. not a Louisiana company, sole employee.of the company, then
bidders must request a workmen's compensation insurance daclaration afficlavit
prior to the bid opening date. This insurance declaration atficlavit mus| be fully
completed, signed, praperly notarized and submiited with she bid. A scanned
copy may be submitted with the bid; however, the successiu! bidder miust submit
the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon
contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the (i submission being
rejected as non-responsive. The Parish ressrves the right t¢ award b'd to the
next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in thie avent.

e B
11Pegs Revised § o0

N
@
[}
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t

M  COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Shall provide limits not less than the following: $1,000,000.00 Combined Sing 2 Limit
per Qccurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

&  COMPREHENSIVE AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Bodily injury liability $1,000,000.00 each person; $1,000,000.00 aach occurrer ze.
Property Darmage Liability $1,000,000.00 each occurrence. '

Note: This category may be omitted if bidders do not/will riot utilize company
vehicles for the project or do not possess company vehicies. Bidler must
request an automnobile insurance declaration affidavit prior to the bid opening
date. This insurance declaration affidavit musi be fully completed, signed,
properly notarized and submitted with the bid, A scanned cepy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid; however,
the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original fc -mat and
without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure o comply will result
in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the
right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this
event,

DEDUCTIBLES

Nc:\I insurance required shall include a deductible not greater than $10,000.00. The cost of the
deductible shall be borne by the contractor.

NOTE: If the vendor requires a change in deductibles, the request must be submitted in writing
to the Purchasing Department prior to the due date of the bid. Suzh request s -all be
reviewed by the Parish Attorney's Office with the concurrence of the Director cf Risk
Management.

UMBRELLA LIABILITY COVERAGE
An'umbrella policy or excess may be used to meet minimum requiremen's.

FOR CONSTRUCTION AND RENOVATION PROJECTS:
The following are required unless otherwise specified in the bid. Such insurance is d.e upon
contract execution.

1) QWNER’S PROTECTIVE LIABILITY

To be for the same limits of liability for bodily injury and property darmage liability
established for commercial general liability. ’

2) BUILDER'S RISK INSURANCE

The contractor shall maintain Builder's Risk Insurance at his own expense to insure
both the owner (Parsh of Jefferson) and contractor as their interest may appear.

A g 3
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JEFFERSON PARISH

Department of Purchasing

CHANGE TO JEFFERSON PARISH BIDDING PROCEDURES

Effective August 15 bidders will be required to submit certain documentation with bid
submission, i.e. affidavits, proof of insurance, etc. These requirements will be outlined
specifically in the instructions of each bid package. Bidders should carzfully read and must
respand accordingly per the requirements of the bid packages.

These changes are pursuant Louisiana Public Bid Law more specifically, Act 206 of the
2016 Louisiana Legislative Regular Session. For the purposes of this co mmunication, this
change applies ta Jefferson Parish Government bid solicitations only. Formore
information, please call Jefferson Parish Purchasing at 504-364-2678.

Genee gl Goveramzar idc, ~ 200 Oardizey $1 - Sube 4368 - Gredng, LA TCOR3
Ollize 5110 383.3618 ~ Fox 504.360,5553

Email Burchasingfiefparish nep Wabgite: vhee feERsnish net

ichael 8, Yenni . "o Breada I Campos
Parish President 03 zetor
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@RD@ CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITV INAUSANAE J DATE HHo0fr Y}

THIS CERTIFICATE I3 ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND GONFERS NO RIGHTS UPQK THE CERTIFICA'TE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED 8Y THE POLICIES
BELOW, THIS CERTIFIGATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A GONTRAGT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(3), AUTHORIZED

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

MPORTANT: If the ceftificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(les) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION I8 \WAIVED, subject to
the tarms and conditions of tha polley, certain policies mey require an sndorsement. A staterient on this certificate doss not tonfer rights to the

cortlflcate holder in lieu of such endorsement{s).

GONTAGT
FRODUCER A

Massh USA, Ine. At T

Alln: Eivira Bord - dallas.certs@marsh.cont L Extl; ieN, L

4400 Cameriza Bank Towar j’&‘_\“ﬁ‘_&

717 Méin Strast — -

Dafias, TX 752017957 INSURER(S) AFFORDING GOVERAGE RAIC #
016016-LES-STD-15-18 NA Mo inguRER 4 ; Groenvizh nsurence Company 232 —
INSURED . INSURER g « AL Speciaity lnsurarice Coimpay 37888

ﬁfmﬁ? gzn;ntai Sclstore NSYRER ¢ ; St Indemnlly & Liebility Company 16318

7]:3%1 E%N‘;sﬁo%uslevard, Suta 200 INSURBR D :

o INSURERE :
INSUREX P
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: HOU-0024580884-04 RIEZVISION NUMBER; U

THIG IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD

INDICATED, NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOGL
CERTIFICATE MAY SE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE FOLICIES DESCRIBED HE

T WITH RESPICT TO WHICH THIS
i 18 SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,

EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REQUCED BY PAID CLAIME.

TR TYPE OF INSURANCE ot vy POLICY NUMBER (ﬁg_i%% X (ﬁw:'atééwm VIS -
A | X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY GEC3000895 HOBR0E  {11i067016 EACH DCGURRENGE 3 1,060,000
TOALSE TORENTED
| Clams-MAGE OCCUR | PARIAES (Ea ponirence) )3 30090
MED 2X- (Any onsoersin) | $ 500
] | PIREONAL & ADVINJURY | § 1,000,000
GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES FER: GENERAL AGGREGATE 3 2000000
soucy | X 5% (oe PRCIAICTS - COMPOP AGE: | § 2,000,000
{ oTHER: g e :
B | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY AECH046831 f1Kenots [{10612616 _&P“’%?‘N&E“MET s 1,000 500
T ANY AUTO BLOLY INJURY (Porpersen} | S
T ALL QWNED SCHEDULED npvI "
| AUTCS AUTOS jCﬂD PHIURY (Per Eﬁrl s
NON-OWNED B Y DANATE <
|| HirReD AUTO3 AUTOS | G ‘any
$
UMBRELLALIAE | | oecur EACH DLOURRENGE s
EXCESS Lia CLAIMS-MADE AGGHECATE §
DED [ RETENTION $ - 3
 |WORKERS COMPENSATION 160 0001284.02 TI06E01S  [11.082018 I l 3%*5!,“5 i I%H'
AND EMPLOYERS* LIABILITY YIN et L
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNERERECUTIVE EL § A ACCIDENT $ 1.000.00
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED? NiA oo -
{Mandatory In NH) | £ L ISEASE « BA EMPLOYET § 1,000,000
11 Y8, dasenibe ung
B PTION BF GPERATIONS beloy £ ( IIGEASE . POLIGY LT | 3 10000

DESCRIPTION OF ORERATIONS [ LOCATIONS f VEHICLES {ACORD 101, Additlonal Remarks Scheduls, may bs allached If moTe 3pacs is required}

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION
Liguls Environmental Solulioas SHOULD ANY GF THE ABOVE DEGCH [BED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
Cosporalion, el af THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREG:® NOTICE WLl BE DELIVERED 1
7851 Esters Boulevard, Sulle 200 ACCCGRDANCE WITHK THE POLICY PR DVISIONS,
irving, TX 75083
AUTHORIZED REPANSENTATIVE
of Marsh USA Ine.
| Manashi Mukherjze B nviwioieh LYol e Fet
@ 1988.2044 ACORD CURPORATION, All rights reserved,
AGCOQRD 25 (2014/01) The AGORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD
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Ranuact for Tavpavar | ilve Form o the
B e oo Traamy identification Number and Certification send to the JRS.
Internat Reverue Servica

1 Nams (a3 shown on your income tax return). Nams Is tequirad on this Jine; do not leave this line blank.

LIQUID ENVIRONMENTAL SOLUTIONS OF TEXAS, LLC

2 Businesa name/disregarded entity neme, if differant from above
LIQUD ENVIRONMENTAL SOLUTIONS

[ ndividuaVsote propriater or L] & corporation

single-memper LLC

8 Check appropriats box for federal tax cigasification; check only one of the fallowing seven boxes:
[ s corporation  [1 pannarsnip

4 Exsmptichs (codas apply only to
. ) certain antitias, not individuals; tsa
[ Tretre tats | jnatuetions a7 page 3):

&

o

o

2

c

&
o 2

) mipt pay e code (1 an

g % Limited liability company. Enter the tax classificatlon (G=C corporation, 8=8 comparation, P=pattnershig) - € Exertp _p >_ (Z (S
82 Note, For a single-member LLG that is distagardad, do not eheck LLC; ehack the appropriata bax in the fins sbo: e for | Xe0PLon fom FATCA reporing
] the tax classification of the single-member owner. couq (f any) o
= -‘5) 7] Gther (zee Instructions) = {Appitas 10 poeona mentateed optalds Gne 32}

% 5 Address {numbar, stres, and api. or suite no) Reguestors nemne and zddrass ‘oplions)

& |PO BOX 733372

Y I8 Gity. state, and 1P code

o

w |DALLAS, TX 75373-3372

7 List account numbet(s) here (oplictial)

Taxpayer ldentification Number (TIN})

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box, The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, thig is generally your secial securlty number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, scle proprietor, or digregarded sntity, sem the Part | Insknuctions on page 3. For ather
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If ypa do not have a number, see How fo gsta

TIN on page 3.

Note. If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for fine 1 and the chart on page 4 for |0 plyer identifioatic-1 nusmber ]

guidelines on whose number fo enter.

| £c sint security aumbr ]

L

or

iy Pre—

T]E] -1 1] &1 3141013]5

I Certification

Under penaities of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct tgxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number £ b lasued to me); and

2. larn not subjact to backup withholding because: (a) | am exemps; from backup withholding, or () | have net bean notified vy & Intarmal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a rasult of a failure to report afl interest or dividend 1, cr () the IRS kas notifled me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. lam a U.8. citizen or other U.S. parson (dafined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this farm {if any) Indleating that | am exempt from FATCA reporiing s comsed.

Certification instructions, You must erass out item 2 above If you have been notified by the IRS that you ere surrently sublect to backup withholding
because you have failed to report all interest and dividands on your tax return, For reg! egtate trapasctions, te: 1 2 does not apply. For mortgage
intsrest paid, acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an indivic sa! retirement aangemnent (IRA), ans
generglly, payments other than interest and dividends, you are not required to 2lgn the certifleation, but you m 15t provide vour correct TIN, Sae the

instructions on page 3.

Slgn Stgnature of
Here U.S. persan =

f/ ‘—Lﬁ»ﬂv/é_.)%««‘;

General Instructions

8aection raferences are to the internal Revenue Code unless otherwise noted,

Future developmants. Information about developmants affecting Form W-8 {such
as legislation enanted afler wa releese It} Is al www.re.gov/iwg.

Purpoase of Form

Anindividual or antity {Form W-8 requestet) who is required 1o 4ito an information
raturn with the IRS must obtain your corect taxpeyer identification numbar (TIN}
which may be your sceial security number (SSN), individual taxpayer Identification
numbar {ITIt), adoption taxpayer idantification nurmber (ATIN), or employer
Identification number {EIN), o report on an information relum the amoun! pald to
you, or ather amount raportable on an information return. Examples of inforrnation
retumns includs, but ére not limited to, the following:

* Form T089-INT {nterast earned or paid)

+ Form 1038-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual funds)

* Form 1098-MIEG {varicus types of income, prizes, awards, of gross procesds)

+ Form 10889-8 {atock or mutual fund sales and ceHaln other transselions by
brokars)

* Foyrn 1099-8 [procesds from real eatate tranzactions)

* Form 1098-K {merchant card and third pany network ttansactions)

Dpta > ( f/ /ﬂ/ ;;_2’_‘5‘ fé;_

7
* Form 1088 homs morigags intere st 1098-E (student isan interest), 1088-T
{luition)

» Form 1089-C {saneeled debs)
» Fonm 1099-A [aequisiden or abene onment of sesured croperty)

Usa Fam W-3 anly Jf yeu ave & U 3. person (Including :2 rasldant atlan), to
provide your corvast TIH.

ifyou do nct retum Form V-9 to e caquester with & TIN, yau right be suliiset
to backip withhoicing. Sas Wha: [z ackup withholding” on'pags 2.
By stening the filed-out fonn, 1ou

1. Certify that the TIN you ar vl 13 ix vorrect (or you are walling for s pumtar
1o be Issusd),

2. Centlty that yeu are not sublact to backup withhalciag. or

3, Clalm sxemmption from back ip * dthholding If vou a2 a U.S. exempt payes. it
apphicable, vou are aluo eertifing that =2 a U8, parson, vour allecabie share of
any partnership Income frotm a ALS, rade or business is nol sublect o the
withholding tex on forsign pariners' shevs of sffectively cannacted insane, ard

4, Gertify that FATCA gatle{s) ente rect on this Torm (it ¢yl Indlcating that you ars
exempt from the FATCA reporting. i3 carrect. See What fs FATCA raperting® on
page 2 for furthsr information.

Cat. No, 10231X

zorm W8 ey, 12-2014)
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ACEE?) CERTIFICATE OF LIADRILITV INSURAN AL DATE (ADDAYY}

THIS CERTIFICATE 1S ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS U2V THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER, THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVIRAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NDT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE SSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holdar Is an ADDITIONAL INSURER, the pollsy(lss) must bs endorsad. I SIBROGATION 1S WAIVED, subject (o
the terms and conditions of the polley, cettein policles may require an ondorsement. A statemant on this ce riificate doss not corfer rights fo tha
certificate holder in lleu of such endorsement|(s).

eRODUCER CORTACT
Marsh USA, lee. O l T
A{m Elvlta Bond - dallss.carts@marsh.com LING. Mo, Exfl; A3, Moy
Cormeriea Sank Towar E(%ML
1717 #aln Slres!
Dalfes, TX 75201-7357 INSUTER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
016016-LES-STD-15-16 NIA No ) SURER A - Creenvith Insurances Compaty 22322
. XL Smaci { L . 37885
REDLiqu‘:i Ermimmentst Sohrgone INsurer @ : M Spacially Vmsumcsl Campeny
Corparation, el 3l inguRER ¢ ; Sl indemniy & Lisblity Compary 38318
7851 Eglérs Boulevard, Suite 200 .
irving, TX 75083 INSURER D ¢
INSURER E :
'NSURER P ;
COVERAGES GERTIFICATE NUMBER: HOU-002459884-04  REVISION NUMBER: ‘¢

THIS 18 TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSUREL N\ MED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTAKNDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT CR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESFECY TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY FERTAIN, THE INSURANGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEYEIN 1S SUBJECT 70 ALL THE TERME,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REOUGED 8Y PAID CLAIME,

OOt
A TYPE OF INSURANCE NS FOLICY NUMBER e LS .
A | X | COMMERGIAL GENERAL LIABILITY GEC2000995 00R05 06018 | ks ecourRENGE s 1000000
| GLAmSMADE OCCUR -zr:'ﬁé£ @ég {Ea cccfﬂnca s 30000
| HED BXP {Any one parson) | § 26,000
:j | PERIONAL S ADVINIURY | s 1030600
| GENL AGGREGATE LIMIT ARPUIES PER; | GEEN (RAL AGGREGATE 5 205000
|| PoucY . 5EG . Loc | FRE JUCTS -COMRIOPATS | $ 203,000
STHER: ]
B | AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY RECOD¥6601 IR [VOETe | Lo S SNGCE TR 1,000,000
X 1wy aura LY i URY (Parpason. 1§
B 'le?gswna: %?gg‘a"-io _ggg ;Y:N.»UF.‘Y {Fer geaor) | §
HIRED ALUTOS AUTGS R 3
3
UMBRELLA LIAB 6COLR A% QOCURRENCE 3
EXCE3s Liag —T CLAMS-MACE GG ECATE $
peo || permnrions . s
C |WORKERS COMPENSATION 100 000128402 TGRS (RS i i? e| BT
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN |- L ELATUT R -
ANY FROPRIETORPARTNEREXECUTIVE E L. [ACH ACCIDENT 3 1,000,20¢
OFFICERMEMBER EXOLUBED? [ ]iwsa =
‘('l'ﬁand;loty_a NH& | €. (ISEASE « EA EIPLOYEE § 1,006,50¢
Ve — .
|DESCRIPTION GF OPERATIONS below £.L. ISEASE . FOLICY Ml | § 1,006,500
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OFFICE OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
Water Permits Division

Approval of Sewage Sludge Transporter Hzgistration

JGT Acquisition Company LLC
2350 Crestview Ave
Kenner, LA 70062

Sewage Sludge Hauler Identification Number: H-111
Agency Interest Number: §2008
TEMPOQ Activity Number: REG20150001

to tramsport sewage sludge in accordance with Registration Requirements and Standards for
Transporters of Sewage Sludge set forth in the Louisiana Administrative Code, Title 33, Part IX,
Subpart 3, Section 7301. F.

Failure to comply with the requirements of LAC 33:IX.7301.F will result in revocation of
authml"ization to transport sewage sludge.

I\‘Iodii?caﬁons to the transporter registration must be reported to the Office of Environmental
Services, Water Permits Division at the address on the preceding page. idodifications include, but
are not limited to changes to receiving/disposal facilities and vehicles,

All registered transporters shall submit a renewal registration on or before Mav 1, 2016.

This authorization to haul sewage sludge shall become effective on Qctober 3, 2013.

The 2athorization to haul sewage sludge shall expire on June 30, 2016.

Issued on October 5, 2015

4

Scott Guilliams, Administrator

GALYEZ BUILDING + 602 N, FIFTH STREET - P.0. BON 4313 ~ BATON ROUGE. LA 08213315 » PHONE (215) 219-3181




