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Jefferson
Parish

State of Louisiana

Bid Number 50-00146780

Purchase of Miscellaneous Stock Items for the
West Bank Public Works Warehouse

BID DUE: December 5, 2024 AT 11:00 AM

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions

in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and

General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received on the Purchasing
Department’s eProcurement site, www.jeffparishbids.net, by the bid due date

and time. Late bids will not be accepted.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Purchasing Specialist Il, Mark Buttery
Email: Mark.Buttery@ijeffparish.gov
Phone: 504-364-2810




INVITATION TO BID Page: 1

DATE: 11/21/2024 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
BID NO.: 50-00146780 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0.BOX9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

PURCHASING SPECIALIST:
VENDOR: Mark Buttery@jeffparish.gov

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 12/05/2024 via online at www.jeffparishbids.net.

LATE BIDS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED

NOTE: ONLY BIDS WRITTEN IN iIN¥ OR TYPEWRITTEN, AND PROPERLY SIGNED BY A MEMBER OF THE FIRM OR AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE, WILL BE ACCEPTED. PENCIL AND/OR PHOTOSTATIC FIGURES OR SIGNATURES SHALL RESULT IN
BID REJECTION. HOWEVER, ELECTRONIC SIGNATURES AS DEFINED IN L3A - R.S. 9:2602(8) ARE ACCEPTABLE.
\?\;?FNA;URSEUEHISSTS?OENA SECURED DIGITAL SIGNATURE AND MUST PROVIDE PROOF OF THE SECURED SIGNATURE
H 8ID .

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general conditions and any special conditions and specifications contained herein, all of which
are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in
compliance with the Jeffersen Parish Cade of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethicai standards and Jefferson Parish
Resoiution No. 136353 as amended. A copy of these resolutions may be obtained from the Office of the Panish Clerk, Suite 6700, Jefferson Parish
General Gavernment Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gratna, LA 70053, You may also obtain a copy by visiting the

Purchasing Department webpage at http Zhwww. jefiparish govi464/Purchasing and clicking on On-tine farms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Pansh vendor if not already vet registered. Registration forms may be downtoaded from
hitp:ifwww.jeffparish.govi464/Purchasing and by clicking on Vendor Information. Current W-8 forms with respective Tax identification numbers and
venyor applications may be submitted at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or a current W-b form is not on fite, vandor registration
is mandatory. Vendors may experience a delay in payment if your company is not a registered vendor with Jefferson Parish.

Jaffersan Parish is exempt from paying sales tax under LSA-R.S. 47:301 (B)(c). All prices for purchases by Jefferson Parish of supplies and materials
shall be quoted in the unit of measure specified ang unless otherwise specified, shall be exclusive of state and local taxes. The price quoted for work
shall be stated in figures. In the gvent there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit price shall prevail. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B.
Deliversd, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Deparment. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID ONLY FROM
EACH VENDOR. ltems bid must meet specifications, JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for each item unless otherwise indicated. Two or more
prices for one item will result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete and retumn the associated
fine item pricing forms as indicated. The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in unit prices and totals, the unit

prices shalt prevail

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts or place orders on a lump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its
judgment be in the best interest of JEEFERSCN PARISH. Every contract or order shalf be awarded ta the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER, taking Into consideration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY AND/QR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submit bids in response to this solicitation may protest ann element of the procurement, in writing to the Director of
the Purchasing Department. Written g_rotest must be received within 48 hours of the release of the bid tabulation by the Purchasing Department. After
consultation, the Parish Attorney's Office will then respend to protests in wiiting. (For more information, please see Chapter 2, Article VU, Division 2, Sec.
2.914.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.)

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all ar any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage:
unless specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any
time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires all products to be new (current) and all work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless
otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts wili be acceptec. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materiale must have at least one {4) year
guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on
the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Regquirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be held to aliow bidders the
opportunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek furthar clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will
issue a written response to bidders’ guestions in the form of an Addendurm.

Al formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder by the bidder placing the Addendum number in the appropriate
section. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause the bid to be rejected: JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid
to next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are spacified, it is for the purpose of
establishing certain minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and
stock numbers are specified. Complete product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.
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INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or activity, any
person in the United States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age
Discrimination Act of 1975, or with respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the
Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except that any exemption from such prohibition against discrimination on the
basis of refigion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title Vi and VIl of the Act of Aprif 11, 1968, shall also apply. This
assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final handicapped discrimination
provisions contained in Section 51.55 (¢}, (d), (e), and (k)(5) of the Regulations. New construction or renovation projects must

comply with Section 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard institute’s
specifications (ANS| Al 17.1-1961).

Jefferson Parish and its partners as the recipients of federal funds are fully committed to awarding a contract(s} to firm(s) that will
provide high guality services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly
encourages the involvement of minority and/or woman-owned business enterprises {DBE's, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE’s) to
stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.

1. Al bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212(1}, all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective

bidder who fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

2. Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed at the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required to complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additional cost to the owner.

3. Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Department of Building Permits.
Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH Department of Building Parmits.
The contractor shall be responsible far the payment of these permits. Al permits must be obtained prior to the start
of the project. Contractor must also hold any and atl applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall be
responsible for the payment of these permits and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

4 A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
nurmber will be shown on the cutside of the bid electronic envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be
rejected. When submitting the bid electronically, the license number must be enterad in the appropriate field in the
electronic procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.



DATE:

BID NO.: 50-00146780

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

16.

11/21/2024
Page: 3
INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

It is the bidder's responsibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submitting a bid.

_ Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daily and upon completion of the cortract. Passageways must be kept

clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material must be removed from the job site daily
because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Precaution must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of
JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards far public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal contract which shall be
recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A
price list of recordation costs may be obtained from the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of
Jefferson. Ali awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in
the bid specifications, the perfarmance bond requirements shalt be 100% of the contract price. Uniess otherwise state in the bid
specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of the contract price. Both bonds shall be supplied at the signing
of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the
contract price uniess ofherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be 100% of the
contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be supplied at the signing of the
contract.

All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached "Standard Insurance Requirements” sheet attached to this
bid solicitation. Any déviation from the Standard Insurance Requirements must be requested in writing prior to bid opening.
Whritten approval for any deviation, must be submitted with your bid submission. Failure to comply with this instruction will result
in bid rejection.

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amaunt of 5% of the total bid, unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. All sureties must be in original format (no copies). When submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an
electronic bid bond through the respective online clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid
solicitation on Gentral Auction House. No scanned paper copies of any bid bond will be accepted as part of the electronic bid
submission.

This is an as needed basis contract. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no representations on warranties with regard to minimum
guaranteed quantities uniess otherwise stated in the bid specifications.

Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. If not guoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be quoted as a
separaie item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not indicated on bid form,

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-§23.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits,
including: Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and
E-Verify Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitied PUBLIC WORKS
BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant
and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be
submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its onginal format and without material
attaration upan contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The
Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Complated, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. Forthe convenience of vendors, all affidavits have
heen combined into one form entifed NON PUBLIC WORKS BID AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original
format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of
the complated, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with tha bid, however, the successful biddar must
submit the criginal affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will

result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest
responsive and responsible bidder in this event.
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INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/er Federal funding/reimbursement.
As such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All
applicable certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted as per the appendix instructions. Failure to submit
applicable certifications as per the appendix instructions will result in bid rejection.

17. For this project, the Contractar shall not pay any state or local sales or use taxes on materials and equipment which are
affixed and made part of the immovable property of the project or which is permanently incorporated in the project (hereinafter
referred to as "applicable materials and equipment”). All purchases of applicable materials or equipment shall be made by the
contractar on behalf of and as the agent of Jefferson Parish (Owner), a palitical subdivision of the State of Louisiana. No state and
local sales and use taxes are owed on applicable materials and equipment under the provisions of Act 1029 of the 1991 Regular
Session - Louisiana Revised Statute 47:301(8){c). Owner will furnish to contractor a certificate form which certifies that Owner is
not required to pay such state or local sales and use taxes, and cantractor shail furnish a copy of such certificate to all vendors or
suppliers of the applicable materials and equipment, and report to Owner the amount of taxes not incurred.

It shail be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcentractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Cede of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.
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BID NO.: 50-00146780 JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.0O.BOX9
GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009

504-364-2678
VENDOR: TRITON HYDROTOOLS, LLC PURGHQSBISTGTEEEC*ALISP

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Guotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or Jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the

Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 2-3 DAYS ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIiME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** Al | BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:
TRITCN HYDROTQOOLS, LLC

SIGNATURE: TITLE:

(Must be signed here) %’MM SALES MANAGER

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
DAVID BRADFORD

ADDRESS:
11210 S. CHOCTAWDR
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
BATON ROUGE, LA 70815
TELEPHONE: FAX:
BOO 1633-7696 { IN/A
EMAIL ADDRESS:

dhradford@tritonhydrotools.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § 51600
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INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 8

SEALED EID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION QF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

6.00

4.00

4.00

4.00

4.00

15.00

5.00

15.00

2.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

Purchase of Miscellaneous Stock items
for the West Bank Public Works Warehouse

0001 - FUSE, DUAL ELEMENT, TIME DELAY,
100 AMPERES, 600 VAC, CLASS RK5,

FUSETRON NO. FRS-R-100
SK NUMBER 00-0855630

0002 - GAUGE, PRESSURE, 0-30, PS,
2.5IN. FACE, 1/4 IN. MPT BOTTOM

CONNECTION, BLACK ENAMEL STEEL
CASE
SK NUMBER 00-0695100

0003 - WALLPLATE, SWITCH, SINGLE
TOGGLE, STAINLESS STEEL

SK NUMBER 00-0880820

0004 - NOZZLE, SEWER, 3/4 IN. RADIAL
VORTEX, 6 REAR JETS AT 18/24DEG, 1
FORWARD JET, 30 GPM, 3000PSI

SHAMROCK NO. 32-18-ELF
SK NUMBER 00-0303670

0005 - U-BOLT, NO. 316 STAINLESS
STEEL, WITH TOP PLATE, BACKING
PLATE, AND NUTS 5/16 IN. DJA. X

172 IN.TWX 2-3M6IN. T L
SK NUMBER 00-027176E

0006 - STRAP, 1-HOLE, STEEL, FOR

1-1/4 IN. EMT CONDUIT

SK NUMBER 00-0879920

0007 - ADAPTER, MALE, PVC, SCHEDULE 80,
1IN., FEMALE SOCKET X MALE PIPE
THREAD (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS

ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE}
SK NUMBER 00-0690920

0008 - BELT, NO. 3VX400, GATES
SUPER HC
SK NUMBER 000041300

0009 - REDUCER, CONCENTRIC, 6 INCH X
4 INCH, FLANGED, SEWERAGE ONLY ISSUE,

s NOBID

$ NOBID

NO BID

$79.00

NO BID

g NO BID

¢ NOBID

s NOBID

NO BID
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BID NO.: 50-00146780

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 7

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIFTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

13

16

17

2.00

3.00

5.00

200.00

4.00

50.00

3.00

2.00

EA

EA

LF

EA

EA

EA

EA

DUCTILE IRON WITH PROTECTO 401

CERAMIC EPOXY INTERIOR COATING/LINING,

FACTORY ASPHALTIC EXTERIOR COATING
SK NUMBER 00-009103A

0010 - REDUCER, BELL, GALVANIZED,
2iNCH X 1-1/2 INCH, SCHEDULE 40,
FASTENAL NO. 66559

SK NUMBER 00-0293400

0011 - ELBOW, GALVANIZED, SCHEDULE 40,
DOMESTIC, 90 DEGREE, 1/8 IN.

SK NUMBER 00-0281740

0012 - STRAP, 2-HOLE, STEEL, FOR 2 IN.
RIGID CONDUIT. APPLETON NQ. CL-200,
MINERALLAC NO. 290

SK NUMBER 00-0880140

0043 - PIPE, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 4 INCH X
20 FOOT LONG, PLAIN ENDS, ELECTRICAL
CONDUIT IS NOT ACCEPTABLE

SK NUMBER 00-0691130

0014 - BELT, NO. C-99, BROWNING
SUPER GRIP

SK NUMBER 00-00423000

0015 - SCREW, MACHINE ROUND HEAD,
SLOTTED, ND. 18-8 STAINLESS STEEL,
10-32 X 3/4 IN.

SK NUMBER 00-0423610

0016 - MONITOR, PHASE AND VOLTAGE,
430-480 VOLT ADJUSTABLE, DIVERSIFIED

ELECTRONICS NO. SLA-440-ALE
SK NUMBER 00-0854400

0017 - BELTS, GATES NO. 3VXE30
SK NUMBER 00-0642870

DELIVER TO:
PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE
1500 RIVER PARK ROAD
BRIDGE CITY, LA 70094

s NO BID

NO BID

g NO BID

g NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

4 NO BID




