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INVITATION TO BID Page: 1

DATE: 11/13/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
BID NO.: 50.00124838 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O.BOX S

GRETNA, LA. 7G054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BUYER: MBUTTERY@jeffparish.net

Bids will be received until 11:00 AM, 11/20/2018 via online at www.jeffparishbids.net or by hand delivery, USPS mail or other
courier service to Purchasing Department, 200 Derbigny Street {(Genaral Government Building), Suite 4400, Gretna, LA
70053. For convenience, bidders may also submit bids in the East Bank Purchasing Department, Suite 404, Jefferson
Parish Joseph S. Yenni Building, 1221 Eimwood Park Blvd., Jefferson LA 70123, However, If submitting bids on the day

of bid opening, bidders must submit at the West Bank location only,

All bids submitted are subject to these instructions and general ¢onditions and any special conditions and specifications contained
herein, ail of which are made part of this bid proposal reference. By submitting a bid, vendor agrees to comply with all

provisions of Louisiana Law, as well be in compliance with the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances, Louisiana Code of

Ethics, applicable Jefferson Parish ethical standards and Jefferson Parish Resclution No. 113646 and/or Resolution

No. 113647, A copy of these reselutions may be ghtained from the Office of the Parish Clerk, Suite 6700,

Jefferson Parish General Government Building, 200 Derbigny Street, Gretna, LA 70053, You may also obtain 2 copy by visiting the
Purchasing Department webpage at purchasing.Jeffparish.net and clicking on On-line forms.

All vendors submitting bids should register as a Jefferson Parish vendor if not already yet registered, Registration forms may be
dowrloaded from http://purchasing jeffparish.net and by clicking on Vendor Infermation. Current W-9 forms with respective Tax
identification numbers and vendor applications may be submitied at any time; however, if your company is not registered and/or
a current W-9 form is not on file, vendor registration is mandatory. Further, a cusrent W-3 ferm and respective Tax Identification
number must be supplied upon contract execution, should you be awarded a contract and/or issued purchase order, Failure to do
s0 may result in delay of payment.

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et saq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quetations shall be
based on F.O.B. Delivered, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department. JEFFERSON PARISH WILL ACCEPT ONE BID
ONLY FROM EACH VENDOR. jtemns bid must meet specifications. JEFFERSON PARISH will accept one price for @ach item unless otherwise
indicated. Two or more prices for ane iterm wili result in bid rejection. Bidders are required to complete, sign and return the bid form and/or complete
and return the associated ling item pricing forms as indicated, The price quoted for work shall be stated in figures. In the event there is a difference in
unit prices and totals, the unit prices shalk prevail.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award contracts of place orders on a Jump sum or individual item basis, or such combination, as shall in its
judgment be in the best interest of JEFFERSON PARISH. Every contract or order shall be awarded to the LOWEST RESPONSIVE and RESPONSIBLE
BIDDER, taking inle consiceration the CONFORMITY WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS and the DELIVERY ANB/OR COMPLETION DATE

PROTESTS: Only those vendors that submitted a bid in response to this solicitation may submit a protest in writing to the Director of the Purchasing
within 48 hours of bid opening. The Purchasing Director will review it in connection with the Parish Attorney's Office as appropriate and a written
response will be provided as soon as possible.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptlﬁt. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage
uniess specified in the quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cance! at any
time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH requires afl products to be new (current) and alt work must be performed according to standard practices for the project. Unless
otherwise specified, no aftermarket parts will be accepled. Unless otherwise specified, all workmanship and materials must have at least one (1) year
guaranty, in writing, from the date of delivery and/or acceptance of the project. Any deviations or alteration from the spaecifications must be indicated on
the big form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Depariment.

If this bid requires a pre-bid conference (see Additional Requirements section), bidders are advised that such conference will be heid to allow bidders the
opporiunity to identify any discrepancies in the bid specifications and seek further clarification regarding instructions. The Purchasing Department will
issue a written response to bidders’ questions in the form of an Addendum.

All formal Addenda require written acknowledgment on the bid form by the bidder. Failure to acknowledge an Addendum on the bid form shall cause
the bid to be rejected; JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to award bid to next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

USE OF BRAND NAMES AND STOCK NUMBERS: Where brand names and stock numbers are specified, it is for the purpose of eslablishing certain
minimum standards of quality. Bids may be submitted for products of equal quality, provided brand names and stock numbers are specified. Complete
product data may be required prior to award.

Quantities listed are for bidding purposes only. Actual requirements may be more or less than quantities listed.

Bidders are not to exclude from participation in, deny the benefits of, or subject to discrimination under any program or aclivity, any person in the United
States on the grounds of race, color, national origin, or sex; nor discriminate on the basis of age under the Age Discrimination Act of 1975, or with
respect to an otherwise qualified handicapped individual as provided in Section 504 of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, or on the basis of religion, except
that any exernption from such prohibition against discrimination on the basis of religion as provided in the Civil Rights Act of 1964, or Title V1 and VIl of
the Act of April 11, 1968, shall also apply. This assurance includes compliance with the administrative requirements of the Revenue Sharing final
handicapped discrimination provisions contained in Saction 51.55 {c), (d), (e}, and (k)(5} of the Regulations. New conastruction or renovation projects
?Xﬁé zagrﬁryp_{[yy;t:;ﬁ?)ecﬂon 504 of the 1973 Rehabilitation Act, as amended, in accordance with the American National Standard Institute’s specifications

Jefferson Parish and its pariners as the recipients of federal funds are fully commitied to awarding a contract(s) to firm(s} that will provide high quality
services and that are dedicated to diversity and to containing costs. Thus, Jefferson Parish strongly encourages the involvement of minority and/or
woman-owned business enterprises (DBE's, including MBE's, WBE's and SBE's) to stimulate participation in procurement and assistance programs.



DATE:

11113/2018

Page: 2

BID NQ.: 50-00124838

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE REGULATIONS JEFFERSON PARISH OFFERS ELECTRONIC PROCUREMENT

TO ALL VENDORS

This electronic procurement system allows vendors the convenience of reviewing and submitting bids online.
This is a secure site and authorized personnel have limited read access only. Bidders are encouraged to
submit electronically using this free service; while the website accepts various file types, one single PDF file
containing all appropriate and required bid documents is preferred. Bidders submitting uploaded images of
bid responses are solely responsible for clarity. If uploaded images/documents are not legible, then bidder's
submission will be rejected. Please note all requirements contained in this bid package for electronic bid

submission.

Please visit our E-Procurement Page at www jeffparishbids,net to register and view Jefferson Parish

solicitations. For more information, please visit the Purchasing Department page at
http:flpurchasing jeffparish.net,

ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR THIS BID

PLEASE MATCH THE NUMBERS PRINTED IN THIS BOX WITH THE
CORRESPONDING INSTRUCTIONS BELOW.

13

All bidders must attend the MANDATORY pre-bid conference and will be required to sign in and out as evidence of
attendance. In accordance with LSA R.S. 38:2212()), all prospective bidders shall be present at the beginning of the
MANDATORY pre-bid conference and shall remain in attendance for the duration of the conference. Any prospective
bidgiertwho fails to attend the conference or remain for the duration shall be prohibited from submitting a bid for the
project.

Attendance to this pre-bid conference is optional. However, failure to attend the pre-bid conference shall not
relieve the bidder of responsibility for information discussed ai the conference. Furthermore, failure to attend
the pre-bid conference and inspection does not relieve the successful bidder from the necessity of furnishing
materials or performing any work that may be required te complete the work in accordance with the specification
with no additionai cost to the owner.

Contractor must hold current applicable JEFFERSON PARISH licenses with the Departiment of Inspection and
Code Enforcement. Contractor shall obtain any and all permits required by the JEFFERSON PARISH
Depantment of Inspection and Code Enforcement. The contractor shall be responsible for the payment of
these permits. All permits must be obtained prior to the start of the project. Contractor must also hold any

and all applicable Federal and State licenses. Contractor shall he responsible for the payment of these permits
and shall obtain them prior to the start of the project.

A LA State Contractor's License will be required in accordance with LSA R.S. 37-2150 et. seq. and such license
number will be shown on the outside of the bid envelope. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.
Additionally if submitting the bid electronically, then the license number must be entered in the appropriate field
in the Electronic Procurement system. Failure to comply will cause the bid to be rejected.

It is the bidder's respansibility to visit the job site and evaluate the job before submilting a bid,

Job site must be clean and free of all litter and debris daify and upon completion of the contract.

Passageways must be kept clean and free of material, equipment, and debris at all times. Flammable material
must be removed from the job site daily because storage will not be permitted on the premises. Frecautions
must be exercised at all times to safeguard the welfare of JEFFERSON PARISH and the general public.



DATE: 11/13/2018

Page: 3

BID NO.: 50-00124838

7.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14,

15.

INSTRUCTIONS FOR BIDDERS AND GENERAL CONDITIONS

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: All awards for public works in excess of $5,000.00 will be reduced to a formal

contract which shall be recorded at the contractor's expense with the Clerk of Court and Ex-Officio Recorder of

Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. A price list of recordation costs may be obtained fram the Clerk of Court

and Ex-Officio Recorder of Mortgages for the Parish of Jefferson. All awards in excess of $25,000.00 will require both a
performance and a payment bond. Unless otherwise stated in the bid specifications, the performance bond requirements shall
be 100% of the contract price. Unless otherwise state in the bid specifications, the payment bond requirements shall be 100% of
the contract price. Both bonds shall be suppiied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A performance bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The performance bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

NON-PUBLIC WORKS BIDS: A payment bond will be required for this bid. The amount of the bond will be
100% of the contract price unless otherwise indicated in the specifications. The payment bond shall be
supplied at the signing of the contract.

All bidders must comply with the requirements stated in the attached "Standard Insurance Requirements” sheet attached to this bid
solicitation. Prior to contract executions/purchase order issuance, the successful bidder will be required to provide final insurance
certificates which shall name Jefferson Parish as an additional insured in accordance with the instructions in the aforementioned
“Standard Insurance Requirements® sheet. '

A bid bond will be required with bid submission in the amount of 5% of the total bid, uniess otherwise stated in the bid
specifications. Acceptable forms shall be limited to cashier's check, certified check, or surety bid bond. All sureties must be in
original format (no copies). If submitting a bid online, vendors must submit an electronic bid bond through the respective online
clearinghouse bond management system(s) as indicated in the electronic bid solicitation on Central Auction House, No
scanned paper copies of any bid band will be accepted as part of the electronic bid submission.

This is a requirements contract to be provided on an as needed basis. JEFFERSON PARISH makes no
representations on warranties with regard to minimum guaranteed quantities unless otherwise stated in the bid
specifications,

Freight charges should be included in total cost when quoting. if not quoted FOB DELIVERED, freight must be
quoted as a separate item. Bid may be rejected if not quoted FOB DELIVERED or if freight charges are not
indicated on bid form.

PUBLIC WORKS BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required; This applies to all solicitations for
construction, alteration or demolition of public buildings or projects, in conformity with the provisions contained in LSA-RS
38:2212.9, LSA-RS 38:2212.10, LSA-RS 38:2224, and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding
purposes, all bidders must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including:
Non-Conviction Affidavit, Non-Collusion Affidavit, Campaign Contribution Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and E-Verify
Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been combined into one form entitled PUBLIC WORKS BID
AFFIDAVIT. This affidavit must be submitted in its original format, and without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for
the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the compleled, signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted
with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration
upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves
the right to award bid to the next iowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

NON PUBLIC WORK BIDS - Completed, Signed and Properly Notarized Affidavits Required in conformity with the provisions
contained in LSA — RS 38:2224 and Sec 2-923.1 of the Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances. For bidding purposes, all bidders
must submit with bid submission COMPLETED, SIGNED and PROPERLY NOTARIZED Affidavits, including: Non-Collusion.
Affidavit, Debt Disclosures Affidavit and Campaign Contribution Affidavit. For the convenience of vendors, all affidavits have been
combined into one form entitied NON PUBLIC WORKS BiD AFFIDAVIT, This affidavil must be submitted in its original format, and
without material alteration, in order to be compliant and for the bid to be considered responsive. A scanned copy of the completed,
signed and properly notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid, however, the successful bidder must submit the original
affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract execution. Faillure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the next lowest responsive and
responsible bidder in this event. ‘

16. The ensuing contract for this bid solicitation may be eligible for FEMA reimbursement and/or Federal funding/reimbursement. As

such, the referenced appendix will be applicable accordingly and shall be considered a part of the bid documents. All applicable
certifications must be duly completed, signed and submitted with bid submission. Failure to submit applicable certifications with
bid submission will result in bid rejection.

It shall be the duty of every parish officer, employee, department, agency, special district, board, and commission: and the
duty of every contractor, subcontractor, and licensee of the parish, and the duty of every applicant for certification of
eligibility for a parish contract or program, to cooperate with the Inspector General in any investigation, audit, inspection,
performance review, or hearing pursuant to Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances Section 2-155.10(19). By submitting a
bid, vendor acknowledges this and will abide by all provisions of the referenced Jefferson Parish Code of Ordinances.




INVITATION TO BID

DATE: 11/13/2018 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00124838 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA, 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: BUYER: MBUTTERY

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the

Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department,

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH
INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 3-4 weeks ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME {IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated, Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the hid
form will result in bid rejection. '

Acknowledge Recelpt of Addenda: NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: {if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME: .
MG Automation & Contpols
SIGNATURE; . TITLE:
{Must be signed here) W 4/(/ Sales
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: N /
Keith Lunsford
ADDRESS;
1412 Edwards Ave
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
Harahan, LA 796123
TELEPHONE: : FAX:
504 733 0070 504 734 8606

EMAIL ADDRESS:

lunsford@mgautocon.com '
With AFS8GN3-30-11-13 With A75N3-30-11-84

TOTAL PRIGE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $5,071.84 $5,588.080




DATE; 11/13/2018

BID NO.: 50-00124838

"INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: §

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

16.00

16.00

12,00

20.00

5 1,000.00

2,00

1.00

1.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

LF

EA

EA

EA

'ABB brand no. A75N3-30-11.84

PURCHASE OF ELECTRICAL STOCK FOR
EAST BANK WAREHOQUSE

Also quoting factery
0001 - Contactor, size 3, 120 volt, racommended

new in factory box, replacemant for
A75N3-30-11-84,
Documentation is

(0860930} attached.

0002 - Block, contact, 2 normally open,
Allen Bradley no. 800T-XA2
(087129D)

0003 - Switch, pressure,
adjustable range 5-80 PSi,

5light descrepancy in
regard to part number.

Documentation attached.

Barksdale model no. D1H-A80
ting DH1-A8@SS.
{0872630) Quoting

0004 - Box, outlet,
4 in square x 1-1/2 in deep,

12 side and 5 bottem 1/2 in knockouts
Raca no. 190
{0873750)

0005 - Wire, electrical, no. 16 solid
tfn, orange insulation, 500 ft spool,

‘copper, Graybar no, 90005827
{088271C)

0006 - Motor, electric, 1/2 HP - 1/4 HP,
1725.1140 RPM, 2 speed, 115 VAC,

1 Phase, NEMA 56, open dripproof
enclosure, A.0. Smith no. F391,
Graniger no. 4UES94
(0890450)

0007 - Motor, electric, 3/4 HP,
1725 RPM, 3 Phase, 208-230/460 VAC,

NEMA frame 56, dripproof enclosure,
GE No. 5K46KN4071 .
{0890630)

0008 - Breaker, circuit, 2500 amperes,
600 volt, 3 pole, with digitrip 310

trip unit, new in factory box

Westinghouse No. RD 6SKMCD.

Must have warranty.

{0841220)

AF8ON3-38-11-13
$159.50 each

A75N3-30-11-84
$191,76 each

800T-XA2

$29,24 each

AF8ON3-36-11-13
$2,552.00

A75N3-30-11-84

$467.84

DH1-ABOSS

$171.60 each

$2,052.900

NO BID

NO BID

——NO BID

NO BID

NO_BID
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Range contactors & overload relays

Power and productivity A “ “
for a better world™




ABB sets a new standard in motor
control and power switching

Featuring AF technology as standard, the latest range of

ABB's contactors establishes a new industry benchmark.

The electronically controlled coil offers multiple benefits over
conventional alternatives, and together with ABB's wide product
offering — an optimal configuration, every time.

Access Global Support

The contacter and motor protection range from ABB is com-
patible with all major national and international standards and
is available worldwide via a global distribution network. One
contactor coil now handles 100 V — 250 V, AC/DC for use in
Europe or Asia as well as North America.

Qptimize logistics

With its contactor and motor protection range, ABB has man-
aged to reduce the number of contactor coils to just four. The
total number of product variants has been reduced by up to
90%. This simplifies the customers' logistics and cuts admin-
istration costs.

Sumplify design

By reducing contactor coil energy consumption by up to 80%,
paneis can be built smaller and transformers more compact.
All the features of the AF technology, along with access to
drawings and coordination tables online, simplifies your de-
sign and assembly process.

1.2 { Motor protection and control

Secure uptime

Time to prevent stoppages caused by voltage fluctuations.
The AF contactor ensures distinct operation in unstable
networks and signifies a major advance in motor control and
power switching. Voltage sags, dips and surges pose no
threat. The AF contactor secures your uptime.




AF technology
Benefits

Reliable in alt networks

The electronic system within the AF contactor rectifies the AC
or DC control circuit voltage to a DC control voltage that is ap-
plied on the coil. The contactor is safely operated in an always
optimized condition making it virtually noise free.

Zornetional 00d

oY ey

Wide control voliage range

With conventional contactor technology, different contactors
were needed for different network voltages. Thanks to the
wide operating range of the AF contactor it can operate just
as well in Europe as in Asia or North America. The core coil of
the AF contactor range covers 100-250 V AC/DGC 50/60 Hz.

Four colis for the entire voltage range

The AF contactor features both AC and DC support. With the
complete AF contactor range, functicnality is improved. Still,
the total number of product variants compared to a conven-
tional range is reduced by 90%. Only four coils are required to
cover 24 V AC, 20 vV DC - 500 vV AC/DC.

Built-in surge supprassien

With conventional contactor technclogy it is recommended

to use an external surge suppressor, an accassory that could
cost as much as half the contactor itself. With the AF tech-
nology the surges are handled by the contactor iself and the
surge never reaches the controt circuit. Neither the surge sup-
pressor nor the actual surge has to be considered anymore.
One less product and one less complication to worry about.

Motor protection and control | 1.5




AF40N2 & AF80ON3 3-pole NEMA rated contactors

Sizes 2 & 3
AC / DC operated with 1 N.O. + 1 N.C. auxiliary contacts

Description

— AFA0NZ and AFBON3 NEMA rated contactors are mainty used for controling 3-phase motor circuits up to 5§75V

AC. These contactars are of the block type design with 3 main poles.

Control circuit: AC or DC operated with electronic coit interface accepting a wide control voltage range e.g.

100...250 V AC and DG, only 4 control voltage ranges covering 24...506V 50/60 Hz and 20...500 V DG !

- can manage large control voltage variations
- reduced panel energy consumption
- very distinct ¢losing and opening.
Built-in surge suppression
— Add-on auxifiary contact blocks for front or side mounting and a wide range of accessories.

AF40N2-30-11 ) Grdering details

§ Rated controi girouit { Auxiliary | Gatalog i Global reference | Weight
i 3-phasemator  © voltage T comacts | number i code (2
Size ; Continuous | raling FUemn, L Ug max. fitted H Pky
Peurent ! ) {1 pee)
fusov laew
575V
A ‘hp hp V 50/60 Hz B
2 45 15 25 24..80 AF40N2-30-11-41
i - 24...80 20..60(1)
48...130 48...130 AF40N2-30-11-12
AF40N2-30-11-13
AF4ON2-30-13-14
3 90 130 50 AFBON3-30-11-41
250...500 AFBON3-30-11-14

AFBON3-30-11

{1) AF..-30-..-11 not suitable for direct control by PLC-output.
(2) Available in the US and Canada anly.

Main dimensions mm, inches

191 agr . 12 947 70 2.76° 118 4.57°
12 047" 5§ 2177 F 1 7 028
7 028" L
. 8 e
‘ & N B — @ @ N
e e & & © © o |3
5 ’ _ 1 _@_ 1 1% es igz-
Blleoos ||: £ 2_ Seas 2 g
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£
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AF40N2 AFBON3

Motor protection and control | 2,17




Diaphragm

Switch

Features

» Stripped and housed versions available

High accuracy

¥y ¥ ¥ v ¥

Applications

» Pump & compressor

monitoring

Machine tools

v v vy

Engine monitoring

Ideat for pressure or vacuum

Easy setpoint adjustment

NEMA 4 (Housed Models)

Up to 3 setpoints available in one switch

Waste management
Food & beverage
Factory automation
Metal working

Yy ¥ v v

Hydraulic power units
Medical equipment

General Specifications*

Process Fitting:

Accuracy; + 0.5% of the adjustable range

Switch:

Type: Single pole double throw (SPDT) Snap
Action; single or dual circuit

Rating:
10 amps @ 125/250 VAC; 3 amps @
480 VAC {Class A or H limit switch).
Consult sales drawing for ratings of
optional limit switches,

Wetted Parts:

304 stainless steel

Diaphragm: 17-7 PH stainless steel

Enclosure: Anodized aluminum (housed mode!s)
Electrical Free leads approximately 18" long, #16
Connection: AWG and 1/2" NPT conduit connection

for housed models

Enclosure Ratings:

Housed Models: NEMA 4
Stripped Models; NEMA 1

Pressure Connection:

1/4” NPT Female

Approvals:
UL {optional):

Stripped (D18 and D23) models may be
ordered as UL Recognized components
(UR) on request. Housed (D1H and D2H)
models may be ordered as UL Listed on
request (UL File No. E42816).

* See product canfigurator for additional options,

Wiring Code
Lead Circuit #1 Circuit #2
Pressure | Vacuum | Pressure [ Vacuum
Normally Closed Blue Red Orange Yellow
Common Purple Purple Brown Brown
Normalty Open Red Blus Yellow QOrange

Approvals {cont.):
CSA (opticnal):

PED {European):

All models may be ordered as CSA listed
under Class 3231 02, File LR22355 on
request.

Compliant to PED 97/23/EC

Temperature Range:
Operating:

Storage:

-65° to +165°F (-54° to +74°C)

-65° to +200°F (-54° to 93°C)

Adjustment Instructions:
Pressure:

Turn adjustment screw counterclockwise to
raise actuation point.

Vacuum: Turn adjustment screw clockwise to
increase setpoint (higher vacuum).

Options: - NEMA 4X enclosure {housed models only)
- Cleaned for oxygen service
- Factory pre-set

Shipping Weight: Stripped Versions: 1.5 Ibs. approximate

Housed Versions: 1.75 lbs. approximate

Wiring Diagram

Single
NQ {Red)

NG [Red)

Barksdale

CONTROL PRODUCTS

"‘h
€ (Purple)
NC [Blue)
B

—
£ {Purpiae)
NO Blue) —o—4 '

Pressure
Dual

NQ [Red)
€ [Purple)
NC (Blue)
NO (Yallow)
C ([Brown}
NC (Orange}

INCR

Vacuum

C (Purple)
NO (Blua)
NC [Yellow)
€ (Brown)
NG {Orange)

-
=]
NG (Rod) ——8——— rer
e 4
— 4 1

, nc./Barkedale GmbH

ASubsdlacy of Cang Co.




BARKSDAE. AT WOMBER

gm Switch D1S, D2S, D1H, D2H Series

Technical Drawing

ADISTNG SCREW ISHER ROTIED —7 MOUNTING HOLE (wprzmig W16 (1.4

Dimansion in inches (mm}

ha L
889 I— 130
s ]
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134 288 =
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e @ & @ %uagmﬁgg WOUNTING HOLE 2 PLACES s
w REMOVE COVER T0ADJUST —1 516
(COVER NOT SHOWN) 1.3
»n
o o
Product Configurator Example -A | 80SS | f -ch
Hermetically sealed limit switch option - Class |,
H Division Il {requires AA, CC, GH or HH lirit switch, Not .
sion I {reo Options
available on vacuum models)
-FX NEMA 4X enclosure
Base Configuration 21 | Oxygen cleaned
D1 Hj}smgle setpoint housed version -U UL Approved (Industrial Contral)
D1$ | Single setpoint stripped version _ S CSA Approved Model
D2H | Dual setpoint housed version . Extra wire fength (XXX =
D25 | Dual setpoint stripped version inches)
D3H* | Triple setpoint housed version -Sxxx | Factory pre-set {consult factory)
Limit Switch'
(Tyﬂ armps @ 125/250 VAC: 3 amps @ 480 VAC,; (standard for pressure range — Pressure Connection
| 355. 8058 ar 15058) Blank | Std 1/4” NPT female pressure connection
1 /48| : 0 VAC; 0.05 @ 125VDC; - .
g | 10@mPs @ 125/250/480 VAC: 2 amps @ 600 VAG; 0.03 amps P2 | 172" NPT female pressure connection
0.03 amps @ 250 VDO
o | 10:amPs @ 125/250/480 VAG: 2 amps @ 600 VAC: 0.1 amps @ 125 VDC; Adjustable Range
0.05 amps @ 250 VDC Adjustable Range (PRESSURE} Approx. Deadband? Proof
10 amps @ 125/250 VAC; 3 amps @ 480 VAC; (standard for pressure range Dacreasing - psi (bar} increasing - psi (bar} (Actuation Value) Prassure
-H 256 or 1858) Min Max Min Max psi(bar) pst {ban)
2 o -
10 amps @ 125/250 VAC; 3 amps @ 480 VAC;: 0.5 amps @ 125 VDC; 0.25 2557 | 008(0) [ 165i1) | 0068(0) 17 N2 05(0-0) 38
M amps @ 250 VDC (nat UL approvad) 388 03 (,00) 2.85(2) 18 (,02) 3(2) 07 - A5(D- .00 10(7)
. 1855 41,03 17.74(1, .66 (.05) 18 (1.2 12 - 26 (.01 - .02) 60 (4.1
-GH | 1 Amp @ 125 VAC; 1 Amp @ 24 VDC with gold contacts {not UL approved) L3 03 0% a2 ! : il
] ) C 8055 § 503 76.6 (5.3) 3.9(3) 80 {5.5) 16-34(1-.2) 160 (10.9)
A Hermetically sealed; 4 amps €@ 125/250 VAC {not available on 285 or -!'5'55‘3 1501 144 8.9) 7505) 150 (10.9) 23612 4 200 20.4)
vacuum modals)
o6 Hermmetically sealed; 10 amps @ 125/250 VAC (not avallable on 255 or Adiustable Range (VAGUUM) Approx. Deadband® Froof
vacuum models} Decreasing - In, Hg Increasing - In. Hg {Actuation Value) Prassure
GH Hermetically sealac; 1 Amp @ 125 VAC with gokd contacts {net avaifable Min Max Min Max in. Hg In. Hg
on 28§ or vacuum models) 288 0.08 572 0.4 8 14- .28 20
HH Hermatically seated; 5 amps @ 125/250 VAC {not available on 23S or 1835 0.8 28.2 1.6 30 4-B 30
vacuum maodels)
NOTES:
-AA | Triple setpoint limit switch ! Consult Supplemental Guide for specific deadband values

2 Dpadband values indicated when used with the "standard” limit switch

3 Not available with hermetically sealed limit switches
Barksdale

4 Available only with AA [not hermetically sealed) limit switch
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