

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00128891

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			PURCHASE OF SURGICAL SUPPLIES FOR THE JEFFERSON PARISH ANIMAL SHELTER		
1	20.00	EA	0010 CHLORHEXADINE SCRUB 4% GALLON	18.35	367.00
2	30.00	BX	0020 22 GAUGE NEEDLE 3/4 INCH	3.51	105.30
3	4.00	BTL	0030 BETADINE OPHTHALMIC PREP SOLUTION 5% 30ML	16.78	67.12
4	10.00	EA	0040 LARGE DOG MUZZLE, NYLON MATERIAL. FURRY FOOTED FRIENDS BRAND	NO BID	NO BID
5	10.00	EA	0050 XL DOG MUZZLE, NYLON MATERIAL. FURRY FOOTED FRIENDS BRAND.	NO BID	NO BID
6	20.00	BTL	0060 MINOCYCLINE 50MG CAPSULES	18.21	364.20
7	6.00	EA	0070 AVAGARD SURGICAL HAND ANTISEPTIC 500ML 16FL OZ	8.95	53.70
8	1.00	CS	0080 OMNISET 7IN (18CM) SMALL BORE EXT SET W/ T-CONNECTOR INJ SITE CLAMP LUER SLIP case of 50	72.50 541.49567.2	7250
9	30.00	EA	0090 NEO POLY BAC W/DEXAMETHESONE EYE OINTMENT OPH SUSP 5ML	MFG 30	MFG 30