




NO BID

NO BID

PX2128BU+PX2128RD+PX2128YE+PX2128WT+(LC195 X 4) 

PX2128RG+PX2128GR+PX2128BR+ PX2128BK+(LC195 X 4)

PX2128VT+PX2128TQ+PX2128RD+PX2128YE+(LC195 X 4)

NO BID

$70.60 $486.96

$70.60 $486.96

$70.60 $486.96



NO BID

NO BID

TA50-700

KW5850
1 EA OF 20 COLORS

TS242
SUNCATCHERS PAINTING KIT SET OF 15

BA8112

GLITTER POM POMS (5 COLORS 5 SIZES)

700 SHEETS

ASST SIZES & COLORS

XB857

$1.11 $15.54

$3.43 $17.15

$21.38 $748.30

$2.78 $27.80

$4.64 $46.40



DECORATE YOUR OWN APRONS SET OF 15

12 1/2" x 18 1/4". 

DB233

COLLAGE POTS SET OF 15

DESIGN & PLAY STEM PLANES KIT

10" WINGSPAN
SET OF 10

SUPER EASY JUMP ROPES
VR801

TT573

AA765

BR281
HONEYBEE TREE

NUMBER BINGO
UP TO 36 PLAYERS

JJ312

$23.24 $209.16

$18.59 $185.90

$15.80 $158.00

$12.04 $96.32

$18.59 $92.95

$9.29 $92.90



 LC1198
CLASSROOM CALENDER KIT

 25 3/4" x 29 1/4" 

AD576

PEEL& STICK WIGGLY EYES

300EA / 3 sizes! LARGEST IS 1/2". 

VR360

LC367
SPANGLES & SEQUINS CLASS PACK

BA9112

PEEL& STICK FELXIBLE FOAM SHAPES

1 POUND

LC2832

800 PCS LARGEST IS 2 1/8"

$27.89 $446.24

$9.29 $46.45

$18.59 $55.77

$9.29 $37.16

$17.66 $70.64

$15.80 $63.20



COLORED FEATHERS CLASS PACK

LC658

LAKESHORE GLUE STICK DOZEN

.28 OZ

BEST BUY SCHOOL GLUE

TT505Z

RS264

8 COLOR ASSORTMENT SD742+SD743

WHITE BUTCHER PAPER ROLL

40 POUND

LX9990

DOUBLE SIDED WHITE POSTER BOARD 

3 OZ BAG

TA5420

100 SHEETS

$8.36 $41.80

$4.64 $46.40

$13.01 $26.02

$46.48 $464.80

$55.79 $167.37

$46.49 $232.45



LAKESHORE WRITE & WIPE BROAD TIP MARKERS

DD108

FOAM SHEETS

10 COLORS
PACK OF 30

9" x 12"

LA189

NON-MAGNETIC WRITE & WIPE ERASER

5 3/8" LONG

SU28 x12

DOZEN

ZW886

NO BID

$8.36 $125.40

$22.20 $111.00

$14.87 $193.31

$2.78 $38.92



GR450X
PRETEND & PLAY HARDWOOD KITCHEN SET

BEST BUY KITCHEN PLAYSET

60 PIECES

LA427

ALPHABET LEARNING LOCKS
LC126

COMMUNITY PLAY CARPET
36" x 78"

GR931

ALPHABET ACTIVITY CARPET

6' x 9' 

TT668

$603.57 $603.57

$37.19 $37.19

$37.19 $37.19

$46.49 $46.49

$278.07 $278.07



TODDLER MANIPULATIVE 4 SETS

BC301 + AA105 + AA617 + LA886

TODDLER MANIPULATIVE 4 SETS

DD645 + FB997 + LA591 + LL503

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

TODDLER MANIPULATIVES 4 SETS

TW427 + FW616 + LL278 + PP881

$76.22 $228.66

$111.56 $334.68

$69.71 $209.13



NO BID

LX375RD

LX375BU

LX375GR

36" x 1000' PAPER ROLL RED

36" x 1000" PAPER ROLL BLUE

36" x 1000' PAPER ROLL GREEN

36" x 1000' PAPER ROLL YELLOW

LX375YE

$74.39 $74.39

$74.39 $74.39

$74.39 $74.39

$74.39 $74.39



NO BID

NO BID

NO BID









N/A
N/A

7-10 business days ARO

N/AN/A

Lakeshore Learning MaterialsLakeshore Learning Materials

Bid Supervisor

2695 E. Dominguez St.

Carson, CA 90895

800  421-5354 310  537-7990

biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

7,390.77

Rafael Muro

N/AN/A




