ic€ : SO'HOOI. SUPPLY
celrviCe,
ser qui ngs 20 Ryan Ranch Road, Suite 200
Selection

Phone 1 800 627 2829 e Fax 1 800 879 3753
www.DiscountSchoolSupply.com

March 12, 2019

Jefferson Parish Government
Joseph S. Yenni Building
1221 Elmwood Park Blvd
Suite 404

Jefferson, LA 70123
Account# 17278086

Dear Ms. Bentley,

Thank you for giving Discount School Supply (DSS) the opportunity to submit a proposal for the
One-time purchase of arts and craft supplies for the Department of Recreation Bid 50-
00125759.

Pricing
e Discount School Supply will offer you the Special Prices and Free Shipping on the
quoted items.

e This proposal will remain valid for 90 days for bid processing and review.
e See website www.discountschoolsupply.com for detailed descriptions of items quoted.

e Payment terms are Net 30.

Delivery
e Allitems will be delivered in 2-7 business days after receipt of purchase order.
e Please mark your purchase orders for a specific delivery date range if necessary.

e DSS does not assemble, install, or remove packaging.

Our Guarantee

e [f something doesn't meet your satisfaction, please contact us within 30 days for a
return authorization (RA) for any unused product. If a product proves to be defective
within one year of purchase, after normal use, we will repair or replace the item. Some
products may be covered by manufacturer's warranties that extend beyond a year.
100% satisfaction is our goal.



Exclusions

e Promotionally-priced items may be excluded from your standard contractual terms as
mentioned above and are subject to review for special pricing. This offer is not valid
with any other promotions, discounts or outside the 48 contiguous United States.

e Either of the parties with a 30-day written notice may terminate this discount
agreement for any reason.

Awarded

e [f awarded, please submit in writing your acknowledgement of agreement for this
awarded bid to bids@discountschoolsupply.com.

e Reference “Quote P3804974” on the purchase order to receive these terms.
e Fax or email purchase order to 1-800-993-3609 or bids@discountschoolsupply.com.

e The one-time order will take place before December 31, 2019.

We look forward to hearing from you regarding this proposal. Please do not hesitate to contact
me at 800-836-9515 ext. 5770 or via email at bids@discountschoolsupply.com if you have any
questions.

Sincerely,

W ZQ&@«QQ@ Vs~

Jenni er}abado—Rios

Cont Coordinator / Bid Officer
Earlychildhood LLC d/b/a Discount School Supply
Phone: 800-836-9515 ext. 5770

Fax: 800-993-3609
bids@discountschoolsupply.com




0000780 RIEY CASHIER’S CHECK

Office AU # 1210(8)
Remitter: JENNIFER RIOS
Purchaser: JENNIFER RIOS
Purchaser Account: 2017715786
Operator I.D.: u521127
Funding Source: Paper Items(s)

PAY TOTHE ORDER OF  ***JEFFERON PARISH GOVERNMENT***

***Sixty-six dollars and no cents***

Payee Address:

Memo: BID 50-00125759

WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A. NOTICE TO PURCHASER-IF THIS INSTRUMENT IS LOST,

447 CANYON DEL REY BLVD STOLEN OR DESTROYED, YOU MAY REQUEST CANCELLATION
DEL REY OAKS, CA 93940 AND REISSUANCE. AS A CONDITION TO CANCELLATION AND
FOR INQUIRIES CALL (480) 394-3122 REISSUANCE, WELLS FARGO & COMPANY MAY IMPOSE A

FEE AND REQUIRE AN INDEMNITY AGREEMENT AND BOND.

Purchaser Copy

FB004 M4a203 80233555

s wew . CASHIER'S CHECK

Remitter:  JENNIFER RIOS. -
Operator L.D.: u521127

PAYTOTHEORDEROF  ***JEFFERON PARISH GOVERNMENT***

***Sixty-six dollars and no cents***

Payee Address:
Memo: BID 50-00125759
WELLS FARGO BANK, N.A.

447 CANYON DEL REY BLVD
DEL REY OAKS, CA 93940
FOR INQUIRIES CALL (480) 394-3122

"O07800300¢2r 12323000 2LANLABE ShaLL 2im

SERIAL #: 0078003002
ACCOUNT#: 4861-511442

March 12, 2019

**$66.00**

VOIDIFOVERUS § 66.00

NON-NEGOTIABLE

0078003002
,March 12, 2019

**$66.00**

VOID IFOVERUS § 66.00

Hoihod Koy

CONTROLLER

luded. [»D) Details on Back.

tures inc

-Security Fe



INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  3/07/2019 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00125759 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA, 700540009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: Earlychildhood LLC d/b/a Discount School Supply BUYER: DABRAHAM

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The erder must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH 2-7 Business Days After

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES Receipt of Purchase Order

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUGTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will resulit in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: N/A
NUMBER:

NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***
FIRM NAME:
Earlychildhood\LLC d/b/a Discount School Supply

SIGNATURE: \ ) / TITLE:
(Must be signed here) e N ; N 2 Contract Coordinator / Bid Officer
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: i

Jennifer Sabado—Rios\ \\

|

ADDRESS:
20 Ryan Ranch Rd., Suite 200
CITY, STATE: ZIP:
Monterey, CA 93940
TELEPHONE: FAX:

() 800-836-9515 ( ) 800-993-3609
EMAIL ADDRESS:

bids@discountschoolsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $__ 1305.26




DATE: 3/07/2019

BID NO.: 50-00125759

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10.00

6.00

4.00

10.00

10.00

10.00

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

COLORATIONS BRAND 1 GALLON EA - GWSTPU - PURPLE

A ane time purchase of arts and craft
supplies for the Department of
Recreation

0001 Color Splash Liquid Tempera Paint

Gallons. 4 gallons per pack. Violet,

Turquiose, Magenta, and Pea"hGWSTTU - TURQUOISE

Brand: S&S Color Splash
Item: PT3470 GWSTMA - MAGENTA

0002 Crayola Crayon and Marker Classpack

$10.79
$7.91
$10.07

$43.16
$31.64
$40.28

Pack of 256 items. 128 markers and 128
CRAMARNW
crayons.
brand: Crayola
Item: Unknown

0003 Crayela Crayon Classpack.

$54.32

$325.92

800 crayons in 16 different colors.
CRRGSIXT

Colorations®
Regular Crayons
- 16 Colors, Set of]

0004 Color Splash Chunky Markers. 800

Brand: Crayola
item: Unknown

$22.99

$91.96

chunky, broad-line markers. 12 bold

CHBST
Colorations®
Washable
Chubby Markers|
Set of 200

colors. 180 markers per pack.
Brand: S&S ColorSplash
Iltem: SC1185

0005 Foam Animal Mask Kit.
Layer foam features to create wild masks

Create a cat, mouse, dog, lion, and more
Includes 4 masks of each design.

Pack of 24,

Brand: S&S

Item: AC729

0006 Teddy Bear Coin Purse Craft Kit.
Lace together a cute, practical purse.

Includes suede and leather-look pieces,
zipper, key ring, wiggly eyes, plastic
needle, and cords. 3 inches. Pack of 12.
Brand: S&S

ltem: GP1950

0007 Animal Hand Puppets Craft Kit.
2 each of six designs: giraffe, monkey,

cow, pig, tiger, frog. Fabric markers
included. Pack of 12,
Brand: S&S

$33.54

$134.16

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 3/07/2019

BID NO.: 50-00125759

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

8 10.00

8 5.00

10 5.00

11 2.00

12 2.00

13 20.00

14 12.00

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

PK

Item: CE4394

0008 Design A Hat Craft Kit.

One size fits most, paint pon your own

slogans and stylish designs. kit

includes everything you need.

Pack of 12. HEADGEAR - Hats & Visors Craft Pack - 96|

Brand: S&S  py.ces include 24 White Paper Top Hats, 24

e EPAb2 Decorate Your Own Visors, 24 Decorate
Your Own Crowns, 24 Painter's Caps

0009 Mini String Art Craft Kit.

$52.55

$525.50

Magically Weave colorful webs. 8 each

of 3 distinctive craftboard shapes.
Complete with assorted colorful thread,
nail pins, tracing paper and instruction
3 1/2 inch diameter. pack of 24.

Brand: S&S

ltem: GP88

0010 Color-Me Boxes. Decorate however
you want to make the perfect trinket box

pack of 12 white paperboard boxes with

flip-top lids. Each box measures 8 1/2in

by 5 3/8in by 2 3/8in.

Brand: S&S PENBOX - Colorations® White
Item: GM201 Cardboard Pencil Boxes - Set of 12

0011 Beaded Ornaments Craft Kit.
Combine beads and chenille stems to make

candy cane and wreath ornaments.
Candy canes are 4 inches and wreaths
are 2 1/2 inches.

Brand: S&S

Item: CE4678

0012 Stained Glass Jar Craft Kit.
Store items in decorative 8-sided

faceted plastic jars. Includes 12 jars
with lids, simulated 'lead’ paint, and
permanant markers. 6 inch tall, 3 1/2
inches deep.

Brand S&$

Item: GP3325

0013 Rectangular Paint Palettes.
Each plastic paint palette holds up to

6 colors in 1/2 inch deep wells.
Stackable. 12 per pack.
Any brand is acceptable.

0014 Magic Color Scratch Safari Ornament
Includes 24 paper ornaments, 12 scratch

NO BID

$10.32

$51.60

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 3/07/2019 Page: 7
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID:NO.: 50-00125759 SEALED BID
ITEM . UNIT PRICE
NUMBER | QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES QUOTED TOTALS

tools, and 24 satin cording.
No brand or item number available.

15 5.00 PK 0015 DIY Unfinished Wood Butterfly House
Use your eown paint and embellishments
to give beautiful butterflies a place to
rest their wings. Includes 10 inch cords
4'1/2 inch by 4 1/2 inch by 7 inch. NO BID
12 per set.
Brand and item number unknown.

16 5.00 PK 0016 Crafts by Amanda: Foil Art
Create 3 foil projects; framed foil art,
foil dragonfly or butterfly note holder,
or foll robot. makes 24 of each project.
72 projects in all.
Brand: S&S NO BID
Item: AP255

17 8.00 PK 0017 Color Me Child Aprons

CHANGE QTY Child-sized aprons now in a convenient
§§T4) pack of 6. Can be decorated. DECAPRON -
F12 Measures 13 1/4inch by 16 1/2 inch. Colorations®
Brand: S&S Blank Canvas $15.26 $61.04
Item: CMZ29 Aprons Set of 12
22-3/4"Lx 12"W

18 4.00 PK 0018 Lego Mega Easy Pack
Qver 2,600 pieces. A classroom starter
pack full of variety. 884 bricks, 1,207
scenery pieces, 286 wheel pieces, 256
community people. Includes plastic tub
with lid for storage.
Brand: Lego NO BID
Item: Unknown.

19 6.00 EA 0019 Chess/Checkers/Backgammon Game.
3 classics in 1 box. Double-sided
board game. 30 plastic interlocking
checkers, and Stauton chess pieces.
Brand: Pressman
Item: unknown. NO BID

20 2,00 EA 0020 Risk Game.
Bring a classic military game to your
rec center.
Brand: Hasbro
ltem: B7404 NO BID

21 6.00 EA 0021 Memory Game.
Find matching pairs. 48 cards.

NO BID




DATE: 3/07/2018

BID NO.: 50-00125758

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 8

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

22

23

24

25

26

6.00

3.00

20.00

2.00

EA

EA

PK

EA

PK

Brand: hasbro
Item: unknown

0022 Doen't Break The Ice Game.
Players take turns using mallets to tap

out blocks of ice one by one.
Brand: Hasbre
Item: C2093

0023 Giant Spoons Game.
Clients strive to get four of a kind In

their hand and swoop up spoons during
every turn. Includes deck of playing
cards, 7 giant spoons, and instructions.
Brand: Play Monster

Item: 6742

0024 Spectrum Intermediate Rubber Balls
Easy Pack.

Official-size 28 1/2inch, 24 balls.

6 each of football, basketball,
volleyball and soccer ball in six colors
Brand: S&S

ltem: W11672

0025 Gator Skin Fusien Ball.
Diameter of 6 inches, coaed foam balls

have low density cut foam core and our
super tough Gator Skin coating in a
highly reflective metallic finish.

Brand: S&S

Item: W12906

0026 Early Elementary Gator Skin Dodge-
ball Easy Pack.

18 super safe Gator Skin dodgeballs,
extra-large storage bag, and Greatest
Dodgeball Games book. 5 inch balls in 6
colors.

Brand: S&S

Item: W11501

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




2 DISCOUNT

SCHOOL SUPPLY
[osens s e o)
Date: 3/12/2019
Company: Discount School Supply
Attn:
PO#: BID 5000125759

Reference #: P3804974

BILLTO:

JEFFERSON PARISH PURCHASING
GENERAL GOVERNMENT BLDG
STE 4400

200 DERBIGNY STREET

GRETNA, LA 70053

Description

Excelligence Learning Corp

DBA: Discount School Supply

Sales Department

20 Ryan Ranch, Ste 200

Monterey, CA 93940

Phone: 1-800-836-9515

Fax: 1-800-993-3609

Email: bids@discountschoolsupply.com
Web: discountschoolsupply.com

SHIP TO:
TBD

Price Extended

w/Discount

Extended

3/12/2019

Pglofl

ORDER RECAP

DISCOUNT/SAVINGS APPLIED
FREIGHT/SHIPPING DISCOUNTS APPLIED
TOTAL DISCOUNTS APPLIED

PRODUCT TOTAL BEFORE DISCOUNT
PRODUCT TOTAL AFTER DISCOUNT
SALES TAX

SHIPPING & HANDLING CHARGE

IGRAND TOTAL

1 4 [GWSTPU 0 GAL PURPLE SIMPLY WASHABLE TEMPERA $14.39 $57.56 $43.16
2 4 [GWSTTU 0 GAL TURQUOISE SIMPLY WASHABLE TEMPERA $14.39 $57.56 $7.91 $31.64
3 4 |GWSTMA 0 GAL MAGENTA SIMPLY WASHABLE TEMPERA $14.39 $57.56 $10.07 $40.28
4 6 |CRAMARNW 0 CRAYOLA 128 CRAYON/128 MARKER PACK $54.32 $325.92 $54.32 $325.92
5 4 |CRRGSIXT 0 COLORATIONS 800 REGULAR CRAYONS(16 CLRS) $34.31 $137.24 $22.99 $91.96
6 4 |CHBST 0 COLORATIONS 200 WASH CHUBBY MARKERS $67.07 $268.28 $33.54 $134.16
7 10 |HEADGEAR 0 HATS & VISORS CRAFT PACK-96 PCS HE $105.09 $1,050.90 $52.55 $525.50
8 5 |PENBOX 0 WHITE CARDBOARD PENCIL BOXES-SET OF 12 $20.64 $103.20 $10.32 $51.60
9 4 |DECAPRON 0 BLANK CANVAS APRONS - SET OF 12 $25.44 $101.76 $15.26 $61.04

$2,159.98 $1,305.26

$854.72
$0.00]
$854.72

$2,159.98
$1,305.26
$0.00
$0.00

$1,305.26

JDATMBIDP3804974



Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera Paint, Purple - 1 Gallon Page 1 of 3

1-800-627-2829 your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

creale account  log in

S D'scoum always low prices 0

SCHOOL SUPPLY* o= 110% guoreneed s o
FER ST RS EETT) $0.00
all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

use code MARCH33

in-stock learn more

free shipping over $33

orders expires 3/31/19
< Go Back
m Tweet P PN
Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera
Paint, Purple - 1 Gallon
Hem # GWSTPU

fCoi02 ionc

Read 37 Reviews Write a Review

Dimply Washable

TRV Your Price: $14.39

Select Quantity Add to Cart

This llem Ships within 2 Business Days!
@ B 4 %
@ ‘. B _,‘Ef\r |
” - = E” ' Brrint» [E]Add to Shopping List »

lae X

Product Overview

Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera is sure to stretch children's imaginatfions and nurture their arfistic talents! And now, you can siretch your dollars even more with
our gallon size! You won't find tempera paint as rich, bright, creamy and ultra-washable anywhere else for such an amazing price! Made in the USA and exclusive to
Discount School Supply. Every day children use our paints in the classroom-we've offered the highest quality lempera paint at the lowest prices for the last 13 years!
Explore our fun activities or make up your own! Paint your world with Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera and watch imaginations grow! Choose black, blue, brown,
green, magenta, orange, purple, red, furquoise, white, yellow or the set of 11.

With Colorafions® Simply Washable Tempera you get:

Economical gallon size-the best value and high quality combine 1o give you the best tempera paint around!
Rich, vibrant colors that are FUN 1o use

Endless arls and crafts possibilities

A safe, non-toxic and AP Cerlified product you can trust-made in the USA

Bottles are recyclable

Super washability-washes complefely out of fabric and skin!
Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera does not contain the following common allergens:

Does nof contain Latex

e Does not contain Dairy & Casein

e Does not contain Egg

o Does not contain Gluten

e Does not contain Peanut & Tree Nut
e Does not contain Soy

You may also like



Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera Paint, Turquoise - 1 Gallon Page 1 of 11

1-800-627-2829 your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

create account  log in

o D'scounr always low prices 0

SCHOOL SUPPLY" ©evs 0% guaranteed serc P
i s ymeane ORI 2o |

$0.00

all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

over 333

use code MARCH33
expires 3/31/19

in-stock
orders

free shipping

< Go Back

m Tweet Dinit m
Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera
Paint, Turquoise - 1 Gallon

ltem # GWSTTU

ey
(COLORATIONG

Read 29 Reviews Write a Review

Simply Washable

resoina panc JIS Your Price: $14.39

Select Quantity Add to Cart

This llem Ships within siness !
: e ik iy
& A § )
- X & print » [E] Add to Shopping List »

Product Overview

Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera is sure 1o stretch children's imaginations and nurture their artistic talents! And now, you can stretch your dollars even more with
our gallon size! You won't find tempera paint as rich, bright, creamy and ultra-washable anywhere else for such an amazing price! Made in the USA and exclusive to
Discount School Supply. Every day children use our paints in the classroom-we've offered the highest quality tempera paint at the lowest prices for the last 13 years!
Explore our fun activities or make up your own! Paint your world with Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera and watch imaginations grow! Choose black, blue, brown,
green, magenta, orange, purple, red, turquoise, white, yellow or the set of 11.

With Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera you get:

Economical gallon size-the best value and high quality combine to give you the best tempera paint around!

Rich, vibrant colors that are FUN to use

Endless arfs and crafis possibilities

A safe, non-toxic and AP Cerlified product you can trust-made in the USA

Botiles are recyclable
Super washability-washes completely out of fabric and skin!

Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera does not contain the following common allergens:
e Does not contain Latex
e Does not contain Dairy & Casein
e Does not contain Egg
o Does not contain Gluten
e Does not contain Peanul & Tree Nut
¢ Does not contain Soy

You may also like



—

Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera Paint, Magenta - 1 Gallon Page 1 of 3

1-800-627-2829 your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

create account  login

0 D'scounr always low prices 0
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Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera
Paint, Magenta - 1 Gallon

Iltem # GWSTMA

oy —
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Read 42 Reviews Wrile a Review

Simply Washable

e U Your Price: $14.39

Select Quantity Add to Cart

This ftem Ships within 2 Business Days!

E & — &

& print » [E] Add to Shopping List»

Product Overview

Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera is sure to streich children's imaginations and nurture their artistic talents! And now, you can siretch your dollars even more with
our gallon size! You won't find tempera paint as rich, bright, creamy and ultra-washable anywhere else for such an amazing price! Made in the USA and exclusive to
Discount School Supply. Every day children use our paints in the classroom-we've offered the highest quality tempera paint at the lowest prices for the last 13 years!
Explore our fun activities or make up your own! Paint your world with Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera and watch imaginations grow! Choose black, blue, brown,
green, magenta, orange, purple, red, turquoise, white, yellow or the set of 11.

With Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera you get:

Economical gallon size-the best value and high quality combine fo give you the best fempera paint around!

Rich, vibrant colors that are FUN 1o use

Endless arts and crafts possibilities

A safe, non-foxic and AP Certified product you can trust-made in the USA

Bottles are recyclable

Super washability-washes completely out of fabric and skin!
Colorations® Simply Washable Tempera does not contain the following common allergens:
e Does not contain Latex
e Does not contain Dairy & Casein
° Does not contain Egg
e Does not contain Gluten
o Does not contain Peanut & Tree Nut
e Does not contain Soy

You may also like



Crayola® Combination Marker and Crayon Classpack® - Set of 256 Page 1 of 2

1-800-627-2829 your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

create account  login

) D'scoum always low prices Io) 0

SCHOOL SUPPLY* °'ovs 110% guaranteed seerch
R R T S ORI ) $0.00
all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

t 1 in- : de MARCH33 3
free Sh' pp | ng ";ra'eorcsk OVer $3 3 g Ll o = Wi - - USO;:DHES 3/31/19 qum more
m Tweet Dinit

Crayola® Combination Marker and Crayon
Classpack® - Set of 256

Hem # CRAMARNW
&2

Write a Review

NOW: $54.32 $68-66

You Save: $20.37 (27%)

Select Quantity Add to Cart

This It ips within In !

& print » [E] Add to Shopping List»

Product Overview

This economical Classpack® includes 16 each of 8 classic Crayola® crayons and 16 each of 8 classic colors, broad line Crayola® markers.

e Crayons measure 3-5/8"L x 5/16"Dia.
o Markers measure 5-3/8"L x 5/8"Dia.
e AP Certified

You may also like

TOIEPH SLATE - oo ASNLEY WOLTT
—_—

Set of 9 Crayola® Washable Paints,

Premium Non-Hardening Modeling Crayola® Regular Crayons
Clay - 3.3 Ibs. Classpack® - 16 Colors, Set of 800 Gallons

Miss Bindergarten Gets Ready for 100 Laminator Pouches
Kindergarten (Hardcover)

Product Reviews & Ratings



Colorations® Regular Crayons - 16 Colors, Set of 800 Page 1 of 4

1-800-627-2829

S D'scoum always low prices

SCHOOL SUPPLY® always 110% guaranteed
R TR e TR

all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler

free shipping ™ok over $33

ot oy

800 Crayons

Product Overview

These beautiful, bright crayons offer exceptional quality for an incredibly low price!
e Full, brilliant coverage crayons
o Sturdy, reusable box
o Big boxes are a must for every classroom

your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

create account  log in

0
search p
$0.00
classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

use code MARCH33

expires 3/31/19 learn more

m Tweet Dinit
Colorations® Regular Crayons - 16 Colors,
Set of 800

ltem # CRRGSIXT

‘z,, ATIoge

Read 50 Reviews Wrile g Review

Your Price: $34.31
Compare at: $59.99
You Save: $25.68 (42%)

Select Quantity Add to Cart

This Item Shi in 2 Busl !

% Print » Add to Shopping List »

e 8 classic crayon colors: black, blue, brown, green, orange, red, purple and yellow

Set of 800 includes 50 each of all 16 colors

Crayons are 3-1/2"L x 1/4"Dia.

AP Certified

Colorations® crayons do not contain the following common allergens:

* Does not contain Latex

e Does not contain Dairy & Casein

e Does not contain Egg

° Does not contain Glulen

e Does not contain Peanut & Tree Nut

e Does not contain Soy

You may also like

8 additional crayon colors:turquoise, blue violet, pink, red orange, berry, yellow green, yellow orange



Colorations® Washable Chubby Markers - Set of 200 Page 1 of 11
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Colorations® Washable Chubby Markers -

Chubby Markers Set Of 200
Item # CHBST

200 Washable
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Product Overview

A rainbow of vibrant colors for the whole class! The Colorafions® Washable Chubby Markers Classroom Pack is perfect for drawing, coloring and wrifing. Conical-tip
chubby markers with premium quality ink are fully washable and come in a sturdy storage box.
e Includes 25 each of 8 classic colors: black, blue, brown, green, orange, red, purple and yellow
° Make fine lines or fill in large coloring spaces
e Sturdy, conical nylon tip measures 1/2"L x 1/4"Dia.
o Markers measure 5-5/16"L x 1/2"Dia.
e Vented caps
e Non-toxic
*Latex free
*Dairy & Casein free
*Egg free
*Gluten free
*Peanut & Tree Nut free
*Soy free

You may also like



Hats & Visors Craft Pack - 96 Pieces

1-800-627-2829

%D'scou T always low prices
SCHOOL

su”we always 110% guaranteed

all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler

in-stock
orders

free shipping

W
Lt
S

/vﬁ-’/fn
= @
: @
“ A

A,

\ C*/’ voo *,."

Happpiy Tl &

) . - 3 2N %
S A e

Product Overview

Page 1 of 2

your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us
create account  log in
0
search p
$0.00
classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

use code MARCH33

expires 3/31/19 learn more

Tweet

i

Pinit

(£ Share
Hats & Visors Craft Pack - 96 Pieces

Iltem # HEADGEAR
a3 62
Tley 48

Discount School Supply®
Add to Cart

This ltem Ships within 2 Business Days!

Write o Review

Your Price: $105.09

Select Quantity

& Print » [E] Add to Shopping List »

Design them, and then wear them! This camp kit is packed full of value with easy-to-decorate hats in 4 fun styles.

Kit Includes:

*24 White Paper Top Hats

*24 Decorate Your Own Visors
*24 Decorate Your Own Crowns
*24 Painter's Caps

You may also like

Magic Nuudles® Magic Sticks®

Magic Nuudles® Magic Paper™

Magic Nuudles® Building Kit

To:Mom & - {

Colorations® Wet & Stick Fuse Beads
Classroom Pack

Valentine's Day Puzzle Cards



Colorations® White Cardboard Pencil Boxes - Set of 12 Page 1 of 3

1-800-627-2829 your shopping lists  quick order form  contact us

create account  log in

Dlscounr always low prices p "

°°L sumvo always 110% guaranteed search
R T e R T $0.00
all categories arts & crafts STEM infant & toddler classroom furniture play & learn curriculum clearance

use code MARCH33
expires 3/31/19

learn more

free shipping Mok

m Tweet Pt [N
Colorations® White Cardboard Pencil
Boxes - Set of 12

Item # PENBOX

et 1©

Read 74 Reviews Write g Review

Your Price: $20.64
Compare at: $24.60
You Save: $3.96 (16%)

D Select Quantity Add to Cart
This liem Ships within 2 Business Days!

& Print » [E] Add to Shopping List »

Product Overview

Perfect for pencils or any special treasures!
e These cardboard boxes are great for personalizing with paint, marker, pencil, crayon and collage
e Set of 12 boxes
° 9"Lx 5-1/72"W x 2-1/8"H

You may also like

Colorations® Jumbo Spiral Glitter Colorations® Fun Shapes Paint Colorations® Decorate Your Own Tu Colorations® Decorate Your Own Colorations® Mini Canvas Tote Bags
Goo Sef of 12 Swatters - Set of 24 BiShvat Flowerpot - Set of 12 Puppy - Set of 12 - Set of 24
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Product Overview

Canvas aprons for young arlists to personalize!
e Decorate with fabric paint, pens, markers and collage materials
o After decorating, aprons can be used during snack time, crafting or dramatic play
e Sef of 12 white canvas aprons
o Each apron measures 22-3/4"L x 12"W

You may also like



