INVITATION TO BID

DATE:  4/19/2017 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00119593 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR; BASIC SUPPLY,LLC BUYER: SFOLSE

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq,, all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work is to be done in a workman-like manner, according
to standard practices. Any deviations or alterations from the specifications must be indicated and backup documentation
supplied with your quotation.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 12-18 DAYS

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid
form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable)

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

BAS PLY, LLC

JOSURPLY. Ve )
SIGNATURE: g ! /o -~ TITLE:
(Must be signed here ?/% 7 W 2z MANAGER
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: v M v
JOHN ATKINSON
. /

APDRESS: 50 BOX'63066
CITY. STATE: | AFAYETTE, LA 2P 20596

H FAX:
TELEPHONE , 337-2321733 ) 337-232-2045
EMAIL ADDRESS: .

charlotte@basicsupply.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ _$1705.72




DATE: 4/19/2017

BID NO.: 50-00119593

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 5

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

4.00

12.00

20.00

12.00

100.00

§00.00

50.00

300.00

100.00

50.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

LF

EA

EA

EA

EA

STOCK SUPPLIES NEEDED FOR THE JEFFERSON
PARISH WB SEWERAGE DEPARTMENT

0010 - BELT 31420 BROWNING FHP
SK NUMBER 00-0042000 PIX 3L420

0020 - BUSHING, GALVANIZED, SCHEDULE 40,
3/8 IN. X 1/8 IN., DOMESTIC

WORLDWIDE
SOURCING 35-3/8X1/8G

SK NUMBER 00-0289940

0030 - REDUCER, BELL, GALVANIZED, 1/4
INCH X 1/8 INCH, SCHEDULE 40

SK NUMBER 00-0202720 WORLDWIDE
SOURCING 24-1/4X1/8G

0040 - ELBOW, BRASS, COMPRESSION, 1/4
INT X 1/8 IN. MPT, MALE, W/BRASS

SLEEVE, DOMESTIC, PARKER NO. 169C-4-2

SK NUMBER 00-0302750 ANDERSON METAL
750069-0402

0050 - TUBING, COPPER, REFRIGERATION,

SOFT, 1/4 IN. OUTSIDE DIAMETER

SK NUMBER 00-0384320 MUELLER REF-1/4
0060 - WASHER, FLAT, 5/16 INCH,

NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL, FASTENAL
NO. 78015

SK NUMBER 00-0411120

0070 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 3/8 INCH - 16
DIAMETER X 3-1/2 INCH LONG, GRADE 316
STAINLESS STEEL, FASTENAL NO.77117
SK NUMBER 00-0411460

0080 - WASHER, LOCK, 1/2 INCH, GRADE
316 STAINLESS STEEL

SK NUMBER 00-0411810

0090 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 1/2 INCH - 13 X
1-1/2 INCH, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS
STEEL, FASTENAL NO. 77209

SK NUMBER 00-0411880

0100 - BOLT, HEXHEAD, 3/4 IN. - 10 X
2-1/2 IN. LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE 5

$2.90

11.60

$0.58

$6.96

$0.67

13.40

$1.48

17.76

$0.56/FT

$56.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 4/19/2017

BID NO.: 50-00119593

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

UM

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

11

12

13

14

15

20.00

50.00

50.00

50.00

4.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

INDENTIFICATION MARKING, BAKED ON
BLUE TEFLON COATING MEEST ASTM B117
SK NUMBER 00-0436580

0110 - ELBOW, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 90
DEGREE, 3 INCH SOCKET X SOCKET,

ELECTRICAL CONDUIT IS NOT ACCEPTABLE,
FASTENAL NO. 047399
SK NUMBER 00-0690160

0120 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 9/16 IN. - 12 X

1-1/2 IN. LONG, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS
STEEL

SK NUMBER 00-0412200

0130 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 5/8 IN. - 11 X

3-1/2 IN. LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE NO. 5
INDENTIFICATION MARKING, BAKED ON BLUE

TEFLON COATING MEET ASTM B117
SK NUMBER 00-0436410

0140 - VALVE, SHUT-OFF, 1/4 IN. FPT X
1/4 IN. FPT, 30 PSI MAXIMUM WORKING

PRESSURE, BRASS BODY AND PLUG,

PARKER NO. V403P-4-4
SK NUMBER 00-0621210 QUOTING PARKER

V403P-4-4

0150 - CAP, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 6 IN.,
FEMALE SOCKET, ELECTRICAL FITTINGS
ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE

SK NUMBER 00-0691780

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$32.00

$1600.00

NO BID

NO BID




WV Belts | % 2887008

PIX 3L420 Cut Edge, Fractional Horsepower, Molded Cog V-Belt, 42 In OC X318 InWX7/32In T

Used for light-duty applications, such as those that transmit less than 1 hp.

Catalog Page & J02070
Click to view Large Image

Orgill ltem Mo. > ZBETOOE Y

3L420 VEELT J/EX42 FHP

Vendor: P1¥ MORTH AMERICA
Model MO 3L420
Retail UPLC: B4B755025885
Country of Onigin: IM
Shelf Pack: 20
Minirum Purchase: 1
able:  pE Check Other DC?
Guant 1 P D

Note: Any prices are subject to change without notice. VWe will bill you at current prices prevailing at the time of shipment.

o Add to Favorites

| Your Comments |

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Used For Light-Duty Applications, Such As Those That Transmit Less Than 1 Hp.

Description Du Frangais: COURROIE EN WV 3/BX42 FHP
Descripcion Espanol: CORREA EN W FHP DE 0,85 X 108,65 CM

*  FHP - FRACTIOMNAL
= 38" TOP WIDTH - 7/32" DEPTH

=  Lgthin: 42

PRODUCT DETAILS

INFORMATION AND GUIDES

* Catalog

To view these documents, you need Adobe Acrobat
Reader. You can download a free copy from the
Adobe web site.

Inside Circumference:

Material:

Outside Circumference:

Section:

Standards:
Temperature Rating:
Thickness:

Top Width:

Type:

Usage:

40-1/2 In
Reinforced Rubber
2 In
aL
RMA Specified, IP-23
-35 TO 100 Deg G
TA2 In
3/8 In
Cut Edge, Fractional Horsepower, Molded Cog

For Light Duty Motors WHilizing Small Diameter Pulleys, Lawn And Garden, Home, Famn Or Shop Applications




Galvanized Pipe Fittings | # 6100333

WORLDWIDE SOURCING 35-3/8X1/8G Pipe Reducing Hexagonal Bushing, 3/8 X 1/8 In, MIP X FIF, Malleable Iron,
Galvanized

WORLDWIDE SOURCIMG Pipe Peducing Hexagonal Bushing, 3/8 x 1/8 in Mominal Size, MIP x FIP, Malleable lron, Galvanized

—— t
i * 6100333 Y 3/8X1/8 GALY HEX BUSHING

WORLDWIDE SOURCING

Maodel NO.: A5-3/BX1/BG

Retail UPC: 045734003330

Country of Onigin: CH

Shelf Pack: 35

Minimum Purchase: 1

tailable a7 Check Other DC?

Cuant 1 PO D
Catalog Page #: GOS072 Mote: Any prices are subject to change without notice. We will bill you at current prices prevailing at the time of shipmant.
Click to view Large Image e

o Add to Favorites ||

< D >

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: WORLDWI DE SOURCING Pipe Reducing Hexagonal Bushing, 3/8 X 1/8 In Mominal Size, MIP X FIP, Malleable Iron, Galvanized

Description Du Frangais: MANCHON HEXAGOMNAL MOIR 378 X 1/8
Descripcion Espanol: CASQUILLO HEXAGOMNAL GALVANIZADOD DE 0,85 X 0,31 CM.

= MALLEABLE PIPE BUSHING
=  MIP X FIP
= Sizeln:3/8BX1/8

PRODUCT DETAILS

End Style: MIP X FIP
Nominal Size: 378 X 1/8 In
Finish: Galvanized
FEATURES

= For Use With Water Or Steam




Galvanized Pipe Fittings | # 6102834
WORLDWIDE SOURCING 24-1/4X1/8G Pipe Reducing Coupling, 1/4 X 1/8 In, Threaded, Galvanized

Flat banded, nght hand threads. UL Listed.

Item Mo. = 6102834 Y 114X1/8 GALV REDUC COUPLING

‘endor WORLDWIDE SOURCING

Model NO. 24-1/4X%1/8G

Retsil UPC: 045734102835

Country of Onigin: CH

Shelf Pack: 25

Minirurm Purchase: 1

milable 23 Check Other DC?

Ciuant 1 (] D
Catalog Page #: GO6069 Mote: Any prices are subject to change without notice. Ve will bil yaﬂ:m current prices prevailing at the time of shipment.
Click to view Large Image = S

f Add to Favorites ||

g wl >

PRODUCT OVERWVIEW: Flat Banded, Right Hand Threads. UL Listed.

Description Du Frangais: COUPL REDUCT GALW 1/4x1/8
Descripcion Espanol: COPLE REDUCTOR GALVANIZADD DE 0,63 X 0,31 CM.

* MALLEABLE REDUCING COUPLIMG
= Sizeln:1/4X1/B

PRODUCT DETAILS

End Style: Threaded
Finish: Gahlanzed
Nominal Size: 174 X 1/8 In
Standards: UL Listed
FEATURES

=  Flat Bended
= Right Hand Threads




Brass Compression Fittings | # 4073846

Anderson 750069-0402 Tube To Pipe Elbow, 30 Deg, 1/4 X 1/8 In, Compression X MIP, Brass
UPC individually bagged.

Item Mo. = AD7BE46 X T50065-0402 ELB BRS 1/ACX1/AMP

endor: NDERSOMN METAL
Model MO ﬁﬂﬂﬁﬂ-ﬂéﬂz
Retail UPC: 719852835445
Country of Onigin: us
Shelf Pack: 10
Minirurm Purchase: 10
lable:  [#f] Check Other DC?
Ciuant 10 (] D

Catalog Page #: G06082
Click to view Large Image

Mote: Any prices are subject to change without motice. We will bill you at current prices prevailing at the time of shipment.

o Add to Favorites ||
< @, >

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: UPC Individually Bagged.

Description Du Frangais: COUDE LAITON 1/4 COMP X 178 MPT
Descripoion Espanol: CODO DE 0,83 X 0,31 CM. (750058-0402)

=  MALE ELBOW - COMPRESSION X MIP
s MO LEAD

= 0D Tube X Pipe Ins : 1/4 X 1/8

PRODUCT DETAILS

Angle: 80 Deg
End Style: Compression X MIP
Material: Braszs

Nominal Size: 174 % 178 In




Refrigeration Copper Tubing | # 4115416 E
Mueller REF-1/4 Refrigeration Soft Coil Tubing, 1/4 In, 50 Ft L, Copper

Cleaned and sealed for liquid fed applications such as air conditioning, ice makers, humidifiers, and refrigeration systems. Adhere to local plumbing codes for
installation/usage.

Org temn No. > 4115416 1/4"X50" REFRIGERATION COPFER
Vendor: MUELLER
Model MO REF-1/4
Retail UPC: 0e4813058028
Country of Ongin: us
Shelf Pack: 1
Minimum Purchase: 1
able: &N} Check Other DC?
Lluant 1 f PO DE
Catalog Page #: GO0S103 Mote: Any prices are subject to change without notice. We will bill you at current prices prevailing at the time of shipment.
Click to view Large Image ™
o Add to Favorites ||

PRODUCT OVERVIEW: Cleaned And Sealed For Liquid Fed Applications Such As Air Conditioning, lce Makers, Humidifiers, And Refrigeration Systemns.
Adhere To Local Plumbing Codes For Installation/Usage.

Descripcion Espanol: TUBERIA OE COBRE PARA REFRIGERACION X 15,24 MT. DE 0,83 CM.

=  SOFT COILS

= ORDER BY COIL
= 50" COIL

= OD Ins : 1/4

PRODUCT DETAILS

Length: 5O Ft

Type: Refrigeration, Soft

Usage: For Use In Liquid Fed Applications Such As Air Conditioning, lce Makers, Humidifiers Etc
Nominal Size: 0.25 In

FEATURES

=  Adhere To Local Plumbing Codes For Installation And Usage
= Cleanad And Sealed






