



JEFFERSON PARISH

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING

CYNTHIA LEE SHENG
PARISH PRESIDENT

RENNY SIMNO
DIRECTOR

March 6, 2024

ADDENDUM # 1

Bid No.: 5000144588

Bid Opening: March 6, 2024
Bid Extended until: March 11, 2024

5000144588 - Purchase of Electrical Supplies for Jefferson Parish East Bank Warehouse

Question: The part on Line 2 of Bid # 5000144588 is obsolete and no longer available. Can you please provide the correct Part Number?

Answer: The item itself is correct and not discontinued, the model Number has changed. The ABB Brand # is AF140N4-30-11-13

Remove and Replace: In its entirety, remove the Bid Form Page 5 through Page 8, and replace with the attached Revised per Addendum #1 Bid form.

Please be sure to acknowledge the Addendum #1 on the Revised Bid Form and vendors must submit the Revised Per Addendum #1 Bid Form.

Sincerely,

Brenda M. Bellow

Buyer I

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department

Bidders must acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder acknowledges receipt of This addendum on the bid form as indicated. Failure to do so will result in bid rejection.
--

This addendum is a part of the contract documents and modifies the original bidding documents and specifications. The contents of this addendum shall be included in the contract documents. Changes made by this addendum shall take precedence over the documents of earlier date.

GENERAL GOVERNMENT BLDG. – 200 DERBIGNY ST., SUITE 4400, GRETN, LA 70053
OFFICE 504.364.2678

JOSEPH S. YENNI BLDG. – 1221 ELMWOOD PARK BLVD., SUITE 404, JEFFERSON, LA 70123
OFFICE 504.364.2678

EMAIL: PURCHASING@JEFFPARISH.NET WEBSITE: WWW.JEFFPARISH.NET

DATE: 3/06/2024

INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00144588

JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

PURCHASING SPECIALIST:
BBELLOW

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

3-4 weeks ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: Addendum #1 Received

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***	
FIRM NAME: MG Automation & Controls	
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here)	TITLE: Sales
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: Keith Lunsford	
ADDRESS: 1412 Edwards Ave	
CITY, STATE: Harahan, LA	ZIP: 70123
TELEPHONE: (504) 733 0070	FAX: (504) 734 8606
EMAIL ADDRESS: lunsford@mgautocon.com	

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 2,957.78

REVISED PER ADDENDUM #1

DATE: 3/06/2024

Page: 6

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144588

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			PURCHASE OF ELECTRICAL SUPPLIES FOR JEFFERSON PARISH EAST BANK WAREHOUSE	RTE-B2AF20	
1	3.00	EA	0001 - TIMER, 0 SECONDS TO 1 MINUTE RANGE, 120 VAC, IDEC NO. RTE-B2AF20	\$ 48.79	\$ 146.37
			SK NUMBER 00-0862030	AF140N4-30-11-13	
2	2.00	EA	0002 - CONTACTOR, SIZE 4, 120 VOLT, NEW IN FACTORY BOX, MUST BE THIS	\$ 735.58	\$ 1,471.16
			BRAND TO FIT PANELS IN FIELD, ABB ABB BRAND NO. AF140N4-30-11-13		
			SK NUMBER 00-0860940	NO BID	
3	4.00	EA	0003 - STARTER, SIZE 1, 3 POLE, 120 VOLT COIL, NEW IN FACTORY BOX,	\$	\$
			WESTINGHOUSE NO. A200MICAC, EATON NO. A200M1CAC SK NUMBER 00-0861600	NO BID	
4	1.00	EA	0004 - MOTOR, ELECTRIC, 3 HP, 3 PHASE, 213TC ALUMINUM FRAME, 230/460 VAC,	\$	\$
			1200 RPM, TEFC, US ELECTRIC BRAND SK NUMBER 00-0891070	NO BID	
5	100.00	EA	0005 - FIXTURE, LED, EQUIVALENT OF, 2-F48T12HO, FLUORESCENT 45-54 WATT	\$	\$
			LAMPS, 120/277 VOLT, FOR WET LOCATION, MORRIS ELECTRICAL NO. 71901 OR EQUAL, 2 BULBS GOES WITH EACH FIXTUE ON WB SK NUMBER 00-0881200	NO BID	
6	1,000.00	LF	0006 - WIRE, ELECTRICAL, SINGLE COPPER CONDUCTOR, THHN/THWN PVC INSULATION,	\$	\$
			600V, STRANDED, 500 FT. PER SPOOL, NO. 16 RED SK NUMBER 00-088286I	NO BID	
7	500.00	LF	0007 - WIRE, ELECTRICAL, SINGLE COPPER CONDUCTOR, THHN/THWN PVC	\$	\$
			INSULATION, 600V, STRANDED, 500 FT. PER SPOOL, NO. 16, WHITE SK NUMBER 00-088286J	NO BID	
8	10.00	EA	0008 - CONTACT BLOCK, IDEC NO. BST-010, NORMALLY OPEN, FOR IDEC	\$	\$
REVISED PER ADDENDUM #1					

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144583

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			NO. ASD320N SWITCH SK NUMBER 00-0853490	NO BID	
9	12.00	EA	0009 - RELAY, ADJUSTABLE 13-52 AMPS, 3 PHASE, 50/60HZ, SIEMENS NO. 48BTF3S00 - MUST MEET SPECIFICATIONS OF REQUESTED BRAND SK NUMBER 00-0858230	\$ _____ AF80N3-30-11-13	\$ _____
10	5.00	EA	0010 - CONTACTOR, SIZE 3, 100-250 VAC/DC, NEW IN FACTORY BOX, ABB BRAND NO. AF80N3-30-11-13 SK NUMBER 00-0860930	\$ 268.05 NO BID	\$ 1,340.25
11	3.00	EA	0011 - CONNECTOR, MECHANICAL, UNI-TAP, AL9CU RATED FOR NO. AWG - 250 KCMIL, BURNDY NO. BIBD250-4 SK NUMBER 00-086991R	\$ _____ NO BID	\$ _____
12	3.00	EA	0012 - KIT, CONTACT, SIZE 3, FURNAS NO. 75HF14 OR HOYT BRAND SK NUMBER 00-0851980	\$ _____ NO BID	\$ _____
13	2.00	EA	0013 - BREAKER, CIRCUIT, 200 AMPERES, 600 VAC, 3 POLE, 250 MAX AMPERES, WITH LUGS ON EACH END, NEW IN FACTORY BOX, SUBSTITUTES MUST BE SAME DIMENSIONS, CUTLER HAMMER STYLE NO. 1491D81G13 - NO. JD3200 SK NUMBER 00-0841870	\$ _____ NO BID	\$ _____
14	100.00	EA	0014 - CONNECTOR, MECHANICAL, UNI-TAP, AL9CU DUAL-RATED, FOR NO. 14 AWG - NO. 4, BURNDY NO. BIT4 SK NUMBER 00-086992A	\$ _____ NO BID	\$ _____
15	100.00	EA	0015 - CONNECTOR, MECHANICAL, UNI-TAP, AL9CU RATED FOR NO. 10 AWG - 250 KCMIL, BURNDY NO. BIT250 SK NUMBER 00-086992E	\$ _____ NO BID	\$ _____
16	6.00	EA	0016 - BREAKER, CIRCUIT, 150 AMPERES, 120/240 VAC, 1 POLE, QUICKLAG-C TYPE, NEW IN FACTORY BOX, WESTINGHOUSE NO. QC1015	\$ _____	\$ _____
REVISED PER ADDENDUM #1					

DATE: 3/06/2024

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 8

BID NO.: 50-00144588

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			<p>SK NUMBER 00-0841250</p> <p>DELIVER TO: EASTBANK WAREHOUSE 4901 JEFFERSON HWY. JEFFERSON, LA 70121</p> <p>REVISED PER ADDENDUM #1</p>		