












Minimum order policy: Orders under $100 incur $10 fee.



see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

#020071

no bid

#002452

no bid

alt: ENROFLOX 22.7% 20ml

#050534

#051169

#051168

#043630

Nobivac   #058566

Nobivac IntraTrac 3 #022339

#050386

$16.00 $8,000.00

$ 6.58 $460.60

$25.00 $250.00



see sheet with current price

see sheet with currnt price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

#038723

#002096

#050603 EACH

#050607 EACH

#050606 EACH

see sheet for current price

see sheet for current price

tablets not available

#059552

#050389

#050387

Torbugesic  #012084

#041065

#041064

#058740

#058741

$48.00 $7,200.00

$ 0.78  $ 39.00

$1.05 ea ($52.50/bx)   $525.00

$1.05 ea ($52.50/bx)  $525.00

$1.05 ea ($52.50/bx)  $525.00

$ 8.58 $ 85.80



see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

#055482

#055480

#014619

see sheet with current price

#061058

#006565

#056989

#056990

#056991

#058121

Nobivac    #011276

Nobivac    #011204

#023065

#031897

$ 21.20  $ 424.00

$ 29.75  $ 892.50

$ 2.64 $ 39.60

$ 59.98  $2,999.00

$ 10.82  $ 216.40

$ 11.86  $1,423.20

$101.11 $12,133.20

$11.46 $1,375.20

$98.17 $11,780.40



see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price 

#035946

no bid

#024680 PK/200

Nobivac Feline 1-HCP   #006882

no bid

no bid

#029405

#056344

#056920

#031971

#049650

ELOXIJECT      #049755

#059004

#059006

$ 70.00  $10,500.00

what brand? We have Abaxis or Witness in 25's only

$3.25/pk ($65/cs)  $4,550.00

see sheet with current price

$ 24.00  $2,160.00

$ 5.40 $ 270.00

$ 54.50  $ 1,090.00

$ 62.29  $ 1,245.80

$ 16.84  $ 84.20

$ 30.99  $ 371.88



see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

#057406

#058242

#02947018x1

20x1 #029474

22x1 #029479

25x5/8 #029483

#054780

(not Clipper) Putney #058975

Carprochew    #059160

Carprochew   #059154

#057551Caproplet Caplets

#037821

Optimmune           #010634

$ 275.00 $ 55,000.00

$ 32.00  $ 6,400.00

$ 4.06 $ 203.00

$ 4.06 $ 203.00

$ 4.06 $ 812.00

$ 4.06 $ 812.00

$ 5.61 $ 1,402.50

$ 5.99 $ 59.90

$ 106.00 $ 1,060.00

$ 69.50  $ 347.50

$ 50.94  $ 254.70



see sheet with currnt price

see sheet with current price

#007210
see sheet with current price

#001555

Chicken    #033096

#055257

#059417

#012006

Nobivax BX/5 x 10ds  #011543

#058095

#001412

#010328

no bid

#029509

#017267

no bid

$ 30.00  $ 2,100.00

$112.54 $ 1,125.40

$ 69.82  $ 698.20

$ 24.99  $ 1,124.55

$ 33.56  $ 671.20

$ 75.00  $1,875.00

$ 9.08 $ 908.00

$ 12.51  $ 375.30

$ 9.99  $8,491.50



see sheet with current price

see sheet with current price

#055475

no bid

#032801

#032802

#059869

#055717X-Ject

$ 3.06 $ 612.00

Private label bx/100 #007319

$ 13.55  $ 813.00

$329.74 $ 3,297.40

$ 17.86  $ 535.80



These items are price-controlled by our vendor partners and are always subject to change. Prices noted are current as of 11/1/2017. We would always 
invoice at the vendor price - cannot be held firm. Cannot be held to any maximum % increases.

line HS# Jefferson Parish, acct#417930

 Current 
Restricted/Shelter 
Price 11/1/2017  NOTES-all pricing subject to change 

1 051169 VS2 ROTOR COMP DIAG PROFILE ABX 48PK 1,134.00$              Abaxis shelter price
2 051168 VS2 ROTOR COMP DIAG PROFILE ABX 24PK 588.60$  Abaxis shelter price
3 043630 ACTIVYL K9 132LB XLG AQUA 6X6 MAH 237.59$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
9 058566 K9 NOBIVAC FLU BIVALENT MAH 25X1DS 291.00$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18

10 022339 K9 NOBIVAC INTRATR 3 MAH 25X1DS 91.75$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
11 050386 BRAVECTO K9 4.4-9.9LB TOY YEL 10X1DS 322.50$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
12 050389 BRAVECTO K9 44.1-88LB LRG BLU 10X1DS 322.50$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
13 050387 BRAVECTO K9 10-22LB SML ORNG 10X1DS 322.50$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
14 012084 TORBUGESIC INJ 10MG/ML C4 10ML 72.22$  Zoetis restricted price
15 041065 CAPSTAR 25LB+ GREEN 57MG BULK 60CT 206.39$  Elanco restricted price; 12/1/17 price $223.24
16 041064 CAPSTAR 2-25LB BLUE 11.4MG BULK 60CT 194.47$  Elanco restricted price; 12/1/17 price $210.34
22 058740 CEFPODOXIME VET TABS 100MG 100CT 52.65$  Dechra shelter price; through 12/31/17
23 058741 CEFPODOXIME VET TABS 200MG 100CT 100.58$  Dechra shelter price; through 12/31/17
29 011276 K9 NOBIVAC 1-DAPPV MAH 25X1DS 87.75$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
30 011204 K9 NOBIVAC 1-DAPPVL2 MAH 25X1DS 109.00$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
31 023065 DECTOMAX INJ SOLUTION 100ML  ZOE 46.87$  Zoetis restricted price
38 031897 EPIOTIC ADVANCED EAR CLEAN VAH 8OZ 8.60$  Virbac shelter price
41 006882 FEL NOBIVAC 1-HCP MAH 25X1DS 72.25$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
43 051080 DIAG KIT GIARDIA K9 ABX 20T 148.50$  Abaxis shelter price
49 031971 LIMEPLUS DIP DVP GAL 74.01$  Dechra shelter price; through 12/31/17
50 049650 MARQUIS ANTIPROTOZOAL PASTE 4X127GM 801.75$  Merial restricted price
65 037821 ORBAX ORAL SOLU 30MG/ML 20ML 6/BX 142.20$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
66 010634 OPTIMMUNE OPHTH OINT 3.5GM SCH  6/BX 138.06$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
67 007210 OTOMAX OINT 215GM BTL SCH 8OZ EA 136.85$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
68 001555 PANACUR SUSP 10% 40DS 1L 110.45$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
73 011543 RAB K9/FEL NOBIVAC 1YR 5X10DS 83.00$  Merck shelter price; through 2/28/18
84 032801 VETMEDIN CHEW TABLET 1.25MG BCT 50CT 26.70$  Boehringer restricted price
85 032802 VETMEDIN CHEW TABLET 5.0MG BCT 50CT 50.80$  Boehringer restricted price
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