

DATE: 3/08/2024

INVITATION TO BID
THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00144665

JEFFERSON PARISH

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
P.O. BOX 9
GRETN, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR

PURCHASING SPECIALIST:
DNELSON

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing body. Quotations shall be based on F.O.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted. JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1 WEEK ARO

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

NUMBER: _____

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) _____

*** ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***	
FIRM NAME: <u>INDUSTRIAL COMMERCIAL MOTORS + CONTROLS</u>	
SIGNATURE: (Must be signed here) <u>William Pappas</u>	TITLE: <u>PRESIDENT</u>
PRINT OR TYPE NAME: <u>William Pappas</u>	
ADDRESS: <u>P.O. Box 1842</u>	
CITY, STATE: <u>MANDERVILLE, LA</u>	ZIP: <u>70470</u>
TELEPHONE: <u>() 504 415-7288</u>	FAX: <u>() 504 827-1167</u>
EMAIL ADDRESS: <u>WPAPPAS@ICMCLL.COM</u>	

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: \$ 1,349.14

DATE: 3/08/2024

Page: 6

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			PURCHASE OF WAREHOUSE SUPPLIES FOR JEFFERSON PARISH PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE		
1	10.00	EA	0001 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 1/2 IN. - 13 X 1 IN. LONG, GRADE 316 STAINLESS STEEL SK NUMBER 00-0411860	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
2	20.00	EA	0002 - ADAPTER, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, MALE, 1/2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X MALE THREAD, ELECTRICAL CONDUIT IS NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0690690	\$ <u>↑</u>	\$
3	8.00	EA	0003 - GASKET, FLANGE, 10 INCH, FULL FACE, 1/16 IN. THICK TEXTURED RED RUBBER, 150 LB., 12-HOLE SK NUMBER 00-0490890	\$	\$
4	10.00	EA	0004 - NUT, HEX HEAD, 9/16 IN. - 12, DOMESTIC, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL SK NUMBER 00-0412120	\$	\$
5	10.00	EA	0005 - CLAMP, CHANNEL PIPE, FOR 2-1/2 IN. RIGID ELECTRICAL CONDUIT, WITH BOLT AND NUT, UNISTRUT NO. P-1118 SK NUMBER 00-0878990	\$	\$
6	2.00	EA	0006 - TRANSFORMER, 120 VAC TO 12 VDC, SOLA BRAND NO. SLS-12-068T SK NUMBER 00-0863200	\$	\$
7	100.00	EA	0007 - NUT, MACHINE SCREW, SIZE 10-24, SQUARE, NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL, FASTENAL NO. 0170849 SK NUMBER 00-0423050	\$	\$
8	2.00	EA	0008 - STARTER, SIZE 1, 120 VOLT, NEW IN FACTORY BOX, EQUALS MUST BE SAME DIMENSIONS, 7-1/2 INCH HIGH X 4-1/2 INCH DEEP X 3-1/2 INCH WIDE, ALLEN BRADLEY NO. 509-BOD SK NUMBER 00-0861010	\$ <u>↓</u>	\$
9	24.00	EA	0009 - OIL, MOTOR, SAE 30, HIGH DETERGENT, QUART BOTTLE	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			SK NUMBER 00-0012000		
10	10.00	EA	0010 - BELT, GATES NO. B-62 SK NUMBER 00-0040560	\$ 11.49	\$ 114.90
11	1.00	EA	0011 - IMPELLER, 10 1/8 IN. OD, SMITH AND LOVELESS, CC/W, NO. 60C75, MODEL NO. 4B2A, OEM ONLY SK NUMBER 00-0673650	\$ NO BID	\$
12	10.00	EA	0012 - ROD, ALL THREAD, 5/8 IN. - 11 X 36 IN. LONG, GRADE 316 STAINLESS STEEL SK NUMBER 00-0425870	\$ NO BID	\$
13	10.00	EA	0013 - BELT, NO. 3VX400, GATES SUPER HC SK NUMBER 00-0041900	\$ 10.09	\$ 100.90
14	5.00	EA	0014 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 90 DEGREE, 1-1/2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET, ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE, FASTENAL NO. 04780930 SK NUMBER 00-0690120	\$ NO BID	\$
15	4.00	EA	0015 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 3/4 INCH - 10 X 2-3/4 INCH LONG, GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL SK NUMBER 00-0412790	\$ NO BID	\$
16	3.00	EA	0016 - BELT, GATES NO. 3VX800 SUPER HC SK NUMBER 00-0041280	\$ 18.71	\$ 56.13
17	10.00	EA	0017 - WYE, 8 INCH X 6 INCH, ALL BELL, GASKETED SEWER LINE FITTING, SDR-35 PVC SK NUMBER 00-0133520	\$ NO BID	\$
18	10.00	EA	0018 - FITTING, SEWER HOSE, 3/4 IN. MALE PIPE END X FEMALE HOSE END, POLYMER NO. UE1121, FOR PIRANHA HOSE, YELLOW STRIPE ON FITTING SK NUMBER 00-030362A	\$ NO BID	\$

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
19	5.00	EA	0019 - CLAMP, PIPE REPAIR, 4 INCH X 15 INCH LONG, SINGLE BAND, ALL STAINLESS STEEL, O.D. RANGE 04.45 - 04.73, BUNA FULL FACED GASKET, DOMESTIC, FORD NO. FS1-473 X 15-N SK NUMBER 00-0164940	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
20	2.00	EA	0020 - BEARING, BALL, NO. SHIELDS, NO. 6206 SK NUMBER 00-0452610	\$ <u>✓</u>	\$
21	100.00	EA	0021 - WASHER LOCK SPLIT SS NO. 10 SK NUMBER 00-0423040	\$	\$
22	20.00	EA	0022 - U-BOLT, NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL, WITH TOP PLATE, BACKING PLATE, AND NUTS 3/8 IN. DIA. X 2-1/2 IN. I W X 3-1/8 IN. I L SK NUMBER 00-027177F	\$	\$
23	10.00	EA	0023 - UNION, PIPE, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 1/2 INCH, FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET, MUST HAVE VITON O-RING SEAT SK NUMBER 00-0690520	\$	\$
24	40.00	EA	0024 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 5/8 IN. - 11 X 3-1/2 LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE NO. 5 INDENTIFICATION MARKING, BAKED ON BLUE TEFLON COATING MEETS ASTM B117 SK NUMBER 00-0436410	\$	\$
25	10.00	EA	0025 - VALVE, BALL, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, TRUE UNION, 1 INCH, TO INCLUDE FEMALE SOCKET ENDS AND FPT ENDS SK NUMBER 00-0692020	\$	\$
26	3.00	EA	0026 - STRAP, 2-HOLE, STEEL, FOR 2 IN. RIGID CONDUIT, APPLETON NO. CF-200 SK NUMBER 00-0880010	\$ <u>✓</u>	\$
27	3.00	EA	0027 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 90 DEGREE, 2 IN. FEMALE PIPE THREAD X FEMALE PIPE THREAD, ELECTRICAL FITTINGS	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0690150		
28	3.00	EA	0028 - COUPLING, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET, ELECTRICAL FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0690300	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
29	10.00	EA	0029 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 45 DEGREE, 2 IN., ELECTRICAL FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0690990	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
30	10.00	EA	0030 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 2 IN., 90 DEGREE, FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE) SK NUMBER 00-0690140	\$	\$
31	50.00	EA	0031 - ANCHOR, WEDGE, 316 STAINLESS STEEL, 3/8 IN. - 16 X 2-3/4 IN., REDHED NO. SWW-3826 SK NUMBER 00-0425500	\$	\$
32	2.00	EA	0032 - NIPPLE, CONDUIT, ALUMINUM, 1/2 IN. X 3 IN. SK NUMBER 00-0881540	\$	\$
33	5.00	EA	0033 - UNION, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET, MUST HAVE VITON O-RING SEAT, (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE) SK NUMBER 00-0690620	\$	\$
34	8.00	EA	0034 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 3 IN., 45 DEGREE, FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET (ELECTRICAL CONDUIT FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE) SK NUMBER 00-0690550	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
35	3.00	EA	0035 - BELT, B-44, GATES HI-POWER II SK NUMBER 00-0042250	\$ <u>8.73</u>	\$ <u>26.19</u>
36	3.00	EA	0036 - CONTACT KIT, SIZE 4, WESTINGHOUSE, HOYT NO. K125	\$ <u>274.00</u>	\$ <u>822.00</u>

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			SK NUMBER 00-0853330		
37	10.00	EA	0037 - VALVE, BALL, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, TRUE UNION, 1/2 INCH, ENDS ARE FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET SK NUMBER 00-0692000	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
38	25.00	EA	0038 - ELBOW, PVC, SCHEDULE 80, 90 DEGREE, 1/2 IN., FEMALE SOCKET X FEMALE SOCKET, ELECTRICAL FITTINGS ARE NOT ACCEPTABLE, FASTENAL NO. 0470926 SK NUMBER 00-0690040	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
39	25.00	EA	0039 - CLAMP, CHANNEL PIPE, FOR 2 IN. RIGID ELECTRICAL CONDUIT, WITH BOLT AND NUT, 2 PIECES EQUALS 1 SET, UNISTRUT, STAINLESS STEEL, TYPE 304, MCMMASTER-CARR NO. 3115T47 SK NUMBER 00-0878980	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
40	3.00	EA	0040 - BELT, 5VX800, DAYCO COG SK NUMBER 00-0040080	\$ <u>42.44</u>	\$ <u>127.32</u>
41	3.00	EA	0041 - NIPPLE, GALVANIZED, 6 INCH X CLOSE, SCHEDULE 40 SK NUMBER 00-0297960	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
42	50.00	EA	0042 - WASHER, LOCK, 5/8 IN., GRADE NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL SK NUMBER 00-0412360	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
43	10.00	EA	0043 - BELT, SUPER HC, GATES NO. 3VX425 SK NUMBER 00-0041750	\$ <u>10.17</u>	\$ <u>101.70</u>
44	200.00	EA	0044 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 7/8 INCH - 9 X 4 INCH LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE 5 INDENTIFICATION MARKING, BAKED ON BLUE TEFLON COATING MUST MEET ASTM B117 TESTING STANDARD FOR CORROSION RESISTANCE SK NUMBER 00-0436860	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$
45	200.00	LF	0045 - PIPE, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 4 INCH X 20 FOOT LONG, PLAIN ENDS, ELECTRICAL	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	\$

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			CONDUIT IS NOT ACCEPTABLE SK NUMBER 00-0691130		
46	2.00	EA	0046 - GASKET, DROP-IN., 20 IN., RING-STYLE, 20 IN. I.D. X 24 IN. O.D., BLUE-GUARD 3000 MATERIAL, 150 PSI, 1/16 IN. THICK SK NUMBER 00-0490800	\$ NO BID	\$
47	2.00	EA	0047 - BUSHING, SCHEDULE 80 PVC, 1/2 IN. MALE SPIGOT X 3/8 IN FEMALE PIPE THREADS SK NUMBER 00-069400B	\$	\$
48	10.00	LB	0048 - PACKING, 5/8 IN., GRAPHITE IMPREGNATED, MULTI-LOC BRAIDED, 10 LB. BOX, ANCHOR NO. 1337 SK NUMBER 00-0620700	\$	\$
49	1.00	PK	0049 - BASE, MOUNTING, NATURAL NYLON, ADHESIVE/SCREW ATTACHMENT, BASE 0.205 IN. H X 0.750 IN. L X .0750 IN. W, SLOT 0.050 IN. H X 0.140 IN. W, PKG. 100, THOMAS AND BETTS NO. MPNY-750A-9-C SK NUMBER 00-0869880	\$	\$
50	1.00	EA	0050 - CAPACITOR, 15 MFD (MICROFARADS), 366-410 VAC, 60HZ, GE NO. 45F1639 SK NUMBER 00-083609Q	\$	\$
51	10.00	EA	0051 - HANGER, CONDUIT, FOR 3 INCH EMT, WITH BOLTS, APPLETON NO. H300WB SK NUMBER 00-0878710	\$	\$
52	100.00	EA	0052 - WASHER, LOCK, 1/4 INCH, NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL, GRAINGER NO. NO. 23NJ81 SK NUMBER 00-0410910	\$	\$
53	20.00	EA	0053 - LOCKNUT, CONDUIT, BONDING TYPE (GROUNDING SCREW), STEEL, 1/2 IN., APPLETON NO. GL-050 SK NUMBER 00-0879460	\$	\$
54	5.00	EA	0054 - HANGER, FOR 2 IN. RIGID OR EMT, WITH BOLT AND NUT, STAINLESS STEEL,	\$ NO BID	\$

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
			TYPE 304, MCMASTER-CARR NO. 3006T94 SK NUMBER 00-0878690		
55	4.00	EA	0055 - SLEEVE, GALVANIZED, SCHEDULE 40, DOMESTIC, 1-1/2 IN. SK NUMBER 00-0294000	\$ NO BID	\$
56	5.00	EA	0056 - BLOCK, CONTACT, 1 NORMALLY OPEN AND 1 NORMALLY CLOSED CONTACT, ALLEN BRADLEY NO. 800T-XA SK NUMBER 00-0871290	\$	\$
57	12.00	EA	0057 - SWITCH, 3 POSITION MAINTAINED, ALLEN BRADLEY NO. 800T-J2A SK NUMBER 00-0871300	\$	\$
58	200.00	EA	0058 - BOLT, HEX HEAD, 3/4 INCH - 10 X 3 INCH LONG, DOMESTIC, GRADE NO. 5 IDENTIFICATION MARKING, BAKED ON BLUE TEFLON COATING MEETS ASTM B117 SK NUMBER 00-0436600	\$	\$
59	200.00	EA	0059 - GASKET, DROP-IN, 6 IN., RING-STYLE, 6-5/8 IN. I.D. X 8-3/4 IN. O.D., BLUE-GUARD 3000 MATERIAL, 150 PSI, 1/16 IN. THICK SK NUMBER 00-0490300	\$	\$
60	50.00	EA	0060 - WASHER, FLAT, 5/8 INCH, NO. 316 STAINLESS STEEL, FASTENAL NO. 78025 SK NUMBER 00-0412370	\$	\$
61	1,000.00	LF	0061 - WIRE, ELECTRICAL, SINGLE COPPER CONDUCTOR, THHN/THWN PVC INSULATION, 600V, STRANDED, 500 FT. PER SPOOL, NO. 16, BROWN SK NUMBER 00-088286C	\$	\$
62	1,000.00	LF	0062 - WIRE, ELECTRICAL, SINGLE COPPER CONDUCTOR, THHN/THWN PVC INSULATION, 600V, STRANDED, 500 FT PER SPOOL, NO. 16, PURPLE SK NUMBER 00-088286H	\$	\$
63	1,000.00	LF	0063 - WIRE, ELECTRICAL, SINGLE COPPER CONDUCTOR, THHN/THWN PVC INSULATION,	\$ NO BID	\$

DATE: 3/08/2024

Page: 13

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

BID NO.: 50-00144665

SEALED BID

ITEM NUMBER	QUANTITY	U/M	DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES	UNIT PRICE QUOTED	TOTALS
64	2.00	EA	<p>600V, STRANDED, 500 FT. PER SPOOL, NO. 16, ORANGE SK NUMBER 00-088286F</p> <p>DELIVERY ADDRESS: PUBLIC WORKS WAREHOUSE 1500 RIVER PARK ROAD BRIDGE CITY, LA 70094</p> <p>0064 - ODOR MEDIA, WAGER BRAND NO. 50 LB. EDIA, 50 LB CONTAINER, SK NUMBER 00-0001030</p>	\$ <i>NO BID</i>	\$