Bid Number 50-132899

Purchase of sports equipment for the Jefferson Parish
Recreation Department

November 25, 2020 at 11:00 am

ATTENTION VENDORS!!!

Please review all pages and respond accordingly, complying with all provisions
in the technical specifications and Jefferson Parish Instructions for Bidders and
General Terms and Conditions. All bids must be received in the Purchasing
Department by the bid due date and time.

Jefferson Parish Purchasing Department
200 Derbigny Street
General Government Building, Suite 4400
Gretna, LA 70053
Buyer Name: Rae Lynn Hartman
Buyer Email: rscott@jeffparish.net
Buyer Phone: 504-364-2688




INVITATION TO BID
DATE: 11/117/2020

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 4
BID NO.: 50-00132830
Riddell / All American Sports Corp. JEFFERSON PARISH
7501 Performance Lane PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
North Ridgeville, OH 44035 P.0. BOX 9

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

FVENDOF{: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR ~ 'BUYER: RSCOTT ]

Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

| DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES 30 Days ARO (or less)
N/A

INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK N/A

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum numbar as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.
Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: N/A
NUMBER: N/A
NUMBER: /A

NuMBER: N/A

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) NA

“* ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

FIRM NAME:

Riddell / All American Sports Corp.

NA’ RE: E e PR ITLE:
il here)/éaém&’/mpézﬁ%ww "™ 8, Bid Gonrdinator

PRINT OR TYPE NAME:
Robin Campbell Hotchkiss

e 7501 Performance Lane
“T" STATE North Ridgeville, OH " 44039
TELEPHONE: FAX:

(8000 275-5338 x 8697 (800 275-2412
EMAIL ADDRESS:

dcampbell@riddellsales.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: § _13,548.91




DATE: 1117/2020

BID NO.: 50-00132899

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

u/m

Page: 5

SEALED BID

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

26.00

126.00

110.00

45.00

60.00

4.00

5.00

DZ

Dz

DZ

DZ

Dz

DZ

EA

Purchase of sports equipment for the
Jefferson Parish Recreation Department

1000-Champion BCSI Tee Ball Level 1 Tee
Ball . Syntex Leather cover {ages5-6)

Riddell # 42218 BB-FL1

FOR ALL ITEMS: WHERE BRAND NAMES » MAKE
MANUFACTURER, OR STOCK NUMBERS ARE
SPECIFIED, IT IS FOR THE PURPOSE OF
ESTABLISHING CERTAIN MINIMUM STANDARDS
OF QUALITY. IF YOU ARE SUBMITTING A
PRODUCT OF EQUAL OR BETTER QUALITY "
COMPLETE PRODUCT DATA WILL BE REQUIRED
PRIOR TO AWARD.

1001-MacGregor 72-Dixie Youth Baseball
Meets Dixie Youth Specs, cushioned cork

center , Alum-tanned cow-hide cover,

ed | and tour t pl
(ages 712) Bddel 4 4557 Ty

1002- Wilson A1062 SST Baseball Official
Dixie Youth World Series approved

stamped, SST raised seams, Grade C full
grain leather, Grey Wool, Red cushioned
cork with Dura-Core technology

(8ges7-12) Riddell # 42210 BB-LL1

1003- Pennant P300DB Baseball Official
Dixie Boys & Majors Approved Stamped,

Grade A leather cover, double-cushioned
cork center, 35 percent wool winding,
TruStitch seam technology

(ages 13-UP) Riddell # 42214 BB-DB

1004- Baden 2BBG Baseball Pro-1 baseball
with NFHS stamp, cushioned cork center,

50 percent wool winding and raised seams

(ages 13-up) Riddell # 42202 BB-PRO

1006-Diamond D1-Pro NFHS baseball NFHS
approved , red rubber, cushioned cork

pill center Grad A-1 premium full grain
cowhide cover, all grey English wool
yarn winding, with DriCore technology

(ages 14-up) Riddell # 42201 BB-ML

1128-Easton Sapphire Softhall Bat one
piece aluminum, 7050 aluminu m, cushioned

3 31.50

$819.00

$30.25

$ 3811.50

$ 36.99

$ 4068.90

$ 38.99

$ 1754.55

$48.25

$2895.00

$49.99

$ 199.96

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 11M7/2020

BID NO.: 50-00

132899

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 6

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

uim

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

10

11

12

13

14

15

4.00

2.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

28.00

40.00

40.00

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

8T

BX

grip, 29/32 inch tappered handle, drop
12, (ASA, USSSA,NSA ISA,&ISF approved)
28 inches.

1129-Easton Sapphire Softball Bat one
piece aluminum 7050 aluminum, cushioned

grip, 29/32 inch tappered handle,

drop 12, (ASA, USSSA, NSA, ISA, & ISF
approved)

29 inches

1130-Easton Sapphire Softball Bat
one piece aluminum, 7050 aluminum,

cushioned grip , 29/32 inch tappered
handle, drop 12, (ASA, USSSA, NSA, ISA,
& ISF Approved)

30 inches.

1131-Easton Sapphire Softball Bat one
piece aluminum, 7050 aluminum, cushion

grip, 29/32 inch tappered handle, drop
12, (ASA,USSSA,NSA,ISA,&ISF Approved)

31 inches

1132- Easton Sapphire Softball Bat one
piece aluminum, 7050 aluminum, cushion

grip, 20/32 inch tappered handle drop
12, (ASA,USSSA NSA,ISA,ISF Approved)
32 inches

1133-Easton Sapphire Softball Bat one
piece aluminum, 7050 aluminum, cushion

grip, 29/32 inch tappered handle drop 12
(ASA, USSSA,NSA ISA,&ISF Approved)
33 inches

3320- Wilson TD Composite Series
(PeeWee) 5-8 Flag Premium composite
leather construction with ACL Lacing

system

4060- Plastic Shin Guards, Adult 9 inch
Pair.

5090-Winchester Super X' X228B 22
Caliber Blanks 22 short blank, heavy

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




DATE: 11/47/2020

Page: 7
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 50-00132899 SEALED BID
EM
NLIETI\;IBER QUANTITY um DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES UgIJOPTIEIgE TOTALS —‘

smoke, extra loud.

DELIVERY ADDRESS:
6925 Saints Drive.
Metairie, La 70003




