INVITATION TO BID
DATE:  9/M12/2022 THIS IS NOT AN ORDER Page: 5

BID NO.: 50-00139772 JEFFERSON PARISH
PURCHASING DE;QRTMENT

GRETNA, LA. 70054-0009
504-364-2678

VENDOR: 27118 BLANK BID COPY VENDOR BUYER: BBELLOW

As per LSA-RS 47:301 et seq., all governmental bodies are excluded from payment of sales taxes to any Louisiana taxing
body. Quotations shall be based on F.0.B. Agency warehouse or jobsite, anywhere within the Parish as designated by the
Purchasing Department.

JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel all or any part of an order if not shipped promptly. No charges will be
allowed for parking or cartage unless specified in quotation. The order must not be filled at a higher price than quoted.
JEFFERSON PARISH reserves the right to cancel at any time and for any reason by issuing a THIRTY (30) day written
notice to the contractor.

JEFFERSON PARISH is expecting all products to be new and all work to be done in workman-like manner, according to
standard practices. Any deviations or alteration from the specifications must be indicated on the bid form for each item
and upon request, product data for same must be submitted by the time specified by the Purchasing Department.

DELIVERY: FOB JEFFERSON PARISH

INDICATE DELIVERY DATE ON EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES In Stock - 30 Dgys ARO
INDICATE STARTING TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK N/A
INDICATE COMPLETION TIME (IN DAYS) FOR CONSTRUCTION WORK N/A

In the event that addenda are issued with this bid, bidders MUST acknowledge all addenda on the bid form. Bidder must
acknowledge receipt of an addendum on the bid form by placing the addendum number as indicated. Failure to
acknowledge any addendum on the bid form will result in bid rejection.

Acknowledge Receipt of Addenda: NUMBER: None Posted

NUMBER:
NUMBER:
NUMBER:

LOUISIANA CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE NO.: (if applicable) __ N/A

— ™ ALL BIDDERS MUST COMPLETE SECTION BELOW ***

< [rIRM N_AME =
‘\* NORTH {\MERICA FIRE EQUIPMENT CO INC. (NAFECO)

smmguns: ¢ 3 (AJ TITLE: )

Muekbe signed here)-f//(? Tvold. J‘O’O(q)?/( Vice President

RINT OR TYPE NAWEE:
; Ronald Woodall

I 1515 West Moulton Street
CITY, STATE: ZIP:

- Decatur, AL 35601
TELEPHONE: FAX

(80 628-6233 " (256 355-0852
EMAIL ADDRESS:

ronald.woodall@nafeco.com

TOTAL PRICE OF ALL BID ITEMS: $ _16,382.95




DATE: 9/12/2022

BID NO.: 50-00139772

Page: 6

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

§0.00

25.00

30.00

10.00

25.00

60.00

80.00

EA

PR

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT RENEWAL FOR FIRE
FIGHTING HELMETS AND ACCESSORIES FOR
JEFFERSON PARISH DEPARTMENT OF FIRE

0010 HELMET (COMPLETE W/ 4" SHIELD)
CAIRNS 660C FD - INCLUDES ROCKER

STICKERS AND FRONT STICKER W/ 3"
COLORED MALTESE CROSS

CERTIFICATION:

THE MANUFACTURER OF THE PROTECTIVE
HELMETS MUST CERTIFY THAT THE HEMLETS
OFFERED MEET OR EXCEED ALL REQUIREMENTS
OF NFPA STANDARD 1971 (2012 EDITION).

TWO (2) YEAR CONTRACT RENEWAL FCR FIRE
FIGHTING HELMETS AND ACCESSORIES

0020 4" SHIELD FOR HELMETS (ONLY)
CAIRNS/MSA 1007006 - MUST MATCH 660C

HELMET IN ITEM 0001

THE SHIELD MUST BE AT LEAST 4 INCHES

HIGH PIVOT WRAP-AROUND COATED LENS FACE
SHIELD. PRICES SHALL BE GIVEN ON

FACE SHIELD ONLY.

0030 ESS GOGGLE SYSTEM S550P

0040 HELMETS - CAIRNS 880
INCLUDES 6" LEATHER FRONT FOR HELMET

SPECIFICATIONS FOR A STRUCTURAL
FIREFIGHTER HELMET WITH A THERMOPLASTIC
TRADITIONAL SHELL.

0050 8" LEATHER FRONT (ONLY) FOR THE
CAIRNS 880 HELMET.

LEATHER FRONT MUST BE AT LEAST 6 INCHES
AND MUST MATCH CAIRNS 880 HELMET. PRICE
SHALL BE GIVEN ON THE LEATHER FRONT ONLY

0060 ULTIMATE CARBON HOOD
PGl, INC. NO. 3049298

SIZE: ONE SIZE FITS ALL

0070 GLOVES - GAUNTLET, WRISTLET
SHELBY FD NFPA PIGSKIN, STRUCTURE

& NO BID

$NO BID

$NO BID

$NO RID

$NO BID

$NO BID

| SNO BID

$NO BID

$NO BID

s 48.73

| SNO BID

$_2,923.80

$_107.93

| $8,634.40




DATE: 9/12/2022

BID NO.: 60-00138772

INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued

Page: 7

SEALED BID

ITEM
NUMBER

QUANTITY

um

DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES

UNIT PRICE
QUOTED

TOTALS

75.00

PR

GLOVES, GAUNTLET STYLE NO. 6226
SIZES: X-SMALL - 2X-LARGE

SPECIFICATIONS:
HEAVY DUTY, ABRASION RESISTANT,
BRUSHED PIGSKIN (3.5 OZ.).

THERMAL LINER LAMINATED TO A PFTE GORE
RT7100 GLOVE BARRIER FOR STRUCTURAL
FIREFIGHTING.

MEETS OR EXCEEDS NFPA 1971 (CURRENT
EDITION) NFPA STANDARDS FOR STRUCTURAL
FIREFIGHTING.

CERTIFIED BY THE SAFETY EQUIPMENT
INSTITUTE.

0080 XTRICATION GLOVE - SHELBY NO. 2600
SIZES: X-SMALL - 2X-LARGE/JUMBO

SPECIFICATIONS:
ANATOMICALLY DESIGNED GLOVE IMPROVES
HAND AND FINGER DEXTERITY.

GLOVE BODY MADE OF DURABLE CORDURA(R),
KEPROTEC(R) AND KEVLAR(R) ABRASION AND
PUNCTURE RESISTANT PALM, FINGERS, AND
KNUCKLE PAD.

ELASTIC "SNUGGLER" AT WRIST REPELS
DEBRIS.

CHARTREUSE GLOVE BACK INPROVES
VISIBILITY.

270" OF SHIRRED ELASTIC
CIRCUMFERENTIALLY AT WRIST CREASE TO
ENSURE PROPER FIT.

GLOVE BODY LENGTH INTERFERES WITH
OTHER PROTECTIVE CLOTHING.

MULTIPLE LAYERS OF PROTECTION IN THE
"HIGH WEAR"” THUMB CROTCH AREA.

"XSTREAMLIGHT(R)" LIGHT FEATURES.

GLOVE DOES NOT ENCOMPASS A PROTECTIVE
BARRIER AND IS NOT RESISTANT TO BLOCD
OR CHEMICALS.

THE SHLEBY XTRICATION GLOVE IS NOT A
FIREFIGHTING GLOVE AND NOT APPROVED BY

NFPA FOR STRUCTURAL OR WILDLAND FIRE
FIREFIGHTING.

** PLEASE NOTE **
OUR DEPARTMENT WILL ONLY ACCEPT LISTED

$64.33

$ 4,824.75




DATE: 9/1212022 Page: 8
INVITATION TO BID FROM JEFFERSON PARISH - continued
BID NO.: 60-00438772 SEALED BID
NUMeER | QuANTITY | ums DESCRIPTION OF ARTICLES i TOTALS

BRANDS AND MODEL #'S ON ALL ITEMS TO
MAINTAIN CONSISTENCY THROUGHOUT THE
DEPARTMENT. OEM ITEMS ONLY ARE
ACCEPTABLE.

SHIP TO:

EASTBANK CONSOLIDATED FIRE DEPARTMENT
834 S. CLEARVIEW PKWY.
JEFFERSON, LA 70123




®
ACORD
;—/

CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY)
03/14/2022

REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on
this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER SANIACT - Kerrie Scott
Stovall Marks Insurance _&ig”fo, i (256) 355-7951 m’é, No): (256) 350-2022
2601 Danville Rd SW EMAL . kscott@stovalimarks.com
INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC #
Decatur AL 35803 INSURER A : Mesa Underwriters Specialty Insurance Company 36838
INSURED Insurer B - Employers Mutual Casualty Company 21415
North America Fire Equipment Co., Inc. Dba Nafeco INSURER ¢ - Evanston Insurance Company 35378
1515 W. Moulton St. INSURER D : Ala SIWCF/Midwest Employers Casualty Co. 23612
INSURER E :
Decatur AL 35601 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: _ CL2231107964 REVISION NUMBER:
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.
ADDL[SUBR]
e TYPE OF INSURANCE INSD | wvD POLICY NUMBER (MADDIYYYY) | (MUIDBIY YY) LIMITS
><| COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE s 3,000,000
DAMAGE TO RENTED
l CLAIMS-MADE OCCUR PREMISES (Ea occurrence) s 100,000
MED EXP (Any one person) $ 5,000
A Y | Y | MP0101001000067 12/12/2021 | 1211212022 | pcpsonaLaapvinguRy | 3:000,000
GEN'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER: GENERAL AGGREGATE s 3,000,000
POLICY s Loc PRODUCTS - cOMPIOPAGG | 5 3:000,000
OTHER: $
COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT
AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY {Ea accident) $ 1,000,000
3| ANy AuTO BODILY INJURY (Per person) | §
OWNED SCHEDULED
B AUTOS ONLY AUTOS Y 5E82722 03/10/2022 | 03/10/2023 | BODILY INJURY (Per accident) | §
HIRED NON-OWNED PROPERTY DAMAGE s
AUTOS ONLY AUTOS ONLY (Per accident)
Medical payments s 5,000
UMBRELLA LIAB OCCUR EACH OCCURRENCE g 1.000,000
C [>¢| excessuas BLAIME:MADE XOBW9261222 03/10/2022 | 03/10/2023 | \ocrecate s 1,000,000
DED l I RETENTION § $
WORKERS COMPENSATION PER | OTH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN STATUTE ER T
D [OFFGCERMEMBER ExcLUpED? - | ||Nia| ¥ | 0374500PSAL129001 01/01/2022 | 01/01/2023 | L EACHACCIDENT —r
(Mandatory in NH) E.L DISEASE - EAEMPLOYEE | s 1,000,000
If yes, describe under 1.000.000
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below EL DISEASE - PoLICYLIMIT |§ P9

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

~~ COPY ~-~

CANCELLATION

_CERTIFICATE HOLDER

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

A

ACORD 25 (2016/03)

© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD




STANDARD INSURANCE REQUIRE D o

All required insurance under this bid shall conform to Jefferson Parish Resolution No. 113646
or No. 113647, as applicable. Contractors may not commence any work under any ensuing
contract unless and until all required insurance and associated evidentiary requirements
thereto have been met, along with any additional specifications contained in the Invitation to
Bid. Except as where otherwise precluded by law, the Parish Attorney or his designee, with
the concurrence of the Director of Risk Management or his designee, may agree on a case-by-
case basis, to deviate from Jefferson Parish’s standard insurance requirements, as provided in
this Section. Vendors requesting deviation therefrom shall submit such requests in writing,
along with compelling substantiation, to the Purchasing Department prior to the bid’s due date.
Any changes to the insurance requirements will be reflected in the bid specifications and
addenda. Prior to contract execution and at all times thereafter during the term of such
contract, contractors must provide and continuously maintain all coverages as required by the
foregoing Resolutions, and the contract documents. Failure to do so shall be grounds for
suspension, discontinuation or termination of the contract.

For bidding purposes, bidders must submit with bid submission a current (valid)

insurance certificate evidencing the required coverages. Failure to comply will cause

bid to be rejected. The current insurance certificate will be used for proof of insurance at time
of evaluation. Thereafter, and prior to contract execution, the low bidder will be required to
provide final insurance certificates to the Parish which shall name the Jefferson Parish, its
Districts Departments and Agencies under the direction of the Parish President and the
Parish Council as additional insureds regarding negligence by the contractor for the
Commercial General Liability and the Comprehensive Automobile Liability policies.
Additionally, said certificates should reflect the name of the Parish Department receiving goods
and services and reference the respective Jefferson Parish bid number.

JEFFERSON PARISH REQUIRED STANDARD INSURANCE
B WORKER'S COMPENSATION INSURANCE

As required by Louisiana State Statute, exception; Employer's Liability, Section B shall
be $1,000,000 per occurrence when Work is to be over water and involves maritime
exposures to cover all employees not covered under the State Worker's Compensation
Act, otherwise this limit shall be no less than $500,000 per occurrence.

Note: If your company is not required by law to carry workmen’s compensation
insurance, i.e. not a Louisiana company, sole employee of the company, then
bidders must request a workmen’s compensation insurance declaration affidavit
prior to the bid opening date. This insurance declaration affidavit must be fully
completed, signed, properly notarized and submitted with the bid. A scanned copy
may be submitted with the bid; however, the successful bidder must submit the
original affidavit in its original format and without material alteration upon contract
execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid submission being

1|Page Revised 10 22 2020



rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to award bid to the
next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY

Shall provide limits not less than the following: $1,000,000.00 Combined Single Limit
per Occurrence for bodily injury and property damage.

53 COMPREHENSIVE AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

Bodily injury liability $1,000,000.00 each person; $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.
Property Damage Liability $1,000,000.00 each occurrence.

Note: This category may be omitted if bidders do not/will not utilize company
vehicles for the project or do not possess company vehicles. Bidder must request
an automobile insurance declaration affidavit prior to the bid opening date. This
insurance declaration affidavit must be fully completed, signed, properly notarized
and submitted with the bid. A scanned copy of the completed, signed and properly
notarized affidavit may be submitted with the bid; however, the successful bidder
must submit the original affidavit in its original format and without material
alteration upon contract execution. Failure to comply will result in the bid
submission being rejected as non-responsive. The Parish reserves the right to
award bid to the next lowest responsive and responsible bidder in this event.

DEDUCTIBLES - The Parish Attorney with concurrence of the
Director of Risk Management have waived the deductible section of
the Terms and Conditions for all Invitations to Bid, until further notice.

UMBRELLA LIABILITYC
An umbrella policy or excess may be used to meet minimum requirements.

EOR CONSTRUCTIO D (0] OJECTS:
The following are required if selected below. Such insurance is due upon contract execution.

O OWNER'S PROTECTIVE LIABILITY

To be for the same limits of liability for bodily injury and property damage
liability established for commercial general liability.

O LDER’

The contractor shall maintain Builder's Risk Insurance at his own expense to
insure both the owner (Parish of Jefferson) and contractor as their interest may
appear.

2 |Page Revised 10 22 2020



